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KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701,
TEL: 6747 4006 FAX: 6743 7591 EMAIL: kaimolor@gmail.com
BUS REG. NO: 44223100L GST NO: MB0371531Y

& EmH

LB AR EL AL TARBSIY %7 it

Specialist in: Accidents insurance Claim, Towing Service, Motor Vehicle Repairing, Panel Bealing, Spray Painting.

Date : 30/10/2018 e ~ =
-  hobly
the Reg
Attn: The Motor Claims Department WI'IHDLIT 'HIE.IUBICE
Your Insured veh no : GZ 2865 M V' ‘ ¢ . "
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. {By{Email. Only) =
78 Shenton Way ol
# 07-16 Chartis Bullding ' ’ e
il
Singapore 079120 )
Segrale
Dear Sir / Madam Ay
Estimate Cost repair Bill To Nissan NV200 NO GBH 916 5 & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00
To Supgply -
1pe Rear boot cover LH Q?A-{e(l $ 1,28110 «
1pc Rear boot cover hinge top ‘i A 1 5 115,004
1pc Rear boot cover hinge lower $ 115004
1pc Rear boot cover NV200 emblem AN s 7990 =
1pec Rear boot cover Innw b e 5 98,00+
1pc Rear bumper “ X » $ 652480 ~7
1p¢ Rear bumper lamp /<€ & Q11380 s ssoot
ipc Tokmih  Mac ’ <; o412 5 10.00 —
1pc Rear baot cover lock A€ #— 5 115.00.4
1pc Rear boot cover "Nissan” logo AL S 5 60.00 —
1set Reverse sensor "« N QDO S moe0— EUU(‘S-”}' .
1pc Rear glass sealant M 5 60.00 L~
5 2,B93.80
Less 10% S 289.38
5 260442
To dismantle and replace of the accident damaged parts,including heat/weld, S 4seT0 35 o
cut-off knocking,straighten,repair,adjust and reshape of same.
To putty,apply primer & spray paint on the affecte portion. 7q O 5 W 8D
To check wiring functions. s M 30
an \n :
To remove reverse sensar, 5 8 =D
s Q .
labour charge to remove & refix windscreen. s 10800 €0
5 390442

Qwﬁmr

289
erlpy v



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 5:4B PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @
08:05:00

Attachments: LOD Nissan NV200 GBH 916 5 & GZ 2865 M on 24102018 @080500.pdf; LTA GZ
2865 M.pdf; SAS Nissan NV200 GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24102018 @
080500.pdf

Date : 14/01/2019

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : GZ 2865 M

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Emall Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam

Final Cost repair Bill To Nissan NV200 NO GBH 916 5 & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 ©08:05:00

Total P by P As Of Repair Costs Recommended By Surveyor And
Agreed By Ourselves : $2,894.22

GST 7% S 202.60
$ 3,096.82



Date : 14/01/2019

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : GZ 2865 M

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building

Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 § & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

We have been authorised by M/S Kumpulan Development (5] P L, the owner of vehicle claim
against the party / parties responsible for the damages arising from number GBH 916 5, to
the above mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number (GZ 2865 M) at the material time
of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, | M/S Kumpulan Development (S) PL).

As a result of the accident caused by your insured driver's negligent driving and/or management
of your insured’s vehicle number (GZ 2865 M), our client’s vehicle was damaged and we have
been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair 5§ 3,096.82
(2) Loss of use X 4days S 360.00
(3) PIR 2days S 180.00
|4) LTA Search Fee S 745

53,644.27



A cope of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
{a) Final repair bill

(b) GIA report with sketch plan of (our client’s veh number)
(c) LTA Search

On Tue, 13 Nov 2018 at 16:45, Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com> wrote:
Your Ref: CC6/AIG18019760/Aha3

Dear Vic,

Awaiting for reply.
Have a nice day w thanks *

Ms Kym

On Mon, 12 Nov 2018 at 16:31, Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Kym,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Vic,

Kindly assist. Our Ref: CC6/AIG18019760/Aha3

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 12 November, 2018 3:40 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <ad lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 5 & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

Hi Sir,

Is the liability clear to direct settlement.

* Have a nice day w thanks .

Ms Kym

~-—-= Forwarded message -—-———-

From: kaimotor <kaimotor@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, 9 Nov 2018 at 17:48

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 8 & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018
(@08:05:00
To: <admin-d@lkkauto.co

Hi Sir,

Is the liability clear to direct satellite

* Have a nice day w thanks .

Ms Kvm



Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1

#01-440

Singapore 408701

Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone.

<eseeeee Original message -

From: Kai Motor <kai ail.com>

Date: 30/10/2018 17:23 (GMT+08:00)

To: "Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)" <admin-d/@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

KAl MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591

E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date : 30/10/2018

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Your Insured veh no ! GZ 2865 M

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)
78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building

Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

We are writing on behalf of M/S Toh Ti Shing Gwendolene the registered owner of GBH 916 S
which was involved on the above mentioned accident between GZ 2865 M.

Investigation reveals that the mator vehicle number GZ 2865 M was insured with you at the
material time of the said accident.

As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle number GZ 2865 M. Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair costs and other
consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s vehicle at KAl MOTOR TRADING Blk 3007,
Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as to avoid further
losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of GBH 916 5 for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and the bill
will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,

* Have a nice day

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



Thank you.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Thank you.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Thank you.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701.
TEL: 6747 4008 FAX: 6743 7501 EMAIL: kalmotor@gmall.com
BUS. REQ. NO: 44223100L  GST NO: MSO3T1531Y

$Z20H: ﬁ.#tﬂ'ﬁtﬁ-ﬂ*ﬂ.#-ﬁ#ﬁ!lﬂﬂ-lﬂ-*hﬁ*-if‘-'
Specialis! in: Accidents Insurance Claim, Towing Service, Mator Vehicle Repairing, Panel Beating, Spray Painting.

Date : 14/01/2019

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : GZ 2865 M

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Emall Onily)
78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Bulilding

Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBM 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

We have been authorised by M/$ Kumpulan Development (5) P L the owner of vehicle claim
2gainst the party / partles responsible for the damages arising from number GBH 916 S, 10
the above mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number (GZ 2865 M) at the material time
nfthl:cddemwiﬁﬂudﬂmﬂmrdwlnhmlmmmmlﬂrn.

As a result of the accident caused by your Insured driver’s negligent driving and/or management
of your Insured's vehicle number (GZ 2865 M), our client's vehicle was damaged and we have
been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair $3,096.82
(2) Loss of use X 4days & 360.00
{3) PIR 2days S 180.00
(4) LTA Search Fee 5 7.45

£3,644.27

A cope of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

{a) Final repair bill
(b) GIA report with sketch plan of {our client’s veh number)
{c] LTA Search




1 UBLAVE 1, 200-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/AIGIS019760/Aha3

13 NOVEMBER 2018

RENTOKIL INITIAL SINGAPORE PTE LTD By Post & By Email
16 / 18 JALAN MESIN

SINGAPORE 368815

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/MVadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2865M / GBH 9165 / OTHERS ON 24/10/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or vour authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) will be withheld for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours fafthfully,

Vie Alpeh

CaseHandler

L Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh/@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S(408933)

ce.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Depr)
Florence lee@rentokil-initial com
(Email)




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November, 2018 5:00 PM

To: Flarence.lee@rentokil-initial.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic [LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref GZ 2865M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2865M / GBH 9165 / OTHERS ON
24/10/2018

L) 74 “ Q=

-
s Ba B Pre Lid

£1 U AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/AIG1B019760/Aha3

13 NOVEMBER 2018

RENTOKIL INITIAL SINGAPORE PTE LTD By Post & By Emall
16 / 18 JALAN MESIN

SINGAPORE 368815

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2865M / GBH 9165 / OTHERS ON 24/10/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given
us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) will be withheld for the time being. Pending for final
allocation of liability in settlement by cur principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

FIIK S
SUSRER = Suve the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged malerial, and are for the sole use of the intended reciplent. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viclation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error. please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached lems. Please delets the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereaf, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.



To: M/5 KAIMOTOR TRADING
Bik 3007 Ubi Hoad-1
#01-440
Singapore 408701
BUS.REG.NO: 44223100L

GST REG No . MO0371531Y

Date: 2B/03/2019

Dear Sirs / Madam,

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING TO VEHICLES Nos: Nissan NV200 NO GBH 916 5 & GZ 2865 M
ALONG PIE Twds Changi B4 Lornie Eixt ON24/10/2018 @08:05:00

In Consideration of your repairing our/my motor vehicle number GBH 916 $ at our/my request,
We /| M/S Kumpulan Development (5] P L NIRC NO: , the owner of motor vehicle
number (GBH 9165  do hereby authorise you as our / my authorised 21 our / my authorised
representative to demand claim settle and / or receive whatever amount teftled /payable by
the insurance company and / or third party or to commence legal proceedings,f necessary,
| in our / my name, for the cost of repairs, loss of usage and any other relevant expenses and

to your appointing any solicitor to act for us / me in respect of the said accident.

Signature: {

Owner Name M/S Kumbulan Development (5) P L
Vehicle No: of Owner GBH 916 5

NIRC Nao:

Address:




RELEASE VOUCHER
(ALG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l. KAL MOTOR TRADING (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD iname of survevor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$83.460.00:Global Sum - all in) for vehicle no. GBH 9168 that was damaged pursusnt to the
accident which vccuwred on 2102018 dute) along PIE TOWARDS CHANGI ilocation)

involving vehicle no/s GZ 2865M This 15 pursuant 1o the mspection conducted on D2/11/2018 (dute)
at “the workshop™

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner KUMPULAN DEVELOPMENT (S) PTE
LTD (“the third panty clasmam™) of vehicle no. GBH 9168 muke the claim as set out in the above
paragraph and we/l have full authormy to settle the matter on hiwher behalfl in a manner that we/l
deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the thurd party claimant”

We/l turther confurm that we/l will indemmiy AIG Asta Pucific Insurunce Ple Lid for all damages
loss andfor expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the thard party chumant’
after the above said agreement lodges o further clam against the former lor any loss and expenises

suffered pertaining w costs of repairs andfor rental and/or loss of use pursuant 1o the damage 10 GBH
9168 (vehucle niv. | as @ result of the accudent,

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above 15 in full and final settlement of any claim of “the

third party claimian™ pursuant 1o the sccident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and withowt admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the spplication of Singapore luw and the Smgupore Couns have
exclusive Junsdicuon aver any dispute arising out of the same

Dated this ‘;J) iday ) of o3 imonthi 2019 (vear)

Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)



N B 5 R HH
KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701,
TEL: 6747 4008 FAX: 6743 7501 EMAIL: kaimotor@gmall.com
BUS. REG. NO: 44223100L GST NO: MODITISNY

FERS AL RRBE L AL RANSRS ook
Spacialist in: Accidents Insurance Claim, Towing Service, Motor Vehicie Repaling, Panel Beating, Spray Painting

Date : 14/01/2019

Ann: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Insured veh no | GF 2865 M

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. By Emall Oniy)
78 Shanton Way

¥ 07-16 Chartis Bullding

Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam

Final Cost repair BIll To Nissan NV200 NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 ©08:05:00

Total P by P As Of Repair Costs Recommended By Surveyor And

Agreed By Ourselves H $2,894.22
GST 7% § 202.60

£3,096.82




Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 5T5T01

GET Registration No. . M4-0006528-2
Print Date/Time : 30 Oct 2018 / 18:57:45
Receipl Date/Time 30 Oct 2016 / 16:57:44

Tax Invoice/Recelpt
Receipt No. | ITNET-00000-181030-001580
Pravious Receipt No

Result of Insurance Enguiry - YNS466L
As at 23 Oct 2018/09:00:00
Insurance Co: SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - YNS458L
Enquiry Fee 7.00 048 749
20181030165558853559

Sub-Total 7.00 D.48 748

Result of Insurance Enquiry - GZ2B65M
As at 24 Oct 2018/08:05.00
. Insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

i N Insurance Engquiry - GZ2865M

Enquiry Fes 7.00 D48 749
20181030165558886192
Sub-Total T.00 D4g T.49
Total Before Rounding 14,00 0.98 1498
Rounding Difference 0.03
Total Amount Payable 14.95
Paid By
m51m1mmmmﬁ'“ 14,98
Total 1495
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 14,95
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

Fastiane
(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING ) o ) -
Case | Motifisd |Est Sutemitted  |Ad) Assigned | Ad) Apt | Adj Supmittea | Ins Auttyen Status .
30 Oct 2018 1::; x' ime S$32 804,22 imm m’lll‘ﬂ'h hfm
Main |00 |
|mna ]| | oo naynge | | ot ertmtes | | _vew vt | Concaicann |

Clalm Details

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS ) - ~[Created by adjuster]
\nsured:  RENTOKIL INITIAL SINGAPORE PRIVATE LIMITED, Co. Reg. Mo 195500145N
;":ﬂ sots NUMPULAN DEVELOPMENT (S) PTELTD, Co. Reg. No.: 1986001062

| 2471072018 080D - (5%

Venicie Reg
No.i GBH916S Date of LaSs- |19 Months and 15 Days From LTA Reg Date {Man ¥r])

' Palicy/Cover |
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Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: GZ2B65M (Insd veh) Model: ISSAN NV200 1.5 (M)

GBHI16S (TP veh)
|Date of Accident: |24/10/2018

Global Sum Settiement | : | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate 3 4177.73
Final Repair Cosl $ 3,460.00
Loss of Use 5 6.00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) - days
LTA [ GIA Search Fee 5
Others; 5
:§
Final Settiement Sum (Global Sum) 5 3,460.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X] NO (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For glun GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability (%) Assassed Liability (*). 0 (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases whera BOLA does not apply.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown
1) |KAIMOTOR TRADING 5 3.460.00
2) 5
3) s

02 Apr
JOANME LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Rolease Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report: Medical
Repart! Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co regno 1sss07188m
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto. comassignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CCE/AIG1B8018760VAHAZQ2

Date: 02/04/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 0999994 346
Claimant Vehicle gaio1es Insured Vehicle No: GZ2865M
Date of Loss: 24/10/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 368679681356
PTION & ID IFICATI F I
Reg No: GBH816S
Make & Mode NISSAN NV200, 1.5 (M) Engine No: KOKEB28D421003
Reg Data 09/01/2018 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No VSKYBAM20Z0156936
Colour; White Cdometer 26694 km
Engine Capacity: 1481 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (55) Market Value/New Car Price
| F T R
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla) Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification No Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 17570 R14C Rear Tyre Size: 175/70 R14C
Front Left Side: Goodyear 8 mm Rear Lef Side: Goodyear & mm
Front Right Side: Goodyear 6 mm Rear Right Side: Goodyear & mm
Thie above valuss epresent the memaning fyre reads deptn
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 2,604 42 2.104.22 500.20 1921
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 D.00
Labour 1.300.00 790.00 §10.00 3823
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 D.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 3,904.42 2,894.22 1,010.20 25.87
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 273 20260 70.71 2587
Nett Amount (5§) 4177.73 3,096.82 1,080.91 25.87
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x $§60.00/day) (55) 360.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 745
Nett Liability (S§5) 3,464.27
Global Sum Settlement (S$) 3,460.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 021172018
Date Inspected! 02/112018  Inspected At: KAI MOTOR TRADING (HQ)
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1. #01-440
Singapore 408701
Estimated Period of Repair; 4.0 days
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE This repor! represents aur findings al fhe ime and place af inspection stated harew. Such mapecton has been carmpd oul o e best of owr
kncwiedoe and ablity buf any othar latlity undar any other cireumatances (3 heraby expreadly sxpliaded
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

Mo. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 "REAR BOOT COVER LH Dented 128110FL  "1.281.10FL
2 1 *REAR BOOT COVER HINGE TOP Not Necessary 115.00FL *-FL
a 1 *REAR BOOT COVER HINGE LOWER Not Necessary 115.00FL *FL
4 1 “REAR BOOT COVER NV200 EMBLEM Necessary 79.80FL *79.80FL
5 1 *REAR BOOT COVER INNER RUBBER Mot Necessary 88.00FL *-FL
6 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 624 BOFL *624.80FL
T "REAR BUMPER LAMP Not Necessary 55.00FL *-FL
8 1 *TOKM/H Necessary 10.00FL *10.00FL
g 1 “REAR BOOT COVER LOCK Not Necessary 115.00FL *-FL
10 1 “REAR BOOT COVER NISSAN LOGO Necessary BOOOFL *60.00FL
"1 *SET REVERSE SENSOR Damaged 252.00FS “200.00Fs
12 1 "REAR GLASS SEALANT Necessary 80.00FL *BO.OOFL

F=Franchise part S=3SpcMefl L=LisillemDisc

Sub Total (55) 2,865.80 2,315.80

- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S5) 2681.38 21158

Total Parts (5§) 2,604.42 210422

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selecied
Recommended Labour
No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO DISMANTLE AND REPLACE OF THE ACCIDENT heaw 480.00 350.00
DAMAGED PARTS ,INCLUDING HEAT/WELD,CUT-
OFF ,KNOCKING ,STRAIGHTEN ,REPAIR ,ADJUST AND
RESHAPE OF SAME
2 TO PUTTY.APPLY PRIMER & SPRAY PAINT ON THE AFFECTE New 580.00 300.00
PORTION
3 TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTIONS Mew B0.00 30.00
4  TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR Mew 80.00 50.00
5 LABOUR CHARGE TO REMOVE & REFIX WINDSCREEN New 100.00 60.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,300.00 790.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. —l

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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