Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November, 2018 4:55 PM

To: Kai Motor

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @

08:05:00 LKK REF CC6/AIG18019760/Aha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Ms Kym,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to
the BOLA guideline settlement.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FEFELS s

P

" Save the Larth- Print only whernr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November, 2018 4:46 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

Your Ref: CC6/AIG18019760/Aha3

Dear Vic,



Awaiting for reply.
Have a nice day w thanks *

Ms Kym

On Mon, 12 Nov 2018 at 16:31, Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Kym,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Vic,

Kindly assist. Our Ref: CC6/A1G18019760/Aha3

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 12 November, 2018 3:40 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

Hi Sir,

Is the liability clear to direct settlement.



* Have a nice day w thanks .

Ms Kym

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: kaimotor <kaimotor @ gmail.com>

Date: Fri, 9 Nov 2018 at 17:48

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018
@08:05:00

To: <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Hi Sir,

Is the liability clear to direct satellite

* Have a nice day w thanks .

Ms Kym

Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1



#01-440

Singapore 408701

Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone.

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor @ gmail.com>

Date: 30/10/2018 17:23 (GMT+08:00)

To: "Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)" <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591
E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date : 30/10/2018

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : GZ 2865 M

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBH 916 S & GZ 2865 M on 24/10/2018 @08:05:00

We are writing on behalf of M/S Toh Ti Shing Gwendolene the registered owner of GBH 916 S
which was involved on the above mentioned accident between GZ 2865 M.



Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number GZ 2865 M was insured with you at the
material time of the said accident.

As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle number GZ 2865 M. Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair costs and other
consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s vehicle at KAl MOTOR TRADING Blk 3007,
Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as to avoid further
losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of GBH 916 S for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and the bill
will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,

* Have a nice day

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Thank you.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



Thank you.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



