Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 12:54 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON

29.10.2018 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC18019749/K1pb3 [External Confidential]

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Case has been settled at a global sumn of $1,840.00(all-in) with Third Party repairer,

We are pending for signed DV from third party and will proceed o close file once DV received.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Pack, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 9:14 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29.10.2018 *LKK REF:
CC4/LPC18019749/K1pb3 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



The all “ wew  lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 April, 2019 5:17 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29,10.2018 *LKK REF:
CC4/LPC18019749/K1pb3

Hi Gerald.
We refer to our emall dated 04/04/2019,

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@® lkdkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 10:10 AM
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' raldpoh@lonpac.com>

Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29.10.2018 *LKK REF:
CC4/LPC18019749/K1pb3

Lonpac Ref: 18/18/18/VC00/021075
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18019749/K1pb3g2

Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 31/10/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The accident occurred when our insured filtered into third party lane and collided with third party. Liability Is
not in our driver's favour. In addition, our driver was charged lor careless driving.

Summary fo offer to third party repairer, “COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" is as lollows: -

Claimed Amount | Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair [w/GST) $231188 31,444 .50
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $106.81) $ 32043 $ 267.03 |2.5daysx $106.81)

2




3. Loss of Income (3days x $80.00) § 24000 3 12500 [2.5days x $50.00)
4, LTA/ GlA Search Fee 3 7.49 3 7.49
Total | $ 2.879.80 $ 184402

**02days recommendation for repair.

Relevant supporting claim documents are atached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong. Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 13 February 2019 3:37 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh®Ilonpac.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29.10.2018 *LKK REF:
CC4/LPC18019749/K1pb3

Hi Gerald.

Third party video as requested.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN pnpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 February 2019 11:37 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto) < kkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29,10.2018 *LKK REF;
CC4/LPC1B019749/K1pb3

Dear Hsiao Tong,



Have you obtained the video footage?

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
| —

i
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) -

Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 8:36 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cec: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29.10.2018 *LKK REF:
CC4/LPC1B019749/K1pb3

HI Gerald,

Contents noted.
By copy fo Shu Pei,
FYNA. CC4/LPC18019749/K1pb3

Hest Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 11:21 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29.10.2018

Dear Hsiao Tong,



—

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) -

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October, 2018 5:07 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29.10.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SH 9033D at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 3:51 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geral >
Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@Ionpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B & SH9033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29.10.2018
Dear Mr Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 October, 2018 3:48 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_5G C lonpac.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD388B B S5H3033D ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT ON 29.10.2018

Our Ref : 18/18/18/vC00/021075

Dear Catherine,

Please see attached and proceed with the survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



COMFORIDELGRO

OurRef : T 1018/ SH 90330 /KS(st) ENGINEERING

Your Ref :

Date 09-Nowv-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept ComlortDelGro Engineariig Ple Lid

&8 Loyang Drive 4ih Fir Eracidedl Road L 1

Lonpac Insurance Bhd Singapore 508069

300 Beach Road

#17-04 / 07, The Concourse

Singapore 199555 Workshops

Attn : Motor Claim Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE ?_""'“"r“

Dear Sir s
ayang

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI| SH 9033D YOUR INSURED XD 3BBB :

AHD DTHER GN 25.1“-1! le Ming

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Lid, the owner of motor
Vehicle No: SH9033D which was invalved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them In presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : XD 388B
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Costof Repair § 144450

2 3 days Lossof Rental@ § 108.81 per day $ 32043

3 Survey Report Fees [Surveyed by Mis LKK) S =

4  LTA Search Fees 7.49

5 GIA/Police Report Fees $ =

8 Towing / Medical / Transparation Fees 5 -
SubTotal: § 177242

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 3 days Loss of Income (@ $ 8000 perdays § 240.00

Total Claims: $ 2.012.42

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

d4) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs ¢ 7 pes.
b) LTA search slip/s of - XD 388B
¢) GlA/ Police report's of - SH 80330

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Witness statement/s ( ) Towing/Medical billreceipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance

{ ) Photographis of Accident Scene  ( x ) Downtima/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate latter

Kindly lock into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully

Kazali ) Selahudin

CDGE Taxl Claims Departmeant

Tel 6214 B738 Fax 6214 1843 Email. kazali@cdge.com.sg

This Is a computar generated letter. No signature s required,

COMFORIDELGRO % <

Fandan
Lt
gnoko

Bungel Kaduit



CDG VARS V LenofAuthorisation Page 1 of 1

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(MAF [/ PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SONATA SH9033D , XD388B ON 29-Oct-18 09:50
ALONG ALONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT TWDS CLEMENTI RD
1/ We LER CHUI SIA (Hirer) NRIC No.. S6820091F
ard/ar {Relief) NRIC No.:

Taxi Number SH9033D
heraby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltal CDGE):

L. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, Including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and |egal costs

2. To have absolite discration to agree to any ssttlement or compensation amaunt in respect of my/aur claim
against third party (except personal Injuries and medical claims),

3. To sign Discharge vouchar on my/four benalf,
4. To accept any payment (claim proceads) n respect of the cdaim against third party and payment by chegque

snall pe forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made jn favour of
“"ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pte Ltd™.

Date 29-0ct-2018

Name of Hirer LER CHUI SIA

Hirar NRIC S6B30091F Signature :

Addrass 21 CHAI CHEE ROAD #06-458
461021

Contact No. 96538944

hitp edgek2srv 82/Runtime/Runtime Runtime/Runtime/ View/CDG VARS V Lettof.  29/10/2018



« ® 1 | onpaC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 18/18/18/VC00/021075
DATE : 15 APRIL 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of XD388B the sum of Singapore Dollar One
Thousand Eight Hundred Forty Only ($1,840.00) in full and final satisfaction,
hquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an necident involving SH9033D and Xd388B on 29 Oct 2018 along Jalan Anak Bukit
Twds Clementi Road.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ SER CHUAN CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD AND/OR LEW SHIT HONG)
agninst all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our
behalf in respect of the said accident.

I'We further authorize vou 1o pay the above seitlement sum directly to
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD.

['We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
linbility basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
msured’s recovery action,

3 DEFARTRENT
R0 ENGIEEING PTE L1

.................

Mamsw frward your o madde pevalile ton
COMPORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE ITT

The contams of s doument apply 10 vehide dameges only
Al personal injuies 2 damages ansng herliom are rudes
vom the ambé &nd anphcaon of i doomen”



COMFORIDELGRO

ComforiDelGro Engineenng Pia Lid

ENGINEERING
ermber of COMPORIDELGRD s o ﬂf‘f i s |
COMP REG. NO.: ’gﬂﬁﬂbl}#ﬁﬂ
Paoe:
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE
8010042 NO HJ{DATE
SH 9033D 91405327 31.10.2018
LONPAC IHSLIRAHCE BERHAD
THE CONCOURSE MAKE JOB_ NO.
HYUNDAI J05231694
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07
SINGAPORE 199555 %TA ODOMETER READING
CONTACT NO: 62507388 s . T
31.1‘.)1.5:]11
CHASSIS CODE JOB TYPE
KMHET41VMBAS04378
' Description : 3F 29.10.2018
Invoice for Lump Sum Repair
Total [.1? Sum Repair Amt 1,350.00
Add GET > 7.000 % 94.50
Total Invoice amount 1,444.50

éssu&d by :
epair
Paymntq%eﬂem ¢

ComfortDelGGro Engineering Pre Lid
A member of ComromltLcag

Hesad Office:
2035 Bruddell Roud
Smgapore 3T9701

Kindly nate that no receipt shall be issued uniess requested

CUSTOMER'S COPY

CHEWBEEL
CLS0/37/37

ENG 01.11.2018 16:31:03
/Credit 30 days

ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHO No




OurRef:  CT18100894
comrort

| g

Date: 01 November 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 29/10/2018 @ 09:50 trs

ALONG ALDONG JALAN ANAK BUKIT TWDS CLEMENTI RD
INVOLVING XD388D

We refer lo the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHO033D (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to LER CHUI SIA IC NO
S6830091F a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $106.81 per day
(inclusive of GST),

Please be advised that the Taxl was insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice,

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident,

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is @ computer generated letter. No signature is required

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile <65 6453 3183
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