_ i cs3| TMigonqog ﬁgc\fﬂ[ v
> . ASSHGNMEN T (OF el . "
JL R T  06e¢|B0iE

{aryaisd il

'_.J:I'Ij_i@lvjli lil'!l;:l =0 1 aun:\}lé;% + - gHB :’543'8
Vet 2hin0 irs 16254 8688
160 %n HiNJ_"\ Dve T o03-14
by L Clam

W e Lsceas

ke of Veh Iyaen A J4|°6 116
g 04|07 2018 © afkr 10aM
CA ! REN | REPR. | |;|,] o ||1;~|w) HALL Endsticuen

[ratel T sm’\o-ﬂ 6 h& Pesai Uomifict bawn Vehiele IN .

r ( X) Estmale
! [- .;.- I -:'."I i |
[ "-__!,I A | 501 _'"._';.; A&

IR Grbed  Lls ¢ 1.Foo)- B 3dapc wilh Guo Qiarg
(414 205 00 RS- 851 )

~nAdn

RECEIVED ! 5 "2 2018 N\ RN -

6D -



illi'rley Hiew (LKK Auto)

= ——
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 19 November 2018 10:26 AM
To: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF.

TCL.MH.RO.50234.18.RR]

Hi Dawn,

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to India International Insurance Pte Ltd

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com [mailto:rhinorepairssg@gmail.com]

Sent: Saturday, 17 November 2018 12:49 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Hi Shirely,
Confirm, $1700 + 3 day loss of use.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
Office: 6254 8858 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: sales@rhinorental.sg
Company/GST Registration No. 201325388E

w Rhino Rental Pte Ltd

Note: This is an original invoice and no hardcopy will be mailed out with effect as we are going paperless
billing



From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 1:33 PM

To: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Hi Dawn,

Please confirm the final fig $ 1,700.00 (lump sum) @ 3 days of repairs.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com [mailto:rhinorepairssg@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 1:32 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Hi Nivitha,

Any updates?

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
Office: 6254 8858 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: sales@rhinorental.sg
RhinoRental Company/GST Registration No. 201325388E

w Rhino Rental Pte Ltd

Note: This is an original invoice and no hardcopy will be mailed out with effect as we are going paperless
billing

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 2:07 PM

To: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.M H.R0O.50234.18.RR]

Dear Dawn,

Thank you for the email.



We'will check and revert to you shortly.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com [mailto:rhinorepairssg@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 2:03 PM

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCLM H.RO.50234.18.RR]

Hi Nivitha,

I have send you the estimated repair cost on the 6 August 2018 and till now there is no respond from your side.
Please advise.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722

(L

g \ Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepairs Company Reg. No. 201600994N

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com <rhinorepairssg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 September 2018 5:54 PM

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Hi Nivitha,

Will like to check with you If there is any updates on this case?
Please advise.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722

(A

g \ Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepairs Company Reg. No. 201800994N




From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com <rhinorepairssg@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 4:23 PM

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.M H.RO.50234.18.RR]

Hi Nivitha,

Please find attachment estimated cost for your attention.

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd
w 160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
g \ Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepairs Company Reg. No. 201600894N

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 1:34 PM

To: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Dear Dawn,

You are most welcome.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com [mailto:rhinorepairssg@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 1:29 PM

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.RO.50234.18.RR]

Hi Nivitha,

Noted ! Thank you so much for your help!

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim



Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722

:_cli Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhincrepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepairs Company Reg. No. 201600994N

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 1:26 PM

To: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Dear Dawn,

I've informed my surveyor, later afternoon he will call to update you.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:; 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com [mailto:rhinorepairssg@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 1:22 PM

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Hi Nivitha,

Any updates on the estimated cost ?

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd
~ 160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
>t \ Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepairs Company Reg. No. 201600994N

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 4:40 PM

To: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com

Cc: 'Motor Claim - III' <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Dear Dawn,

Around 5 plus.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phdne: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com [mailto:rhinorepairssg@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 4:38 PM

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Motor Claim - llI' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Hi

Can | check what time your surveyor will come down?
Please advise.

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
Office: 6254 8858 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: sales@rhinorental.sg
Company/GST Registration No, 201325388E

. | Rhino Rental Pte Ltd

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 3:38 PM

To: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com

Cc: 'Motor Claim - llI' <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0O.50234.18.RR]

Dear Dawn,

Later my surveyor will come down for the post-repair photo taking.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claim - lll [mailto:motorclaim @iii.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 3:34 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.RO.50234.18.RR]

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com [mailto:rhinorepairssg@gmail.com]
Sent: 06 July, 2018 3:08 PM
To: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>; 'Ruby Ong' <ruby@htapartners.com.sg>
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Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; Sherini Pillai <sherini@iii.com.sg>
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Hi,

| will like to check with you if you can arrange your surveyor to drop by my workshop for the post-repair photo
taking?

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd

~ 160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
g \ Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepairs Company Reg. No. 201600994N

From: rhinorepairsse@gmail.com <rhinorepairssg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 5:52 PM

To: '"Motor Claim - IlI' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; 'Ruby Ong' <ruby@htapartners.com.sg>

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com: 'Sherini Pillai' <sherini@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.M H.R0.50234.18.RR]
Importance: High

Hi,
Please get your surveyor to come down tomorrow morning for the post — repair inspection.
I will very much appreciate if you can reply to acknowledge with a time.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd
w 160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
g \ Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepairs Company Reg. No. 201600994N

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com <rhinorepairssg@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 July 2018 1:10 PM

To: 'Motor Claim - Ill' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; 'Ruby Ong' <ruby@htapartners.com.sg>

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; 'Sherini Pillai' <sherini@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.R0.50234.18.RR]

Hi,

Please advise what time is your surveyor coming down.



Thank you.

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd
w 160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
> \ Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepairs Company Reg. No. 201600984N

From: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com <rhinorepairssg@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July 2018 10:22 AM

To: 'Motor Claim - IlI' <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>; 'Ruby Ong' <ruby@htapartners.com.sg>

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; 'Sherini Pillai' <sherini@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.M H.R0O.50234.18.RR]

Hi All,

The vehicle is in our workshop already, | will like to request for your surveyor to come down today instead of
tomorrow before 5.30pm.

Please let me know if your surveyor can make it today.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Dawn Sim

Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd
“’ 160 Sin Ming Drive #03-14, Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722
g \ Tel: 8666 4445 Fax: 6250 9702 Email: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com
RhinoRepais Company Reg. No. 201600894N

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 29 June 2018 4:00 PM

To: Ruby Ong <ruby@htapartners.com.sg>

Cc: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com; 'sur@lkkauto.com' <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Sherini Pillai <sherini@iii.com.sg>
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.M H.R0.50234.18.RR]

Dear Sir/ Mdm

This Pre-Repair Survey is on Without Prejudice Basis.

THIRD PARTY VEHICLE NO. : GUI1733T
11 INSURED VEHICLE NO. : SHB7542B
DATE OF LOSS : 04.06.2018



We acknowledge receipt of your email.
In compliance to Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA cases, we note that
We disagree to the list of motor surveyors that you have proposed.

Therefore, we have appointed our surveyor LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS to conduct the pre-repair survey.
This claim is handled by PRIYA.

Please let us have your client’s accident report and repair estimate for our appointed surveyor to conclude his
report.

**We would like to conduct a re-survey after spray painting. Please contact our surveyor to arrange.
**Surveyor kindly upload this assignment to Merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

ANDREW LIM

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street | #05 I0B Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 227

S&P ‘A-* (stable) rated Company

From: Ruby Ong [mailto:ruby@htapartners.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 29 June, 2018 9:56 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: rhinorepairssg@gmail.com

Subject: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR GU1733T [OUR REF. TCL.MH.RO.50234.18.RR]
Importance: High

Your ref: SH 6383M WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Ourref: TCL.MH.ro.50234.18.rr

29 June 2018

India International Insurance Pte Ltd By Email Only

Motor Claims Department
64 Cecil Street

#04-02 108B Building
Singapore 069428

VERY URGENT

Dear Sirs

CLAIMANT: RHINO RENTAL PTE LTD
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GU 1733T, SH 6383M & SHB 7542B ALONG CTE ON 4 JUNE 2018 @ ABOUT 0930HRS

We are instructed by Rhino Rental Pte Ltd to notify you of a road traffic accident on 4 June 2018 at about 0930hrs
along CTE involving our client’s vehicle registration number GU 1733T and vehicle registration number SH 6383M
driven by you/your insured at the material time.



As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the damaged
vehicle, our client propose to appoint Victor Png of Appraisal VP Pte Ltd as the single joint expert to carry out the
pre-repair survey for GU 1733T.

Kindly make the necessary arrangements with the contact person. The details are as follows :

Venue ; Rhino Repairs Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#03-14 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Contact Person : Ms Dawn Sim (Tel: 6254 8858)

In the event that the pre-repair survey was not conducted during the prescribed time or already conducted at your end
previously, we reserve our client’s right to claim for compensation for loss of use for your current request for re-survey.

Best regards,

Ruby Ong

Secretary

M/s Hin Tat Augustine & Partners

20 Upper Circular Road

#02-10/12 The Riverwalk

Singapore 058416

Tel : 6533 0212 ext 278

Fax: 6338 3536 / 6533 0313

www.htapartners.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information is contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or
responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you
should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email.

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.
Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
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the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling -
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately. '

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
www.avg.com

11



Model : : NISSAN CABSTAR

Vehicle No : GU1733T

Workshop : Rhino Repair Pte Ltd
f Da. Parts

1 1 |Rear tailgate 1,700.00|

2 1 Rear floor panel 5,000.00

3 1 Rear end panel S N n 885.00

4 1 |Rearrhside gate X 3,000.00
Pisc 3¢,

Nett item

5 1 Rear Tailgate "nissan"big red sticker X 100.00

6 3 Rear tailgate hinge @60. each X s M 180.00

7 1 Rear "nissan cab star"emblem sticker X 30.

8 2 [Reartaillamp (Ih & rh) @250 (Y~ (MR , M W/Vs00.00| (€57
9 2 Rear tail lamp holder (Ih &rh ) @ $100 X| A/A~ 200.00

10 1 Rear no plate holder ,~ f4T 180.00 QS‘ .3
11 1 Rear no. plate lamp assy % 55.00

12 3 Rear rh side gate hinge @60. each X 180.00

13 1 |Rearrhsidegatelock ¥ NN 200.00

14 1 Rear rh lower tool box X 170.00

15 i Rear tow hock X 260.00

Special Item

Disc LG?,/




16
17
18

20

NN N

Rear reinforcement bar holder
60 km/h sticker ~ MC
13 paxsticker X e NH

Rearnoplate &‘(

Rear reinforcment bar X /U"

400.00
30.00
30.00
40.00

1,400.00




Vehicle No GU1733T
Workshop Rhino Repair Pte Ltd

Labour Details for front

Check wiring system
Anti rust

Labour charge
Spray painting

Repair Cost $1 5,909.00‘

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify ’L{ kP 2 é
1

the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey beforelafte: Spray painting
» To display damaged pan(s) duri ; ,7
ng resurvey '2} 00
o

* Pants prices are subject to confirmation

* Third party survey is on a "Without Preiudics*
rejudice” basis
* No llegal modification(s) is allowed f4

The repatfgouldrequire-aperiad o
Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:

Date:

08 working days. 2 pa.,, ¢ .




' 7d 74

-

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL

64 CECIL STREET

#05-02 |0B BUILDING SINGAPORE 049711

Ref :  CS3/11118011908/Gsd3e2-1

Date: 21-11-2018

Code: II2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 7542B Veh. Inspected GU 17337
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. MCT18080110 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From ANDREW LIM Assign Date 30/10/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN CABSTAR c.c 3153
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2001
Chassis No. JN1SF4F23Z0843020 Colour SILVER
Odometer 502621 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [195R15 SUMITOMO 5mm
L/H Front Tyre [195R15 SUMITOMO 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155R12 YOKOHAMA 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre 155 R12 YOKOHAMA 5mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/06/2018 Inspection Date 04/07/2018
Survey held at RHINO REPAIRS-160 SIN MING DRIVE#03-14
Repairer -
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




4

/L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-H: ;‘. ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GU 1733T
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshop?g)) ($])
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILGATE BUCKLED 1,700.00 1,700.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL NOT NECESSARY 5,000.00
1|REAR END PANEL NOT NECESSARY 885.00
1|REAR RH SIDE GATE NOT NECESSARY 3,000.00
LESS 30% DISCOUNT -3,175.50 -510.00
7,409.50 1,190.00
NETT ITEMS
1|REAR TAILGATE "NISSAN" BIG RED STICKER (N) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
3|REAR TAILGATE HINGE @$60.00 (N) NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
1|REAR "NISSAN CAB STAR" EMBLEM STICKER (N) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
2|REAR TAIL LAMP (LH&RH) @$250.00 (N) N/S CRACKED / O/S 500.00 148.70
NOT NECESSARY
2|REAR TAIL LAMP HOLDER (LH&RH) @$100.00 (N) NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
1|REAR NO PLATE HOLDER (N) BENT 180.00 65.30
1|REAR NO. PLATE LAMP ASSY (N) NOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
3|REAR RH SIDE GATE HINGE @$60.00 (N) NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
1|REAR RH SIDE GATE LOCK (N) NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
1|REAR RH LOWER TOOL BOX (N) NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
1|REAR TOW HOCK (N) NOT NECESSARY 260.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -205.50 -21.40
1,849.50 192.60
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR REINFORCEMENT BAR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 900.00 -
2|REAR REINFORCEMENT BAR HOLDER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 400.00 -
1|60KM/H STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 15.00
2|13 PAX STICKER (SN) NOT CHANGED 30.00 -
2|REAR NO PLATE (SN) BENT 40.00 15.00
1,400.00 30.00
LABOUR
CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 250.00 30.00

Report Ref No. CS3/11118011908/Gsd3e2-1
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description Condition )

B ponsiliads Workshop (S) (5)
ANTI RUST NOT NECESSARY 500.00 -
LABOUR CHARGE. 2,500.00 300.00
SPRAY PAINTING 2,000.00 400.00

5,250.00 730.00
GRAND TOTAL 15,909.00 2,142.60
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,700.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS3/11118011908/Gsd3e2-1
XING GUO QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




-_: o wel ?

Af ;F‘Ll BY

REF: :m:

ASSIGNMENT
| C
From Date ‘q\ao‘g Yeh No 6 qna.}r 1 Regn ‘55}3 | e L)

Eslimated Cost
PY WS | TP RES / OD RES [ EVA/INV.I MY

Gu 131331

Toinspect Vehicle No

at Workshop mis %i[\o rs gLIns
4160 Sin Viing D F 0314
insured
Policy Ns
Ctaims No
Sum Insured Excess
{Client's Record)
Make of Veh Town@ 6254 §858
{Polcy Conaition)
Ramark: The veh had commenced its NIS | OGS
repair at the time of inspection, I~
o

Bal or Matke! Value

1DAC Accident Rport Consistent? . Yes or No

GIA / PH Sesn Consisten? : Yes or No

days Res: Yes or No

2.0 %

CA | REV | REP, | 24 HRs'UP’

£sl Repaus

Lum Sum dval. Yes or No

Vehicle: INTOUT

Date Person Contacted

Type: M.Car / MCycle / Bus/ Van | Taxi | Prime Mover !

Truck ) Trailer of

Make /u, ¢ Gm CapSfoye  5[55
Colour Vt v AIC:  Insured) Std | NI NA
soready 0262 | TRadio asured  Sid NirNA
EngiNo

CMNo :(/U(SF”’FQF) co g(P bo')_,

Gen. Cond l@l | Fair | Poor | Burnt
Steenng IndGer | Jammed | Leaked f Bumt of
Brake:  Injder | Jammed | Leaked [ Burnt or
I SiRim | STD A/Rim or
Tyre Size H L? S K tsl
R (55 R[Z
BS I DUN / EXNOVA | GY | FS/ LIZA/ MIC | QHTSU / PIR / SUMI i
TOYO!Y

Modi

Fronl

RiBal < : L mm
UBal, 9 N L/Bal 5 ~wm
D.OA 0O 9_({9-—0 7-1¥
Survey heid al Ab‘/l_s 4

tlo /),“
Des of Damages - Frt | @ QIS | NIS | UIC | Rooltop or

The UIC | Chassis frame ! Body Structure affected due 10 collision

Action / Instruction

c%rz,pao -~ %q;ooo

- : o I, o Py
e #amd TR0 1

Date | Tune

Dt/ Tiine., File Fass o7 . "
| »cmA' ;lt‘z E Prell. Repont Days Of Repair: 3
1) 2 ’]: Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: ( Survey Fee 30
DistaTena i';hr Returm o7 | Transportaton m

Add Fee: ‘Site Insp (8 )|_SeR5._ Sl

D Interview (¥ )| Protos

Report Format : Tech Invs ($ ) Omers 1
Lump Sum/IBLE 7, foo /_ /_{; ) D Weekend ($ )

TOTAL



