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11MFNA PARFINNFE Balata Famnr

> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type: Singapare NRIC

Owner 1D: 27948

Vehicle No.: 5JQ2892X

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 01 Nov 2018

Vehicle Make NISSAN

Vehicle Model; LATIO SPORT BASE 1.5L AT ABS D/AB 2WD 5D
Primary Colour; Red

Secondary Colour: Grey

Manufacturing Year: 2008

Engine No.: HR1509353468
Chassis No.: JN1FAAC11ZD010555

Maximum Power Output: BO.O kW (107 bhp)

Open Market Valua: £19.002.00
Criginal Registration Date: 30 Apr 2009
First Registration Date: 30 Apr 2009
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid; $19.002.00
PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 29 Apr 2019
PARF Rebate Amount: $9.501.00

COE Expiry Date: 29 Apr 2019

COE Category; E - Open Categary
COE Period[Years)! 10

QP Paid: $7,789.00

COE Rebate Amount $375.00

Total Rebate Amount: £9.876.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Nov 2018
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SHU FATT AUTO WORKS

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-80 SINGAPORE 150723 TEL: 8273 01198 FAX: 6270 7065

Email: shulatt O paoifioRot-ageag=i1 w=. iy
Co. Reg. No. 09062400M GST Reg. No. 09-062400-M

Our Ref. SF/WSK/jw/SF-quo

30 Ocrober 2018

AIG-TP

CV-ska2892 X NISSAN LATIO

Spare Parts

Labaur

front bumper O <
Front bumper retainer M- #

Front bumper clips @54.40 x 10 ~&~ -

Right front headlamp 7 Ch8 -~

Right front headlamp holder 2 Ko

Right front fog lamp " b
Right front fender Tagesr 75
Right front fender cowling < A~

Right front fender cowling clips @54.40 x B pcs o A

To knock, straighten front inner panel, front lower panel,
Frt side panel, right front wheelhouse, front support
Panel, renew front bumper, front right headlamp, right

Front fender and assembly.

To respray damaged parts.
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470.00 nett .~
25.00 nett"
44.00 nett””

390.00 nett ~~
30.00 nett ¥

350.00 s.nett £

650.00 nett
85.00 nett
35.20 nett 2

2,079.20

sgr{‘f-ﬁ-i'“"" = 5w
- ytﬁlfw

553,729.20
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BOE AR B T R
/& SHU FATT AUTO WORKS

BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-80 SINGAPORE 158723 TEL: 6273 0119 FAX: 6270 7065

Emall: shufatt @ pacifie-notegi~jni1 im. 13
Co. Reg. No. 08062400M GST Reg. No. 09-062400-M

Our Ref. SF/WSK/|w/5F-quo

30 October 2018
AIG-TP
s 2 X NISSAN LATIO sS
Spare Parts front bumper 470.00 nett
Front bumper retainer 25.00 nett
Front bumper clips @54.40 x 10 44.00 nett
Right front headlamp 390.00 nett
Right front headlamp holder 30.00 nett
Right front fog lamp 350.00 s.nett
Right front fender 650.00 nett
Right front fender cowling 85.00 nett
Right front fender cowling clips @54.40 x 8 pcs 35.20 nett
2,079.20
Labour To knock, straighten front inner panel, front lower panel,
Frt side panel, right front wheelhouse, front support
pPanel, renew front bumper, front right headlamp, right
Front fender and assembly. 900.00
To respray damaged parts. 750.00
553,725.20
Suppleme 31.10.2018
Front bumper foam 220.00 nett CPA ~
Bumper reinforcement 450.00 nett ¢4~
fe - Luwiged | Pazul 670.00 nett
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BORE AR B T R
;e /= SHU FATT AUTO WORKS

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-90 SINGAPORE 150723 TEL: 6273 0118 FAX: 6270 7085

Email: shulatt @ pacifie-net-ags an11 wm. g4

Our Ref. SF/WSK/jw/SF-quo

30 October 2018
AIG-TP
ﬁD\ E 2892 X NISSAN LATIO 55
Spare Parts  front bumper OF <~ 470.00 nett
Front bumper retainer A~ # 25.00 nett
Front bumper clips @54.40 x 10 »s~ - 44,00 nett
Right front headlamp 7 390,00 nett
Right front headlamp holder . 30.00 nett
Right front fog lamp % 350.00 s.nett
Right front fender Tepess 650.00 nett
Right front fender cowling + 85.00 nett
Right front fender cowling clips @54.40 x B pcs « 35.20 nett
2,079.20
Labour To knock, straighten front inner panel, front lower panel,
Frt side panel, right front wheelhouse, front support
Panel, renew front bumper, front right headlamp, right
Front fender and assembly. M@N
To respray damaged parts. ?}D{f Yoo
553,729.20




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Julla - Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>»

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 10:33 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: accident involving 5JQ 2892 X and SKA 3993 D on 25/10/2018 *LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18019715/pa3

Attachments: img-181114095537 pdf; img-181114095657 pdf

Miss Chew Hsiao Tong
Without prejudice

We refer to the above and forward our LOD with supporting documents herewith,
We look forward to your payment of $2,302.50 soon.

Thank you

| pogat SESEl

Sho Fatt Aute Works

elia Worg

Tel: 62730119

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 30, 2018 5:30 PM

To: Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works

Cc: Admin A; assignments
Subject: RE: accident involving SJQ 2892 X and SKA 3993 D on 25/10/2018 *LKK REF: CC6/A1G18019715/pa3

Without Prejudice

Hi Sirs/Mdm,

We refer o the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA [subject to BOLA guideline setflement] and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above

menfioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair o your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost Is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Please note that all finalisation subject insurer's approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal procecdings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works t@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 5:17 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewhi@lk on>

Subject: FW: accident involving SJQ 2892 X and SKA 3993 D on 25/10/2018

Miss Chew
Without prejudice

As requested, we forward photos depicting damages to our client’s vehicle.
Pls confirm liability asap.

Thank you

From: Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works [mallto:shufatt@singnet.com.sg)
Sent: Tuesday, October 30, 2018 12:11 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (chewht@lkkauto.com)
Subject: FW: accident involving SJQ 2892 X and SKA 3993 D on 25/10/2018

Miss Chew
Without prejudice

We also forward our request letter for survey with supporting documents herewith o vou.
Pls confirm liability asap.

Thank you

el TE3t
Sl Fatt Aute Works
Volia Worg

Tel: €2730119

From: J_uif; - Shu Fatt Auto Works "
Sent: Tuesday, October 30, 2018 12:08 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: accident involving SJQ 2892 X and SKA 3993 D on 25/10/2018

To : LKK Auto
Without prejudice

We forward our request for survey.



Pls arrange and confirm liability asap.

Thank you

Lo pragd HE3ti]
Ste Fatt Aute Works
Velia Wong

Tel: 62730114



BEA SR R
SHU FATT AUTO WORKS

BLOCK 1MWIEHAHWESH1~MMPCHE 169723 TEL: 8273 0110 FAX: 8270 7085

Ellﬂ:M.mii-lhfﬂ-lg
Co. Reg. Na. 09082400M GST Reg. No. 09-062400-M

Our Ref. 5F/091/2018

13" November 2018 without prejudice
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd,,

78 Shenton Way, #07-16,

Singapore 079120,

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 510 2892 X AND 5KA 3953 DON 25/10/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Repair costs $1,979.50
Loss of use s
Lm:nfusl{smuxadaﬁx %) S 3100
Loss of Income 5

Survey fee 5

Towing fee S

GlA search fee 5 200
LTA search fee 5

GlA report fee for TP report -]
Miscglianeous 5
Off-peak e-day licenca 5

Sedl for off-peak car 5
Phnrtucnnim‘numzwadnﬁn — p

$2,302.50

EESIERE==a
To facilitate your investigation, we farward repair bill, accident report, certificate of Insurance and Letter of
Authorisation, GIA search, rental dgreement and invoice for your necessary action.

The above pertains 1o property damage claim only and should not prejudice infury claim, if any.
We thank you for your Prompt assistance and we look forward to your early settlement.

Yours faithfully,
5HU FATT AUTO WORKS

%‘f[ |~
Juliz Wong (Claims)

Encs,

—_—




MSIG

MSIG Insurance } Pte. Lid

4 Shenton Way. ¥ 21-01. Elnrrl! SHuMIOEBBW
Tel +65 BA27 7E8E, Fax «65 6827 7

o Reg No. 2004122126 Eﬁﬂuhiﬂ-ﬂllﬂl!c—

Certificate of Insurance

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT 1887 ([MALAYSIA
THE MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1856 RATION OF MALAYS
THE MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COM Emnml 1ON (CAP, 188 OF THE REVISED EDITION)
(REPUBLIC OF SIN
THE MOTOR U'EHIGLED'{FHIRD-PARW RISK AND COMPENSATIO 'LRLH.ES 1996 Eamonémm OF SINGAPORE)
AMENOMENT, ACT OR ACTS PASSED IN SUBSTITUTION REQF.

Form M.X.1 MOTOR MAX
Individual Ownership Comprahanalve

Centificate No. A 27651574 QMX
Excess: SGDS00

Windscreen Excesas : 5GD100
1, Index Mark and Registration Number of Vehicle
5J02892X%

2 Mamae of Pollcyholdar
Tan Wei Ping

3. Effective Dats of the Commencemant of Insurance for the purposas of tha Act
Io/f04/2018

4. Date of Expiry of insurance
29/04/20189

§. Persons or Classes of Persons antitied Lo drive®

Tan Wel Ping

.IJ;I othar person provided he is driving on cthe Policyholder's order or with the
Pollcyholder's permimsion.

* Provided that the person driving is permifted in sccordance with (e licen or ather laws or laws or regulations o drive
htlﬂwﬂfﬂﬂlmhnhmwrmmudmdhmlﬁmﬂmw of @ Court of Law or by reason of any
enactmant or regulation in thal behall from driving the Malor Vah

8. Limiations as to use®

Use only for social domestic and pleasure purposes and for the

+ Policyholder's business.
The Policy does not cover use for hire or reward racing pace-making
reliability trial speed-testing the carriage of goods othar than
sanples in connection with any trade or business or use for any
purpose in connection with the Motor Trade.

* Limitations rendered inoperativa by Section 8 of the Motor Vehiclas (Third-Party Risks and cmmndnn}muﬂm
188) and Section 05 of the Road Trensporl Acl. 1687 (Malaysia), are not to be | ed under thase headi

FLEAEE NOTE ALL CLATMS RELATED REPATR MUET BE CARRIED OUT AT ANY MAIG
AUTHORISED WORKSHOF LISTED IN THE ATTACHED.

Wmﬂmhhmlhmh{umummrﬂfﬂwmm if for reason the |s terminated durl . Iha
ﬁﬁhhmhmmﬂmmmmﬁ m%mam‘;% or Il tha .l!::hh.-m ﬂ 8
m [T comply wi offence
mm“camml A.r.li(‘.lp1 }'
IWE HEREBY CERTIFY that the 1o which this Certificata relates is issued In scoordance with the provisions of the Motor Vehlcles

{Third-Party Risks and Compansation) Act (Chaplar 188) and Part IV of the Road Transport Act. 1867 (Malaysia) or any Amendment, Act

MSIG Insurance (Singapors) Ple. Lid.

rovied
Golden Prme instaice “JENLY he
20 Ukl Hoad 3
yo1- .07 Think Qe S
Singapare 40de -1‘1 a1
Tel: 5842 5788 Faxi 62 07T for Chief Executive Officer

JCY20NB0412110



£1 UL AVE L #01-23 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 6256338] FAX (1165 2564315

Our Ref: CC6/AIGI8019715/pa3
FTOCT 2018

LIM ZHI CHEN KENNETH
150 MEILING STREET
#D4-59

SINGAPORE 141150

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA 3993D & SJQ 2829X ALONG/AT 184 MEILING
STREET MULTI STOREY CARPARK ON 25/10/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by yvour motor insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid 1o deal with the third

party claim against your policy.
We have received a claim from SJQ 2829X against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your favour. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAO TONG
Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

c.c. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

VEHICLE NO. 38 292 ¢

Name of owner _ lan Wiy ﬁﬂ-"ﬂ MRICNo. 3 1334191 8
Address _ BIK 1y09 Buliy Meral bave 3 H0l-40 <¢ 59723

Name of driver 20 above NRIC No.

Address an  apevd

ACCIDENT INVOLVING S 2842 AND <CkA 395D

ON__35)c]aes ALONG _ Msc? (7 Blk 1488 Mo bawy_S1etef

In consideration of M/S. SHU FATT AUTO WORKS repairing my/our vehicle no.  S!6 2843 X

at my/our request, |/we, the abovenamed owner/driver of the said vehicle hereby irrevocably
Instruct and authorize SHU FATT AUTO WORKS to demand/claim/settle/receive whatever amount
settled/payable by the Insurance company and/or third party insurance company and all amount
claimed and/or settled shall belong to SHU FATT AUTD WORKS to give an absolute discharge on
my/our behalf. The settlement cheque should be made In favour of SHU FATT AUTO WORKS
directly.

Dated this____ 370 dayof ___Nov 20_14
.,../“? .
Signature ; m
Name : Tﬁ N W | {l rN‘r

CarNo. : Cju :"qu X




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, SHU FATT AUTO WORKS (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
§51,979.50 (Repair Cost), $5321.00 (Loss of Hse/Rental). S82.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle ho.
SJQ 2892X that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 25/10/2018 (date) along
MSCP @ BLK 148A MEI LING STREET (location) involving vehicle no/s SKA 39930, This is
pursuant to the inspection conducted on JU/10/2018 (date) at “the workshop™.

Wel/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner TAN WEIL PING (the third pany
claimant™) of vehicle no. SJQ 2892X make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid for all damages.
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining 1o costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage 1o SJQ 2892X (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and finol settlement of any claim ol “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on n
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law und the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute ansing out of the same.

Dated this__ 18" (day) of __Detwh et month) 2018 (vear)

MWL

Signed by appointed surveyor




BB AR £ 4 E K
= SHU FATT AUTO WORKS

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-80 SINGAPORE 159723 TEL: 6273 0119 FAX; 6270 7065
Co. Aeg. No. 08062400M GST Reg. No. 09-062400-M

TAN INVODICE NOy - SFO9) 20
12 November 2001 8

AIG Asmm Pacific Insurnnce Pre Lid
(Third Partv)

..... >

The repair casts of the above vehicle has been ngreed

upon a lump sum figure of SS1850 00 183000
T GST 129.50

S'PORE DOLLARS: ONE THOUSAND NINE
HUNDRED SEVENTY-NINE & CENTS FIFTY ONLY.

L

[
............

E&0.E



13711 2018 17:40 FAX

RENT-A-CAR

INVOICE TO

TAN WEI PING
BLK 145

MEI LING STREET
#03-13)
SINGAPORE 140145

@ooo1/0001

TAX INVOICE

GST REG. NO.. 200106276D

DATE INVOICE NO,

13-Nov-2018 A 38569

VHA NO. DUE DATE VEH. NO.
A JESGS 13-Nowv-2018 SQP7S23U
DESCRIPTION NO. OF DAYS RATE AMOUNT
RENTAL FROM 31 OCTOBER 2018 TO 03 NOVEMBER 2018 ] 100,00 300.00
YOUR REF: 8JQ 2892 X
GST@ 7% $21.00
TOTAL $321.00

All cheques must be made payable to BKW Rent A Car Pre Lid

Please write the vehicle and Involce mumber on the reserve

BKW Rent-A-Car Pte Ltd

120 Lower Dalla Road #02-15 Cendex Centre (S) 169208 Tel: 8738 7777 Fax: 6738 6666

ACRA No: 2001082780 GST Reg. No: 20-0108278-0
A subsidiary of BEKW Automaobile Pte Lid

Website: www.bkw.sg



Invoice Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

€ Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
|N5MCE Phone: +85 8224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CST Registration No: MA00DT7735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-166368

Date of Request: 26/10/2018 Your Ref No: Oniline Purchase

Shu Faft Auto Works

Block 1009 Bukit Marah Lans 3

#01-90

Singapore 158723

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 26102018

Enquiry By JULIA WONG POH CHOO

TP Vehicle No. SKA3093D

Accident Date 25102018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicla No. Ingsurer Pariod of Insuranca [neurer Tel, No.
SKA3S830 AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pta. Lid. Zrizor-2eM1 12018 65-8418-3000
Thank You.

Tha images provided to you are taken from the original reports farwanded Io the cenire by the membars of the General Insurance
Association of Singapors and we take no responsiblity for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no llability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arsing oul of or In connection with the mparts or thelr images.

This is a computer ganaraled document and requires no signature.

https://www.giarmc.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fuscbox=MTRsas&fuscaction=dsp_geni... 10/26/2018
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GE"M RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapare 048580
INSMCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 8224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE OST Registration No: M400017735
TAX INVOICE

Our Rel No: GR-18-186368
Date of Reguest: 26811072018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Shu Fatt Auln Works
Block 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80
Singapore 158723
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 26102018
Enquiry By JULIA WONG POH CHOO
TP Vahicle No. SKA3EE3D
Accident Date 25M10/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%) s
TP Insuror Enquiry 1.87
GST Amouni 013
Total Amount Dus {GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You.

This is a computer genarated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date

[X] GIRO { ] Cash [ ] Cheque

htlps:ﬁwww.gimmc,urg.sgfclainu’ind:x.cfm‘?ﬁjsch-ux=

MTRsas&fusmtion’dsp _geni... 10/26/2018
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Faatiane

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case  |Notifed | Est Submiried Ad) Assigred | Ad) Rt Ad) Submitied | ins Aurhed Status
| |2802018 MOGI0E gy ms000  5$1,850.00 oy Yoy S
el | g Adi Rpe | | e Esnmates | | new Ao | | cancel Case |

[Created by adjuster]

LIM ZHI CHEM KENMETH, 1D: 57107774
TAN WEI PING, |0¢ 579927568

[ 25/10/2018 10:00 - .56
l $1Q2892X Date oF L9551 1113 Months and 25 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

|Ciaim Typa: | TP / 454227570556 :";‘:?:‘E‘“‘" | 2100358362 (Comprehensive)

| shicle Bag,
' SKA3993D :’g ticy ”"l']: | A27691974GMX

Ko
| [Irsured):

L— =
Hardlirng AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-8410-3000 ... [Handled by Chan, Kian-Mang |
Insumner: | Klanmang.Chani $aig.com

m“ MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7EEE
Aduster | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Te 62563551 _ [Handled by MOMD RASUL] | Final Rpt due 09/11/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED . view All |  Campose case mail ||

= AIG_SG (30/10/2018): Re: Request for O1 GIA [SKA 39930; DOA: 25/10/2018)

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All_| Search Tasks | Croste New Task | Complate |

i Due Date Priority  Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
| Mo results.

https://singapore. merimen.conVclaims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp... 17/12/2018



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*51Q2B92X (45422757055G)

[SKA3993D]
™
TAN WEI PING
Oct 25 2018 6:00PM

Page 1 of 2

[LIM ZHI CHEN KENNETH]
Shu Fatt Auto Works
mm]wmlmhm_nﬂ upinsd waso |  Uplosd Audio | View [View m Browser| =]
ii._lttlflfﬂnﬂ'llﬂﬂm tperpage  |v] [

[Na | Firaliz=d O

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

1 |(Oram) Third Party Express Settiamant - Payment Breakdown O = | |
Photos/ Images . 1 - 7]
%o | Relabel/Reorder | LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) — l Thumbmail | Print
1 0W/11/18 12:56 | Odometer Reading . © | waws | B
3 |07/11/1812:5%6 | Chassis Number D | oeaws |
3 |07/11/1812:56 | General View O Laws | A
4 |07/11/18 12:56 | General View D | =diws | &
5 |o71118 12:5% | Ganeral View 0 icawors || (4
6 |07/11/18 12:56 | Ganeral View © | atws | D
7 |0711/18 12:56 | General View 0 | Loas s =1
8 (07/11/18 12:56 | General View O imows &
9 |0711/1812:56 | Geners! View © | 0wc & |
10 |07/11/18 12:56 | General View 0 | wedrsc | 4
11 (0711118 12:56 | Geners! View ©  tmdws | [
12 071118 12:55 | General View 'ﬂ | e | &
;13_5!:111:;1: 12:56 General View 0 latws | A
114 [07/11/1812:56 | Ganaral View 0 | teaiws | A
15 (0771118 12:56 | General View O | waows | B
16 D7/11/18 12:56 | General View O | ecws H
17 [07/11/1812:56 | Ganeral View o 0| leadiec | A
18 07/11/1812:56 | General View 0 | weaws | @
19 (07/11/1812:56 | Genaral View © | wawc | B
10 0711/1812:5 | General View - O | esdwc |
21 071171812:56 | General View - O sews | B
{22 |07/11/18 12:57 | Reinspection Photo 0 loadies | A
123 lo711/1812:57 | Reinspection Photo O wwaws || B
24 (0771118 12:57 | Reinspection Photo D | s | 4
25 071118 12:57 | Reinspection Photo O | waers | (A
26 (07/11/18 1257 | Relnspection Phote D | wers | M
27 074181257 | Relnspection Photo O | eiws | M
28 |07/11/1812:57 | Rainspection Photo © | s | A
| :_ri_';_nmma 12:57 | Reinspection Photo 0| i |
0 07/11/1812:57 Reinspection Photo O | adws || A
31 [07/11/1812:57  Reinspection Photo - © | oears | O |
37 (07711718 12:57 | Reinspection Photo D | weaws | A |
33 07/11/18 12:57 | Reinspection Photo O s | @ |
34 [07/11/1612:57 | Reinspection Photo 0 | s |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 17/12/2018
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\Letters/Correspondences 1perpage  [v]
[no | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ} Thumbnail

|35 |py/1e/18 12:57 Reinspection Phato
{36 |07F11/18 12:57 Reinspection Photo

Load PG

page ]

i
Print
M
Load G | A
[
i
Print

{No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)
1 3/10/18 1336 NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP + TP GIA REPORT
2 011118 18:36 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED —
3 17/12/1810:59  WORKSHOP INVOICE -
4 17/12/18 10:50  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM
[§  17/12/18 10:59 | Release Voucher
|6 |17/12/18 10:59 RENTAL RECEIPT
|7 |1/12/1810:59  GIA SEARCH
& |12/12/1810:% |LETTER YOOI
No |Finalized Gn AIG Asla Pocific Insurance Pts. Ltd, (SG) Thumbnall| Print
! [30/10/18 16:08 | OI GIA REPORT

g
-

1
g

2
3

cooceceed i o°
]
g

|
is
q

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST raset | save | print |
There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checkiist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Show Remarks Tor [ Handiing Insurer
Wobe BEnacui are OrVALE undEss vou show i Le other osrties.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do... 17/12/2018



NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|'U'lh|l:ll No: SKA39930 (Insd veh) Modal: ISSAN LATIO 1.5 SPORTS
5J02892X (TP veh) A)
| Date of Accident: |25/10/2018
Global Sum Settlement | [ [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate 5 4,707 14
Final Repair Cosl g 1,8789.50
Loss of Use s days at $0.00 per day
Rental [if any) § 32100, 3 days
LTA ! GIA Search Fee 5 2.00
Others: 5 000
-
Final Setilement Sum ] 2.302.50

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Istered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable’ Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registerad Workshop:

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (%) (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be filled only for chaln collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Shu Fatt Auto Works 5 2,302 50
2]
3) -
17 Dec
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents ta the form,
{(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice: Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill {if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 17/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (. Reg No:190807104R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax 6844-BBDS Email: sur@ikkauto. com;assignments@Iikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG18019715R1PA3O2

Date: 1711212018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 2100358362
N mant Vehicle 5 ja2892x Insured Vehicle No :  SKA3593D
Date of Loss: 251072018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 454227570556
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJQ2892X
Make & Model: NISSAN LATIO, 1.5 Sports (A) Engine No: HR 150836368
Reg Date: 30/04/2008 (Man, Year: 2008) Chassis No: JN1FAAC11Z0010555
Colour: Brown Odometer. 70827 km
Engine Capacity: 1498 cc
Markel Valus/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/Mew Car Price
VEHICLE AT THE TIM F SURVEY
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
From Tyre Size: 215/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/80 R16
Front Left Side: Yokohama B mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 6 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama 6 mm Rear Right Side Yokohama & mm
The above values represant the remadining (e ireads depth
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Dff %
Parts 274820 1.439.10 1.310.10 47 65
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,650.00 S00.00 750.00 4545
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 4,399.20 2,339.10 2,080.10  46.83
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,850.00
(SS) 439920 1.850.00 2.548 20 5795
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 307.94 129.50 178.44 57.85
Nett Amount (5§) 470714 1,979.50 2,727.64 57.95
+ Car Rental (3.0 x 55100,00/day + 7.00% G5T) (55) 321.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5) 2.00
Natt Liability (S§) 2,302.50
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 311072018
Date Inspected 311072018 Inspected Al Shu Fatt Auto Works (HQ)

Block 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-90
Singapore 159723

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 17/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: CHEW HSIAQ TONG

NOTE: Thiw report reprasents our fndings af the fime and place of inspechon sisted kerem. Such mspection has teon cormed our 10 the bast of our
knowiedge and atulity but any other Kebiily under any offier ciumtances is bamby expressly oxciuded.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 17/12/2018



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deformed 470.00F *470.00 FN
2 1 “FRONT BUMPER RETAINER Necessary 25.00F *25.00FN
i 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 44 00F *44.00FN
4 1 *RIGHT FRONT HEADLAMP Cracked 39000F *390.00FN
5§ 1 "RIGHT FRONT HEADLAMP HOLDER Serviceable 30.00F *-FN
g8 1 *RIGHT FRONT FOG LAMP Serviceable 350.00FS “FS
701 *RIGHT FRONT FENDER Repair B850.00F *FN
B 1 *RIGHT FRONT FENDER COWLING Mot Necessary 85.00F *-FN
g 8 *RIGHT FRONT FENDER COWLING CLIPS Not Necessary 35.20F “-FN
10 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOAM Cracked 220.00F *220.00FN
11 1 “BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Bent 450.00F *450.00FN

F=Franchise part. S=Spchett N=Neattitem Disc

Sub Total (S§)  2,749.20 1,599.00

- Nett Item Discount on N Items 0.00/10.00% (S%) 0.00 155.90

Total Parts (S5)  2,749.20 1,439.10

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 17/12/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairar's Amount
Labour tems
1 TO KNOCK ,STRAIGHTEN FRONT INNER PAMNEL FRONT Hew 800.00 500.00
LOWER PANEL,FRT SIDE PANEL,RIGHT FRONT
WHEELHOUSE ,FRONT SUPPORT PANEL,RENEW FRONT
BUMPER ,FRONT RIGHT HEADLAMP ,RIGHT FRONT FENDER
AND ASSEMBLY
2 TO RESPRAY DAMAGED PARTS MNew 750.00 400.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1.650.00 900.00

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 17/12/2018



