Vic (LKKAuto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 11:59 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated

30/10/2018 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG18019706/Uha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

Please settle our claim as follow :

Repair Cost $512803.97 ( as finalised by surveyor’s)

Rental S$ 856 ( 8days as recommended )

To settle the claim amicably and promptly we prepare to settle at $513600.00 Global Sum.
Please reply .

Thank you & Best Regards,

Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April 2019 4:03 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18019706/Uha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jouis,

We refer to your below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer a global sum of $13,280.00 (all in) to settle your

client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward a copy to us for payment processing.



The above amount is to be made payable to JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 22 March, 2019 2:19 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18019706/Uha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

Refer to your email dated 28/11/2018.

Any update or offer to settle ?

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg




From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 24 January 2019 12:54 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18019706/Uha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

Refer to your email dated 28/11/2018.

Any update or offer to settle ?

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 2:04 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18019706/Uha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Jouis,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Meanwhile, we would like to request for a copy of your client’s video footage.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November, 2018 11:13 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18019706/Uha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Letter of Demand enclosed.

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 3:59 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18019706/Uha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October, 2018 4:12 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856J) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018




Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 12:12 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Jouis,

Please provide us GIA report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October, 2018 12:09 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: Accident Involving VehicleGBF5856J) and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018

Vehicle No. SGD3139K
Accident Date 30/10/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No.

Insurer

Period of Insurance

Insurer Tel. No.

SGD3139K

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

17/02/2018-16/02/2019

65-6419-3000

Without Prejudice .




Dear Sir/Madam

Accident Involving Vehicle GBF5856)J and SGD3139K (AIG Insured ) dated 30/10/2018.

We are assisting owner of GBF5856J handling their third party claim

against SGD3139K .

Kindly conduct the survey and establish liability for this case .

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg




