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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Kim Hong <kimhong@kim-co.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 January 2019 5:35 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; mj@kim-co.com.sg; nadiah@kim-co.com.sg; 'Janice '; intern@kim-co.com.sg; 

'Lucas Lee'

Subject: RE: PRI FOR SLX8977K 

Importance: High

TOP URGENT 

 

Dear Mr Taufik, 

 

We refer to our email below and to our various tele-conversations with regard to your Pre-repair Survey Report 

which is not ready. 

 

We wish to place on record that you had surveyed our client’s vehicle since October 2018 and until now, your Pre-

repair Survey Report is still not ready. As such, our client shall claim for all loss of use from the time of the accident 

until such time when our client is able to consider your recommendations.  

 

We also note that you have failed to revert on the agreed rates for a BMW i8 which is of similar make and model as 

our client’s vehicle.  As such, our client has proceeded to rent such a car and shall claim all rental costs accordingly 

from China Taiping.  

 

All our client’s rights are FULLY AND EXPRESSLY RESERVED. 

 

Regards, kim 

 

M/s Kim & Co 

Advocates & Solicitor 

Commissioner for Oaths & Notary Public 

10 Anson Road #30-11 

International Plaza 

Singapore 079903 

Tel: 65-62227263 

Fax: 65-62277263 

www.kim-co.com.sg 

 
CONFIDENTIALITY:   This e-mail message and any attachments thereto, is intended only for use by the addressee(s) named herein 

and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail message, 

you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail message, and any attachments thereto, is 

strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail message in error, please immediately notify the sender and permanently 

delete the original and any copies of this email. 

 

From: kimhong@kim-co.com.sg <kimhong@kim-co.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 27 December 2018 9:35 AM 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com 

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; mj@kim-co.com.sg; nadiah@kim-co.com.sg; 'Janice ' <janice@kim-co.com.sg>; intern@kim-

co.com.sg; kimhong@kim-co.com.sg 

Subject: FW: PRI FOR SLX8977K  

Importance: High 
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Dear Mr Taufik, 

 

We spoke a while ago and I confirm that you were the surveyor who surveyed my client’s above-captioned Vehicle 

in October 2018. 

 

You have informed me that you have yet to finalise the Survey report as my client’s workshop had informed you that 

my client has not decided whether to claim a total loss for his vehicle. 

 

For the avoidance of doubt, we are instructed that my client wishes to make a claim for a total loss.  Kindly confirm 

that you concur with this and that you shall proceed to prepare a Total loss Report for the vehicle. 

 

In addition, my client’s vehicle is a BMW i8 which rental costs is in the region of $1,500 a day.  Before my client 

proceeds to rent a car of the same make and model, kindly confirm the agreed rental rates of  a BMW i8 of the third 

party Insurance company in this case ie China Taiping Insurance.  

 

We thank you for your attention and look forward to hearing from you soonest and if possible, not later than 31st 

December 2018. 

 

Best Regards, 

Ms Lim Kim Hong 

M/S KIM & CO. 

Advocates & Solicitors 

Commissioner for Oaths & Notary Public 

10 Anson Road #30-11 

International Plaza 

Singapore 079903 

Tel : 65-62227263 

Fax: 65-62277263 

Website: www.kim-co.com.sg 

 

Privileged/Confidential information is contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this 

message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to 

anyone. In such a case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. 

 

From: Kim Hong <kimhong@kim-co.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 5:04 PM 

To: sur@lkkauto.com 

Cc: 'Janice' <janice@kim-co.com.sg>; mj@kim-co.com.sg; intern@kim-co.com.sg; 'Nadiah' <nadiah@kim-co.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: PRI FOR SLX8977K  

 

Attention: Mr Kenneth Kong 

 

Dear Mr Kong, 

 

We refer to the Pre-action survey carried out in October 2018 which we are given to understand that the Survey 

report has yet to be finalised. 

 

Our client instructs that he has been advised that his above-captioned Vehicle is beyond repair and as such, he 

wishes to make a claim for total loss. 

 

Kindly confirm your position on the same.  

 

All our client’s rights ARE FULLY AND EXPRESSLY RESERVED.  

 

Regards, kim 

 



3

M/s Kim & Co 

Advocates & Solicitor 

Commissioner for Oaths & Notary Public 

10 Anson Road #30-11 

International Plaza 

Singapore 079903 

Tel: 65-62227263 

Fax: 65-62277263 

www.kim-co.com.sg 

 
CONFIDENTIALITY:   This e-mail message and any attachments thereto, is intended only for use by the addressee(s) named herein 

and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail message, 

you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail message, and any attachments thereto, is 

strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail message in error, please immediately notify the sender and permanently 

delete the original and any copies of this email. 

CONFIDENTIALITY:   This e-mail message and any attachments thereto, is intended only for use by the addressee(s) named herein 

and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail message, 

you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail message, and any attachments thereto, is 

strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail message in error, please immediately notify the sender and permanently 

delete the original and any copies of this email. 

 


