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CREDIT REVIEW HL

26000 2018 1%:08 FAX

@ 0002/ 0004

> Back to OneMotoring
Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle .
" Vehicle Owner Particulars == E SR e e )
L Owmer 0 Type. _ Company > e |
| OwneriD: CIEAm 1

Vehicle Details I

Viehicle Mo.: SHAE788

Vshicle 1o be Exported: [

Ingerded Daragistration Date: 09 New 2018

Vehicle baka: HOMNDA _|

Vehicls Martel: HONDA CRY 200 AT

Primary Colour: e O B i) —
| Marsfacturing Yesr S — 2008 L

Enﬁml'h._'_ I m&ﬂ ______

" Chassis No: . JHLREZB309C200220 :

Masimum Powesr Output: i T 1100%W (147 bhgl .

Open Market Value: - $30,057.00 |

Criginal Registration Date: 28 Mow 2008 )

FroiRegitrationOpte:: = 00 _MNov208 =0 et e 3
__Transter Count: S —
| Actysl ARF Paid: $30,057.00 l

intended PARF Rebate Detalls

= _ PARF Eligibility: Ve ; '
__PARF Eligibility Expiry Cate: __ Nov20i8 “

PARF Rebate Amount ;

Intended COE Rebats Details {35 - 1
| COE Expiry Date: {27 how 2018 |
| COE Category: B - Car (1601cx & above) |

COE Period(Years); 0 i

P Paid: $8,301.00 |

COF, Rebate Amount: LG |
. Total Rebate Amount: $15,069.00 |
The information contained neseinis correct ss 3t 22 Ot 2018

OK

fkJo IC.W’X
| pukit o CwascenT
g d (D .



10/28/2018 Singapara Usad Car Lisiings - sgCarMart

saCAarMAarRT.COoM
THE UNLY PLAGE FOR SMART CAR BOYIRS
Honda CR-V 2.0 Used Vehicle List (4 vehicles)

‘Car Modal Price Depreciation  Heg Date EngCap Mileage  Company Avallability
Honda CR-V 2.0A S$18.800 . 02-Dec-2008° 1,997 ¢c 160,000 bom MY Commiercidl Pte Ltd  Avallable
550 Daily For Leasa| Cpbien To Extend For Anather 5 Or 10 Years, Very, Well Maintained By Previous Dwner, Vehitle Tn Excefient Condibon, Very Quet Drive
Briatifal Tntarior. Flael Tn Hous= Lban Avall..,

Office-No. - HI093877
Kenny Tan = 91853232

Honda CR-V 2.0A (New 10-yr 450,800 £5,080 fyr 16-Dec-20D8 1,997 cc - Seng Huat Motors Trading  Awallable
COE) ) ) ) Pte ifd

fload Tax Till 15 Dec 2018, Very Well Malntained. intarior Like New. See To Beheve. Make An Appointment For Vigwing.

Dffice No. - 68442050

Jonathan - 81814939

‘Honda CR-V 2,04 (COE till $34,800 7,290 fyr OB-Aug-2008  1997¢c - Avallible
08/2023) - ;

4 Transtur OF Same Owrier, 10 Years Service Records Available, New fircon Compreessr, Fully Sinced In Septammber.

Ciffice Mo, - -

Andrew Tan - BI9I0411 | Lee Med - 52920420

Honda CR-V 2.0A (New S-yr  $35,800 7,760 yr 11-55p-2008 1,997 cx  LOB000 kW Karz Korcent Available
psi ; . ;

Funmumvms;mmmumwmm Griginal mwmwnmmmm ﬁﬁmﬂﬁWanam- Fnriwm:am
Gestbos, Chaapest Prica With The Bisit Conditon. ...

office No, - -
Kelvin - 83513333 | Tan ( No 5MS ) - 81173313

qmuummmammnmmmrmw Nissar, Mitsublshi & BMW, There are plenty of cars for saie, sven for COL
i3, OPC cars, vans, trucks; hybrid cars, spons cars or statonwsgons, Tmmmmmamm;mmwm;,m il car <ol Btahds,
na-pirkm&mmﬂafm‘mMMmdﬂmmmmﬂmmwmmwmwmﬂwmmﬂmm
{rica-ists, risy car sunches and new ca promotions, and also metoring advice, ot reviews B Car fews on the latest modele, Vish our partnad gjtes for job
sp=nirgs far Singapore jobs, real estate properties for sale, movat, ar parfarmane parts, Gar discussion, forlm dispssion, commerdal vehlels leasing & CDE
1gLilks,

1D 2004-2018 sglarMart. All rights reserved.

hittges:ifwiew sgoanmant. comivsed_carsfsedrch readll_privefist print. php75A=&MOD=Honda%e20CR- V202 0ARPG=20&VEH=0GRGD=20088A.
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Celine Fung (LKKAuto)

From: Daryl She Nee TAN <dan/ftansn@dbs.com>

Sent Tuesday, 4 December 2018 10:02 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAyte); LKK Valuation

Ce Shiau Chan [LKKAuto); Audrey Hwee Ling GOH; Poh Keng TEQ
Subject: RE: Valuation Request

Hi Celine

Please proceed to submit formal valuation for the 4 vehicles below.
Aegards,

Daryl Tan

DID: 6878 9945

Risk Management Group
C8G/WM Credit Callection
DBS. Live more, Bank less

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: 01 November 2018 16:03

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>
Ce: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Daryl She Nee TAN <daryltansn@dbs.com>
Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request

This mail originated from an external party outside DBS - celinefong@Ikkauto.com.

Dear Audrey,
The Valuation of vehicles as below:

Viewing place at No 1 Bukit Batok Crescent Level 10 (Roof Top) Weega Plaza -

1) siL48788 MV: 516.5K F5:515.1K
2) SLBB174B MV: 570K FS: 549.9K
3) SKHB004P MV S46K FS5: 543.2K
Viewing place at 210 Turf Club Road Lot C20 The Grandstand-
4) SKJ407C MV: STOK F5: 564.7K
As at October 2018
Best Regands,
Celine Fong
LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phoe: b256-3561 | email: colinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Rlk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 5:36 PM



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

e ———
From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 4:03 PM
To: "Audrey Hwee Ling GOH'; LKK Valuation
Ce: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto): Daryl She Nee TAN
Subject: RE: Valtation Request
Dear Audray,

The Valuation of vehicles as balow;

Viewing place at No 1 Bukit Batok Crescent Level 10 (Roof Top) Weega Plaza -

1) SIL4878B MV;: $16.5K FS: $15.1K
2) SLBE174B MV: STOK FS: §49 9K
3) SKHBOOD4P MV: S46K FS: 543.2K
Viewing place at 210 Turf Club Road Lot C20 The Grandstand-
4) sK407C MV ST0K FS: S64.7K
Asat October 2018
Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

tthone; 6a56-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: fast-ams
Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Averiue 1, #o2-25 | S(408934)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 5:36 PM

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Daryl She Nee TAN <daryltansn@dbs.com>
Subject: RE: Valuation Request

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,

Please update the valuation for the below 4 vehicles.
Thanks.

Audrey Goh

CBG/WM Credit Collection

Risk Management Group

DBS Bank Ltd
Tel - 6878 9026 / 62233 007

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH

Sant: 29 October 2018 12:32 _
Ta: LKK Valuation <yaluation Lomz>; 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@lkkautp.com>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsci@kkauto.com>; Daryl She Nee TAN <daryltansn@dbs.com>

Subject: Valuation Request



-eline ang (LKKAuto)

From: Audrey Hwes Ling GOH <apdreygoh@dbs com>
fent: Monday. 22 October 2018 12:32 PM

Ta: LKK Valuation; Celine Fong (LKKAUtE)

LY ) Shiau Chan (LKKAGta); Danyl She Nee TAN
Subject: Valuation Reguesst

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,
Please assist to provide valuation for the following vehicles:

Viewing place at No 1 Bukit Batok Crescent Level 10 (Roof Top) Wecega Plaza -

1) SIL4878B - No key, Company registered vehicle, road Tax & COE expiring 28/11/2018
2) SLB8174B - No key, Road Tax expiry 13/1/2019

3) SKH8004P - With key, Road Tax expiry 16/1/2019

Viewing place at 210 Turf Club Road Lot C20 The Grandstand-
4] SKI07C - Road Tax expiry 4/2/2019, chstomer arranging to surrender key,

\We had faxed the above log cards, please acknowledged.
Thank you.

Audrey Goh

CBG/WM Credit Collection
Fisk Management Group
[*85 Bank Ltd

Tel - 6878 9026/ 62233 007

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email s intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of
tnis message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby noetified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please iImmediately notify the
sander and delete the mall. Thank you.
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