Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 3:50 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Cc: CS ATeam

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 || Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on
25/08/2016

Dear Bennie,

We refer to the below matter.

M/s China Taiping is agree to contribute 50% liability.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 3:37 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 || Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on 25/08/2016

Hi Thin Thin

Referring to your email below.

Reference to the attached scene photos provided, SGX1694G is in contact with SHC1947B.

Pls advise on how is SJD1475Z & SGX1694G (CTI) ->SKQ1636P AIG) ->SHC1947B (TP) applicable?

Best Regards

Bennie Tan
AlG
Senior Complex Claims Examiner



78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, July 14, 2018 4:24 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Cc: CS A Team

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 || Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on 25/08/2016

Dear Bennie,

Enclosed herewith accident scene photos from TP repairer, inspection photos and survey report for China Taiping
Insurance for your necessary action.

For AIG, we have submitted in Merimen.
Kindly let us have your further instruction in order for us to proceed further.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ [mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com]

Sent: Monday, 2 July 2018 7:34 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 | | Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on 25/08/2016

Hi Thin Thin

Kindly advise any scene photos & video footage to this accident.

Also, kindly let us have a copy of the survey report and photos pertaining to TP vehicle damages (SHC1947B).

Best Regards



Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718| Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 2:55 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Cc: CS A Team

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 || Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on 25/08/2016

Dear Bennie,
We refer to the below matter.
Please be inform that TP (SHC 1947B) has submitted the claim under AIG (SKQ 1636P) and CTI (SGX 1636P).

However CTI (SGX 1636P) have re-directed the claim to AIG (SKQ 1636P) based on their client reported he did not
collided onto TP vehicle SHC 1947B. Please see the attached email from CTI.

The sequence of this chain accident as follows;
SJD1475Z & SGX1694G (CTI) ->SKQ1636P AIG) ->SHC1947B (TP). We are of the view that BOLA 28F is applicable.

The summary of the claims is as follows:

(Al (H] [
Rear [1] Rear [2] Tatal

[Surieyed by | [Surveyed by

afM - Details of Claim LKK far AIG] | LKK for GTI]

1 Cost of Repairs $ 444050 (% 40660 | § 484710
2 Loss of Rental [SF100.55 % 6 days] §  G@03.48
3 Loss of Income [5F 50.00 x 6 davs] § 480.00
4 Damages § 5,930.58
5 LTA Search Fees 5 10.70
B Total Claim Amount § 5041.28

In view of the above, kindly let us have your further instruction whether can we proceed to settle for both claim.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Tan, Bennie-WZ [mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com]

Sent: Monday, 25 June 2018 2:23 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 | | Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on 25/08/2016

Hi LKK

Referring to the above.

Kindly advise on the last correspondences / status on this matter.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, December 26, 2017 5:33 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ; CS A Team

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 || Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on 25/08/2016

"Without Prejudice"
Dear Sir / Madam,

We acknowledge your email below.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Tan, Bennie-WZ [mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 5:25 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 | | Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on 25/08/2016
Importance: High

Hi LKK

Referring to the above.

Kindly advise on the last correspondences / status on this matter.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718]| Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Sent: Friday, September 29, 2017 11:52 AM

To: 'CS A Team'

Subject: Our Ref: 8153632979SG-005 || Accident Involving SKQ1636P / SHC1947B on 25/08/2016
Importance: High

Hi LKK

Referring to the above.

Kindly advise on the last correspondences / status on this matter. If no TP developments > 1 year, we will close this
matter on our end.

Best Regards



Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg
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