Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October, 2018 11:44 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: Our ref: CLMOMVP000000887- OD CLAIMS - SGD6226Y DOA 18/10/2018 AT

JUNCTION OF TOMLINSON

Hi team

Authorise if consistent, Excess of $2600 applicable. ($600 plus additional excess $2000 for less Than 24 Months
Driving Experience In Singapore On The Valid Class Of Driving License)

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, October 29, 2018 11:31 AM

To: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Our ref: CLMOMVP000000887- OD CLAIMS - SGD6226Y DOA 18/10/2018 AT JUNCTION OF
TOMLINSON

Dear Sharon,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng, Sharon [mailto:Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 October, 2018 11:26 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: FW: Our ref: CLMOMVP000000887- OD CLAIMS - SGD6226Y DOA 18/10/2018 AT JUNCTION OF TOMLINSON

Hi LKK team
Please survey OD veh today.
Cc: Kel- please check excess and advise authorization.

Regards
Sharon
GAIC

From: Tan, Rachel On Behalf Of General Claims
Sent: Monday, October 29, 2018 11:09 AM



