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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 '10:27 AM

To: 'KHONG Lynn'

Cc: CHOW Soon Hee Gene (gene.chowsh@axa.com.sg); KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto);

Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); HO Vincen| SUR

Subject: RE: Assistance required: Effect MV for SKB3318Z

Dear Lynn,

The market value of SKB 33182 is $31K-$32K (Estimated) as at Oct 18.

Best Regards,

Veron chen I case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 I emall :sur@lkkauto.com I fax:6256 4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CHOW Soon Hee Gene <gene.chowsh @axa.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 3:35 PM

To: bhtay@a utoprobe.com.sg; ad m in @a utoprobe.com.sg; nick@lbs-auto.com, jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg;

cynth ia.o ng@ p riorityse rvices. sg; ricky@rta.com.sg; elson @rta.com.sg; collin.wonE@a-pac.sg; patrick. soo @a- pa c. sg;

fra n kie@fta.com.sg; KKLau <kklau @ lkka uto.com>; olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <oliviala u@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang

(LKKAuto) <bryana ng@lkka uto.com>; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; HO Vincent <vincent. ho @axa.com.sg>; LKK

Valuation <va luation @ lkkauto.com>; KHONG Lynn <lynn, khong@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Assistance required: Effect MV for SKB3318Z

Dear Valued Partners,

Kindly check MV and update Ms Lynn

DoA: 2a/70/18

Tha nk You

Gene Chow ( Mr )

AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Sin8apore 068811 www.axa.com.sq

HP : 98587664

-----Drsc laime r-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. lf you are

not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. lf you have

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this

message are sotely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd or any other

entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

owner lD TYPe:

Owner lD:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No:

Vehicleto be Exported:

lntended DereBistratlon Date:

Vehicle Make:

VehicleModel:

Primarycolour:

M anufacturing Year:

EngineNo.:

Chassis No.:

MaximumPower Output:

Open MarketVelue:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfercount:

ActualARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

cOE Cate8ory:

cOE Period{Years):

qP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correctas at 26 Oct 2018

rage lol I

Singipore NRIC

99580

sKB3318Z

Yes

26Oct20I8

VOLKSWAGEN

JETTA 1.4TSIAT 1K23G5 MX

Black

2070

cM627 694

ww,lTzzlKzBv&7726
90.0 kw (120 bhp)

$20,s25.00

30 Mar 2011

30 Mar2011

o

$20,52s.00 t0uL
Yes

29 Mar2027

$12,31s.00

29Mat 2027

A- Car(1600cc& below)

10

$42,600.00

$10,329.00

$2L644.00
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