Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 October 2018 4:50 PM

To: Ng, Sharon

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value - FL2222D - CLMOMVMO000000332 (DOA 20/7/2018)

Dear Sharon,

The MV of FL 2222D is $30K-$31K(est) as at Jul’18.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 8:38 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Market Value - FL2222D - CLMOMVMO000000332 (DOA 20/7/2018)

Dear Denise

Please advise Market Value of FL2222D at the material time of the accident on 20/07/2018.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Sharon Ng, Claims | P. +65 6804 7845 | Fax. +65 6235 3354 sharon.ng@sg.gaig.com
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