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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Simon <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 3:01 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: REPAIR QUOTE OF SJM 5253S (OD)

Hi Shirley, 
  
We are unable to under take the repair offer. 
Estimate to repair about $3.5k 
  
Regards 
Simon 
KKH 
  
  
 

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Friday, November 16, 2018 2:34 PM 
To: simon@kkimhin.com.sg  

Cc: SUR  
Subject: REPAIR QUOTE OF SJM 5253S (OD) 

 
Hi Simon, 

 

Please assist to check whether you are able to undertake the repair at not more than $ 2,200.00. 

 

See attached photographs. 

 

 

 

 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


