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oo e S Conswltarnts

B BA B Pra Lid Company Registration No., 1996071958
51U AYE 1, #02-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL SIS BIARARAL FAX : (065 A153R111S
Your ref: D18007105MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCI18019508/T 1vd3 Date: 8/11/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REFPORT OF VEHICLE NO S]JL 7474M

We thank you for your instruction on 26/10/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
/1112018 al the premises of M/s  CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
and have the following lo report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 553,879.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 552,119.00
"Check" Items Amount : 5$357.00
Total : 8%

Market Value 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear portion

Comments/Present Status;

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAL AMSAE-A
Automaohile Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

B Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B580
Tel: (65)6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cofeg o 1950001060 G5T Reg Mo M2-D0CLETE-S

Claims & Mertor Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapese 068277

Tel (B5) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) BS07 3849
‘wiww mafirsteapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

27-09-2018 Qur Ref No
25-09-2018 Claim Type
SH7699X Third Party Vehicle

209 PANDAN GARDENS
COCOo
B5884555/ 0 Fax No

DIRECT SETTLEMENT: EST COR - $4,150.53

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

. D18007105MFSH

. Third Party

. SIL7474M

. 65681056

. 68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CYCLE & CARRIAGE
AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No

Attention

SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

. NIL

. NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

i :.‘4:..--'-!:': RuUP




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LEKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 November 2018 3:50 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Serene Ler’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007105MFSH/1, SIL 7474M
Attachments: SJL 7474M PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear SirfMadam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJL 7474M
Date of survey: 7/11/2018
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 12:38 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007105MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{g408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 12:19 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@E@ LKEKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@mosfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007105MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: T WWW.avg.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
R e e . R e o s e T i R

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 11:08 AM

To: Loi Ai Ting

Cc: Coco Lu Ting; Tay Jian Ye; Songcuan JR Laure Araos; Cheng Jo Jo; SUR
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALISE-SIL 7474M

Dear Ai Ting.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm finalised amount $2119 before GST @ 3 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 8:33 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay Jian Ye <jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Songcuan JR Lauro
Araos <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Cheng lo Jo <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALISE-SIL 7474M

Hi, Veron,
Sarry for the delay.
Kindly refer attached and confirm finalised amount at $2,267.33.

Thanks,

Best Regards,

Loi Ai Ting
Customer Service Advisor



@@ ' Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore = 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapere 609338
T: +65 6568 4556 « F: +65 6565 1240 = www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

Lol -
ei;i A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carnage Group

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 3:38 PM

To: Songcuan IR Lauro Araos; Loi Ai Ting; Cheng Jo Jo

Ce: Coco Lu Ting; Tay Jian Ye

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALISE-SIL 7474M

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us. .

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

"

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 5:40 PM

To: 'Songcuan JR Lauro Araos' <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; 'Loi Al Ting' <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Cheng Jo Jo (jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg) <jpjo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Cc: 'Coco Lu Ting' <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay lian Ye (jianye. tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg)
<jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALISE-SIL 7474M

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 4:08 PM

To: 'Sengcuan JR Lauro Araos' <laurc.songeuan @cyclecarriage.com.sg=; 'Loi Al Ting' <aiting loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Cheng Jo Jo (jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg) <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage com.sg>

Ce: 'Coco Lu Ting' <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay Jian Ye (jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg)
<jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALISE-SJL 7474M

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 20 December 2018 3:06 PM

To: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <giting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;

Cheng lo lo (jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg) <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.ses
Cc: Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay Jian Ye (jianye.ta clecarriage.com.sg)

<lianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALISE

Dear All,

Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.
1) SIL 7474M-DOA: 25/9/18 (FCI TP)

2) SLU 8308H-DOA:18/9/2018 (CHINA TAIPING TP)
3) SKK 3288D-DOA: 2/11/2018 (FCI TP)

Best Regards,



Uerdn Chen | Case Handler

' LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 11:40 AM

To: 'Songcuan JR Lauro Araos' <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;

Cheng Jo Jo (jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg) <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Cc: Coco Lu Ting <coco lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay Jian Ye (jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg)

Subject: PENDING FINALISE

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

1) SIL 7474M-DOA: 25/9/18 (FCI TP)
2) SKT 5488H-DOA: 25/9/18 (FCI TP)

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4085933)

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its
related corporations.
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFINOF Rahala Familne

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 10:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid;

COE Rebate Amoaunt:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Nov 2018

Singapore MRIC
21378

SILT474M
Mo

08 MNov 2018
MITSUEBISHI

LAMCER 1.5 MIVEC GLS 4A/T

Red

2008

4AF10117071
JMYSRCY2A9U002442
80.0 kW (107 bhp)
$18,750.00

11 Dec 2008

11 Dec 2008

0

$18.750.00

Yes
10 Dec 2018
£5,375.00

10 Dec 2018

A - Car [1600cc & belaw)
10

$7.721.00

$48.00

$9,443.00

OK

nttps: vl ita.gov.sginaivrilaciion/enguiralebatedyHublicHeroralarag input’/FUNL | EON_IL=FOEU4009 11

11



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Hame of Policyholder : Kwek Kian Tiong Vehicle No. : SJLTATAM
Period of Insurance 1 11 Dec 2017 To 10 Dec 2018 Policy No. £ 21001087 18-09
Engine No, L AARIRT 7OV Endorsement No.

Chagsis No. : JMYSRCY2ASU002442 lzsued Data : 08 Dec 2017

IIABOUT THE COVER ¥
Make/Model . MITSUBISHI LANCER EX 1.5 MIVEC

Enpine Capacity/Tonnage © 1.499.00 CC Sum Insured © Market Value First Year of Registration | 2008
Driver Restriction A Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COEPARF  : Yes

F P'S{m mr Glaﬁes of Persons: Entitied to Drive*

gilEr e, |
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L.mna. oM as 1o use”
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i< 50 Chan Chinage - SE00° Thetl - 50 Flood Caver - 50 [

Baation 2
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kerek Haany Tionp - S50 {Own Donoge)

T
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IMPORTANT NOTES
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Jine: lvewetny certily Sttt pobcy to whch s Candeste of In o eetas [ 1SS0 in DocORCANGE Wit e proneinng of the Motor Wehicks T hird Party Risks and Compensatian] £ iSag, 1T, Far 1Y 2
e Brad Trinspon Ao, 1987 (Maleyiia) and Motor Venlcies  Thifd Parly Rigks) Fules. 1058 [Walaysia)

DEGOT 20050 W
U¥CLE & CARRIAGE - CORPORATE

218 ALEXAMDRA ROAD — e

SINGAPORE 158830 ANSP - MOTOR AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Undenvritten iy AIG Asia Pacifle nsurancs Ple. Lid. AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED

¢

@

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE ¥ A\
CYCLE & CARRIAGE 200 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684555 Fax: 65691056 Mgg?gg"

ESTIMATE

Co Reg Mo : 197701469G

GST Reg Mo : MR-8500111-X

Invoice Name & Address

Owner Name & Vehicle Info

Mr KWEK KIAN TIONG

Cust No/Name

{Mr Kwek Kian Tiong

Reg No/Reg Date SJL7474M

J 11/12/200

Blk 709 Tampines 5t 71 Date In/Mileage f 0

#08-120 Chassis Mo JMYSRCY2ZASLI002442

$i 5207

Tagpere 20709 Engine No 44910117071

Contact No Mobile: 90477229 Make/Model MIT/LANCER 1.5 MIVEC 4AT SPORT (NEW

Colour/Trim P02 RED METALLIC / BK
AccountNo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
CSMD0041 Cash 25/09/2018/ 15:59 TLC 442 / Cocolu 31291
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNTB8000 - | 5 5¥1100.00
REMEW REAR BUMPER, REPAIR REAR END PAREL =
E PNT98000 #20 1260.00
SPRAY PAINT FOR REAR EUMPER, REAR END PANEL
E PNTBBOOO < 80.00
REMOVE & INSTALL PARKING SENSOR
E PNTEB000 ‘/’Z'DG.Dﬂ
REMOVE & INSTALL REAR COMPARTMENT TRIMS
M SUNDRY 7 20.00
Sundry )
M FACE,RR BUMPER 1.00 852.00 00.00| A<~ 852.00
M BRKT,R/BMPR FACE SUPT,LH \ [ 3.00 17.00 00.00| “24<717.00
M REINFORCEMENT,RR BUMPER 11.00 231.00 00.00 231.00
M BRACKET,LICENSE PLATE LAMP 3. 00 13.00 00.00 13.00
M REINFORCEMENT,RR BUMPER 1.00 90.00 00.00 90.00
M HREFLECTOR LH 1.00 36.00 00.00 KE.E.EHJ g
T J Ayl
EYOR NAME lub 13445949 '
SURVEYOR SIGNATURE; _T‘ -~ N
DATE : ___ i & UL'[': e ﬂ‘j. - \\‘{(
o AT W
RENARK R ) J:._{M 0\
' e T J -
LKK Auto Consultants hence notify i 14 -
tha R.Ei'};!-.req' ;,'.":‘-1 the fmlﬂ'ﬂlngl
Confirm & accepted by «To :;L-.sa&af damaged part(s) during resurvey
« Parts prices are subject to confirmation :
o Third party survey 1s.ona “Without Prejutice Dasis Nett k] ; 879.00
oMo illﬂ‘;:\:‘":ltd fcations) s akiowed 7% GST on 3879.00 271.53
= Supplamentary TR “L“M any
is subject o final _-'_;-pra'\.'ai from Prgur anie Compan Tﬂtﬂt Pﬂj"ﬂ.lﬂ.ﬂ 4’ 150 X 53
Euthorized signatory and company stamp, fepaie
Validity of this estimate is dayE ¥ date of guote. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.
Estimated costs quoted are exclud G5T, We would mention that t fimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include

any additional parts or labou

&r repair work has commenced. Occasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered

after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement, However, should this occur, we would advise you. Please be informed that a
deposit of 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
cheque. You must also agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of remewing
the rubber seal or cther repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.

Page 1 of 1



' % (@: , Surveyor : _LKK-TAUFIKH
C Exceptional Journeys Company : TP FIRST CAPITAL
SYELE SCORRINAS Emailed : 19/02/18, 4.30pm

VEHICLE NO - SJL 7474 M

MODEL : Mit Lancer 1.5 A Sports

WIP 31291

Material s 869.00
Labour : 9 1,250.00_
Sub-Total $ 2,119.00
Less Excess 3 -
Total T - 2,119.00
GST 7% + B 148.33
Grand Total i 2,2.5?.33
Finalise By/Date : LOI/ 19/02/19

7
REVERT BACK WITHIN 7 DAYS,
OTHERWISE WILL PROCEED WITH INVOICING

[_] SURVEYOR'S REPORT REQUIRED

REPARTOOK 3 WORKINGDAYS +__0 Days (_0 ) Weekends
+ 0 Days (0 ) PublicHoliday
TOTAL DAYS REPAIR TOOK =__3

TP claim SH7699X

[_] Claim GIA/LTA fee

Claim Loss of [ [JUse /[ ¥ _|Rental

[_] Claim Medical Fee / Others

[] Third Party Report -




CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED }‘
% @ PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE MITSUBISHI
CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 809339 Tel 65684555 Fax: 65691058 MOTORS

PRO-FORMA INVOICE
‘THIS IS NDT AN DFFICIAL TAX INVOICE

GST Reg Mo : Hl-ﬁiﬂﬂlll—H

Co Reg No @ lﬂ??ﬂl#ﬁBE

“Invoice Name & Address -~ W T b-Owrier Name & Vehiclelnfosm e iioam o
Mr KWEK KIAN TIONG Cust No/Name /Mr Kirek Kian Tiong
Reg No/Reg Date SJLmaM /117122008
Blk 709 Tampines 5t 71 pate In/Mileage ! 15;11;2915{ 269156
sl ks B
: Chassis/Package | JMYSRCYZAU002442
Stngapare 520787 ‘Engine No |4A910117071
Contact No Mobile: 90477229 Hakeﬂ-!ude] ) M[T;LhNtER 1.5 Hur-c 4AT SPDHT (NEW)
07/11/ Colour/Trim ‘POz RED METALLIC J By,
AccountNo [ Terms: ~DaterTime Printed - -+ CSEZ " Operator - e B WIRING e SR
csmnouu Cash 15/11/2018/ 10:42  TLC 442 / Cocolu 11291
T 007 0.. ., Description of Goods/Services ¢ T Gty UnitPrice Disch . Amount
F PuTssnuu -~ 550.00
RENEW REAR BUMPER,
E PNTOS000 ~ 420.00
SPRAY PAINT FOR REAR BUMPER,
E PNT28000 L~ 60.00
REMOVE & INSTALL PARKING SENSOR
E PNTBS0OO ~ 200.00
REMOVE & INSTALL REAR COMPARTMENT TRIMS
M SUNDRY o ~ 20,00
Sundry ¥ R e e e S e
X FACE,RR BUMPER |1} ) A f’-—\ﬁ ! —l ;‘i\ F?;J [ =1\.1Eu[} £7852.00 00.00 852.00
X BRKT,R/BMPR FACE SUPT,UH " I ( L ir i i 1J i. u;l ~F519.00 00,00 17.00
L] i thqﬂﬂf L kE:ﬁ/!iJ UL ?fit

"Gugrantes your worranty, maintein with Cycle & Corrioge.”

Parts 869,00 Hett 2,119.00
Labour 1,230.00 7% GST on 2119.00 148.33
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialmst Job 0.00 Total Payable 2,267.33
Diagnostics Job 0.00
Sundry/0thers 20.00
Total (w/o GST) 2,119.00

This s not an official tax invoico.
This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&1 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 100607198R GST Reg. No. 19-060T198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref :  CS/FCI18019508/T1vd3n2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date: 20:02:2019 IH"MW""”'“”"H
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH TEIEX Veh. Inspected SJL 7474M
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D1B007105MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  SERENE Assign Date 28/10/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI LANCER 1.5 c.c 1490
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JMYSRCY2ASUD02442 Colour RED
Odometer 265157 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/50 RA7 YOKOHAMA, 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/50 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/50R17 YOKOHAMA, 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/09/2018 ]Inspectiun Date 07/11/2018
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
208 PANDAN GARDENS SINGAPORE 608339
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|EST|MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJL T474M

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-89607196-R

Page No.:1of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) ($)

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FACE RR BUMPER (SN} DEFORMED B52.00 852.00
1|BRKT R/BMPR FACE SUPT LH (SN} MECESSARY 17.00 17.00
1|REINFORCEMENT RR BUMPER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 231.00 -
1|BRACKET LICENSE PLATE LAMP (SN} MOT NECESSARY 13.00 -
1|REINFORCEMENT RR BUMPER [SN) NMOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|REFLECTOR LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 36.00 -
1|SUNDRY (SN) MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1,259.00 889.00

LABOUR

REMOVE & INSTALL PARKING SENSOR. &0.00 £0.00
RENEW REAR BUMPER.REPAIR REAR END PANEL. 1,100.00 550.00
SPRAY PAINT FOR REAR BUMPER.REAR END PANEL. 1,260.00 420.00
REMOVWVE & INSTALL REAR COMPARTMENT TRIMS. 200.00 200.00
2620.00 1,230.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,879.00 2,119.00
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 2,119.00|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18019508/T 1wd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $12,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: §9,443.00=NETT VALUE: $2,557.00

M :

MOHAMALD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solaly for tha use and benefit of the Client named
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ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI

Licensed Appraiser
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on tha front page of this Report.
ptally oo in part, Aoy third party acting of reelving on this



