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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 3:16 PM

To: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: RE: Re: SGV1236G Claiming against SKL316X *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18019488/ha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Mandy, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to 

the BOLA guideline settlement. 

 

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 

your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the 

consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the 

number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 

 

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 

#02-25 | S(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or 

distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received 

this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all 

attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments 

and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com [mailto:mandy.neo@edgevantage.com] 

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 3:07 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Fwd: RE: Re: SGV1236G Claiming against SKL316X *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18019488/ha3 

 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

please confirm on the liability urgently . 

 

we have arrange surveyor at 2-4pm today 

if liability not clear will arrange owner to revert to OD 
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please advise ASAP 

 

 

Thank you 

 

best regards, 

Mandy Neo 

 

 

 

 

 

-------- Original Message -------- 

Subject: RE: Re: SGV1236G Claiming against SKL316X *** LKK REF:  

CC4/ASM18019488/ha3 

Date: 2018-11-07 14:08 

 From: "Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)" <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

To: "mandy.neo@edgevantage.com" <mandy.neo@edgevantage.com>, "Vic (LKKAuto)" <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

 

_‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’___ 

 

_  SAVE AS TO COSTS_ 

 

Dear Mandy 

 

Thank you for the email. 

 

Please be informed that case has reassign to Vic 

 

Dear Vic 

 

Kindly assist CC4/ASM18019488/ha3 

 

_Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 

intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.___ 

 

_ ___ 

 

_In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 

affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 

terms/settlement.___ 

 

_ __ _ 

 

_ _ 

 

_ _ 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards, 

 

VIVIAN LAU| Case Handler 
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LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 

 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

-----Original Message----- 

 From: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com [mailto:mandy.neo@edgevantage.com] 

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 1:32 PM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Re: SGV1236G Claiming against SKL316X *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18019488/wa3 

 

Hi Vivian , 

 

any update on the liability for the above vehicle SGV1236G. 

 

Thank you 

 

Mandy 

 

-------- Original Message -------- 

 

Subject: Re: SGV1236G Claiming against SKL316X *** LKK REF: 

 

CC4/ASM18019488/wa3 

 

Date: 2018-11-05 08:24 

 

 From: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com 

 

To: Meikwan@lkkauto.com 

 

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>, Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

 

Hi , 

 

please confirm on the liability for the above vehicle SGV1236G. 

 

Thank you 

 

Best regards 

 

Mandy 

 

On 2018-10-31 09:23, Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) wrote: 

 

> _‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’___ 

 

>  

 

> _  SAVE AS TO COSTS___ 

 

>  

 

> Dear Mandy, 
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>  

 

> Thank you for the email. 

 

>  

 

> Dear Mei Kwan, 

 

>  

 

> Kindly assist to reasign to the new handler. 

 

>  

 

> _Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is 

 

> purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

 

> resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal 

 

> proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 

 

 

> inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.___ 

 

>  

 

> _ ___ 

 

>  

 

> _In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently 

 

> produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

 

> issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by 

 

 

> the negotiation terms/settlement.___ 

 

>  

 

> _ __ _ 

 

>  

 

> _ _ 

 

>  

 

> _ _ 

 

>  

 

> Thank you 
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>  

 

> Best Regards, 

 

>  

 

> VIVIAN LAU| Case Handler 

 

>  

 

> LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 

 

>  

 

> Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

 

>  

 

> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

>  

 

> -----Original Message----- 

 

> From: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com [mailto:mandy.neo@edgevantage.com] 

 

> Sent: Wednesday, 31 October, 2018 8:53 AM 

 

> To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

 

> Subject: Re: SGV1236G Claiming against SKL316X *** LKK REF: 

 

> CC4/ASM18019488/wa3 

 

>  

 

> Dear Vivian, 

 

>  

 

> please confirm on the liability for the above vehicle SGV1236G. 

 

>  

 

> Thank you 

 

>  

 

> Best regards 

 

>  

 

> Mandy 

 

>  
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> On 2018-10-26 10:27, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) wrote: 

 

>  

 

>> _‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’___ 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> _  SAVE AS TO COSTS_ 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> _ _ 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> We refer to the above matter. 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Please be informed OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's 

 

>  

 

>> sketch plan and statement. 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  
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>> _PLEASE __ARRANGE FOR TP SURVEY.___ 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> _ _ 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, 

 

>  

 

>> please contact Vivian at 6841 8625. 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to 

 

>  

 

>> you in due course. 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> _ _ 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> _TO CHECK AVAILABILITY OF THE CASE HANDLER, YOU MAY CONTACT THE 

 

>  

 

>> UNDERSIGNED._ 

 

>  
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>>  

 

>  

 

>> _ _ 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Thank you. 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Best Regards, 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> MEI KWAN | Admin 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

>  
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>>  

 

>  

 

>> -----Original Message----- 

 

>  

 

>> From: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com <mandy.neo@edgevantage.com> 

 

>  

 

>> Sent: Wednesday, 24 October, 2018 1:59 PM 

 

>  

 

>> To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey 

 

>  

 

>> <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 

 

>  

 

>> Subject: SGV1236G Claiming against SKL316X 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Hi, 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Attached for TP claim 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> please advise if direct settlement is possible. 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  
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>> if you need footage please let me know 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> best regards, 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> contact 87783280 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Mandy Neo 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> Motor Edgevantage Pte Ltd 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> 160 sin ming # 03-01/02 

 

>  

 

>>  

 

>  

 

>> sin ming autocity Singapore 575722 


