Vic (LKKAuto)

From: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com

Sent: Wednesday, 13 February, 2019 8:40 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Fwd: Re: Fwd: SGV1236G discharge voucher
Attachments: SGV1236X discharge voucher filled.pdf

Hi

Attached discharge voucher for vehicle SGV1236G

Thank you

best regards,
Mandy

———————— Original Message --------

Subject: Re: Fwd: SGV1236G

Date: 2019-02-12 21:58

From: Siow Fah Lim <siowfah.lim@outlook.com>

To: "mandy.neo@edgevantage.com" <mandy.neo@edgevantage.com>

Hi Mandy
Attached signed discharge voucher, thanks
Siow Fah 96666700

FROM: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com <mandy.neo@edgevantage.com>
SENT: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 10:33 AM

TO: Siow Fah Lim

SUBJECT: Re: Fwd: SGV1236G

Dear Mr Lim,

please help us to sign the discharge voucher

AXA insurance company will pay us our repair bill once we receive the cheque .

As for the loss of use per day $60 x4 days return the sum of
$240

Thank you

Best regards,
Mandy Neo

Motor Edgevantage Pte Ltd



> [1] https://aka.ms/ghei36



