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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

—— e e —
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 5:25 PM
To: 'Claims’; SUR
Cc: ‘Nora Khal'
Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SLW 2909 C-DOA: 22/10/2018
Dear James,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLW 2909C not exceeding part
by part $73,000/- (Excess $3700/-).

[f there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company

before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Bast Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@/kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 3:46 PM

To: Veran Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Nora Khal' <nora. khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR S5LW 2909 C

Dear Veron,
Any update on approval?
Best Regards,

James Tan
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd mes s sz

55 Ubl Road 1 Road Singapare 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9BI8 1. +65 6841 1183

e, clame@premipmauTo COmLEE W, WWW BUDLCOMLER
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alesandra Road Singapore 159938 p. =65 6836 2223
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Email Disclalmer

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@|kkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 8:59 AM

To: Claims; SUR

Cc: 'Nora Khal'

Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SLW 2909 C

Dear James,

Pending insurance instruction,

Best Regards

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: §256-3561 | emall jsur@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com. sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 B:55 AM

To: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Nora Khai' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FORSLW 2508 C

Dear Veron,

Any update on approval, repair limit and excess?
Kindly advice
Thanks

Best Regards
James Tan

Claims Advisor

Premium Automaobiles Pre Lrd



5% Wi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6A8A 7323 d. +H5 5768 9828 1. +65 664 1183

B CIRImEEE pe Mauto.Com. g WO U O SE

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 2B1 Alexandra Road Singapore 1

The all-new Audl Q2

#untaggable |

http://www.audi.com.sa/sea/bran audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-g2-
2017 .html

Email Disclaimer

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 25 October 2018 4:33 PM /
To: 'Claims'; "Veron Chen (LKKAuta)'; 'SUR’
Cc: 'Nora Kha!'
Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SLW 2909 C
L
Dear Veron,

Please refer to the above attached for amended GIA Report.
Thanks.

Best Regards
James Tan
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd »
5 Lbi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. #6835 638 5 6768 9828 1. +45 6841 1'H

The all-new Audi Q2

#untaggable

http: //www.audi.com.sa/sea/brand/sa/audl promotions/promotions/car _promotions/new-audi-q2-
2017.html

Emall Disclaimer

1 i Puiive recihentl 1 erroi . please notify ul imemediatel by reply Bma o [hen cetrte 10 ¥ site Trovem v



From: Claims [mallto:claims@premlumauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 25 October 2018 4:12 PM

To: "Veron Chen (LKKAuto)'; 'SUR'

Cc: 'Nora Khai'; 'Claims'

Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SLW 2909 C

Dear Veron,

We are unable to repair the said vehicle within 565,000
We propose repair limit at $90,000.

Also refer to the above attached for the document you requested
Thanks.

Best Regards
James Tan
Claims Advisor

Promium Automobiles Pra Ltd sy

55 Libi Road 1 Aoad Singapore 408695

p.+B5 6388 7323 d. +65 6708 9628 f. +65 6841 1163

e. claimy@premivmauto. com. 8 w. www audl.com. g8

Audl Showroom, Aud| Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. «65 G836 2223
;

lhe all=-new Audl Q2

#untaggable

2017.htm|
Email Disclaimer
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 October 2018 3:58 PM

To: Claims; SUR

Cc: Nora Khal

Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SLW 2509 C

Dear James,

Kindly check vehicle able to repair at part by part not exceeding $65,000/-.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phane: 6256-3561 | emall sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumautp.com.sg=>
Sent: Thursday, 25 October 2018 3:29 PM

To: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto com>
Cec: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SLW 2909 C

Dear All,

Kindly assist approval repair for the above mentioned vehicle.
Also kindly advise excess and repair limit.
Thanks

Best Regards,
James Tan
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd e

55 Ubi Aoad 1 Road Singapore 408659

p. +65 6388 2323 d. «65 6763 9828 1. +65 6541 1183

e Llami @ premiumauto COm.SE W Wiww aUdl cOm. g8

Audi Showrpoom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singaporas 159938 p. <65 6E3E .";1.25

QoD

The all-new Audil Q.2 !
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From: Claims [mallto:claims@premiumauto com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 25 October 2018 2:01 PM

To: 'SUR’

Cc: 'Claims’

Subject: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM FOR SLW 2909 C
Dear All,
Kindly assist approval repair for the above mentioned vehicle.

Also kindly advise excess.
Thanks.



Best Regards,
James Tan
Claims Adwvisar

Premium Automohiles Pte Ltd
5 bl Road 1 Road Singapore 40
d. +55 6768 9828 f. «65 6841 1183
& claims@pramiumaulo COM.SE W, Wiww,.Budl COm.SE
Audl Showroom, Audi Centre 251 Alexandra Road ngapdre 1

AE5G

p. +65 B3EA 23
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The all=-new Audi Q2
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Merimen &-Claims
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View Received Message

This mall is associated with :
*SLW2908C ¢5un:n:mr-]
oD
Oct 22 2018 9:40PM

[TIN PET LING]
Eremium Automoblies Pte Ltd

_Reply | _Reply Al | _Markas Unread | _Print Message | Deiete Message | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 29/10/2018 13:58 PM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$73338.00) - SLW2909C - Claim Handler: Loo, Tong Shing

[Approved: 73338.00:To commence repairs. Itams awarded will have to be quantified with clear photos

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents,

hitps://singapore.marimen com/claims/index cfm?lusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_viewsmode=1&iinboxid=1377734&iDomainid=11&i0bjld=12 . 172



V0/25/2018 Rich Text Editor, SVCOOChreoniant
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg e 1asseriser

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Emall: sun@ikkaulo.com:assignmenisi@ikkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd,

From: LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1401-25
78 Shenton Way #07-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn.  Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina Date: 25 Oct 2018
Preliminary Advice
Viehicle No 1 SLW2909C Accident Date - 221072018
Make :AUDI A3 Policy Na. : 1800007839
Assignment Date : 25/10/2018 Excess : $50.00
Date of Inspection : 25/10/2018 Est. Duralion of Repair 28,00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)
55 UB| ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact | damages ofs body and paris claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revisad Amount

Check ltems (Estimated)
Talal

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Valua

Pre-Accident Valua

COE / PARF Rebate

Salvage Value

Margin for Repair (New for Cld Value)
Margin for Repair (Pre-Accident Value)

Remarks

ap

The vehicle is repairable al our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy

coverage. Kindly let us have your authorisation.

5%
5%
58
S8

58

55
58
53
5%
S8
5%

91,273.00
60,928.00
12,408.00
73,338.00

136,000.00
120.000.00
54,158.00

81,842.00
65,842.00

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck

(X )
Other comments ; Pending repalr cost from repairer,

hitps:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index. cfm ?lusebox=MTRadjusterAfuseaction=dsp_rpis&mptmode=24caseid=7555084extid=2863268adjcur. .

1712



1MPSANIA PAREFOFE Rahata Frniir
. »BacktoOneMotoring
'Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Dwner 1D Type: Singapare NRIC
Owner 1D: D417E
Vehicle Details
Vehicle Na.: SLW2509C
Vehicle to be Exparted: Ma
Intended Deregistration Date: 250ct 2018
Viehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model; AJSEDAN 1.0 TFS5I S TRONIC (LED)
Primary Caolour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No:: CHZA417559
Chassis No. WAUZZZBV7)1035978
Maximium Power Output: BS.0 kW (113 bhpb
Opan Market Value: £24 478.00
Original Registration Date: 05 Feb 2018
First Registration Date: 05 Feb 2018
Transfer Count: 1]
Actual ARF Paid: £26578.00
Iintended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 04 Feb 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: £19,933.00
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date: 04 Feb 2028
COE Category: A-Car up to 1400cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: %34 89000
COE Rebate Amount: £34 22500
Total Rebate Amount: $54,158.00

The information contalned herein is correct as at 25 Oct 2018

OK
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* Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: D417E
R DI e e
WVehicle Mo SLW290%C
Wehicle to be Exported; Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 25 0ct 2018
Vehicle Make: ALIDH
Viehicle Model: A3 SEDAN 10TF5I STRONIC (LED)
Primary Colour: Blus
Manufacturing Year 2017
Engine No.: CHZ41755%
Chassis Mo, WAUZZZBVTI1035998
Maximum Power Qutput: B5.0kW (113 bhp)
Open Markst Value £24 498,00
Original Registration Date 05 Feb 2018
First Registration Date 05 Feb 2018
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Pald $24.578.00
Ela AR R e e e e
FARF Eligihility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 04 Feb 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: $17.933.00
R COr Rata b deralle o oo
COE Expiry Date: D4 Feb 2028
COE Category: A~ Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Perlod{Years) 10
QP Paid $34,8%0.00
COE Rebate Amount: $29.512.00
Total Rebate Amount $49.245 00

The information contalned herein is correct as at 25 Oct 2018

OK
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Nama of Policyholder  : TIN PEI LING Vahicle No, sLwas08Cc
Perlod of Insurance : 05 Feb 2018 To D4 Feb 2019 Policy No. : 1800007639
Engine No. : CHZ417559 Endorsement No,
Chassis No. : WAUZZZBVTJ1035998 Issued Date : 07 Feb 2018
Maka/Mode! AUDI A3 Sedan 1.0 TFSI S tronic
Engine Capacity/Tonnage = 999.00 CC Sum insured : Market Value First Year of Regisiration = 2018
Driver Resiriction NA OIf Peak Car : No Insuting with COE/PARF Yes

Parson or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive*

a) The Policyrnioer
B Ay oY et wnG B g on e Pulicyhoiders order of with hinha pamission
Thin Poliry wil Fdemndy Ta Policyholoe of sy Adonses e anly I haabe meess (ha wpecien Bpe ConaRion

¥iens vl S5 gy B0 ESdibonal bum of §L000 sy “megemenced Ditver Ercewns” FIOA7)d You s o Yo Authomss Dial | REM@S GF Urnamec) i eyn e § pSEY @vang e ros

Age Candition 30 years old and abova

Lirnitation as 1o use”

L Dy MF BOCEI, Sormarene s pldssuim pueposns and kor i Policyfoices tesmeis

Thin Py Gom ML Cowel U Ior b OF iewend, CTRAnG Ion, arving el iacmg, pROE Mg, ey il apred sl
Turietn OF Ve YO aPy DuiDose i cormecton wih Moo Trade

g, B casnage of gonis oiher Ihan sEMmDes 0 ponnachon weh ary Tdde o

Loss of LUise 1300cc - 2000ce Dplionsl

* Limtulins rencarss inoporsine by Serson 8 of he Mol Vehices (Thiod Parfy Sisss 8ng Comperaaion | Act (Cap 18%) snc Smcnon 45 of the Fosd Trenapon A 167 [Uaieysia | sfe ral 10 Do
nchared e B ey

Saction 1
Fee - 30 Own Damage - $1400 The® - S0 Fieon Cover - 30

Section 2
Fropery Damnags - 30

Windscreen - 5700

Named Dnver and EXCess jwheie spolicsnivi

T P LING - 1400 [Own Damags )

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (F

4 i Cuwpregr Sorews Conier Add &S Uibi Road 1 Segepons 408G 6365300

For Gl Acproves REoing CHnmssic Authomr Fepains, panse comiact our 24-how scckount smargancy hotiee 2l +65 6338 0200 Amermptively, o may misi 5 AIG sslain meis g com g
e fils 55 Mobis App Smply s end download “AM B0 Bom Tunes or Google Pay |

IMPORTANT NOTES

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: MayBank

mmmunmnmumnm“-“hmmHMHhmmMMHWHMWHNl"
o Fcag Tramspon ko, 1887 | Malayiia) et otor Vishicies [Third Py M) Fusm, 1950 (Maloyss)

0504126220 \&

PREMILM LEASING - MH
281 ALEXANDHRA RDAD ALDI CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

SINGAPORE 156938 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Underwrinen ty AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pra. Lid, AUTHORISED REPREBENTATIVE __ . ...
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IMPORTANT: KEEP THIS DOCUMENT IN YOUR CAR AT ALL TIMES.

LOSS OF USE CAR REPLACEMENT BENEFIT

Applicable only if this benefit is included in your motor insurance. Piease refer to your Policy Schedule for details. Policy lerms
and conditions apply. Pleasa call our customer service hotline number (65) 6419-3000 for assislance.

The Certificate of Insurance (Cl) should be produced without demand when callecting the Renlal Car and the Renlal Car Company
resarves the right 1o verify the identity of the holder. Tha Cl is the property of AIG and ils use Is subject 1o the lerms and conditions
contained in the Loss of Use Endorsement under the policy jssued to the policyholder

Steps lo activate Loss of Use Car Replacement Benefit and Important Information

1 To activale your loss of use car replacemeni, please contact the Rental Car Company flisted below) after filing/reporting your
accident claim

2 Your rental car will be made available within § working hours of activation with ihe Rental Car Company.

3 Al the time of collection of the Rental Car. the original insurance policy and schedule (ssued by AIG. a copy of the Acciden!

from Audi Customer Service Centre must be produced.

4 The number of days is based on the period your vehicie is in the repair workshop unless the number of days of 1058 of use
sntitiement is stated in the Policy

& Renlal cars are strictly lor use in Singapore only.

6 Exisnsion of rental bayond repair pariod approved by AIG surveyor will be chargeable by the Rental Car Company on per day
basis

7 Upgrade of Rental Car is available upon request subject to additional charges by the Rental Car Company

Rental Car Company: Popular Rent A Car Pte. Ltd.

Activation Hotline: 67428888

501 Guillemard Road Singapore 399840

Operation Hours: Monday 10 Friday: 9am to 6pm Saturday (Half Day); 8am to 4pm

L‘:TM bl Car Companys Tarems & Consmons sppey & tlundable sscury Seoomt B WARrY for e Pamial Cir, Colision Darmags Wi, W)

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Il you seil your malor vahicle, this Notice s MPORTANT and MUST be complied with. Policyholders are hereby wamed thal under the
Motor Vehicies (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Acl {Cap.89), It shall be uniawful for any person 1o use of cause or penmil any
olher person 1o use @ Molor vehicle without a valid policy of insurance under he Act

The Policyholdet is further warned thal on ihe sale of & motar vehicie, thay must surrender the Certificate of insurance and the Policy o
the Insuranca company. If the Cerlificate of Insuranca has been lost or destroyed, a Stalutory Declaration to that effec must be made
Fallure to comply with this obligation is an offence under the Motor Vahicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap.BB).

This Policy will cease lo be valld once the molor vehicle has been soid 10 anolher persan uniess the transter of inleres! has been duly
notified 1o and agreed 1o by fhe insurance compainy concerned. If the insurance company agrees 1o covar the new owner, lhey wil issue
a new Centificate of Insurance in he new owner's name The premium chargeable may vary according o the new owner's profile
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1 Please repon
2 Thes Form must be

the dwimis af the accident 10 1pesd up Me cliems process
he the

g of muierial lacts may wliow insursnce companies fo

3 Informatn jrovded st be an Yuthhul ang acourate e
reputinte policy bability.

e Ay mil'id

o

4 Trwe ssus and sccopiance of S Fom by SrminGs COMpanis & not an drminssn of pobcy labiity 0n Se part of Be naurmece COMpatE

s tabes (e rederred o the Police lor
& Thin repert will bo forwarded by the insuren of the Gl R

&

by e Ganersl Irmance Asscciaton of Sngapors (GM) o

Erething and thal copies of Bis report will for & fee. be made

upon by parten
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ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Cwner
NRIC No

Emall Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phane No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used st
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repaic 1o your vehicle?

If No, Please state action 1o be taken
Vehicle Calegory
Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleel Policy

Policy Number
Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

- -~

ZU10/2018 12:55

2201012018 21:40

OUTSIDE CARRIBEAN @ KEPPEL BAY
SINGAPORE

SLw2o09C

TIN PEILING

SB340417E
TINPEILINGE GMAIL COM
(LOCAL) +65-97324004
OTHERS-9T3I24904

AUDI
A3 SEDAN 1.0 TFSI BV

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

1800007839

TIN PEILING
SBMOTE
23/1211983




a MOUNT FABER RDAD,
Address #02-15, THE PEARL,

Postcode 098208
Was driver an employes of the Insured’s Company NO
If Mo, Ralalionship of tha Driver with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Dirver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accidant

Type Of Accident COLLISION - MAJORU/MINCR RD
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any fareign vehicile invalved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles involved in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident? ND

Was any injured conveyed Io haspital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

I hum_ ba_-an approached by u!_'ulrnnwn pErsonis) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Numbear of Passangars (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported 1o the police? NO

I Yoz Plaaze stale which Police Station
¥Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes agains! whom?

Circumstances of Accident

| WAS TRAVELLING ALONG TELOK BLANGAH ROAD (RIGHT MOST LANE), INTENDING TO EVENTUALLY TURN TO
HENDERSON ROAD. AS | APPROACHED THE JUNCTION QUTSIDE CARRIBEAN @ KEPPEL BAY, MY CAR WAS
SUDDENLY HIT ON THE RIGHT SIDE BY ANOTHER CAR (JAGUAR, VEHICLE: SJHB015H), TRAVELLING IN A DIRECTION
PERPENDICULAR TO MINE. ALL THE WHILE UP TO THE POINT OF IMPACT MY CAR WAS TRAVELLING AT MODERATELY
SLOW SPEED AND THE OTHER CAR EMERGED FROM BEHIND THE PILLAR OF THE WEST COAST HIGHWAY. UPON
IMPACT, THE AIR BAGS IN MY CAR WERE INFLATED AS MY CAR SWERVED BY ABOUT 180 DEGREE AND ROLLED
BACKWARDS UNTIL | MANAGED TO APPLY BRAKES. MY CAR STOPPED AT ABOUT 20 - 50 METERS (ESTIMATED) AWAY
FROM THE LOCATION OF IMPACT, AFTER MY CAR CAME TO A HALT, MY DOOR COULD NOT OPEN AND REQUIRED A
PASSERBY TO OPEN THE DOOR FOR ME TO CLIME OUT. THE DRIVER OF THE OTHER CAR APPROACHED ME AND
CLAIMED THAT HE HAD THE RIGHT OF WAY. HE ALSO HAD NO VISIELE SIGNS OF INJURY AND WAS INCID AND ACTIVE
THROUGHOUT UNTIL OUR CARS WERE TOWED. THROUGHOUT THE JOURNEY ALONG TELOK BLANGAH ROAD UP
UNTIL IMPACT, | WAS ALERT, | HAD ALSO THOUGHT THAT TRAFFIC LIGHTS WERE GREEN FOR ME AND HENCE, |
CONTINUED TRAVELLING.

Attachmenty(s)
Ara accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camara? NO
Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SIHB015H
Vehicle MakeModel'Colour JAGUAR
Detalls Of Properties
Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
MName of Driver PRASHANT AGARWAL
NRIC/Passpart Number SB0GEB41D
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Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

96564774

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
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Accident Photo
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Addendum Sheel

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE RECORDS MANAGIMENT CENTRE

b Mgt Gy #1800 hrgaperr DREIEE
Tl [85) 8254 DOTD  Waw pik) 604 0080
Ot sti'gg Mhosary  Aoratoy Ls fridiy. 0900 1700
il WAVRIE | LY ey b gl PR

|MPORTANTNOTE: Please submit the completed Addendum torm 1o the same Authorised Reporting Centre
with wham you submitted the Original Repart

ADDENDUM

(&) PARTICULARSOF PERSONMAKING THEAMENDMENTS:

Original Reportho - MPA118137491 Vehicle Registration No. SLW2809C

MAmE e it MR |

(*Vehicle Driver / Vehicle Owner) (*] Please delete as appropriate

Address
Contact (Tel)
Frnail Address
Date of Acciden

Place of Accident

| ING

. 8 MOUNT FABER ROAD, #02-15, THE PEARL singapore{ 089208 )

Mohbile No.: 97324804

2211002018 Time of Accident: 21:40
DUTSIDE CARRIBEAN g KEPPEL BAY

Insurance Company . AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE.LTD.

(B) ADDITIONALINFORMATION /AMENDMENTS:

| have made a repart an the above mentiened accident and would like (o include additionalinformation ot
make the following amendments:

1 PROVIDE VIDEO FOOTAGE

2. TO AMEND STATEMENT. STATEMENT AS BELOW.

| was in shock after the accident on 22 Oct 2018. Atter my car was towed and the SD

Date

Polcynolder / Oriver s Sgnature zwm,w

uTM
NRIC/FINNo.
Dave
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Ernall: Nara_khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com. sgq

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop : UbiRoad 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 6B411183
Reference : PA/OD/1213/2018/PH
Date «  241/10/2018B

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 ALG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 D055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name : MsTin PeiLing

Address : 9 Mount Faber Road
#02-05 The Pearl
Singapore 099208

Telephone HP +65 97324904
Type of Claim Own Damage Claim
Fuliqr No. 1800007839

Vehicle No : SLw 2909 C
Model Code +  Audi A3 Sedan 1.0 TFSI
Model / Year ! Feb-18

Engine No : CHZ417559

Chassis No v WAUZZZBVT7)11035998
Mileage 3 @

Date In :

Liability

Excess Cost HE

Estimated By +  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date :  22-Dct-18

Place of Accident : OUTSIDE CARRIBEAM @ KEPPEL BAY



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Raad 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax: 58411183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLW 2909 C.,

5/N Nature of Jobs

Estimated Surveyar's
Charges Recommendation

To remove and transfer rear parking aid.Check
function.

2 Tacarry out first measurement on car-o-liner

[F%)

To renew rhs 1/4 glass and rear windscreen.

To remove and transfer front wire harness for
4 headlights,horns,fog lamps,outside temperature
sensor and headlight washer assy.

To remove and transfer front and rear door's multi-
5 lock systems and power window devices.Inspect
for damages and renew If necessary.

To remove and reinstall rhs front seat assy,ABCD
& pillar trims, floor carpets,electronic components
and fuse travs.

To dislodge and reinstall rear wire harness for
lights,battery manager,fuse and relay
trays,electrical and audio equipment.Inspect for
damage and renew where necassary.

SUB TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

S/N

S5/N

5/N

SIN

5/N

S/N

S5/N

-

s 280.00

s 72000

s 140000 "

$ 1,400.00 S

5 5,560.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408693
Tel: 63662323 Fax:B6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLW 2909 C.

Estimated Surveyor's
S/N Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendotion
To remove and reinstall rear seat,back rest,hat
B tray,abed pillar trims,luggage compartment S/N S 1,400.00
trims,rear seat belts.
To remove and reinstall centre console,renew
9 airbag control unit,roof liner,both curtain S/IN S 2.800.00 .~
airbags.and both front seat belts.
10 To renew driver seat air bag and leather cover. s/n s soooo v
11 To remove and reinstall front suspension for car-o- S/IN § 2.400.00 o e
liner repairs.
To remove and reinstall rear exhaust silencer :
12 assy,rear suspension assy and fuel tank.for car-o- S/N § 2,800.00 .~
liner repairs.
13 To place vehicle on car-o-liner, S/N § 1,800.00 .
To dismantle frant and rear bumpers,rhs franbt
1d fender,rhs front and rear doors and rear lid.Inspect § 12.600° cSDEI (=%

rhs floor pan for damages.Cut out andweld rhs B-
pillar,inner reinforcements,sill panel and rhs rear

SUB TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 5

% 24,600.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel : 63662323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax
2
Estimated Surveyor's
S/N Nature of Jobs Charges Yecommendation
Ta respray f;';\.;}/aumper,rh ont fengﬁrﬁnd rear N Mf
S doors,door Nandles,rhs B pillar,sill panel.d:g; 43‘:"0: r
entrances,inner reinforcements,rhs rear 2 W da o
5 fender,drain panel,roof channeland end 5 8,500 m ' )
-/ panelling.To carry out joint sealer works and stone T H ?'-. i Te

chip treatment. (Mt u )

To renew Lhs front rim and tyre and carry out wheal
alignment.

17 Tocarry out diagnostic check. S/N S 5.'!&-60—-4 381‘ ’

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : 5 39,516.00

S/N § 28000~




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax
ial Li hicl 2
Damage Parts & Prices
S/N  Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS

1 FRONT FENDER - RH ﬁr\( S 746.00

2 BRACKET FOR FENDER - RH 5 34.00 4

3 BRACKET FOR FENDER - RH s 24.00 ¥

4 CLOSING ELEMENT WING - RH -1 S 29.00 >

5 INSULATION FOR FRONT FENDER - RH 5 36.00 ¥

&  WHEEL HOUSING LINBER -RH 5 151.00 X

7 ATTACHMENT PARTS FOR WHEEL HOUSING LINER M Ade S 77.00 .

8 FRONTDOOR-RH < Wigfocled $ 2,190,00

9  OUTER DOOR SEAL - FRONT RH  Asay 5 139.00 =
10  BONDINGAGENT ™ s a300 568
11 CLEANING SOLUTION I+t H& S 64.00 T
12 ATTACHMENT PARTS FOR DOOR Pt Mo 5 206.00 > %
12 DOOR HINGE HALF-UPPER PART - RH UPPER  Tusb 5 72.00+ " SLER
14  DOOR HINGE HALF - LOWER PART - RH UPPER 3 4400, @l s
15  DOOR HINGE HALF - UPPER PART - RH LOWER ¥ 3 108.00> &
16  DOOR HINGE HALH - LOWER PART X g 5 44,00 % "SeHs
17 DOORCATCH Mt 5 92,00 +
18 COVER FORDOOR CATCH A== 5 13.00+
19  DOORSEALINNER Tl . 3 139.00 7 IS
20  SECURING BRACKET DOOR PANEL M ré” 5 11.007 %
21  DOOR HANDLE,EXTERIOR PRIMED (b 5 207.00.~”

SUB - TOTAL SPARE PARTS S  4,469.00

All charges are not Inclusive of GST.

Legend Remarks (0K) = Approved. Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408639
Tel: 63662323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax
Material List for A No. SLW
S/N  Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS
22 DOOR HANDLE CAP-RH Al Ao s 26.00 X
23 SLIDE VALVE - RH ML D 3 11.00 #
24  SENSOR FOR DOOR HANDLE /A€ ¢ 3 200.00 ¥
25  FRONT DOOR LOCK CYLINDER - RH ~ Nrt M < as700 K
26 MOUNTINGBAR /€ “— 5 143.007
27 BOWDENCABLE A o 3 48.00*
28 FRONTDOOR LOCK-RH Pl ander 3 466.00 TS
29 DOORLOCKCOVER - Mo 3 13.00 £
30 STRIKER  #aaf 5 s7.007  HE5OS
31 UNDERLAY  med pén” 5 30.00 T %
32 BOWDEN CABLE »&of o 5 34.00 ¥
33 COVER FOR DOOR INNER PANEL-RH T pe 3 22007
34  WINDOW GUIDE - RH P N 5 365.00 7 LR
35  TRIMSTRIP FOR WINDOW GUIDE HIGH CHROME ¢ M 3 22200 °
36 WINDOW APERTURE SEAL-RHINNER POl mee $ 113.00 7~
37  TRIMFOR B PILLAR BLACK GLOSSY - RH  ~N-E M- 5 B5.00 &,
38 WINDOW SLOT SEAL WITH TRIM STRIP CHROME  metorest 5 268.00 "
39 WINDOW LIFTER W/OMOTOR Sonny st $ 232007 WESD
40 WINDOW MOTOR y s 21200 7™
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS 5 3.004.00
All charges are not inclusive of GST,
Legend Remarks {DK) = Approved, Remarks (0= Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett



