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DEQPLE'S VEHICLE RECOVERY SERVICE

BLK 3023-A UBI ROAD 1 W01-60 SINGAPORE 408T17

Tel No. : 67433246/ 67438552 Fax No. : 67430013
E-Mall : peoplevehiclefgmaill.com

Tax Req. No. : MOO001885E Buss. Reg. No. : 31800200

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD
TR SHENTON WAY #07-16
CHARTIS BUILDING (5) 079120
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Slala Department
Contact : 6418 1826 Fax No. : 6415 3727

SN Quantity Particular

Estimate : ES18041

Date : 23102018
Vehicle Num. : ER 250 R
MakeMode! : BMW 24

Chassis/Eng# :

Accident Date : 13102018
Clatm No. : TP 320-18
Reference : SLT 1160 8
Policy No. : NTUC 508915857203

Unit Price  Amount 55

LIST ITEMS :
1PC DOOR SIDE MIRROR RH
Liasi TLAG
10 DYsTount 56

LABOUR :
SPRAY PAINTING ACCIDENT EFFECT PARTS
REMOVE & REPLACE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS

AND PROGRAMMING
Lorimonm Tisiad 39 . 570.60
SingDoltars : One Thousand Eight Hundred Eleven £ Cents Fifty Oniy
E L0E Towal S8 : 1.811.80
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ut Industrial Park, Singapore 408521
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX 6250 4315
Reg. No 198607198R GST Reg, No 18-9507198-R

Al % L 3

Affiliated to Federatlon Internationals Des Experts En Automobile

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CCB/AIG18019392/Awb3
R AT
CHARTIS BUILDING Date: 2510-2018
SINGAPCRE 078120
Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SLT 11605 Veh. Inspected ER 250R
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 25/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyra mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. l General Information
Accident Date  13/10/2018 [Inspection Date 23/1012018

Survey held at PEOPLE'S VEHICLE RECOVERY SERVICE
BLK 3023-A UBI ROAD 1 #01-60 SINGAPORE 408717

Sa. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




£1 LUBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408953 TEL ; (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CCO/AIGIBD19392/Awb3
30 October, 2018

NEO AH LEE
17 FERNVALE LANE #14-18
SINGAPORE 797498

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 11608 AND ER 250R ON 13/10/2018 ALONG /AT
TANJONG PAGAR ROAD

We. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim
against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this
letter, giving the version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The
GIA report can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer 1o your
Cenrtificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the
undersigned within five days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & ete
would be affected.

Yours faithfully,

P

Vivian Lau
Claims

Tel : 6841 B625
Fax: 6741 4108

Email : vivianlau @ lkkauto.com

cc.  Claims Manager
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
{Mator Claims Dept)



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, B October 2019 11:55 AM

To: People's Vehicle Group

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Offer - [ACCIDENT BETWEEN ER 250R & SLT 11605 [AIG] ON 13/10/2018]
People's Vehicle Group
Admin A
shupeittlckauto com Daliversd: B/10/2019 1156 AM
Melkwan@lkkauto com Deliverad: 8/10/2019 1156 AM
olivialau@kkauto com Delivered: B/10/720719 171:56 AM

Without Prejudice

(save as lo cosis)

Dear Sirs/Mdm

we refer to the above matier.

We prapose setfliement for global sum of $1,371.00{all in) on this matter for amicable setllement

Please confirm acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially affect/influence on the Issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email; Khanchna@lkkauto,.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: People's Vehicle Group <peoplevehicle@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, B October 2019 10:56 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Offer - [ACCIDENT BETWEEN ER 250R & S5LT 11605 [AIG] ON 13/10/2018]

Hi Khanchna,



E%——

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2019 10:40 AM
To: Peaple Vehicle
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Offer - |[ACCIDENT BETWEEN  ER 250R & SLT 11605 [AIG] ON 13/10/2018]
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
People Vehicle
Admin A
olivialaug lkkaulo com Delivered: B/10/2019 10:40 AM
shupeiflkkauto com Delivered: B/10/2019 10:40 AM
Melkewan @ kkauto.com Delversd: B/10/2019 10:40 AM

Without Prejudice

{save os lo costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer 1o the above matter.

wWe propose setiliement on a 50% liability basis for global sum of $689.00(all in) on this matter.

Please confirm acceplance,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed { inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.,

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially affect/inlluence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna/@ lkkauto.com|Fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S(408933)




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

-—— - = —

From: People Vehicle <peoplevehicle@gmail.com:>

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 7:17 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: TP Direct Settlement for vehicle No: ER 250 R, Your ref: SLT 1160 5
Attachments: ER 250 R Tax Invoice09112018.pdf; ER 250 R GIAD9112018.pdf; ER 250 R LTA

search09112018.pdf

Categories:

PEOPLE'S VEHICLE RECOVERY SERVICE

BLK 3023A #01-60 UBI ROAD 1 (S) 408717

TEL: 6743 3246 FAX: 6743 0013

Co Regn No: 31800200X , GST Regn No: M90001895E
Email: peoplevehicle@gmail.com

Date: 09-11-2018

AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way # 07-16

Chartis Bldg

(S) 079120

Your Ref . SLT 1160 S
Officer-in-charge — Vivian

Accident involving ER 250 R AND SLT 1160 S ON 13-10-2018

We act on behalf of our client ER 250 R on above claim

COR per your appointed surveyor $1,284.00
recommendation

(inclusive GST)

Loss of Use @120 X 1 Days $120.00
LTA search $7.45
Total $1,411.45

Kindly revert back to us within 14 days from date of above if you wish to settle
with us under
direct settlement



Yours sincerely

Enclosure Original Tax Invocie , GIA report of our client .LTA Search Receipt

People's Vehicle Recovery Service
Computer Generated document . No signature is required



S1UBEAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UlLENDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAIMRE J08938 TEL : (063) 62863361 FAX 1 (0651 61564315

Our Ref: CCO/AIG18019392/Akb3
06 SEPTEMBER 2019

NEO AH LEE
APTBLK 17
FERNVALE LANE
#14-18

THE TOPIARY
SINGAPORE 797498

Denr Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING ER 250R & SLT 11608 ON 13/10/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 10

resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up
with them.

We have received a claim from ER 250R against your motor insurance policy.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your
authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident. We will therefore proceed 1o
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20%
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy
has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
Thanchan
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: khanchna@lkkauto.com

ee ANG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Moror Claims Depi)



AUTHORIZATION !10 ACT

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Thhrd Pariv Claim)
|

|, LUM CHEE KOK - (the third party claimam™) of

(vehicle no.) hereby authorize PEOPLE'S VEHICLE HECU\“’ER? SERVICE (“the workshop™)

|
to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and dr rental and/or loss of use ("claim™) tor

my vehicle no ER250R that was damaged pursuant to the scaident which occurred on
13/10/2018 (date) along TANJONG PAGAR RO _ D {location )

involving vehicle no's _SLT11808S (“the accident™) |

I further authonze the workshop to settle my above mentioned elaim i & manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my ¢laim with

payment cheque's being made in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any seulement the workshop may reach on my behalf 1s on a withow
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofur as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle's 15 concerned.

Dated this 11 (day) of 10 (month) 2019 (vear)

= | [
Signed by “the third party clarmant™ Signed by “the workshop™
{with chop if applicable) twith chop)




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Thifkd Party Claim)

(“the workshop™) hereby confirm that

of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance e Lid
LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of survejor) with respeet 1o the amount clammed
for S$1.371L.00(Global Sum) for vehicle no. ER250R that|was damaged pursuant to the accident

which oceurred on 13/10/2018(date) along TANJONG PAGAR ROAD involving vehicle no's
SLT11605.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 23/11V2018 {date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owng LUM CHEE KOKithe third purty
clammant™) of vehicle no. ER250R make the claim as set oft in the above paragraph and we | have
full authority to settle the matter on his'her behalf in @ mpnner that we'l deem fit We/l enclose
herein the lener of authority given by “the third party claimgm™.

We/l further confirm that we'l will indemnify AIG Asia Pagific Insurance Pre Lud for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incufred in the evemt thar “the third party
clatmant™ after the above said sgreement lodges a further cluim agamst the former for anv loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or reptal and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to ER250R(vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full uIILl final settlement of any claim of “the
third party climant™ pursuant 1o the accident and that further this settlement s reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of iability basis.
This agreement 15 subject to the application of Singapore law and the Smgapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising oul ol the surge.

Dated this U4 (day) or I8 imonth) 20 {19 (year)

P

Signed by um"u'ﬂnh:d sUrveyor !i:r_n-:d by “the warkshop™ (with chop)
!




PEQPLE'S VEHICLE RECOVERY SERVICE

SLK 3023-A UBI RUALD 1 801-680 SINGAPORE 08717
Tol No. - 7433048/ 6T438557 Fax No @ 8T430013

F-Mail . peoplevehiclefbgmul com

Tar Rea. No : MBODOTBSSE Buss Aeg No. @ 31800200X

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD
TR SHENTON WAY 80T-16
CHARMIS BLRLDING (5) 078120

L e ——

Aseation ; Aistor Clakn Departraarst
Contact . G470 1828 Fax No. . 8415 3727

Tay Invoice : TT18041

Date : 08112018
Vehicie Num. : ER 250 R
MakeModel : BMW 24

ChassmEngd

Accident Date : 13102018
Claim No. : TP J20-18
Reference ; SLT 1180 5
Policy No. : NTUC 5089158573-03

Amount 55

LUMPSUM REPAIR 1.200.00
SingOnitars ; Orm Tiousamt Two Hirsdred Eighiy-Fosr Cnly

ELOE Toml Z% : 1,200.00

GSTTN S5 . 84.00

Amount Due 5§ ; 1,284.00

i e s

s g

fo- NECPLES VEHICLE RECOVERY SERVICE



" s Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Autharity

Land Transport Authority

10 Sm Ming Drive

Singapore STST01

GST Regstration Mo | M4-0008528-2

Print Date/Time 18 Oct 2018/ 174808
Receipt Date/Time | 16 Oct 2018/ 17.48.08
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No ITHE T-00000-181015-001835

Preveous Recepl No

SN Iem Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Referance Before Amount After GST
Ne. GST(5%) (5%) (58]

Resuft of Insurance Enquiry - SLT116805

As al 13 Oct 2018/06:30 00

insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

1 insumnce Enguiry - SLT11805
Enquiry Fee T.00 [ ] T 48
201810191 T4T1 1340058

Sub-Total 700 0 &8 T4
Total Belore Rounding 700 0.48 T48
Rounding Differance oo
Tolal Amount Payable T45
Paid By
Direct Debit: eNETS Debil
1 174730500 Banii ’

201818 0 . ) T.45
Total T.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tondered Amount 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly sattied by the payment service
m:mmmnum.mﬂ-m“mﬂuummmum

may apply.

Print Receipt oK Save as PDF



Menmen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlane

inm SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Lase Hotified £t Suhmitted A Asmagned Ad) Apt Ad) Suheriittad Ins Auth'ed Status
25 Oct 2018 ulnu 2018 $41,200.00 $$1,200.00 Pending for Survey
Edit Aag HIEMJIHI Edm Bsfirmales Wers BT l;mlm]

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]

insured NED AN LEE, ID: S1523537A
Main .
| . |LUMCHEE KOK, ID: 51311600)
Vehicle Reg [13/10/2018 19:00 - :59
No.. ER250R Date of LO53: |19 en Months and 2 Days From LTA Reg Date {Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: |TP / D0326833445G poAcHCOVer | 4700067435 (Comprehensive)
Vehicle Reg.
N, SLT11605 m 50601 58573-03
[Insured): -
Excess:

Enpairer: People's Vehicle Recovery Service (HQ) Bk 30234 Ubl Ad 1, #01-60, 408717 Ub - Tel: 67433246

HandlinG | A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 .. [Handled by Foa, Chit Yan] Chityan Fao@iag,com

EI:L'::::“ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operstive Ltd (HQ) - Tel:
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel| 6256-3561 . [Handied by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 05/11/201E]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED wiew Al | compose Case mail |

+ AIG_SG (26/10/2018): Reguest to uplosd TP GIA Report
+ AIG_SG (26/10/2018): Mo OI GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS® View All | Search Tasks | Creste Mew Task | comoiete |

Duw Date  Priority Type  Task Group  Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Dane?
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuscaction=d... 5/11/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*ER250R (00326833445G)
[S5LT11605]
™
LUM CHEE KOK
Oct 13 2018 7:00PM
[NED AH LEE]
People's Vehicle Recovery Service

Page 1 of 1
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5 |05/11/1908:5) | Release Voucher Load POF
& |05/11/190B:53 | LTA SEARCH Load POF
7 |pS/11/1908:51 LoD % Load POF
8§ |0%11/1908:53 | LETTER TO O1 0 | Lowd POF
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLT1160S (Insd veh) Model: W Z4 2.0 (A)
ER250R (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: | 13/10/2018
Giobal Sum Settiement| - | [X] Yes | [ ]| No
Repair Estimate 5 1,938.31
Final Repair Cosl - 1.371.00]
Loss of Use -1 1.00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) ' S days
LTA / GIA Search Fee 1
Others: 3
15
Final Settlernant Sum (Global Sum) § 1,371.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindyindicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No
B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability. (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain callisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown

1} |People's Vehicle Recovery Service ! 1,371.00
2) ' &
3) s
4) $
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN “gu’}';"
LKK Aute Consultants Ple Lid Dale

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Releass Voucher: Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Blll (if any)
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Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico neg noteseoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page 1 of 4

Our Flla No: CCB/AIG1B019382/AKBI02

Data: 05/11/2018

REFERENCE

Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:

Claimant

17000687435

Vehicle No : ER250R Insured Vehicle No : SLT1160S8
Date of Loss: 13/10/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 0032683344506
R &1 TIF I
Reg No: ER250R
Make & Model! BMW Z4, 2.0 (A) Engine No: 3022574822651
Reg. Date: 11/04/2006 (Man. Year: 2006) Chassis No: WEABT12050LR02142
Colour: Red Odomeler 162859 km
Engine Capacity: 2171 ¢cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S$) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabls): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/40 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 225/40 R18
Fronl Left Side; Goodyear 6 mm Rear Lefi Side: Goodyear 6 mm
Front Right Side: Goodyear 6 mm Rear Right Side: Goodyear 6§ mm
The above wWlves represent the memaning fyre reads degth
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  DIiff %
Parts 1,241.50 1.241.50 0.00 0.00
Miscellapeous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labaur 570.00 280,00 290.00 50.88
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§5) 1,811.50 1,521.50 290.00 16.01
Approved Total (Overridden) (55) 1,200.00
(S%) 1.811.50 1,200.00 611.50 3376
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 126.81 84.00 42 B1 33.76
Nett Amount (S§5) 1.938.31 1.264.00 654.31 33.76
+ Loss of Use (1.0 x 5580.00/day) (S5) 80.00
+ Doc/Search Feae (S5) 745
Nett Liability (S5) 1,371.45
Global Sum Settlement (55) 1,371.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 2310/2018
Date Inspecled: 23/10/2018 Inspected Al: People's Vehicle Recovery Service
(HQ)
Blk 3023A Ubi Rd 1, #01-80
Singapore 408717
Estimated Penod of Repair; 1.0 days
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Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj

NOTE. This report represents our findings af the lime and place of inspoction stated herein. Such inspection has been carriad oul o Ihe best of aur
knowiedge and abdily Suf sy offier ability under any ofher circumstancas (s hanety 8xpresaly srciuded
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Adjuster Report

Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo.  Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *DOOR SIDE MIRROR R/H Camaged 1.378.45FL “1,3TBA5FL
F=Franchise part. L=ListitamDisc
Sub Total (S5) 1,379.45 1,379.45
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S§) 137.95 137.95
Total Parts (5%) 1,241.50 1,241.50
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. il
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no naw miscollaneous lems selected,
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 SPRAY PAINTING ACCIDENT EFFECT PARTS MNew 120.00 80.00
2 REMOVE & REPLACE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS AND New 450,00 200.00
PROGRAMMING
Gross Labour Cost (5%) 570.00 280.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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