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-' l'fl' Auto

bl gl Consultants
BJA Ba B Pte Lid Company Ragistration No. 199607198R
A1 UBLAVE 1, #0225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (655 62564015
Your ref: YP 7T908E/SL/pl
Our ref; CS/EGI18019361/Avb Date ; 14/1/2019
The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SLS 3658R
We thank you for your instruction on 24/10/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
vehicle on 29/10/2018 at the premises of M/s FIRST AUTOWORKS

Workshop Estimate Amount : §$12,038.20
Revised Estimate Amount : §%5,001.10
"Check" Items Amount : S%

Market Value : S%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8%

Nett Value . : S%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,
ADRIAN LING WAL PING

B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAL
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

E

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 4:23 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: YP7908E / TP : SLS3658R/LKK / DOA : 27/07/2018
Attachments: SLS 3658R PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLS 3658R
Date of survey: 29/10/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 B:42 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: YP7908E / TP : SLS3658R/LKK / DOA : 27/07/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle on SLS 3658R on 29/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 4:35 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assighments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: YP7908E / TP : SLS3658R/LKK / DOA : 27/07/2018

1




Dear Pei Li,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignmentz@lkkauto.com | fax: ba56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg
Sent: Wednesday, 24 October, 2018 3:54 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Ce: survey @ jpknights.com
Subject: Ol : YP7908E / TP : SLS3658R/LKK / DOA : 27/07/2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the "Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from 15T AUTOWORKS PTE LTD.

ADDRESS . 23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4

#04-01 (SOUTH WING)

SINGAPORE 415533
PERSON TO CONTACT : SUHAIMI ONG / RONNIE TAN @ 6844 1985 / 8298 8933
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE  : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle.
Obtain estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey
before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are our insured's and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee PeiLi
Claims Agsistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd,

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore J38085

DID.. +55 6829 5154

Tel +55 8820 9199

Fax +55 GE29 8247



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 8:42 AM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)’

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: YP7908E / TP : SLS3658R/LKK / DOA : 27/07/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle on SLS 3658R on 29/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 4:39 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: YP7908E / TP ; SLS3658R/LKK / DOA : 27/07/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report @ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 24 October, 2018 3.54 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc: survey @jpknights.com

Subject: Ol : YP7908E / TP : SLS3658R/LKK / DOA : 27/07/2018

Dear Catherine,



In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from 15T AUTOWORKS PTE LTD.

ADDRESS : 23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4

#04-01 (SOUTH WING)

SINGAPORE 415933
PERSON TO CONTACT : SUHAIMI ONG / RONNIE TAN @ 6844 1985 / 8298 8933
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVELIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle.
Obtain estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey
before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are our insured's and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,
Yee PeiLi
Claims Assistant {Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

A Temasak Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038235

DID.: +65 8829 5194

Tel =565 6829 3158

Fax - +B5 B329 5247

ERGO

ERGO s ana of the major insurance groups in Gemany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countrees and concantrates
on Eurape and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers

WY B100.COM S0



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 2:49 PM

To: ronnie tan@firstautoworks.com.sg

Cc: Suhaimi; Admin-D (LKKAuto), SUR

Subject: RE: Is the liabilty clear for SLS3658R ( Ergo) Steve Lim (CDMCG18000712)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ronnie,

We write to confirm our agreement to have a direct settlement of this claim with quantum to be agreed. Appointed
assessor LKK will finalize the reasonable cost of repairs and the number of days.

Aside to LKK, please assist to confirm direct settlement with the third party workshop.

Regards
Yee Pei L
Claims Assistant (Molor)

ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.

5 Temasak Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038585

DID.: +85 6829 9194

Tel | +65 5825 9199

Fax: +585 G829 9247

ERGO

ERGO is cne of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide ERGO s represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia. ERGD is part of Munich Re {Group}, one of the world's leading risk carriers

WIWWLETO.COm 0

From: Ronnie Tan [mailto:ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2018 2:13 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Cc: Suhaimi

Subject: fw: Is the liabilty clear for SLS3658R ( Ergo) Steve LIm

Hi Mr Steve Lim
Good day to you

|5 the liabilty clear for SLS 3658R

Yaour client vehicle YPTS08E .

Thank
Regard

Ronnie
Tel 6844 1985



From: "Ronnie Tan" <ronnie.tan@firstau rks.com.sq>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 2:01 PM

To: chewht@lkkauto.com
Ce: "Suhaimi” <suhaimi@fi 50>

Subject: Is the liabilty clear for SLS3658R. ( Ergo)
Hi Ms Hsiao Tong
Good day to you

Is the liabilty clear for SLS 3658R

Your client vehicle YP7T908E .

Thank
Regard

Ronnie
Tel 6844 1985



Catherine Ehung (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 October, 2018 3:54 PM

To: admin-d@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: survey@jpknights.com

Subject: OI : YPT7908E / TP : SLS3658R/LKK / DDA ; 27/07 /2018

Attachments: YP7908E - SAS.pdf; SL53658R - SAS.pdf; SLS3658R - PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from 15T AUTOWORKS PTE LTD.

ADDRESS 1 23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4

#04-01 (SOUTH WING)

SINGAPORE 415933
PERSON TO CONTACT : SUHAIMI ONG / RONNIE TAN @ 6844 1985 / 8298 8933
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle.
Obtain estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey
before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are our insured's and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,
Yee Pei Li
Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

DiD

ERGO i on

: of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represenied in more than 30 countries and concentrates
an Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group). ane of the warld's leading risk carriars



Drate:
Dur Reference:

Your Relerenca:

Ta:

24.10.2018

¥YP 7908E/5L/pl

SLS 3658R

15T AUTOWORKS PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey {PRS) Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspection: 5L5 3658R

Insured's Vehicle:

Date OF Accident:

We acknowledge

YP 7908E

19.10.2018

receipt of your request Tor PRS on:

23.10.2018

ERGO

Sent via Fax

ar

Email
rennie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016%, do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *.

* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

AlS Automobile Inspection Servicas Pte Lid LBS L85 Aule Consultants Fle Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Ple Lid LEK LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
LAS Infiniti Appraisal Service 3 Pririty Services

JPE JP Knights Fte Lid VaC Vicom Lid

v lvour request for inspection does not have your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindly forward 2 copy.

Qur Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Your request for inspection does not have your clignt's GiA report, kindly ferward a copy.

we acknowledge vour Interest for diract settlomont, we will 255055 & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

V jothers:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM
Prepared by: Q_% Pal LI G829 9194 claims rEO.COM.5S
|signature: g FAX : 68299247
Asjessor usg only: Workshop use only:
Assnssor ndegd workshop ont
Assignment Date: Date:
Assignrment Time: Time
Ingpacton
Remarks: D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Werkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Nate: Our Inspection Is on o without admission to lability besils.
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magde different
Certificate of Insurance

——

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER 189}
MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1960

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 [MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES {THIRD PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1859 [MALAYSIA)

Certificate Number: S094469515-01 Cowver : drivo PREMIUM
L. Index mark and Registratian Number of Vehicle | 5L53B538R

Chassis Number © WOLBEREAZHG173874
2. Name of Policyholder CHOOMNG MING LING SUSAN
3. Effective Date aof Insurance 21 5ep 2018
4. Expiry Date of Insurance ;20 Sep 2019
5. Persons or Classes of Persans entitled to drived

{a] The Policyhalder
[b] Any other person who is driving an the Policyholder's order ar with hisfher permissian,
Provided that the person driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or ather laws or regulations to drive
the Motar Vehicle or has been so permitted and Is nat disqualified by order of 3 Court of Law or by reason af any
enactment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Matar Vehicie,
6. Limitations as to Usel
{a) Use for social domestic and pleasure purposes and in connection with the Policyholder's business or profession,

This Policy does not cover
{3} Wse for hire or reward.
{b) Use for racing, pace-making, reliability trial or speed-testing,
(e} Use for the carriage of goods (other than samples) in connection with 2ny trade or Business.
[d} Use tor any purpose in connection with the Maotor Trade,
# Limitations rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Mator Viehicle (Third Party Risks and Compensation)
Act {Chapter 189) and Section 95 of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia), are not to be included under thase

headings.
EXCESS (SECTION 1) : SSE00
EXCESS [SECTION 2) N/A
WINDSCREEN EXCESS : 55100
ADDITIONAL EXCESS - NSA
UNMAMED DRIVER EXCESS : PLEASE REFER OVERLEAF
REPAIR AT OWNER'S PREFERRED WORKSHOE ¢ YES
INSURE WITH COE : YES
WKCD PROTECTION : YES
TRAMSFORT ALLOWANCE . NO
EXCESS WAIVER ¢ NO
PRIMARY DRIVER : CHOONG MING LING SUSAN
NAMED DRIVER (1) CNSA
NAMED DRIVER (2) : NSA
HIRE PLURCHASE COMPANY : MAYBANK
SUM INSURED : MARKET VALUE OF INSURED VEHICLE AT TIME OF LOS5

I/We hereby Certify that the Policy to which this Certificate refates is issued in aceordance with the provisions of the Motor
Vehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Part IV of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia)

Apency i ALPINE CREDIT PTE LTD (00000615217}
Date of lssue : D7 Sep 2018 18:55 hrs
Reprint : 07 Sep 2018 18;56 hrs

For NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LIMITED

¢ o /

Authorised Officer Chief Executive

Countersigned By:




REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE
+ IDENTITY CARD NO. S1517024G
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CHOONG MING LING SUSAN
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Date of birth ez 515170240
08-05-1862 F

CountryPiace of birth
SINGAPORE
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FIRST AUTOWORKS

Repair Estimate

Date : 24/10/2018 Reference:
Make: Opel

To Whom It May Concern Astra
Dear Sir,

TP Tyl
RE: VEHICLE .: SLS 3658R VA
CHASSIS NO.: WOLBEGEA2HG 173874 .-
ENGINE NO.: B1171497HRXX0526 Veron,
Name of insured .: CHOONG MENG LING SUSAN
Date of accident.: 19/10/2018
We append hereunder the estimated cost of repairs to be carried out to the above vehicle.
Parts
No. Qty Part Dgscription Price (SGD)

1 1 REARBUMPER UPPER 5':3 185&(1!}"';_ _

2 1 REARBUMPER LOWER A 1450.00

3 1 LHR BUMPER REFLECTOR '%H P 70.00 #

4 1 RHRBUMPER REFLECTOR 70.00 *

5 1 REAR BUMPER TOW COVER #t ~ N 60.00 -

6 1 REARBUMPER REINFORCEMENT Tt * 2178 1599.00 X
7 1 REAR BUMPER GUIDE LH %P_ o 57.00 -

8 1 REAR BUMPER GUIDE RH N 1 57.00 -

9 1 REAR BUMPER GUIDE CENTER A*~ Sialt™ 65.00 < °
10 1 REARTAILGATE QJJ 2,200.00 +
11 1 REAR OPEL EMBLEM M+ 120.00 =

Parts Total: 7,598.00
Less 10%: 759.80
Total: 6,838.20
Labour
No. Labour Description Price (SGD)
To dismantle / renew the accident damaged portion,to panel s

4 beating,reshape,straighten,orientate and align repair /replacement EM ébt:"

parts.

2 Carry out spray painting on accident affected area ( Rear Bumper) W /70

3 To disconnect wire hamess of electrical component to facilitate M 20
= repairs,reconnect and check electrical function after repair :

4 Remove and refit reverse sensor (Labour) (54O 1/39‘00/ 60’

5 To conduct anti rust of under carriage tuff coat 80.00 4.

Labour Total : 5,090.00
1st Autoworks Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing) Next to Vicom Building, Singapore 415833 Tel : 6844 1885 Fax: G844 5185



No. Other Description Price (SGD)
1 Sealant pit e 50.00 +
2 Rear Bumper Clip Set &= 20 6600 30

Other Total : 110.00

Total :  $12,038.20
Gst (7%): $B42.67
GRAND TOTAL: $12,880.87

NB: THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE AND SHOULD ADDITIONAL WORK BE FOUND NECESSARY TO BE CARRIED OUT IN THE

COURSE OF REPAIRS, EXTRA MATERIALS AND LABOUR COST WILL BE CHARGED ACCORDINGLY WHICH HOWEVER, YOU
WILL BE INFORMED PRIOR TO ACTIOM TAKEN, PARTS PRICES ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGES.

Yours faithfully-

5 M. L
/ IL - "T/P 2?

\ : (0frg -
Service Advisar

Ronnie Tan

DID: 6844 1985 Fax:6844 5185 oM 9"7’

st |- Soul: (0




IRST AUTOWORKS

1st Autoworks Pte Lid
29 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 | South Wing) Singapore 415933 Tel: 68441985 Fax: 68445185

TAX INVDICE
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd.
AlG Building
78 Shanton Way
#07-18, Singapara 079120 GST Ref. Mo M2-0111811-5
Wahicke Mo SLS 3658R Invaice No:
Chasis No : WILBEGEAZHG 173874
Enging No: B117T149THRXX0526 Invoice Date:
AMOUNT
DESCRIPTION SGD
Parts
Mo,  Qty. Description Pri b]
1 1 REAR BUMPER UPPER 1850.00
2 1 REAR BUMPER LOWER 1450.00
§ 1 REAR BUMPER GUIDE LH 57.00
4 1 REAR BUMPER GUIDE BH 57.00
] 1 REAR BUMPER GUIDE CENTER 65.00
Total:  3479.00
Less 10%: 347.90
Parts Total - 3131.10
Labour
HNo. Description Price (SGD)
1 Ta dismantle / renew the accidant damaged porticn, o panel beating, reshape, straighten, 65000
= origntate & align repair / replacement parts :
2z Carry out spray painting on affect area Rear portion | Rear bumper & tailgate | 1,100.00
3 To disconnect front wire hamess of electrical component Lo facilitate repair, reconnect & 10,00
check electrical function after repair .
4 Remove and refit reverse sensor (Labour) 60.00
Labour Total : 1840.00
+
Other
Mo, Other Description Price (SGD)
1 Rear Bumper Clip Set 30.00
Other Total 30.00

Total:  5001.10
GST (7%) 350.08
Grand Total:  5351.18
Yours Faithiully,

-
A

Ronnié Tan

Service Mdvisor

Tel: 68441985 Fax:68445185

E&OQOE
ALL CHEQUE PAYMENTS SHOULD BE CROSSED AND MADE PAYABLE TO "1 5T AUTOWORKS PTE LTD"
PLEASE INDICATE THE INVOICE NG, ON THE REVERSE SIDE.

1st Autoworks Pte Ltd
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing) Next to Vicom Building, Singapore 415933 Tel : G844 1885 Fax: 6844 5185



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199507T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CS/EGI18019361/Avbn2

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

I

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date :  16-01-2019
SINGAPCORE 038985
Code: EGI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  YP 7S08E Veh. Inspected 5L5 3658R
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. YPT908E/SLIpl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  YEEPEIL Assign Date 24/10/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model OPELASTRA c.c 959
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. WOLBEBEAZHG173874 Colour RED
Odometer 22303 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[225/45R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/10/2018 linspection Date 29/1012018
Survey held at 1ST AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
#04-01 (SOUNTH WING)
SINGAPORE 415933
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-96071%8-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLS 3658R
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | &% mmp?;}} ‘}‘:l}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER UPPER DEFORMED 1,850.00 1,850.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER cuT 1,450.00 1,450.00
1|LHR BUMPER REFLECTOR NOT NECESSARY 70.00 :
1|RHR BUMPER REFLECTOR NOT NECESSARY 70.00 '
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT WOT NECESSARY 1.5949.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER GUIDE LH NECESSARY 57.00 57.00
1|REAR BUMPER GUIDE RH NECESSARY 57.00 57.00
1|REAR BUMPER GUIDE CENTER NECESSARY 65.00 65.00
1|REAR TAILGATE TO REPAIR SEE 2,200.00 =
LABOUR
1|REAR OPEL EMBLEM NOT NECESSARY 120.00 .
LESS 10% DISCOUNT 759,80 347.90
6,838.20 3.131.10
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1| SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 .
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 30.00
110.00 30.00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE/RENEW THE ACCIDENT DAMAGED 2,500.00 650.00
PORTION, TO PANEL BEATING RESHAPE STRAIGHTEN,
ORIENTATE AND ALIGN REPAIRIREPLACEMENT
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR TAILGATE.
CARRY OUT SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED 2,300.00 1,100.00
AREA (REAR BUMPER),
TO DISCONNECT WIRE HARNESS OF ELECTRICAL 80.00 30.00
COMPONENT TO FACILITATE REPAIRS RECONNECT
AND CHECK ELECTRICAL FUNCTION AFTER REPAIR.
REMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR (LABOUR), 130.00 §0.00
TO CONDUCT ANTI RUST OF UNDER CARRIAGE TUFF  [NOT NECESSARY 80.00 :
COAT.
5,090.00 1,840.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18019361/Avbn2




1 /d 74

- A W .
- F ¥ W
Page No..2 of 2
| GRAND TOTAL 12.038.20 5,001.10
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | I | 5001.10|

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18019361/Avbn2

%g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

[MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Repor i made solely for the was and banafit of the Client named cn the front page of this Report,

i Bability of responsibility whatscever. in contact or tort, |s accepted 1o any ihird party wio m
Report, in whole of in part, does so at his or her own risk,




