Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Autolnsure (Claims) <claimsO1@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 April, 2019 5:04 PM

To: Mavis, Chew

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: #1075108914SG003#023# << AIG ref | Accident involving SLT2932A (OI) and

SHD9814T on 18/10/18 along Bishan Road | CC3/LCR18019238/Kwa << LKK ref

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mavis,

No we do not have further documentations to prove our client's driver version of accident.
Do proceed to offer at 50/50 and keep us updated upon settlement.

Thank You.

Regards

Geraldine Lim
did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628
mobile: (65) 9743 6363

e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626

f: (65) 6368 0081

W: www.autoinsure.com.sg
g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This

may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service
providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.

On Thu, Apr 25, 2019 at 4:53 PM Mavis, Chew <Chew.Mavis @aig.com> wrote:

Dear Geraldine,

Thank you for your quick reply.



TP’s sketch plan and statement below:
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Circumstances of Accident

On 18.10.2018 at about 1355hours, | was travelling straight on the Centre lane along Bishan Road. Su
Vehicle B (SLT2932A) hit onto my taxi left rear portion.

Do you have any scene photos or any other documentations from our insured that may support his version of the
accident? Else, for conflicting reports like this and there is no evidence to substantiate, we will have to propose a
50-50 settlement to third party.

Hope to hear from you soon, thanks!

Best Regards,
Ms. Mavis Chew

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner



Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1970

chew.mavis@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Autolnsure (Claims) [mailto:claims01@autoinsure.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, April 25, 2019 4:38 PM

To: Mavis, Chew

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: #1075108914SG003#023# << AIG ref | Accident involving SLT2932A (OI) and
SHD9814T on 18/10/18 along Bishan Road | CC3/LCR18019238/Kwa << LKK ref

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mavis,

Please be informed we are still pending for AXA's offer and do not have the said video footage as it was overwritten.

On a side note, can you provide us TP's sketch & statement?



Thank You.

Regards

Geraldine Lim

did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628

mobile: (65) 9743 6363

e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626
f: (65) 6368 0081

w: www.autoinsure.com.sg

g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately

notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This
may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party
service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.

On Thu, Apr 25, 2019 at 4:20 PM Mavis, Chew <Chew.Mavis@aig.com> wrote:

Dear Sam/Geraldine,

Kindly advise on the status of our mutual client’s claim against AXA and also forward us a copy of the
video footage which was indicated in hirer’s report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ms. Mavis Chew



AlIG
Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1970

chew.mavis@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visir 1o learn more.

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility
of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



