On the contrary, you simply tell us that you are still pending your Principal's investigation. (222)

Since, you do not wish to settle this matter as per BOLA scenario, we regret to inform vou that we are
escalating matter to GIA. Unless you forward your offer by end day.

Thank you.

Best Regards

William Tan

Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off : 62148737 | Fax : 62141843

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohking@lkkauto.com=
Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 4:08 PM

To: William Tan Thoo Seng
Ce: KKLau; Aileen Tan Lee Noi; Asher Sng (LKK Auto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Yrref N.A. (SHD 957 Z - Transcab) vs SHC 2194 A D.O.A. 20.10.18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CCH/ASMIB0I9221/K 11a3
Your Ref: SHC 2194A

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter and tele conversation.
Please be informed our principal still pending Investigation on this matter.

We will follow up with our Principal again and shall revert to you once our principal revert to us.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negatiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Aulo Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080233)
| 7 P

SLRRIR N Save the Earthe Print omly when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any allached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,



Sent: Monday, 8 April 2019 10:59 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKK Auto) <pohkin(@lkkauto.com=; kianchuan.chan(@axa.com.sg

Ce: KKLau <kklau(@lkkauto.com=; chris.chionhhs(@axa.com.sg; Aileen Tan Lee Noi
<aileentan{@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Yrref N.A. (SHD 957 Z - Transcab) vs SHC 2194 A D.O.A. 20.10.18

Another gentle reminder

Video footage forwarded on 04.03.19
BOLA S5 :100% ***

Without Prejudice.
Dear Poh Kin
Below emails refer.

This morning, we spoke. The video footage was forwarded to yo on 04.03.19. It clearly showed liability is
100% down on your driver.

Case has been protracted for another month. Without any delay, we urge you to settle matter as per BOLA S
5. (100%).

If we do not receive your offer by 15.04.19, we regret to inform you that we will then escalate matter to
GIA.

Kindly be informed that our taxi driver 1s chasing for settlement.
Looking forward to receive your offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards

William Tan

Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off : 62148737 | Fax : 62141843

From: Poh Kin (LKEK Auto) <pohkini@lkkauto.com=>
Sent: Monday, 8 April 2019 10:19 AM

To: William Tan Thoo Seng

Cc: KK Lau; Admin A

Subject: RE: Yrref SHD957Z our taxi SHC2194A doa 20.10.18 - ( attached video, PO/DO to substantiate
the expanded downtime )

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

QOur Ref: CC4/ASMI1B019221/K 1fa3
Your Ref SHC 21944

10



Dear Wilham,

We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed our principal still pending Investigation on this matter.

We will revert to you once our principal revert to us.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{a08031)

¥y ESRS 2L
SeS =SS N Sgve the Larth- Frint only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the scle use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof, Thank you

From: William Tan Thoo Seng [mailto:williamtan@cdge.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 March 2019 5:09 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKK Auto) <pohkin{lkkauto.com=>

Cc: KK Lau <kklau@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: Re: Yr ref SHD957Z our taxi SHC2194A doa 20.10.18 - ( attached video, PO/DO to substantiate
the expanded downtime )

Gentle reminder
Video footage forwarded on 04.03.19

~ BOLASS : 100%
Without Prejudice.
Dear Poh Kin
Below email refers.
Kindly forward your offer and settle as per BOLA scenario.

Thank you.

11



Best Regards
William Tan

Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off ; 62148737 | Fax : 62141843

From: Catherine Koh Mu Gek

Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 3:30 PM

To: kklau@lkkauto.com

Ce: William Tan Thoo Seng

Subject: Yrref SHD957Z our taxi SHC2194A doa 20.10.18 - ( attached video, PO/DO to substantiate the
expanded downtime )

Dear Mr Lau

Our LOD of 1.2.19 refers.

Attached video footage, PO/DO to substantiate the expanded downtime for your review.
Kindly settle our PD claim as per BOLA S35,

Thank you.

Best Regards

Catherine Koh

Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off : 62148733 | Fax : 62141843

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privilegad or proprietary information. If you are nat the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and iis attachments immediately, and please be advised that using. copying, distributing or disclosing any cantents
therein = not aliowed Statements pertaining to any matter outside our busingss are not to be taken as endersed by ComfortDeiGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies. The comments/propasals pravided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Mothing herain
shall consttute a binding agreeman! betwaen the parties, Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition @xcept as agreed in 3
wriltan agreement signed by the duly authonsed representatives of both paries

ComforDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Enviranment Caungil - 2 committed to preserving the environment We encourage you
o @rint this only if necessary

ComferDelGro Engineenng Pte Lid [Registration No. 122506048W]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, priviteged or propnetary infarmation, If you are not the intended recipient, kindly natify
ug and dalete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised thal using, copying, distriputing or disclosing any contents
therein is not aflowed. Statements periaining to any matter outside our business are not 1o be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGra Corparation
Limited or ts related companies The comments/propasalz provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way 1o any term or condition except as agreed in a
written agreement signad by the duly authorised representatives of both parties

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to presarving the environment. We encourage you
o print this' only if necessary

ComfartDeiGra Enginesring Pte Lid [Reqistration No. 199506048W)
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This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged o propristary information. If you are nat the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delele this message and s attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
thersin Is not allowed. Statements pedaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corparation
Limited or ds related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to appravals Nothing herem

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither pany shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except 4s agreed In a
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of bath parties.

ComfertlelGro - a Green Office cartified by the Singapore Enviranment Council - s committed to presarving the emaronment We encourage you
1o prnt this only if necessary

ComfortDelGra Enginearing Pre Litd [Registrabion No. 1995060480

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or praprietary informatian. If you are not the intended recipient. kindly notify
uz and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
tharein i3 not allowed. Statements partaining to any matter cutside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGra Carparation
Limited or its related companies. The commenls/praposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be baund in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a
written agreemant signad by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComtortDelGro - & Green Office cenified by the Singapore Environment Council - i= committed 1o preserving the environment. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary

ComfertDelGro Engineering Ple Ltd [Regisiration No, 1955080480

This message and any attachments may contain confidential. privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its altachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowed. Statemants paraining to any matier outside our business are not to be laken as endorsed by ComfortDelGra Cormparation
Lirited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Naither party shall be baund in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a
written agreament signed by the duly authorised reprezentatives of both parties.

CaomfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - i committed to praserving the enviranment. VWe encourage you
ta pring this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGre Engineanng Ple Ltd [Registration Mo, 199506048W)

Thig message and any attachments may contain confidental, prvileged or proprietary information: If you are not the intended recipient. kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowesd. Statements periaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDeiGro Corporation
Limited or its refated companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nething herain
shall constitute a binding agresment between the parties. Neither pay shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a
written agresment signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office cerlified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you
ta print this only if necessary,

ComfertDelGre Engineering Pte Lid [Registration No. 199506048W)

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using. copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therein 1s not allowed. Statements perfaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGre Corporation

13



Limited ar its related companies: The commants/proposals provided are for discussion purposes cnly and are subject to appravals. Nothing herein
shall constitute 2 binding agreement between the parties. Meither party shall be bound in any way to any tarm or condition except as sgreed In 2
written agreement signad by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGre - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Couneil - i commitied to preserving the environmient. We encourage you
o prnt this only if necessary

ComforiDelGro Engineenng Pte Lid [Registration Mo 199506048W]

This message and any atachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its altachments immediately, and piease be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclasing any contents
therein 18 not allowed. Statements partaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing hergin
shall constitule a binding agreement Getwean the parties. Neither party shall be bound inany way to any term ar condiion except as agreed in a
wriflen agreement signed by the duly suthorised regpresentatives of bath parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Grean Office cerified by the Singapore Enviranment Council - is committed to preserving the enviranmeant. We encourage you
L print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engingenng Ple Lid [Registration No. 1995060480
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Cur Ref: T 1018/ SHC2194A /WT(st)
Your Ref :
Date 01-Feb-19 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept
59 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Singapore 508960
8 Shenton Way
#24-01, AXA Tower
Singapore 068811
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

COMFORIDELCRO
ENGINEERING

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHC2194A YOUR INSURED SHD 9572

AND OTHER ON 20.10.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the
of motor vehicle Mo :
insured vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi

owner

SHC2194A which was involved in the captioned accident with your
driver conderned have requested and

authorized us to assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible

for all applicable matters arising from the damage to the vehicle.
: SHD 957Z

your insured driving
m for your consideration an behalf of the claimants

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of
we are submitting these clai

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair
2 31 days Loss of Rental @ $ 12540 perday
3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK)
4 GIA/LTA Search Fee
5 GlA/ Police Report Fees
6 Towing Fees
Sub Total :

HIRER'S CLAIM
7 31 days Loss of Income @ $ 80.00 per days

Total Claims:
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -
a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs 4
b) LTA search slip/s of :
¢) GIA/ Police report/s of : SHCZ2194A
d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer | operator

{ X ) Photocopiels of Accident Scene Photofs
{ ) Witness statement/s (x ) Renta

{ X ) Towing receipts
| Rate letter ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any seftlement reached that
prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.
Yours faithfully

WAlGam Tan

CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 B737 Fax:6214 1843 Email : williamtani@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. Mo signature is required

COMFORIDELGRO
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you on the settlement of the said claims

it shall be without
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ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
Amember of COMPORIDELGRD ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

Head Office;
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701
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ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
A mamber of COMPORIDELCAD ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 379701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Awe 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 18%6071%8R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXATOWERSINGAPORE 068811

ATTN: SAW THENG

Ref - CC4/ASM18019221/K1pa3ds2
|||
Code: ASM

1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 8572 Veh. Inspected SHC 2194A
Policy No. VPX/P1680520 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. S8MD103K Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SAW THENG Assign Date 22/10/12018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAPRIUS c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JTDKB3FUT03529765 Colour BLUE
Odometer = Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FOOR
a. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[195/65R15 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/85R15 WEST LAKE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [195/65 R15 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/10/2018 Inspection Date 22/10/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508968
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B}jIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 14 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 2194A

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No 19-9607186-R

Page Mot of &

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM1801 8221/K1padsZ

|_m3r Description of Parts Condition ,.E::gm %’“ Our ﬁ:::]}ustad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| BONNET (CONSISTENT) BENT 950.50 50,50
1|INSULATOR, HOOD (CONSISTENT) TORN 398.10 398.10
10| INSULATOR CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 3.60 -
1|BONNET RUBBER (CONSISTENT) TORN 35.50 35.50
1|BONNET HINGE (RH) (CONSISTENT) BENT 57.70 57.70
1|BONMNET HINGE (LH) (CONSISTENT) BENT 57.70 57.70
1|BONNET LOCK (CONSISTENT) BENT 132 60 132.60
1|CATCH, HOOD AUXILIARY HOOK {CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 8.60 -
LABOUR
1|RADIATOR GRILLE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 438.00 43B.00
1|RADIATOR GRILLE EMBLEM (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 88.00 88.00
1|LAMP SET, STOP CENTER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 231.30 -
1|LAMP ASSY, FOG, RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 920.00 §20.00
1|LAMP ASSY, FOG, LH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED §20.00 920 .00
1|BULE. FOG LAMP, LH (CONSISTENT) NOT MECESSARY 34.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 499.90 48090
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) BENT £96.40 £96.40
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT ABSORBER TORN 115.70 115.70
{CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 7B.80 -
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 301.90 -
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 166.90 166.90
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 22.00 22,00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ §77.00 CRACKED 154.00 154.00
{CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT LOWER CROSSMEMEBER {CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 357.70 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT UNDER COVER (CONSISTENT} CRACKED 180.80 180.80
1|SUPPORT FR BUMPER, RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 81.70 -
1|SUPPORT FR BUMPER, LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 81.70
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE FRAME (CONSISTENT) BENT 236.00 236.00
1|BRACKET, FRONT BUMPER MOUNTING (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 2960 -




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. Mao: 190607 198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607 198-R

Page MNo.oZ of 5

’ - Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ hop l:g'ﬂ {5!!
1|BRACKET, FRONT BUMPER MOUNTING, NC.2 SERVICEABLE g7 80 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|uNIT ASSY , HEADLAMP, RH (LEDY (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 3,455.00 3,455.00
1|UNIT ASSY, HEADLAMP, LH (LED) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 3,455.00 3,455.00
1|HEAD LAMP PANEL (RH) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 240.10
LABOUR
1|HEAD LAMP PANEL (LH) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 240.10 .
LABOUR
1|TOP PANEL CENTRE (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 364.90 4
LABOUR
1|TOP PANEL SIDE (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 69,20 -
LABOUR
1|TOP PANEL SIDE (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 69.20
LABOUR
1|BRACE PANEL (CONSISTENT) BENT 75.20 7520
1|BRACKET, HEADLAMP MOUNTING, RH (CONSISTENT) | SERVICEABLE 25.50
1|BRACKET, HEADLAMP MOUNTING, LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 25.50 -
1|RADIATOR ASSY (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,841.80 .
1|RADIATOR BOTTOM MOUNTING (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 27.50 :
1|HORN WIRE (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 6,079.70 .
1|HORN (COMSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 11271 -
1|CLEANER ASSY, AIR (CONSISTENT) SERVICEAEBLE 970.30 -
1|AIR DUCT (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 129.40 -
1|CONDENSER ASSY, WIRECEIVER (CONSISTENT) BENT 1.336.60 1,336.60
1|FENDER SUB-ASSY. FRONT LH (CONSISTENT) DENTED 045 30 945 30
1|FRONT FENDER SHIELD, LH (CONSISTENT) TORMN 196.60 196.60
10|FRONT FENDER SHIELD CLIP (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 7.60 7.60
1| FRONT FENDER HYBRID EMBLEM, LH (CONSISTENT)  |NECESSARY 53.50 53.50
1|BRACKET, FRONT SIDE PANEL, LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 44.50 .
1|EXTENSION, FRONT FENDER, LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 47.20 .
1|PROTECTOR, FRONT FENDER, UPPER, LH SERVICEABLE 46.10 ;
(CONSISTENT)
1| TRAY BATTERY (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 42,80 3
1|cLaMP, BATTERY (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 16.10 =
2| FRONT DOOR SAFETY BELT (LH/RH) @ $846.10 JAMMED 1,692.20 1,692.20
(CONSISTENT)
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2|REAR DOOR SAFETY BELT (LH/RH) @ $828.00 JAMMED 1,676.00 1,676.00
{CONSISTENT)
1|ERONT WINDSCREEN GLASS (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 1,627.30 1,627.30
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING (CONSISTENT) |NECESSARY 94.33 94.33
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS PILLAR (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 343.10 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT CHASSIS MEMBER (LH) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 2.03510 -
LABOUR
1|coOMPUTER ASSY, AIR BAG ECU (STEERING AIR BAG) SHORTED 2,402.20 240220
(CONSISTENT)
11SIDE AIRBAG, LH [CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 1.479.00 1,479.00
1|SIDE AIRBAG, RH (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 1,479.00 1.475.00
1lAIR BAG ASSY, DRIVER SIDE LOWER, RH (CONSISTENT) ACTIWATED 1,615.00 1,615.00
1|AIR BAG ASSY, FRONT SEAT, RH {CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 84610 846.10
1| AR BAG ASSY, FRONT SEAT, LH (CONSISTENT}) ACTIWATED B46.10 8456.10
1|AIR BAG ASSY, INSTRUMENT PANEL PASSENGER WO |ACTIVATED 3.277.50 3,277.50
DOOR, LH (CONSISTENT)
1|SENSOR ASSY, SIDE AIR BAG, RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE T09.30 N
1|SENSOR, AIR BAG, REAR RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 567.80 -
1|SENSOR, AIR BAG, STEERING (CONSISTENT) SHORTED B68.60 668.60
1 IMOULDING WINDSHIELD {CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 4400 44 00
1| TAPE RAIN SENSOR (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY £.70 570
1|ABSORBER FRONT BUMPER {CONSISTENT) BENT 115.70 115.70
1|AIR BAG ASSY INS PA (CONSISTENT) ACTIWATED 1,479.00 1,478.00
1|LH ROCKER PANEL (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 570.00 570.00
1|LH BUMPER COVER (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 28.10 2810
1|RH BUMPER COVER (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 2810 28.10
1|RADIATOR SUPP COVER (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 22520 22520
1|RAD SUPP SUB ASSY (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) BENT 368.70 369.70
1|RAD SUPP SUB ASSY LOW (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) |[BENT 393.20 383.20
1lsupP sUB RAD LH (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 23470 23470
1lsUPP SUB RAD RH (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL} CRACKED 23470 23470
1|FRT BUMPER BRAC EXTENSION (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 899.00 99.00
(ADDITIONAL})
1|INLET AIR CLEANER NO2 (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) |CRACKED 93.00 93.00
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1|CASE SUB ASSY AIR CLEANER {COMSISTENT) CRACKED 190.10 190.10
(ADDITIONAL)
1|INLET AIR CLEAMER NOZ2 (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 34,80 34 80
1|INLET AIR CLEANER NO1 (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 129.40 126 .40
1lcoVER PILLAR SUB FRT PILLAR (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 95 .00 96.00
(ADDITIONAL)
11AIR BAG ASSY BUTTOMN (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) SHORTED 2.377.30 2.377.30
10|RAD SCREW (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
s|cLIP WINDSHIELD MOULD (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIOMAL) |[NECESSARY 17.40 17.40
1lcAP SUB-AIR CLEANER (CONSISTENT) (ADDMTIONAL) CRACKED 446.30 446 30
1|COMPUTER SUB-HEADLAMP (CONSISTENT) SHORTED 481.40 481.40
(ADDITIONAL)
1|GUIDE RAD AIR LH (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 5R.20 58.20
1|SEAL HEAD FRONT (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL} TORN 24.40 24,40
1|WIRE INSTRUMENT PANEL FROMNT (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 24.30 24.30
(ADDITIONAL)
1|HEAD LINING ASSY REST INNER (CONSISTENT) TORN 2037 .40 2.037.40
(ADDITIONAL)
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -11,701.93 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -10,788.76
46,807.71 32,366.27
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NG, PLATE (SN} (CONSISTENT) BENT 25.00 25.00
1|FRONT MO PLATE TRIM COVER (SN} (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 30.00
1|FRONT NO, PLATE GARNISH [SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 99.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER LOGO (SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 87.10 -
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) [CGN$1STENT] WECESSARY 45.00 45,00
1|ERP STICKER (SN) (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 6.00 6.00
29310 77.00
LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF CATCH, 2,000.00 1,400.00

HOOD AUXILIARY HOOK; FRONT LOWER
CROSSMEMBER: HEAD LAMP PANEL (RH); HEAD LAMP
PANEL {LH); TOP PANEL CENTRE; TOP PANEL SIDE;
FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS PILLAR AND FRONT

CHASSIS MEMBER (LH) .
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SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 1,500.00 1,000.00

WIRING CHARGE 50.00 20.00

TUFF KOTE. 200.00 120.00

TOWING CHARGE. 60.00 60.00

FRONT CHASSIS ALIGNMENT CHARGE. 400.00 100.00

REMOVE / REFIX RADIATOR 280.00 50.00

REMOVE / REFIX AIRCON & REFILL GAS. 150.00 60.00

REMOVE / REFIX ENGINE NOT NECESSARY 450.00 !

REMOVE / REFIX DASHBOARD. NOT NECESSARY 400.00 -

REMOVE / REFIX FUSE BOX NOT NECESSARY 120.00 !

REMOVE / REFIX FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS. 90.00 90.00

REMOVE / REFIX CUSHION & UPHOLSTERY FRONT. 150.00 50.00

R/REFIX AIR BAG /| STEERING WHEEL / DASHBOARD / 550.00 200.00
SEAT.

R/REFIX SEATS UPHOLSTERY 154.74 154 74

6,554.74 3,304.74

GRAND TOTAL 53,655.55 35,748.01

[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS [ 35748.01]
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