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Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd A uw{

Bik 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412 ,{_/; \
Singapore 539195
Tel:62898126 Fax 62870590 ; 1':'{ l&'
Company Reg No:200704370C GST Reg No ::200704370C 4,'({,_; “(

A-L»-f

DATE :  23/10201%

M/S EQ INSURANCE

JE——
ESTIMATE REPAIR COST FOR SLH 59648

b= - - R S S PRI —

List ltems

IPC  BONNET V2 O s 424007
2PCS BONNETHINGE A1 i3 96.00. 7

| PC  BONNET LOCK 5 69.00

| PC FRONT BUMPER 7). A b&& S 769.00"
ISET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS “l4< s 45.00 ="

1 PC WIPER TANK 4 1 § 98000

| PC  BADGE AL 5 4i.00—

I PC BONNET BLACK GARNISH €47 3 R7.00-

| PC FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER %4 S 24.00”
2PCS  HEADLAMP  Sca/cas fv x> (3o $ 170800
I PC FAN COWLING -4 4 § 7 38500 X

I PC  AIRCON CONDENSER %7/ v 4 §  S.00-
| PC  RADIATOR  Jue § 20800 &

| PC SUPPORT PANEL £ s 298.00—
IPC  REARBUMPER 7 © bfo ¥ S 80500~

| SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS  7¢< § T 4500
2PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER 'f-j;f? § 32000
2PCS REAR BUMPER RED REFLECTOR §  ea00

I PC REAR BUMPER INNER ALUMINION ‘}I-IIELD Laufftmr  §  ggo0—
I PC REAR MUFFLER o & $  _750.00—
| PC TAILPIPE CHROME § 0500
IPC  TAILGATE $edg D & $  985.00 —
IPC  TAILGATE BADGE A¢d s T 4100~

| PC TAILGATE | EMBLEM Aé~ S 500

| PC TAILGATELOCK 4 §  296.00.%

S 8,150.00 »""/ W
LESS 10% % (BI5. ﬂ[}}
4 S 733500
| &3 REVERSE SENSOR q[,,ﬁ( S 25000 29y S A
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28
29

30
3
32
33
34

35
36
i7
38
i9
40
41

2PCS
2SET
1 PC

NUMBER PLATE e S 8000 5
SEALANT A s pooo¥p S
TOWING S 15000 [y 2R
FRONT LABOUR :

SPRAY PAINTING s 860.00 Yo 5
LABOUR CHARGE § 88000 Fop

TO REMOVE AND RENEW AIRCON PARTS S 160,00 /s 4
TO REMOVE AND REFIX DASHBOARD ANS 22000 £
WIRING CHECK $ 300070
REAR LABOUR
SPRAY PAINTING $ 1,00000 P00
LABOUR CHARGES $  1.250.00 L0
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR GLASS S 12000
REMOVE AND RENEW MUFFLER S 160,00 6 D
WIRING S 350020
TUFF KOTE 12000 {p

S i)
S 12.760.00
2609
LKK Auto Consylfants hence nobly
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> Back to OneMotoring

" Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
CIOE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein Is correct as at 22 Oct 2018

Singapore NRIC
1487C

SLH5%9648
Yes

24 Oct 2018
MITSUBISHI

AR 4AT MIVEC I-CASUAL

White

2010

3B20CIB199
JMYLRHATIWAUDO0210
47.0kW [63 bhp
$15,183.00

29 Dec 2010

29 Dec 2010

3

$15,1B3.00

Yes
28 Dec 2020
5%.109.00

28 Dec 2020

A - Car (1600¢cc & below)
10

$47.604.00

$10.365.00

$19.474.00

ruw:mumwwmmmunﬂmmmummwuwl P ) N U USRS



- Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Justin Wong <justinwong@eqinsurance.comsg>
Sent: Monday, 22 October 2018 1:22 PM
To: ‘assignments’
Cc: SUR 11 £
: I 2|2
Subject: FW: Third Party claim survey - EQI (SGJ498L) I 5@1“\@; “
Attachments: SAS2491597 pdf wvihicdle In
Peson @ |
Dear LKK, SURE@ Mared:

Kindly assist with PRS.

Please note that Ol non-reporting.

Regards,
Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190

Www eginsurance.com.sg

I |

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 11:54 AM

To: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Third Party claim survey

Dear Justin,
Please appoint

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 6741-4108

Thank you & Best Regards,
lowis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Bik 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,



Tel {65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email uis@jinauto.com.s

From: lustin Wong [mailto:justin.wong@eqinsurance.com.sg)
Sent: Monday, 22 October 2018 11:35 AM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Third Party claim survey

Without Prejudice
Sove As To Costs

Dear Jouis,

We refer to your email on PRI on even date.,

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client's vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have
agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one or more of
our proposed mator surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte
Tel: 6255 0BOE Ltd
Fax: 68499155 Tel: 5286 0155
Fax: 6284 1539
Contact Person: Sophia
3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822
Tel; 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283
Fax: 6281 8743 Contact Person: Sharon
Contact Person: Amy/ Grace
5] RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361 Fax; 6741-4108
Contact Person: Elson/Elgene
7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services
Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655
Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662
Contact Person: Mr Chee
9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070
Contact Person: Jasmine




11) Infiniti Appraisal Service
Tel: 9009 9001 , 96684818
Fax: 6458 7432
Contact Person; Cedric / Edward

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Regards,
Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 656223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWW,EQINnSurance.com.sg

[ l

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t}

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg|
Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 10:44 AM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance com.sg>
Subject: Third Party claim survey

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Accident Involving Vehicle SLH3964B and SGJ498L (your Insured ) dated 20/10/2018

We are assistingowner of SLH3964B handling his third party claim

recovery against  SGJ4981. . Please arrange third party survey at our workshop.

Kindly establish liability for this case.

Content of emall:



* Vehicle to be Surveyed: SLH5964B

EQ-insured Vehicle: SGJ498L

Date of Accident: 20/10/2018

Name of Workshop:

Address of Survey Location: Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 539195.

Name of Contact Person: Jouls Seow

Contact Number: 62898126

Email Address of Contact Person: jouis@jinauto.com.sg

Jouls Seow

lin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax :{65) 62870590

Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 2:20 PM
To: ‘assignments’
Cec: SUR
Subject: RE: Third Party claim survey - EQI (SGJ498L)
Attachments: Ol GIA - SGJ49BL.PDF 2-Slpmy@ 23 1'. alaale
fmw@
Dear LKK,
\thic lﬂ
Please find OI's GIA report as attached and assist with direct settlement. SJJ‘R@ W"-‘t
Regards,
Justin Wong
Executive | Claims
re- Ly O Tr-" -
EQ Insurance turnpanv Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
Www.eginsurance.com.sg <
J~ A Member of Chystate ﬁ

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Justin Wong

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 1:22 PM

To: 'assignments’ <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Ce: 'SUR' <ssur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Third Party claim survey - EQJ (5GJ498L)

Dear LKE,

Kindly assist with PRS.

Please note that Ol non-reporting.
Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited



S Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 656223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eqinsurance.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tf

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@ijinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 11:54 AM

To: lustin Wong <justin.wong@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Third Party claim survey

Dear Justin ,
Please appoint

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 6741-4108

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouls Seow

Jin Auto Services Pre Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel  :(65) 62898126
Fax  :(65) 62870590

Emall . jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Justin Wong [mailto:justin.wong@eqinsurance.com.sg)
Sent: Monday, 22 October 2018 11:35 AM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Third Party claim survey

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Jouis,
We refer to your email on PRI on even date.

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections ta the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have
agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one or more of
our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte
Tel: 6255 0808 Ltd
Fax: 6849 9155 Tel: 6286 0155




Fax: 6284 1539
Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283

Fax: 6281 8748
Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

Contact Person: Sharon

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361 Fax: 6741-4108

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services
Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655
Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Mr Chee

9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070

Contact Person: Jasmine

11) Infiniti Appraisal Service
Tel: 9009 9001 , 96684818
Fax: 6458 7432
Contact Person: Cedric / Edward

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor befare you
return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Regards,
Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 656223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWw.eginsurance.com.sg



—

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: jouis |mailtn:|::-ui§@tinaum‘cgm.,r_,g|

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 10:44 AM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: Third Party claim survey
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam
Accident Involving Vehicle SLH5964B and SGJ49BL (your Insured | dated 20/10/2018

We are assisting ownerof SLHS5964B handling his third party claim

recovery against  SGJ498L . Please arrange third party survey at our workshop.

Kindly establish liability for this case.

Content of email:

Vehicle to be Surveyed: SI.H39648

EQ-insured Vehicle: SGJI498].

Date of Accident: 20/10/2018

Name of Warkshop:

Address of Survey Location: Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 539195,

Name of Contact Person: Jouis Seow

Contact Number: 62898126

Email Address of Contact Person: jouis@jinauto.com.sg

Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel : (B65) 62898126
Fax  :(65)62870590

Email : jouis@jinauto.com.sg






Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 539195
Tel:62898126 Fax :62870590

Busioess Hegistration Ne:2007045700 GST Registration No: 2007043700

Date: 29/1072018

Your ref: SGJ498L

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
C/0 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs
Accident involving SGJ498L & SLH3964B on 20/10/2018

We are instructed by the owner SLH5964B to write, negotiate and settle claim on his behalf
tor the above mentioned accident. Our client’s vehicle: SLH5964B was inspected and surveyed
by your surveyor. As the accident was caused solely due to the negligence of your insured:
SGJ498L we are now seeking the total amount of claim as follow:

We are now seeking the total amount of claim as follow:
Repair cost S56420.00( with gst)
Rental 1080.00

TOTAL SS 7500.00

We shall appreciate if vou could kindly consider our claim at vour earliest convenience and
kindly let us have your acknowledgement of receipt of this letter within 14days of your
receipt of this letter.

Yours faithfully

Jouis seow



Ju! Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene [LKKAUtD)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 3:07 PM

To: 'kelvinloh@gmail. com’

Ce: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ 49BL AND SLH 59648 ON 20/10/2018

Our Ref: CC4/EQI18019204/Uja3

LOH KAK WEI KELVIN
Policy Holder

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5GJ 498L AND SLH 59648 ON IDZIDEID;E

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the
claim against you under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an
amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) will be withheld for the time being. Pending
for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ikkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this emall Is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
infarmation, If you are not the intended recipient (or have recelved this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

To: Jin Auto Services Pte Lid

Dear Si
Lﬂ;“fﬂm_wwg a1y L & UHS{WB on 20| 10| (&

I/We, the owner of Vehicle Registration Number,QLH S04 ®  hereby authorise you to
repair my/our vehicle repair, submit ,correspond ,negotiate and settle my/our claim for cost of
repair and/or uninsured losses arising from the ahove accident .

I/We further authorise you M/S Jin Auto Services Pte Lid, to execute, sign, seal and deliver all
documents whatsoever in relation to this matter and to accept and receive any puyment due to
me/us in respect of my/our claim above.

I/We hereby declare that all acts and documents done by virtue of this Letter of Authorisation
on my /our behalf shall be good valid and effectual to all intents and purposes whatsoever as if
the same had been done or executed by me/us in person .

[/We further confirm that the acceptance by M/s Jin Auto Services Pte Lid of the settlement
amount in respect of such claim shall constitute the full discharge of my/our claim in respect
of such loss and damage.

Signed by :

Name : L\‘mr\n Seke e
NRIC NO: S Fo 4%

Dae: o -0 - |




Jin Auto Services PTe L1p

s Blk 14 #01- 410/412 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539195
Tel: 6289 8126 (24 hrs) Fax: 6287 0590
Email: jin® jinauto.com.sg
Company Reg. No: 200704570C GST Reg. No: 20743 70C

TAX INVOICE
s BO Woer Comnuont, Swnded . i 16273
Vehicle No: SLH 596%R
Date: ;q\lu\l% z
Quantity DESCRIPTION —
O(ﬁh. (ﬂ\ MM-« M\!u\ 1 o
J
T N T LoV
v s
Gornege 1y VAHEA O PG i B st E.&O.E ADDGST | 6 ‘fb‘-—-‘
for amy reason whisoeve: I 'g e¥;p_;_,._}




HIRER'S PARTICULARS

=

DAWN ENTERPRISES

a Qe

21 Seletar West Farmway 1
Singapore 798125 N° 36155
Tel: 63832661 Fax: 64842836
Reg No.430058/000
\\\\ ¥
RENTAL AGREEMENT DATE L

b\]uv\.q Soke Ll-"\a

DRIVER'E PARTICULARS

Hume U. Hame
o B HOS R Femila R —
#19-4%. SC Ha4e8)
mmmﬂmﬁ“‘?l“{f&}ﬂ Courtry VG or Passport No. County
o - Iadwsy Oecusation
s ar=b- Jo o 48 i Ae
OmvinglicencaMa. __ Dats Passaq M Ditving Licance No Daty Passed
Teu ey G 48 l}*:er [Residernca) Tol: (Oftcs) (Remioenco)
IMPORTANT NOTES: CHARGES
T My eurErs Coversds || e ot py e 38 bl o e Suar ) gpen Seaing s & -
ety e [Wonw 12800 e [SWEHUD
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DAWN ENTERPRISES

21 SELETAR WEST FARMWAY 1
SINGAPORE 796125
TELL: 6383 2661 FAX: 6484 2836
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e—p Y ‘I; ‘- Prw L Company Registration No. 189607188R

1 UBLAVE LoMi2-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE JOM9AY TEL : (065) 62563861 FAX : (065) 62564015

To : Mis EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 12/112/2018
IRD DIRECT SETTLEMENT
_ SGJ 498L (Insd Veh) [Your Ref. No. : DMPPHQ18-004308
Vehicle No.
SLH 59648 (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CC4/EQI18019204/Uja3q2

Date of Accident 20/10/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost ' $ 6.420.00
Loss of Use '8 days
Rental (If any) ' $ 900.00 9 days
Others: ]

'8

7,320.00

Final Settlement Sum |: § 7,300.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks

Paymenl Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |JIN AUTO SERVICES PTELTD - 7,300.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 8258 4315
Reg. No: 18660710BR GST Reg. No. 18-0807108-R

Affilinted to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CC4/EQI1B019204/Ujadq2
o TonER IR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date . 12-12-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 088110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGJ 488L Veh. Inspected SLH 5064B
Policy No. DMPPHQ18-004309 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  JUSTIN Assign Date 2211072018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHII-CAR (A) c.C 659
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. JMYLRHATWALIDDOZ10 Colour WHITE
Odometer 127544 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOQD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |145/65R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |145/85R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |145/65 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[145/65 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR & FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5 General Information
Accident Date  20110/2018 |In|pnctlun Date 22/10/2018
Survey held at JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
BLK 14 DEFU LANE 10
#01-412
SINGAPORE 539185
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTIM#TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: T Working Days




¥y

e &am A

L

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SLH 59648

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Park, Singspore 408933
TEL: 6258 3551 FAX: B258 4315
Reg Mo 198607T1BBR GST Reg. No. 19-9507198-R

Page No.;T ol 2

aty Description of Parts Condition “"“5‘,"“"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BONNET DENTED / 424 00 424 00
BUCKLED
2|BONNET HINGE NOT NECESSARY 98 .00 -
1|BONNET LOCK BENT 69.00 68,00
1|FRONT BUMPER TORN 769 00 68800
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 45.00 4500
1|WIPER TANK NOT NECESSARY 88.00
1|BADGE NECESSARY 4100 41.00
1|BONMET BLACK GARNISH cuT B7.00 B7.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER BENT 24 00 24.00
2|HEADLAMP SCRATCHED / 1,708.00 1,300.00
CRACKED
1|FAN COWLING NOT NECESSARY a85.00 -
1|AIRCON CONDENSER BENT / PUNCTURE §72.00 572.00
1|RADIATOR SERVICEABLE 298.00 -
1|SUPPORT PANEL CRACKED 26868.00 288.00
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 805.00 B8040
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 45.00 45.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER BENT 3200 32.00
2|REAR BUMPER RED REFLECTOR NOT NECESSARY 64.00
1|REAR BUMPER INMER ALUMINION SHIELD BENT / TWISTED 88,00 88.00
1|REAR MUFFLER DENTED 75000 B85.00
1|TAILPIPE CHROME NOT NECESSARY 85.00
1| TAILGATE BADLY DENTED 88500 B85.00
1|TAILGATE BADGE MECESSARY 41.00 41.00
1|TAILGATE LEMBLEM MECESSARY 35.00 35.00
1|TAILGATE LOCK NOT NECESSARY 208600 B
LESS 10% DISCOUNT 81500 4603 94
7.335.00 5,435 48
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 25000 20000

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18019204/Uja3q2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE = 51 Ui Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubi Ingusirial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 19880T16BR GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R Page No. 2ol 2
aty Description of Parts Condition wm%] *&J‘_"""
2|NUMBER PLATE (SN) DENTED / BENT 80.00 80 00
2|SET SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 40,00
410,00 320 00
LABOUR
TOWING 150.00 50.00
SPRAY PAINTING 860.00 400.00
LABOUR CHARGE 880 00 500.00
TO REMOVE AND RENEW AIRCON PARTS 180,00 100.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX DASHBOARD | NOT NECESSARY 220.00
WIRING CHECK 30,00 20.00
SPRAY PAINTING 1,000.00 600,00
LABOUR CHARGES 1,250 00 550.00
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR GLASS 120.00 120.00
REMOVE AND RENEW MUFFLER 160.00 60.00
WIRING 3500 20,00
TUFF KOTE 120.00 60.00
4,985 00 2,480.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,730.00 8,235.46
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 16,000.00
{TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18019204/Uja3q2
CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAIMER OF LLABILITY TO THIMD PARTIES - This Meport (s made solely lor e uss aind benefll of he Clisnt named on he front page of ihis Repert




