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* Nivitha (LKK Auto)
\,

From: TEQ Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 October 2018 2:16 PM

To: SUR; LKK - Assignments

Subject: OD Survey @ GFORCE AUTOTECH - SFG6161X - SBMO0ZHZ
Attachments: OD ESTIMATE pdf; SFG6161X INSD GIA PDF; GBR6226B TP GIA PDF
Hi

Please survey and authorise if damages consistent and within economical repair limit.
Please apply cost + 10%. Excess is $700.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kitty Teo | Specialist, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | B Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.ana.com.sg
Email:kitty.teo@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 Press 3

. a¥ redefining /insurance

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message IS conhidentia II'|I'|.|. unauthorized disclosure e or disssmination. either whale or partial, is

ohibited. If ¢ou are nat the intended re iment af the message. please notify the sender immediately

--—---Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this
message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or
opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group. unless otherwise stated by the sender and
duly authorized by the said companies.



Denise Ta: !LI{HAutn]

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 3:45 PM
To: '‘Gforce auto’; SUR

Subject: RE: SFGE161X NEW REVISED QUOTATION
Attachments; SFG6161X ON COST PRICE pdf

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SFG 6161X (Excess $700/-). Parts supglier
invoice need to be provided.

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: B256-3561 | emall: denisetay(@|kkauto.com | fas: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Libi industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #802-25 | 5(408533)

From: Gforce auto <gforce.workforce@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 2:54 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SFG6E161X NEW REVISED QUOTATION

On Wed, Oct 24, 2018 at 1:31 PM Gforce auto <gforce. workforce @gmall.com> wrote:

On Wed, Oct 24, 2018 at 1:13 PM Gforce auto <gforce workforce @gmail.com> wrote:

Forwarded message ————

From: Gforce auto rce workf mail.com
Date: Wed, Oct 24, 2018 at 12:47 PM

Subject: SFGE161X NEW REVISED QUOTATION

To: <sur@lkkauto.com>

Hi,



Denise Tﬂ SLI(HAutn}

From: Gforce auto <gforce workforce@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December 2018 1:35 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Automatic reply: SFG6161X NEW REVISED QUOTATION
Attachments: CCI26018_0003 jpg; SBB818 SFG 61 61X pdf

Hi Denise,

Here | attached Tax Invoice & Discharge Voucher signed by owner.

Best Regards,
Elie

On Thu, Nov 29, 2018 at 4:42 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto com> wrote:

Dear Elle,

Confirm figure at 58582 .98 + $420.82(GST 7%) = $9,003.80.

Repair days 6.

Please forward us the Discharge voucher and tax invoice after owner has sign.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handlar

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: denisetay®lkkauta com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenus 1, #02-35 | 5{408933)

From: Gforce auto <gforce workforce@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 2:04 PM




-ur:..u...u 1] Claim Ponal

« Service Request Details
Claim
SEMOOZHZ

Reterence

None &

Loss Date
October 15, 2018

Reguest Date
October 22, 2018

Due Date
October 29, 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss

Cwn Damage

SETVICeS

Accelerated survey and authorize

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perfarm service

L

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #

SFG6161X

Make
BMW

rmptmrp.mwtmim:mm.-nh:lm-pnrrauhmm:mnumm-mum.hmmmmwmmwnm-m 12



/52018 Claim Portal

: Model
e 740)

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

GNANAKUMAR KANAGASABAPATHY PERIMANAM PILLAI
59 NAMLY DRIVE. 267467, Singapore
96954527

Claim Handler

® ok
6568804602
kitty teo@axa.com sg

Additional Instructions

EXCESS $700
Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics MNotes
TYPE (7]
. SENT 11/2/18 6:02 PM
FROM TEO Kitty
SUBJECT Re:SUPPLEMANTARY
BODY Hi Denise Please proceed with supplementary,
-~
TYPE (7}
SENT 11/1/1B 4:49 PM
FROM LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

hﬂps:f.fvp.nmunmjmssm.m,ng!clmm-purtll.rhmh:ﬂmmmmmmmamummﬂmmlmwﬂm



WLz Claim Portal
Model
740 |

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

GNANAKUMAR KANAGASABAPATHY PERIMANAM PILLAI
59 NAMLY DRIVE, 267467, Singapore
96954527

Claim Handler

TEO Kitty
6568804602
kitty.teo@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
EXCESS $700

Messages Invoices History Documents Aszesament Matrics MNotes

hittps:/ivp smaricliaims.axa com. sgiclaim-portal/himi/index-vendor-service-requests himi#/service-raquests/?serviceRequestNumber=T6859



KADRI Mateen
H

From: Gforce auto <gforce workforce@gmail com>

Sent: Friday, Octaber 19, 2018 11:13 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Mator Survey

Subject: ATTN TO CLAIM DEPARTMENT (CLAIM OWN DAMAGES)

Attachments: EST - SFG 6161X pdf updated 19.10.18.pdf; GA005021-Policy Schedule pdf:
SAS52489585.PDF; CC117018jpg

Categories: Mateen

Dear Sirs,

NOTICE TO CONDUCT PRI INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NUMBER SFG 6161X

We would like to inform you to conduct Pri Inspection and
arrange your surveyor to come and take photo. My client would
like to claim Own Damages and here | attached GIA report,
NRIC, Insurance Certificate & driving license our client's for your
reference. Our client car at workshop already.

As per result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client's
proceed to repair damaged of the vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of
your receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would like to conduct a pri
inspection survey of the vehicle.

‘Location Gforce Autotech Pte Ltd
10 KaKi Bukit Road 2,
#01-34
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

Contact Number +65 6205 8108 (Office)

+65 9139 1448 (Adrian)

'Oparatiun Hour 9.00am to 6pm (Weekdays)

1



9.00am to 3pm (Saturday)
PH (Closed)

Regards,
Elle (Ms)
Gforce Autotechnik
Tel: +65 6205 8108



Denise Taz SLKK.Auto]

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 4:43 PM

To: 'Gforce auto’

Subject: RE: Automnatic reply: SFG6161X NEW REVISED QUOTATION
Dear Elle,

Confirm figure at $8582.98 + $420.82(GST 7%) = $9,003.80.
Repalr days 6.

Please forward us the Discharge voucher and tax invoice after owner has sign.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denlsetay®lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
gk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Gforce auto <gforce.workforce@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 2:04 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Automatic reply: SFG6161X NEW REVISED QUOTATION

Hi Denise,

Please revert my estimate as soon as possible. Owner will go down to our place to sign the discharge voucher.
| need the confirmation amount before owner sign the discharge voucher. Appreciate if you can reply asap.

Thank you

Regards,
Elle

On Tue, Nov 27, 2018 at 2:57 PM Gforce auto -:g{gp_:g.ﬂnrkforg@gmalliggmb wrote:

Hi denise,
Any update for finalization estimate?

Regards,
Elle

On Mon, Nov 19, 2018 at 10:24 AM Denise Tay {LKKAuto) <denisetay@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear All,



TAPUANIR

?‘B‘ack to OneMotoring

*Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:;
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassks No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Cipen Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date-
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
FARF Eligibllity:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category

COE Perlod{Years):

QP Paid;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The Information contained herein s correct as at 23 0ct 2018

PARFICNF Rahata Frniirg

Company
0410H

SFG&141X

No

230ct 2018

BMW.

7401 AT SR LED DSC MAY HUD
White

2012
13438266N55830A
WEAYALZOPOCTPA546
235.0kW (315 bhp)
$£78,176.00

2% Nov 2012

29 Nowv 2012

0

£78.174.00

Yes
28 MNov 2022
§54.723.00

28 Nov 2022

E - Open Category
10

$73.990,00
$36,105.00
$92.828.00

oK

MRS VLIS, GOV, S/ A YT BCTIoN enguInen e 0ale oy ubliCoeTorBuereg mput iU | IWN_sualsuud |l
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huy my carl s + Get Pald Now. Handaver Later

* Fram WICOW gvalustion
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rag Ay ay W1 iy A ey Meai sl
] BMW 7 Series 740U Sunronf $110.808  $21.080 /yr 1517012 LM 86,000 km Luamuiry Awuilabie
The BMW 7 Sevies Embodies Luxury That [rpines Criving Dynamics That Enthuse And A& Vieus! Pressmnoe That Esms Uslvarssl Adrseration, [t 15 4

Product OF & Sedf Assurod Design Philsscohy And Corlgient ¥ el D
[l oMW 7 Series 7400 Sunrood $11%.000 S18.520 fyr 15N 10132 19 e H1,000 km Lusury Awallable
Single Dwmer, Low Mileage PML Unt. Highest Paper Value! Lusury Sedan That Biends Perdectly For Business And Lissure: e Parnpmred Wilh Ample

Liog Rocim|

Bawvarian Margust Pis Lid

[ BMw 7 Series 7400 Sunroof $112.800 $17,950 fyr 21-hav-2013 19 . Luniry Avaliabie
100% Laan Availathe, ] Dwner,Full Ssraced Hessornes wits P Es-Bankruptoy And Bad Crest Walcome, High Trace In
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

T v I Lestals of thes accident o soned U B cheirms o

pomplaled by the Pokcwlioldes saior (he. Addborsed Dirwer
1 [ I;I'f'-li i i s | ' vl o i EsETa e wedfickifingg of misiprnl (acks maey @l IWEANOD COmbEnes 10

# iree] dcrptance ] B Form by (Hauieics oarmparses & nol i s e Rl o i il of i Sviiiiinnce Soavishii

.il.l:r' T-_l_lh- reporting may I_:-:Etl_l_rrﬂrr rill_--_i-'nlnrﬂ for IrrwesTgatinn

dlll v loradinideidd Ley Ths i T i Il i i i il [y T | i A jii] sarcrEaiE (0 i
AT i T AN P " f Biiw et il | - —— o ! i v Bry fesresyionch parhons
W Il |[FT Pl T i i i Bt e i i ppaail @i i b i (i 1 st Lssiingy Phichs sy il astals

alorr il

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Prte O Rapon 1B0R2018 17T

Daate OF Acoident 1502018 183

Exacl Localicn OF Accidant BUKIT TIMAH ROAD
auntry/State af Loss NGARORI

Vishicle Registration Mumbei SFGE1B1X

Insured/Policyholder

Hame Of RHegisterad Owies AMNANMAKUMAR KANAGASABAPATHY PERIMANAM PILLAI

MHIC Mo S2TIASTEO

Emiml Adrireas MUERAI

Mabile Phone No LOCAL | +65-96854527

Altarnative Phone Mo JFFICE-9649545.27

Vehicle Particulars

Manufaciurer Brw

Model rA0LI

Exact Purposa for which vehicles was baing used al
time of acciden

Are yol claimimg under your own insurance policy

for repair o your vehicke?

It No, Pleas=s state aclion o be laker

Vathicla Cotigon, PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

HName of Insurance Company AXA INSLIRAMNCE PTELTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleat Palicy N

Folicy Mumibt GAODGOZ

Corver Nats Nurmibesr

Drivar

Name of Driver SNANAKUMAR KANAGASABAPATHY PERIMANAM PILLAI
NRIC No 537335780

Date OF Birth 1511211962

Crooupalion MDD

Date Of Driving Pass 1RM0/18994

Driving Exporiencn 1 YEARS AND 11 MONTHS
Crernichent RAALF

Mobile Number LOCAL § +B5-B5a54527
Fax Nuimbes

Coniact Numbe IFFICE-BR0%4577

EMail Address ROIERAIN

Pans 1 of 1



Address e MAALY DRWVE
Postcade STANT

Was driver an F'ﬂp{"?&? of the Insured's Lompany NI

I Mo, Relationstip of the Driver with the Insured LWINEER

Vahicla Hr.lgl.'j.[r:’irh.lrl Mumbper of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Ingurance Company of Drver's Own Vahicle

General Information of the Accident

Type OF Acciden! COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Waeather Condilions CLEAR

Road Surface DR

Other Information

Was any foreign vemcke involved m this accidart™ WO

Mumber of vehicles invalved in the aocident

VWas any body injured in the Accident” ND

Was any mjured commyed la hospial by NG

ambulanca™ bt

Was any other matenol or propany damagen” H S

I I'h'.i'.rf'. besn approachaed by unknown personis) hih

saliciting/offering acciden! claims assistance

Number of Passengats {Including Daver)

Passenger 1 MAM UNKNOWRN
GE MUE ALTN

Details of Police Action

Was the acodent reported to the police MG

Il Yos Plenss statie which Police Siation

Was notlce of intended Prosecution given’ Wi

I ¥es against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

ON 151072018 AT ABOUT 1928HRS, WHILE DRIVIMNG ALCMG 8L T (IMAH HOAD CAR B IGBEGZ26H) JAM BRAKE AND I
ACCIDENTALLY KNOCKED INTO HIM

Attachment(s|

Are acciden! photos avalable for attactiment’? ] ==

Wag thore any video caplured by Cor Camern? i

Was there any audo ecomed? M

vehicle Reastration Number GRERIAH

Vahicle Maka/Model/ Calaur

Distmila OF Propeatiss VEHICLE B

Vehicle Catogory viEMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Mame of Dive

MRIC/Passport Numbear

Contact Number E2502201
Adpgress

Pastcode

Insurance Company Name

Mmture O Dharmiigs

Ma, OF Passenger (Including Deiver
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Skotch Plan #2 Pg, 1

RIS R PR T TR Wik A rEa
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Skaotch Plan #3 Pg. 1

LETTER OF UNDERTAKING

1;\,\-‘-_C-aufl_ﬂfrl"\m

~, the swrier of vehicle uungfﬂ_g_&”;

My/Our Insurance is under M/s AXA Insurance Pre Ltd , Vwe shall decide whether to
¢laim under mysour Poliey or against the Third Party and 1f the former shall submn
siich i claim o M/s AXA Insurance Me Lid with all relevant facts and documents
within [difourteen) days of ocenrrence or discovery of damage.

My/Our Third Panty elaim is hundle by inyrour preferred workshop, éF""‘- A"tfﬂf"‘ rle

x|

Signed and Acknowledge by:

..........................

ric no. & signature of policyholder Company stamp Date

Page & of 16



GFORCE AUTOTECH PRIVATE LIMITED

10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2 #01-34
SINGAPORE 417868

MOBILE: +65-913% (448

CO REGISTRATION NO: 20063 1929K

GFORCE

BUTOTICHMNIN

..._——-l-.-uu.——

- Front Trim Cover
Front bumper

Front cover tow

j Flap prime coated LH & RH

Spring
Bar LH

_ Bar RH

Rubber strip LH
Rubber strip RH

' Baseplute for car plate

Spoiler front

51260
s34
| $37.74

| $402x2=$804
| s2r00
$27.00

| S4134%

| $41.34

Dwner: GNANAKUMAR KANAGASABAPATHY PERIMANAM PILLAI
Vehicle Reg No.:  SFG6I61X
Make ( Model: BMW T40L1
Dear Sirs,
Front Reinforcement
1 ~ Mount bumper front top - $696
1 Mount bumper front lower . §1164
2 Connector LH& RH $30x2=560
1 Impact absorber top | 5T $ 77.90 -
1 Deformation _ﬁ 07.40 -
| B Adapter plau-_LH | $40.44 4 =
1 ' Adapter plate RH | S40.44
!  Bracket LH | $24.00 -
I  BracketRH s2a00 -
dir Ducts o [ .
1  Air duct - $216.00
2 ' Air duct LH & RH | $378x2=S756 .
2  Air duct exterior radiator LH & RH | $45.00x2=$90.00"
6 Oval-head screw with washer | $6x6=%536.00
4 Clamp | $36.00 e B
1  Air duct support $120.00 L,- [
1 Cover right ~ $18.00
4 ' Air channel RH (2pes) LH (2pes) $48.00 x4 =$ 192,00



1 Setof mounts for PDC front sensor | §5394
1 Bracket LH S 1N $ 30,00~ o
"1 BackaRH il lC $30.00 S
5 Support $144x2=5288
Eront Trim (Grille)
2 Molding LH&RH | | 55090x2=510180
I 1 Grille air intake center [0 00 | $70.60
2 Grille nir intake open LH& RH | §54.00x2=510800 -
1 Suppon Ny  S4800
2 Top Chrome Ny $7200x2=%5 144
f Sub Total  $4191
- Additional of 7% GST | $293.37 -
Total § 448437
Additional 10% | $419.1 N
(e P Total Amount _g_ﬂ;ﬂ
2 * Front grille LH RH $144.00x2=5288 .~
I Front Bonnet - Cs2100
2 Bonnet Hinges (LA $2247x2=54494
| 5 Parking sensor (PDC) A4S 7L | 51105x5=5552500)
2 . Side view camera [\ T SB06x2=S5 1,612 .
1 Aircon condenser | L vl | $240\ 200 |
Sub Total $5241.9 !
Additional 7% of GST $ 366.93

- Towl | §5608.83
Additional 10% = $524.1
Total Amount  $6132.93

Bl




LABOUR CHARGES

To check wiring and reset headlamp focusing $50
To remove and refit inner gamnishes S50
To remove, replace aircon and conduct leakage test §120
Panel beating s800
To re-spray painting on the affected arcas - $800
To diagnose erase fault memory after repair S1s0

$2770

Grand Total : §$ 138064




GFORCE AUTOTECH PRIVATE LIMITED —— —_—

10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2 #01-34 by —— —
SINGAPORE 417868 — =
MOBILE +65-9139 1448

00 REGISTRATION NO- 20163 1929K GFORCE

AUTOTECHNIK

Owner: GNANAKUMAR KANAGASABAPATIIY PERIMANAM FILLAT
Yiehicle Reg No.:  SFGaIGIX
Make / Muodel: BAW 0L

Diear Sirs,
Il | .
! | Front bumper bracket LR | |$Hﬁﬂ.// -
1 | Front Bumper Washer Level LH 2_;_%,1_ [s1s 7~ o
1 Front Bumper Washer Level RH i 515 f
1 _ Moulding LH 7 > 44
1 Moulding RH f J BET
e ‘HmdhurphhzzI:CmrrLH 20cad | S 50 -
1 ~ Headlamp Nozzle Cover RH ¥ | S50 7 B
~ SubTotal _ - - $2366 -
Additional of 7% GST | S1656
Additional 10% o o 5135‘5
Total Amount | s2682
/H"“-ﬂ
;}I j0]l¥
LXK Auto Consullants hence notify
e Repasrer of the folloean:
« T2 roturey DM B3I CATTY
» To gy Oumapey pariy) duTy ey
» Par pross o0 sulgett o corfrmescr
o Thisd party Burvey B an 8 Wihot Prgedion” bosis
* Mo Begsl momlcations| o shoee:
* Guppiemerary frss] mus be e Fd
in suibecd i el mporowal o Ingurancs Cormeny
i omiogod by Papars
Sqres

Lot




OTY  PARTITEMS | AMOUNT (5Gm)
1 ~ Front bumper bracket L/R $ 18.60
[ 1 Front Bumper Washer Level LH | $15.00
1 Front Bumper Washer Level RH | $15.00
1 Moulding LH | §44.00
1 MouldingRH | $44.00
1 Headlamp Nozzle Cover LH | $50.00
B Headlamp Nozzle Cover RH $ 50.00 B
Sub Total | $ 236.60
- Additional of 7% GST S 16.56
I Additional 10% S 23.66
Total Amount  $27682
|
oTy NETTITEMS | AMOUNT (SGD)
2 Fromgrille LH RH _ | $144.00 x 2= 288.00
1 . Front Bonnet N . $2,10000
4 Parking sensor (PDC) | $110.5x4=5442.00
I Arconcondenser | $200.00
| Emblem M $80.00 (P
~ subTotal $3,11000 -
Additional 7% of GST = $217.70
Additional 10%  $311.00
B Total $3.638.70
- _)-:'Ql A =
LABOUR CHARGES
To check wiring and reset headlamp focusing $ 50,00
To remove and refit inner garmishes §s000
To remove, replace aircon and conduct leakape test - §120.00
Panel beating $ 800.00
To re-spray painting on the affected areas $ 800.00
To diagnose erase fault memory after repair $ 150,00
§ 1,970.00
Grand Total : 9.003.80
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GFORCE AUTOTECH PRIVATE LIMITED TG e
10 VAT M D Wiy -R __ —-
SN LA P HRE ) THEN e _—— L

Skl W0 ) v AR W LR

L0 UGS TRA TION SO 200 109k GFORCE

O hers EAANART MAR RASAGASAARATIY FERIMAS A PILLAT

Vehlcle Heg No:  SFG alaly
Make © Madel: PATW T30,

| et S
ESUONVEA TN D0 B AR O] b DR S L MEN TS ED ABORE
o1y FARTS ITEMS AMOLUNT (5GH)
C lombewremen T,
1 Mot bumper Tl top Bet saegon <~ G 1.’,"
I Alund bwaenpoct Grosnt bosy e et S 19470 M,
2 Corector L& KRH po siock ) e s Lo v’:f
| Impacy alsorber wop CM‘I—j 5 T7.00 )
I e Fosermad s gLt L pon Kk
I Addaptier pliite 101 ;H A ShTdn &
1 Adapter plate RI1 S6T.40
| Pracket 111 } i s2enn by »
1 Brocket RIT =R () »
T d ey
1 Nirduet e d sa000 = o
2 i doet LI & BRI AP A SO x2S 12600 &
y - Ve duet exterion rudinhon LIT&E RHD A goe— CTL Oy 2~ S 15000 b=
f Erail-hiemd screw sl wirsber admf gl Sl :;_t o bl &
4 Clmmp Do shock ) s {0 [ = Ly’
[ N st siprport { e siock ) mu 5 h\.— "
| Cover right fs 5 FREmT :':L“ F
! \ir chuinnel LI T4 N x
L N chaumel B f = SR T g
1 Adr chatvivel LI iy stisgh) E“F FEQL &
I Sir chammel BRI ime stk ) i 5L &,
Fromp Frdm Coved

I I romi bmper M S5 157290 v""l I b
1 Prowil cover lis r.l-{ . 55090 _%.
2 Flap prime conted LH & RIT A § 62,90 +
2 Spring AT SL.TUX2 =S 1340
! far |11 1”“_ semmn 55 f
1 Bar 111 ST = S
I Hubber sieip L4 F e CHROn



I Risbber sirip 1011 H [ SoRon Lk
i Baseplate lor car plue Cﬂu ST e
I Spvler Troni | gﬂ""ﬁ % R4} ,,-ﬁ"’
| Sel ol mounts o D0 Gt sensor 5 KLU0 f{ﬂ
I Hracket | 1] SAEST S0 &
1 Brackel RIL | AL s $lesh S0 K
2 Support $2400x2 - SA80n A
Lromg {rim iGrilic
2 Molding 11 & kI @k S0 2-5 10180 & 1
I Ciralle air imtake comer Q-Q.....J— L TR0 —_— vl
2 Cornlle wr ke open 110 & BRI AR v S90.00x 2 - 5 18000 +
1 Support D stock ) o % = &
2 Fap Chrome SR L1200 x 2 - 5 24000 &
Suh [oial .
Addivional of 7% GN 3
Fotal Amount %
O1y NETT ITEMS AMOUNT (81 !
i A righ #rd ity M :.'-JL-'. l_.--"’..
I Fromt Headlomp i /i) a‘..f....c‘ 5 F.NI-L‘ 20 ﬁ-""!
P Fromi grille # 1N ot SR x 2 = 5 36000 o--"'"' N T
| Fromt Homnet w S 203000 " 110
2 Havimtied Hinges H"t S$ifdiin2=% TA9O0 4
5 Parking sensor (P10 }?I'M 22500 x5 - 8 LAl 5o
2 Side view camiern N SO0 X2~ 5 LESROD o

Sub Teanl &
Sahidinenal 7%« o 0% s
Lot Amonint &

e Fop— Hedloo,  SSgo,
: — &Y. 2o X2
~ e,

HuJ(;.,T, L 2 R S
C,M—C(‘

Vestal cost ol parts ¢/1;
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GFORCE AUTOTECH PRIVATE LIMITED RS, —

10 KAKI BUKT ROAD 2 #01-34 . — —d
SINGAPORE 417868 ~— —
MOBILE +65-9139 1448

OO REGISTRATION NO- 20163 1929K GFORCE

AUTOTECEHMNIK

Owner: GNANAKUMAR KANAGASABAPATHY PERIMANAM PILLAIL
Vehicle Heg No.:  SFGAIGIX

SMake " Model: BMW T40L1

Dear Sira,

oY PARTS ITEMS AMOUNT (SGD)
Front Reinforcement
1 | Mount hﬁi:cipe-r front top | $696.00
! Impactabsorber top 87790
| Air Ducts T
! ' Air duct $216.00
3 Clamp - | $36.00x3=5108
1  Air duct support © $60.00

Frant Trim Cover

1 Front bumper N | §1260.00
1 Baseplate for car plate B | 57490
.  Evont Tvim (Grille) .
2 Molding LH & RH $50.90 x 2= 101.80

1 Grille air intake center | §$70.60
J - Sub Total  § 2665.20
Additional of 7% GST . % 186.56
Additional 10%  $ 266.52

Total §3.118.28
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GFORCE AUTOTECH PRIVATE LIMITED —_——
10 KAK] BURIT ROWID 2 #0134
SINGAPORE 41 TH8E

MOBILE: <65-8355 R300
CORECISTRATION MO 20063 ) 004K

e
E—
1 —
— —t
GFORCE

AUTOTECHNIK

INVOICE
DATE: 301118
Bill To : AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD OHDER NOn SEERIE
PAGE: 111
MODEL: BMW 7401
Car Plate: SFG6161X
Tel:
IEMNO  |DESCRIFTION QUANTITY U.FRICE AMOUNT
ORDERED SGD SGD
l COST OF REPAIR, PAINTING SGD 9,003.80 | SGD 9,003.80
& KNOCKING INCLUDE
LABOUR
2 EXCESS S0D 700,00 -SGD T00.00
Grand Tofal Amouni: SGID E303.80 |

MODE CF PAYMERT: CHEQUE SHOULD BE CROSSED AND FAYABLE TD
GFORCE AUTOTECH PRIVATE LIMITED
DCBC BANK: S19-431957-00)

THIS 15 AN AUTOGENERATED INVOICE THEREFORE SIGNATURE 1S NOT REQUIRED, THANK YOU

(ALL TRADEMARKS ANI TRADE NAMES ARE RECHSTERED PROFERTIES OF THEIR RESPECTIVE COMPANIES)

COSFIDENTTALTTY NOTE. T i i

T I R TS e i B e bl a2 b dimetiesdlioe. dutridsion e coromy of el @ sl

® gy gl sl omlitesial B s s by GFORCE ALTOTECH PRIVATE LIMITED
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