Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 9:22 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLA

668B (Ol) AND SH 9329B (TP) ON 19-10-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18019142/K1fb3;
Lonpac ref: TBA [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Poh Kin,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Te!_:_ (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Saturday, 23 February, 2019 10:52 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLA 668B (OI) AND SH 93298
(TP) ON 19-10-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18019142/K1fb3; Lonpac ref: TBA

Importance: High

Attached video footage

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/1LPC18019142/K1fb3
Your Ref: TBA

Dear Gerald,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLA 668B (Ol) AND SH 9329B (TP) ALONG
CLEMENCEAU AVENUE NORTH ON 19/10/2018



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

S ——

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 23 February 2019 10:47 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLA 668B
(Ol) AND SH 9329B (TP) ON 19-10-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18019142/K1fb3; Lonpac
ref: TBA

Attachments: SH9329B (191018).avi; LKK Adjustment report.pdf; LKK Inspection report.pdf; LKK

RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; TP LOD_ SH 9329B.pdf

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/LPC18019142/K1fb3
Your Ref: TBA

Dear Gerald,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLA 668B (Ol) AND SH 9329B (TP) ALONG
CLEMENCEAU AVENUE NORTH ON 19/10/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Liability: The accident occurred when our Insured beat red traffic light collided into third party vehicle as
per TP video footage. Liability is down against our Insured.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 11,134.03 ($10,405.64 + 7%gst) S 6,736.42 (56,295.72 + 7% gst)
2. Loss of Rental S 920.00 ($115.00 x 8 days) $  920.00 ($115.00 x 8 days)
3. Loss of Income S  640.00 ($80.00 x 8 days) S 400.00 ($50.00 x 8 days)
4. LTA search fee S 7.49 S 7.49
Total | § 12,701.52 $ 8,063.91

**05 days recommendation for repair + PRI + Weekend = 8 days
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.




COMFORIDELGRO

OurRef T 1018/ SH 93298 /KS(st) ENGINEERING
Your Ref :
Date ; 02-Nov-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept
59 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
Lonpac Insurance Bhd Singapore 508969

300 Beach Road
#17-04 | 07, The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn : Motor Claim Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SH 9329B YOUR INSURED SLA 668B
AND OTHER ON 19.10.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No: SH 9329B which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : SLA 668B
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER’S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 6,736.42

2 8 days Loss of Rental@ $ 115.00 perday $ 920.00

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) $ -

4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.49

5  GIA/ Police Report Fees $ -

6  Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 3 -
Sub Total: $ 7,663.91

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 3 days Loss of Income @ $ 80.00 perdays $ 640.00

Total Claims: $ 8,303.91

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : 8 pcs.
b) LTA search slip/s of : SLA 668B
c) GIA/ Police report/s of : SH 9329B

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
() Witness statement/s ( ) Towing/Medical bill/receipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance
( X)) Photograph/s of Accident Scene ( x) Downtime/Mileage record ( x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Kazali Hj Selahudin

CDGE Taxi Claims Department

Tel : 6214 8736 Fax: 6214 1843 Email: kazali@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

A member of

COMFORTDELGRO




CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING |40 SH9329B , SLAG668B ON 19-Oct-18 07:50
ALONG WINSTEDT RD TOWARDS CLEMENCEAU AVE NORTH
1/ we GOH KWEE SENG (Hirer) NRIC No.: S0362898A
and/or (Relief) NRIC No.:

Taxi Number SH9329B

hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behalf.
4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 02-Nov-2018

Name of Hirer GOH KWEE SENG

Hirer NRIC S0362898A Signature :

Address 538 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 5 #10-40...
560538

Contact No. 90056615

http://cdgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG. VARS.V Lettof .. 02/11/2018



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO :18/18/18/VP05/021039
DATE covionixonqg

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SLA 668B the sum of Singapore
Dollars Eight Thousand Fifty Only ($8,050.00) in full and final satisfaction,
liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an accident to my vehicle, SH 9329B on 19™ October 2018 along/at Clemenceau
Avenue North.

[ /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (CHAN WOEI SHYONG
/LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

[/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

\A CLAINS DEPARTMENT
\~ COMFORTD mw '

Signature of vehicle owner/Date
\k\ﬂ\t‘\

Name of vehicle owner/Date

Ploass forward your ;if’%ﬁ ,;E‘i‘,‘f\ g ff?ﬂ
COMBORTDELGRO ENGINEERING FiE

"The contans of s document aDply 10 velicke Cameges only
AR parsonsl injures and da ur’f;” a ":}@H, fhmim.} e excluded
om the ambit and appfication o




COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

er of COMFORIDELGRO

ComfortDeiGro Engineering Pie

-]

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Litd

A CET S R ACCOUNT No. _  INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.
Head Office:

205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.

CUSTOMER’S COPY




COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

A member of COMFORIDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

TAX INVOICE

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
A member of COMFORIDELGRO

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.

CUSTOMER’S COPY

ACCOUNT No.

ComfortDeiGro Engineering Pte

INVOICE No.

AMOUNT

 BANK/CHQ No.




COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING
A member of COMFORTDELGRO
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
A member of COMFORTDELCRO ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT ' BANK/CHQ No.
Head Office:

205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.
CUSTOMER’S COPY




Qur Ref: CT18100614
comrort

| g

Date: 30 October 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 19/10/2018 @ 07:50 hrs
ALONG WINSTEDT RD TOWARDS CLEMENCEAU AVE NORTH
INVOLVING SLAG68B

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SH9329B (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to GOH KWEE SENG IC NO
S0362898A a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $115.00 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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10/18/2018 Insiiranca Partictilara Fnaniry Rv Anants Natail

Enquire Vehicle Insurer

SLAG68B 19 Oct 2018/07:50:00 Successful LO6 LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
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