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[VOLXCSVAGEN

I R UF
| SING ~"ORE PDI TUAS
(N
. (\A/
81030002
Phana No.
Fax No.
BOI TUAS E-Mail
NG HSING MEI, LINDA VAT Registration No. M20098505-2
(WENG XINME!) Tax No. 1991014942
6 LILAC DRIVE
Singapore, B0B196
Singapare Service Quote
Customer No CV037215
Quiota No. SER/QUOM801751
QuoteDate 19/10/18
Salesparson Bryan Toh Pee Tian
Page 1
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passang GOLF AT 1.2 TL B1 (DSG) 18.870 Tang Shu Shi
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SLJB060S WVWZZZAUZGW222487 110517 Bryan Toh Pee Tian
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
1T CYV 103999 5G128Z
No. Description Qty. UoM Unit Price Amount
P B&P MACP LABOUR TFR DOOR MECH 1 UNIT v n«é
P B&P MACP LABOUR LABOUR 4 UNIT (349 326600
P B&P MACP PAINT SPRAY PAINT 4 UNIT (6oV 320070
P B&P DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Time Un 480.00
COMPULSORY TO DO AFTER AC a
P BAP MECH CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, S 1 Time Un 280.00
Nett v
Sum Labor 8,160.00
P 5G4831055AQ LHF DOOR 1 Pieces B~ 038 65
P 548376518 DOOR SEAL 1 Pieces A& -7 109,43
Use Predecessor SG4837651A e
P D 314D36M2 UNDERSEAL 1 Pieces PG 106.17
P D 378500A2 LHF DOOR INSULATOR 1 Pieces A~ 4623
Sum Item 2,202.48
Sum Laber 8.160.00
Sum ltem 2.202.48
Total  SGD 10,362 48
7% GST 10.362 48 72531
Total SGD Incl. GST 11,087.85

Payments o - BBN: - Acc -No



Supplementary or Omitted List

VEHICLE NUMBER: SLJG060S
MODEL GOLF A7 1.2 TL 81 (DSG)
LAIM |
LABOUR DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Oty Linit Amount
Total $0.00
No |ltem No. Description Qty Unit Pricing un nt
1 |N 81188501 POP-RIVET A / 4 5 213 8.52
F
3
4
5
B
T
B
)
10
11
12
13
14
15
i6
17
18
189
20
21
22
23
TOTAL: $8.52
Total Labour & Parts $8.52

Survey By
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Service Order Confirmation

BERVICE ORDER M- TRIFTESH
CLPETOMER Wl CVaITHE
CUMTOMER MAME M0 HESG MET, LMD

TELLPHOME MO

VEH No.: SLJB060S

Drdesr Dadm: Os11Ma

Rey Date. Iveanr 3 aM

bl WVWEEL AU IIIANT ENGINE MO SA: Targ S Bhi

WODEL GOLF &7 12 7L 89 (085 MODEL MO S01IRE

g DESCRWTION ary uow UNIT PRICE e % AMDUNT
TOTAL £.261.00
ST AMOUNT arsr
TOTAL ANOUNT ey
Om Bahat! OF "TOMPANY" Castifisl Doode Sarvice moeived:
Authorized Signsture Customar

NOTE: THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL RECEIPT



Poh Kin (LKKAuto) S ——

From: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) <shushi.tang@vw.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 11:56 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore); Admin A
Subject: RE: SLIG0EOS - finalized

Attachments: DV SUJ 60605.pdf

Categories: clear

Hi

Attached sign copy
Best Regards,

Tang Shu Shi
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampal
Singapore 368314

DID: +685 6922-3502
Mobile: +65 9386-7833
Main Line . +685 6305-7299
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
shushl tang@vw.com.sg
hitp./lwww . vw.com.sg

Back with a
bold new look.

The new Polo.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto: pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 4:21 PM

To: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Cc: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore); Admin A
Subject: RE: SLI6060S - finalized

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/ASM18019136/R1fa3
Your Ref: SU 60605 (DDA: 18/10/2018)

Dear Shu Shi,



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

S ——————————————————————————

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 February 2019 421 PM

To: "Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)’

Ce: Chee, Steven (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore); Admin A
Subject: RE: SLIGDE0OS - finalized

Attachments: DV SU 60605.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/ASM18019136/R1fa3
Your Ref: SU 6060S (DDA: 18/10/2018)

Dear Shu Shi,
We refer to above matter and your letter of demand.

We hereby confirmed settlement as per your letter of demand:-

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) SS  6,688.57

2. Loss of Use SS 240.00

3. GIA search S5 2.00
SS  6,930.57

Please duly sign the DV attached and return to us for payment processing.

Your prompt action will be very much appreciated.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEEK Auito Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | emalil: pohkin@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408031)

r et
IKK = Save the Larth- Print only whaen necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited. and may be a violation of law. If you belisve that you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you



'Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LEKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 3:31 PM

To: 'Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)’

Cc; 'Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore]’; Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore);
‘edmund.goh@vw.com.sg’

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SLC3542A &
SMC330C ON 241018 ***LKK REF.CC3/AIG18019375/fb3

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC3/AIG18019375/fb3

Your Ref: SLC 3542A
Dear Charmine,
We refer to above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the lssues of llability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohking@ [kauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408933)

¥ ILSLS s
===R=R == S the Earth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient Is prohibiled, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not

1



2Mmnoe Claim Paortal

LKK AUTD CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

« Pls proceed DS with quantum as proposed

Type
© Question

Message

Rienls

hitpsJivp imul"lc.iulm.nu.mm.w:wmmﬂnm-vmnrﬁmh.hlmll'lnmrnqwat&*ﬂaw-m”wmmﬁnqunlhhmbaﬁ?ﬁ.. . "



1122018 Claim Portal

LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD[TP) = Meni

E RE: <S8M0100D > SEEK MANDATE APPROVAL

Type
© Question

Message

Dear Peter, we refer to the below message. we appreciate you could let us have your mandate
approval/instruction on this matter. Thank you- pohkin-12/01/2019----—-Liability: Insured driver collided
into the third party vehicle while reversing into parking lot. Liability is down against our insured as per video
footage. We did clarify with insured driver (Mr Heng) the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if
any) is affected. Immediate Advice (with mandate) have been uploaded in SMART CLAIM. We hereby seek
your approval to offer Third Party repairer M/s “Volkswagen Group Singapore® is as follows: - 1)COR{w/gst] :
$6,688.57 + 2) Loss of Use (4daysx$60.00): $240.00 + 3) GIA Search: $2.00=Total: $6,930.57. **04days
recommendation for repair. **All the relevant documents had been uploaded In SMART CLAIM. For your
approval please, PohKin - 15/12/2018

Rysgrly

hitps-iivp.smarnclaims.axa.com. sg/claim-portalhtmiindex-vendor-service-requests htmig/sarvice-requesta/view-messaga/ TserviceReguesiNumbe... 11



121 5/2018 Claim Portnl

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD [TP) = Menu

« <S8M0100D > SEEK MANDATE APPROVAL

Type
@ Question

Message

Dear Peter. Liability: Insured driver collided into the third party vehicle while reversing into parking lot. Liability Is
down against our insured as per video footage. We did clarify with insured driver (Mr Heng) the nature of the
accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) Is affected. Immediate Advice (with mandate) have been uploaded in
SMART CLAIM. We hereby seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer M/s “Volkswagen Group Singapore"
is as follows: - 1)COR(w/gst) : $6,688.57 + 2) Loss of Use (4daysx$40.00): $240.00 + 3) GIA Search: $2.00=Total:
$6.930.57. **D4days recommendation for repair. **All the relevant documents had been uploaded in SMART
CLAIM, For your approval please, PohKin - 15/12/2018

Reply

hupn;l'rupmrtldmm.mm.lgfdainhpndnuhIml.rhm:laaHnamummumﬂm“mmmqmm“mmwumquﬂmumbmﬂﬁ.. 1M



Ask mam Pein Company Magistraiion He, 1BBIOT 1IER

S0 UM AVE B P3-3E FAYVA DI ENDSTIRLAL PAMK. SING ATOME JB00 TEL | faS) s2SaMSa1 FANX 1 jied) A25eLi1s

Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 15/12/2018

Survey Details:

Date of loss 18-0Oct-18
Date of appointment 22-Oct-18
Date of survey 24-0ct-18
Location of survey VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Vehicle number SLJB0G0S
Make and Model VOLKSWAGEN GOLF 1.2 TSI AT
Date of registration 11-May-17
Excess
Market Value 5 £0,000.00
Parf Rebate 5 47,393.00
Mett Loss 5 32,601.00
Repair details:
[initial Estimate | 10,362.48 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts 5 2,211.00
Check items (estimate) 5 .
Labour 5 4,040.00
Total 5 6,251.00
Lump Sum(if applicable) 5 -

[Number of days for repair | 4 days |




Company Reghiration Na 17807 19R

10 AVE T, S 25 PAYA LR ISDUSTRIAL PAME. RI%EL A TOME JONRAS TH L o (6F) AISRIS&1 FAN piad ) alsad it

Remarks:

Mandate:
Liability(TP} 100%
Proposed repair cost 5 6,688.57 |(56,251.00 + 7% gst)
Loss of use 5 240.00 |(S60.00 x 4 days)
Loss of rental 5
Loss of income s -
GIA search fees 5 2.00
Others -
Proposed Total S 6,930.57




Volkswagen Centre Singapore @

Wiz Nag. Ma. SI103049E
GET Nz MJOO9E305-D

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

1/ We _N_‘_HHM' Ml-l P U"ll. A (Passport No.SHIZFU A ) the

owner of vehicle number SLJ60 BD‘* hereby accept lrom

A‘XR (Insurance Company) the sum of

(total repair cost) in full and final settlement for the cost of repairs

arising from the loss damage of property as a result of the accident involving

SLIEM0S & SEMESDAR  fiong Lor L Toon ?ﬂ‘lldn sr Jabn] Sfubian
on [q:{u’ﬁlﬂ‘

Please pay to Volksw who is authorized to receive

only on the total cost of repair on my/our behalf.
The lost of use (transport allowance / mlé{ﬁelpu} to be payable to
VOLKSWAG /P SINGAPORE PTE

Dated this on 55\ b "E _ (DD/MM/YYYY)

be e

(Signature of owner / Company stamp)

Name }_M’dq
NRIC No, : 3-:};' 123212 j
Date : 9 5 HWEIM-W 2018




Auto
! -- y Consutants
A JA BA B Pre Lid

STURLAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UHLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE J08923 TEL : (h5) A2563361 FAX : (B6E) 62561015

2™ November 2018

HENG YEOW CHUAN ALBERT
Block 213 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh,
#11-59,

Singapore 310213,

Dear Sir,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18019136/R1fa3

YOUR REF : SKM 8509Z

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. SKM B509Z AND SLJ 60605 ALONG
LORONG 2 TOA PAYOH ESSO PETROL STATION ON 18.10.2018

We refer 1o the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor Insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party
Property Damage claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s Volkswagen Centre Singapore Pte Ltd, acting on
behalf of the owner of SLJ 60600 against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident video footage, accident report and accident scenario, it was
reporied that your vehicle had collided with Third Party vehicle SLJ 6060D. As such,
liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim Is required and kindly submit the
following to pohkin@ikkauto com within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not provided
at AXA's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may
be required:

= Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

if you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
stalus of the claim

. 8 8 8 @



UU g;:.rﬂu'll

- .
S BA R Ple L

S U AVE L #01-25 FAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE J08%33 TEL: (065) 6256356) FAX : (b65) 82564515

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
setftlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2132 or email us
at pohkin@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively

Yours sincerely,

o

Poh Kin, Chong

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@lkkauto com

c.c. AXA Insurance Pte Lid {AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)



Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Rir Rag. M. 3100498
GFT M, MIDORIS0%-7

L R OF AUTHORITY

ACCIDENT INvOLVING __ SLII6060S  and SEMES01E on NL 10/ 2+) 3
along__Lor 2 Too p:;;ht-ﬂ;b ﬁ*nfn'm
Arcidan! Basion

BY THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, l/we, Nn{ Hif"q Mas | U_‘-.-l-L

of SF%FFHLT Ty of Velioia Registration
Number S cokos hereby irrevecable appoint Volkswagen Centre Singapore
Crwnn vhicia s Aumiber

(hereinafter refer 1o VGS), a company incorporated in Singapore and having Its registered office al 247
Alexandra Road, Singapore 159934, ts agents of any person authorized by VGS to be *my / our Attorney and
in* my !/ our name(s) on *my / our behalf to do all or any of the following:

To submit, resolve and make any claim(s) (Including the commencament of legal proceedings) which *I'we may
have against the other *party/parties fo the Accident and under the insurance *policy/policies taken up by such
“party/pariies or alternatively under Insurance Policy number taken up by *me/us and
pay the compulsory excess In respect of the cost repairs suffered by *melus arising from the Accident (loss and
damage)/.

To collect payment(s) due In respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment to be made by
way of Cheque In favour of Volkswagen Centre Singapore and give a valid receipl and discharge therefore.

For any of the purpose aforesaid, to executa, sign and deliver all documents whatsoever In relation thersto.

Generally do all such acts as it shall deem necassary lor the purpose of seltling such claim,

*IWe hereby declare that all acts, instruments and docurments done by virlue of this lefter of autharity on *myfour
penalf by the Attorney, its agents or any person suthorized by VGS in that behalf shall be as good valid and
effectual to all intents and purposes whalsoever as If the same had been done or executed by *me/us in *mylour
own proper parson(s) and “liwe hereby ralify and confirm, all scts, instruments and documents done or executed
by virtue of the authority and powars heraby confared.

‘IWe heraby further declare that the letter of authority hereby conferred shall remaln Irrevocable.

“I'We further confirm that the acceptance by VGS of the settlement amaunt in respact of such constitute the full
discharge of *mylour claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, *l/we have hereunto to set *mylour hand and sign this 2 > of the month
\\ Year W -
ek
Py

Witness By.

e

1030



M redefining /insurance

CLAIM REF : $8MO100D
INSURED : HENG YEOW CHUAN ALBERT

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/l Mﬂﬁ_ﬂﬂ_ﬂﬂﬂ& NRIC "HMI hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars [slx
] il yndred thirty anc |1$5Mplidlam.’mwm
mwumci PTE I.TD a3 full and final tﬂtltmmt ul! Il! claims of whatever kind Including damages for
personal injuries and damages to property that we/l may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE
LTD or their Insured or the driver of motor vehicle no. SKM 85092 as a result of an accident along
Lorong 2 Toa Payoh ESSO Petrol Station on 18™ October 2018 of which we/l were/was the driver/
owner/ hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of motor vehicle no. SLI 60603,
We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SKM 85092 in connection directly or

indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.
We/I hereby declare that we/l are/am the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlement.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of lability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/ar driver of vehicle no. SKM 85097

Dated this I3 dayof __ O 2~ 2019
Claimant’s Signature : &'ﬁ
NRIC no./ Company Stamp S3423>2]
Occupation/ Business : A
Address . £ Lilag Mive K) som9( .
Telephone No. §96o Eoto.
Witness’s Name I St S 0
Witness's Signature : ! \9

Witness's NRIC No.

AXA Insurance Pre Lid [Company Reg. No. 199903512M)
B Shenton Way, #2401 AXA Tower, Singapore DERE11L

mmlﬂlﬂl



Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Service Tax Invoice No. SV18P51983
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GST (T%) AMOUNT:  aar.s7
TOTAL AMOUNT: 6,680 57
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Invoice https://singapore. merimen.com/claima/index.cfmMusebox=MT

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
mml" RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

INSUME 6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCIATION Phona: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE wmﬁ o) 0 FYaRY Sam o Som

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref Mo: GR-18-162379
Data of Request: 18/10/2018 Your Raf No: Cnline Purchase

Centra Singapore
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 18/10/2018
Enquiry By Cheaa Tiow Chuan
TP Vehicla No. SKMas0az
Accdant Date 18M10/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TP Insurar Enquiry 1.B7
GST Amounl 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive] 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official usa:
Data.
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ | Cheque

20f2 19/1072018, 3:57



Invoice https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfim uscbox=MT

G.mm GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

'chs & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

ASSOCLATION Phone: +65 8224 0010 Fax: +85 8224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE %ﬂﬁm Hours: mm&; '»,:;’?5'; gam to 5pm

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-162319

Date ol Requast 19102018 Your Refl No: Oniine Purchasa
Volkswagen Centre Singapore

24T Alaxandra Road

Singapore 159934

Desar SinfMadam,

Enquiry Date 19/10/2018

Enquiry By Chea Tiow Chuan

TP Vahicla No. SKMBS500Z

Accident Data 18102018

Engquiry Result

TP Vehicla No, Insurar Parod of Insuranca Insurar Tal. Ma.
SKMBs09Z AXA Insurance Pie Lid 14/04/2018-13/04/2018 6338 7288
Thank You,

Tm'mmpmmuwyuunmmmmmmhmnhmwmwdm-mlnmuantun
ﬁ&wmuwuhmmhmﬂmwmmlmnlummmtyvmnmuhumrmarmm
arising out of or In connection with the reports or thalr images.

This is a computsr generated document and requires no signature.

lof2 19/10:2018, 3:57



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
Vehicle No: FKH 85092 - (Insd veh) |Modal: VOLKSWAGEN GOLF 1.2
IsLJ e060S (TP veh) TSI
Date of Accident: 181072018
Global Sum Seftlement | : | [ ] Yes [¥] No
Repair Estimate ] 11,096.97
Final Repair Cost -] 6,688.5
Loss of Use 5 240.00 4days at $60 .00 per day
Rental {if any) g 0.00 days
LTA [ GIA Search Fee '8 2.00
Others: |: $| U.Dﬂl
Final Setflement Sum s y 6,930 57'
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [1] YES [X] NO (Kindly indicate
below)
A} For Mon GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (%) (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be flled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply.

Remarks

Paymaeant Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) IJGLHSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE - 6.930.57]
f‘ f‘
JOANNME LEE KHANG MIN 13/02r2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents Lo the form.

[Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill {if any)




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e B 51 Uibi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408633
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX 6258 4315

Reg. No: 199807188R GST Heg. No. 18-B60T198-R

AHilinted to Fedoration Internationale Des Experta En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Rel CC4/ASM18019138/R 1fadq2
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 058511 ouesozzon | AN
ATTN:PETER Code: ASM
 F Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKM 85082 Veh. Inspected 5LJ 6060S
Policy No. GA190215 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SAMO100D Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 22102018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN GOLF12TSl |c.c 1197
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. WAVWEZZAUZGW222407 Colour WHITE
Odometer 20588 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/ Front Tyre |[205/55R16 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 PIRELL! & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/10/2018 ]Inupﬂ:tlm Date 24/10/2018
Survey held at VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAFORE
1 KAMPONG AMPAT OFF MACPHERSON ROAD
SINGAPORE 368314
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

61 Uibl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8258 2561 FAX: 8258 4215

Reg. No: 189607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R Page No 1ol 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLJ man_s
Girstiton Edlmlhﬂé Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Workshop { ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LHF DOOR (SN} ([CONSISTENT) BENT 1,838 B85 1,938 65
11D00OR SEAL [SN) (CONSISTENT) MNECESSARY 109 .43 100.43
1JUNDERSEAL (SN) (CONSISTENT) MNECESSARY 10817 108.17
1|LHF DOCOR INSULATOR (SN) (CONSISTENT) MNECESSARY 48 23 48 23
A|POP -RIVET (SN) (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIOMAL) MNECESSARY B52 B 52
f 2.211.00 2.211.00
LABOUR
TFR DOOR MECH B40.00 42000
LABOUR 3,360.00 1.260 00
SPRAY PAINT 3,200,00 1,600 00
PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION COMPLULSORY TO DD 48000 4B0.00
AFTER AC
CHECK WIRE HARMESS ECUS 280.00 280,00
B.160.00 4.040.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,371.00 B6.251.00
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 5,251.00|

i

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18019136/R1fadq2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

J Lt
||'[
¥

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THED PARTIES: - This Haport s made solety for The wes and benafit of he Client named on the front page of his Beport.
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