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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 8:46 AM

To: 'JingFeng'; Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team

Cc: kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg; ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; Dd hashim; 

duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: 85008709/SLG5969T- FINALIZE AMOUNT AND AFTER PAINT PHOTO

Dear Jing Feng, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Confirm Lump Sum $2550.00 @ 4 working days. 
 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: JingFeng <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>  

Sent: Saturday, 27 October 2018 3:28 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg; ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; Dd hashim <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; 

duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg 

Subject: 85008709/SLG5969T- FINALIZE AMOUNT AND AFTER PAINT PHOTO 

 

HI ALL 

 

 

As Agree ,Please confirm this case repair cost @ 2550.00 

 

 

Thanks You And Please Help To Close The File 

 

 

Best Regards 

Ding Auto Pte Ltd 

You Jing Feng 

Hp : 9733 5832 
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