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S IS 3 Pta Litd Cempany Registration Mo, 199607198R

2] UM AVE [ #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE S9N TEL 1 1065) 62563561 FAX : (Bo5) 62564315

Your Ref: D18007502MESH Date: 23 October 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18019125/Asd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _§JM 88337 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 17/10/2018 at the premises of M/s Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 10,222.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 58 5.055.00
“Check” ltems Amount - 55 3,351.00
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value . 55
Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithfully,
Adrian Ling
Automotive Assessor



Vs @ FirstCapital

B Rattles Quay 421-00 Singapore DMB5ED
Tel [B3)6ZEE 31T Fax (B5)B222 3547

Claims & Motar Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Spad #16-01 City House Singapore 06EE77

Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849

M5 First Capital Insuronce Limited o meg ne L3sunaiosl

wiwred TS ICAQITAl COMUSE

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 16-10-2018 Our Ref No. D18007502ZMFSH
Accident Date 13-10-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC23587G Third Party Vehicle, SJM88332
Survey Location 55 UBI ROAD 1
Contact Person, JEFFERY TAN
Contact No. 63882323/ 67689911 Fax No. 68411183
Survey Type DIRECT SETTLEMENT:
y o

prgNite LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor
Contact Person NA, Fax No. 68416315

Contact Number.

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

PREN LM Attention
AUTOMOBILES FTE LTD '
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No.

JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required

MIL

NA

LA Epg e, ME-GOOIGT G




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 December 2018 10:11 AM

To: ‘Carrine Leong’

Cc jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; ‘Claims Dept’ Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SIMB833Z - TP FIRSTCAP - SURVEYED 17 OCT 18

Dear Carrine,
Confirmed final fig of $ 7,692.70 (part by part) @ 3 days of repairs before GST.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fan: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 3:20 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: jiavee vap@premiumauto.com.sg; 'Chang Chee Sing' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SJM8833Z - TP FIRSTCAP - SURVEYED 17 OCT 18

Hi Adrian and all,

Reminder

We have yet receive your confirmation of repair cost and days of repair for above vehicle.
Revised estimate was mailed to you on 29 Nov 2018.
We sincerely appreciate your early closure.

Thanks & Best Regard
Carrine Leong
Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pre Lid eg s 19smzztiwg

35 11bi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +63 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9925 £.+65 6841 1183

. carrine. leong@premiumaunto.com.sg  w, wiww.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road  Singapore 139938 p. +65 6836 2223



Email Disclaimer

[his email, including any attachment, i confidential and may also be privileged

I¥ vou have received it in errar, please notity us immediately by reply el and then delete this message from vour Sys1em
Plesse do not copy itor use it for any purpese, or disclose is contents or any attachment o any other person, Thank you

From: Boo seng yak [mailto:boojohnny@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 29 November, 2018 4:15 PM

To: Adrian Ling <adrianling@Ikkauto.com>; cs-a@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; Carrine Leong
<carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jlayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SIM8833Z - TP FIRSTCAP - SURVEYED 17 OCT 18

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate and photographs is attached.
Please confirm repair cost of $7692.70 (@ 3 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



Shirle! Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 5:37 FM

To: ‘Joanne Yong Lai fong’; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: SUR; assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007502MFSH/1
Attachments: SJM B833Z - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear Joanne,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIM 8833Z.

Imank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4D8233)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 October 2018 10:33 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong Lai fong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007502MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be infarmed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 4:22 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007502MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
Www.avg.com




GUNERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF LINGAFORE RECORDS MANAGEMINT CENTRE

GEMNERAL ¥ Wiy Ciay B1B-00 Songapo e R3S
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IMPORTANTNOTE: Pleate submit the completed Adgendum form tothe game Authorised Reporing Centre

with whom you submitted the Onginal Report

ADDENDUM

|A] PARTICULARS OF PERSON MAKING THE AMENDMENTS:

,,..MF" He 13341 — Vebarle Registration No SdMm ﬂia [

Oniginal Repoct Mo

Nameis same s i) | DIONG OW Choy (e NRIC/FIN/PassportNo : _ S1344827 C
(*Vehicle Driver / Vehicle Owner | ("] Plezse delete as appropriste

s 196 Willyew Avenue #0s-09 singapore| 669598
Contact (el onigno; JUEINE
Email Address M‘MGP'.W““#'M %

Date of Accident ﬂ‘f"l’ o8 Time of Accident | [¥:40

Place of Accwoent __z:lﬂﬂlﬂ ﬂ"f;ﬁf HW"‘
e

Insurance Company:

(B] ADDITIONALINFORMATION / AMENDMENTS:
| have made a report on the above mentioned accident and would like to include
make the following amendments

T wasld s #o awand !-m Clacming  Own poli'cy o hord b
- T
cAlmin

adcitional information or

—2yanelt L0 ¥

Poligyholder / Qeerti's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Farme V0N

pate ¢ qJi0[12 NRICHE N Mg ﬂwﬂﬁ‘
Date 18| P 00D




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Email; Nora.khai@premiumauto.com sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate Accident Repairs
Workshop Ubi Road 1

Contact No Bibb 2323

Fax No 6841 1183
Reference PASTP/1173/2018/]T
Date 18-Oct-18

Vehicle not IN workshop. Kindly assist to arrange for survey.

First Capital Insurance Ltd

36 Robinson Road
# 16-01 City House
Singapore 06BB77

Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Tel:6854 3909 Fax: 6507 3849

Owner's Name

Ms. Diana Ow Choy Chee

Address 136 Hillview Avenue
#05-09
Singapore 669598
Telephone HP +65 98182428
Type of Claim Third party Claims
Policy No. 1800056429
Vehicle No SJM 8833 Z
Model Code Audi AS SB 2.0 TFSI
Model / Year Jun-18
Engine No CVK 061459
Chassis No WALZZZFSB)A098322
Mileage
Date In
Liability
Excess Cost -
Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date 13-Oct-18

Place of Accident

Jalan Bukit Merah



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6R41 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SIM 8833 2

Estimated
S/N Nature of Jobs Charges

To remove and transfer rear parking aid and rear :
/N 360.00 .
: lid kick sensor . Check function. 3 *

To dismantle and renew rear bumper. Re-organize
2 rear crash management components. Inspect for S5 1,05000 5'*-"3
further damages. Reinstall all parts removed.

300 .
3 Torespray rear bumper. s E'M%
4 TO remove and renew rhs e:lcl?au5t silencer and SN S 480.00
centre silencer align to position.
> Tocarry out diagnostic check. S/N S 192.00 /
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 2,982.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 40B639
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SJM 8833 Z.

Damage Parts & Prices
S/N__ Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS
1 REAR BUMPER &Lé s 2,190.00 ~
2 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS pL = 5 142.00
3 REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP Der~d + S 191.00 *
4 REARBUMPER CHROME TRIM &4 3 878,00 <
5  REARBUMPER CLIP AL e 11 S 407.00 4
= REAR LIGHT REFELCTOR-LH/RH RBH &k 2 5 a0 iy
7  REAR BUMPER CARRIER /Nr€ Neer 5 786.00 ™ |
8 REARBUMPERSEAL  Nrt Mo 25 24.00 7/
9 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-RH ™ & $ 37.00 ,
10 REAR BUMPER UPPER CUIDE SECTION-RH M7 »— s 15.00 =,
11  REARSENSOR Al s 5 421.00 #
12 REARSENSOR SEALRING AVt Neo 45 14.00 #
13 REAR SILENCER Beg 3 789.00 " .
14  REARSILENCER DUAL CLIP Mo~ 35 128.007
15  REAR SILENCER-CENTRE Raal™, $ 801.00 7
16  REAR SILENCER DUALCLIP MM $ 43.00 1 >
17  SUNDRIES N s S 300.00 °
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 7,240.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 2,982.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 10,222.00
Legend : Rernarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (%) = Mot approved

Spare parts are Special Nett,



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Read 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax . ;
Name Aclam i subject o
Suwey.:ed Date |1 e { 1% .r.:_q.-.,;:-iuf._-.,m:! by Repairer

Authorised Date : :3;

Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Atoosed T 0% 07,

Please Note This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Morah Khai at

Tel:6768 5828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant

Johnny Boo
Body Repair Manager




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel: (65) 6366 2323 Fax:(65) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1

5T Reg No. 19-9502271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd |Estimate No. EPMTPH 173/2018/]T
78 Shenton Way Date ‘1-Nov-18

#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor  Jeffery Tan
Singapore 079120 Pages (1

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept Regn No |S)M 8833 Z

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No

| Audi AS SB 2.0 TFSI

Unit Price | Amount

| Quantity Eﬁcriptinn
N I

Labour

1 To carry out paint protection (Supplied by owner)

TOTAL

s 15000

'§  150.00

1

ﬂ

Far Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

fd{ic.m. JI'-*:""‘K
/;kﬂ,&,&'
0? Ii/fﬁ'

Authorised Signature

LKK Autp Congultarts I ca I'lﬂtiﬁf

tha Repairer of the icliowing:

» To resurvey beforalatier spray paintng

» To display damaged parts) during resurvey

» Padts pricas are subpetd i confirmation

« Third party survey is on @ “Without Prejudice” basis
» Mo ilegal modification(s) is sllowed

» Supplementary fherm i) Mwsd be resurveyed and
umuﬂmﬂmww

Acknowiedged by Repaine
Signarure:
Date:




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408698
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Emall: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg ! claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate
Workshop
Contact No
Fax No
Reference
Date

Vehicle not IN workshop. Kindly assist to arrange for survey.

First Capital Insurance Ltd

36 Robinson Road
# 16-01 City House
Singapore 06BET7

Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Tel:6854 3909 Fax: 6507 3849

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.
Vehicle No
Model Code
Model | Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Accident Repairs

Ubi Road 1

6366 2322

6841 1183
PATP/11TA2018/JT
18-Oct-18

Ms. Diana Ow Choy Chee
136 Hillview Avenue
#05-09

Singapore 662588

HP +65 98182428
Third party Claims
1800056429

SJM 8833 Z

Audi A5 SB 2.0 TFSI
Jun-18

CVK 061459
WAUZZZF58JA008322

Johnny Boo [ Allan Wu
13-Oct-18
Jalan Bukit Merah




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408689
Tel ' 6366 23253 Fax: 6841 1182

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SJM 8833 Z

Estimated
SIN Nature of Jobs Charges

’ Tp remove and transfer rear parking aid and rear lid SN S 260,00 s 360.00
kick sensor . Check function.
To dismantle and renew rear bumper. Re-organize
rear crash management components. Inspect for

: 1,050. 700.

% further damages. Reinstall all parts removed. y 959,00 2 0o
($700.00 per day for new A5)

3 Torespray rear bumper. $ 900.00 $ 800.00
T :

4 10 remove and renew rhs exhaust silencer and centre o, ¢ 480.00 $ 480.00
silencer align to position.

5 Added labour charges - see attached (Owner) § 150.00 5 150.00

6 To carry out diagnostic check. SN § 192.00 3 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : 8 3,132.00 5 2,682.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SJM 8833 Z.

Damage Parts & Prices

S/IN Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
1 REAR EUMPER 5 2,180.00 2,180.00
2 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 142.00
3 REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP 5 181.00 191.00
4 REAR BUMPER CHROME TRIM 3 878.00 877.50
5 REAR BUMPER CLIP 11 % 407.00
6 REAR LIGHT REFELCTOR-LH/RH 25 70.00 34.70
7  REAR BUMPER CARRIER 5 786.00
8 REAR BUMPER SEAL 295 24.00
9 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-RH B 37.00

10  REAR BUMPER UPPER GUIDE SECTION-RH 3 18.00

11 REAR SENSOR 2 % 421.00

12 REAR SENSOR SEAL RING 4 % 14.00

13 REAR SILENCER. 5 789.00 789.00

14 REAR SILENCER DUAL CLIP 3 ¥ 128.00 127.50

15 REAR SILENCER-CENTRE 5 801.00 801.00

16 REAR SILENCER DUAL CLIP 3 43.00

17 SUNDRIES 3 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 7,240.00 5,010.70
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 3,132.00 2,682.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 10,372.00 7.692.70
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Mol approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408689
Tel : (65) 6366 2323 Fax! (B5) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg No. 19-8802271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PATPIM17T3/20181T
78 Shenton Way Date 1-Nov-18

#07-16 AlIG Building Service Advisor Jeffery Tan
Singapore 079120 Pages 1

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept  Regn No SIMBB33Z

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No Audi A5 SB 2.0 TFSI

_ Quantity Jescription. Unit Price | Amount |

Labour
1 To carry out paint protection (Supplied by owner) - $ 150,00 § 150.00
. JOTAL . |$ 15000 § 150.00

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant
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01 Nov 2018

Ms Diana Ow

Dear Ms Ow,
Quotation for Audi AS (SJMBB3IIM)

Please refer below for pricing on the following items:

and Recoating Rear Bumper after Repair

» Polishing
g day for the above works.

» Please note that we need one(1) workin

All items mention above is chargeable at $150.

Thank you.




|

&) Opti-Shine

OPTI-SHINE PTE. LTD. neg o, 2012274800

25 Kokl Bukit Road 4 #06-47 SynergydKB Singapore 417800
Tl +06.5 6635 5650 Fax: +635 6635 46406 AMobile; +63 BOST BTSF
Emall: salesgropti-shine.com Webisite! www opti-shing com

invoice /| Cash Sale
MO DO5-1 A

|

Mame Date = widl
Address : 2l S Mobilo el
. ; _ Email 2 e
Vehicle No. Model Remarks
mt fE 2T A Al

I 294 ]_ﬁ[ Ladla

ToTAL| 400 |
DEPOSIT PAID 74
BALANCE PAYABLE ==l
and Conditions:

widing your contact number on this form, you give us permission to call you In response to this request and other marketing activities via

d phun:e- even if your contact number s listed in the Do Not Call Registry, Your privacy is impaortant to us, We will never sell, trade or share
ersonal information with any third party organization,

ove agreeement is not refundable or transferable,

otherwise stated, the expiry date of package shall be for a period of 24 months from date of agreement,
s should be crossed and made payble to OPTI-SHINE PTE. LTD.

:nsfer should be made to DBS Current Account No, 0093463537 and proof of transfer to be emailed to sales@opti-shine com for our

¢ Is subject to Quick Maintenance done at least once every 6 months.
ents are due upon receipt of this invoice, ()

\ Ay W
N, e’

OPTI-SHINE PTE. LTD. Professiona

| o

| Cor Grmmiqg | Paint Protection System Custumer’: SIQ"“““

et T el it w2 o



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL:

6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4115

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 15-9607138-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCIMB019125/Asd3n2
$16.01 CIT HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date - 24122018 MIW"'HI“H'”“"“
Code . FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 2387G Veh. Inspected SJM 88332
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1B007502MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 1910/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDIAS SB c.c 1984
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WALUZZZF58.A008322 Colour BLACK
Odometer 6148 Steering IN CRDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/40 R18 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40 R18 PIRELL! & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/40R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/40 R18 PIRELLI & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  13/10/2018 Inspection Date 1702018
Survey held at PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD
55 UBI ROAD 1.
SINGAPORE 408699
Sa. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
CjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJM 88332
o Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshap?:}l ﬁi}
REPLACEMENT QF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (SN) DEFORMED 2.150.00 2,190.00
1|REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 142.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP (SN) DAMAGED 191,00 191.00
1|REAR BUMPER CHROME TRIM (SN} CuT 878.00 BY7 .50
11|REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 407.00 .
?|REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR-LH/RH (SN} 0I5 CUT 70.00 34.70
1|REAR BUMPER CARRIER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 786.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER SEAL (SN} NOT NECESSARY 24.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 37.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER UPPER GUIDE SECTION-RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 19.00 .
2|REAR SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 421,00
4|REAR SENSCR SEAL RING (SN} NOT NECESSARY 14,00
1|REAR SILENCER (SN) BENT 789.00 789.00
3|REAR SILENCER DUAL CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 128.00 127.50
1|REAR SILENCER-CENTRE (SN} BENT BD1.00 801.00
1|REAR SILENCER DUAL CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 43.00 .
1|SUNDRIES (SN} NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
7,240.00 5,010.70
LAEQUR
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER REAR PARKING AID AND 360.00 360.00
REAR LID KICK SENSOR.CHECK FUNCTION
TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW REAR BUMPER.RE- 1,050.00 700.00
ORGANIZE REAR CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPONENTS.INSPECT FOR FUTHER
DAMAGES REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED,
TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER. 800.00 B00.00
TO REMOVE AND RENEW RHS EXHAUST SILENCER AND 480.00 480.00
CENTRE SILENCER ALIGN TO POSITION,
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK. 192.00 192.00
TO CARRY QUT PAINT PROTECTION (SUPPLIED BY 150.00 150,00
OWNER)ADDITIONAL).
3,132.00 2,682.00
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GRAND TOTAL | l 1u.312.uu[ ?,anz.ru|
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | |  7.692.70|
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ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client namad on the front page of this Repor.

Mo liability of responsibiity whatseever, in contact or tort, s accepted o any third party wio may reply on the Regort wholly or in sart. Any third party acting or realying en this
Report. In whole or in part, dess so 8l his o her cwn risk



