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Your Ref: FY 18/19/0028
Our Ref: CC2/MIDAI1BD19072/p

HQ-Transport Command
Kranji Camp 3

151 Chua Chu Kang Way
Singapore 688248

Attn _: CPT MERLIN/ 1W VEEN
Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20948 & GQ 5985C ON 25/09/2018

We refer to the above matter.

According to SAF’s accident report, the accident occurred solely caused by the negligence
driving of civilian driver by changing lane and collided with our MID 20948. As such, SAF
driver is not liable for causing the accident. Up to date, we have not received any recovery
claim from TP.

Since there is no damage to MID vehicle, we will proceed to close our file as per your
instruction.

Our note of charges is enclosed for your necessary action.

Summary: -
Date of submission: | Remarks:
Professional Service Fee Completed
Disbursement Fee NA NA
TCA NA NA
Y ours faithfully
Chew Hsiao Tong

Claims Section

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

E-mail: chewht(@lkkauto.com



Hsiao TunE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 457 PM

To: 'tptsafety@gmail.com’

Ce: Joy Irene (LKKAuteo); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <Request for Final Repair Bill & Damage Photos> FY 18/19/0028 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING MID 20948 8 GQ 5985C ON 25/09/2018]

Date ‘05 APRIL 2019

To : MINDEF = Army

Attention : CPT MERLIN/ TWO RAVEEN
Your Ref : FY 18/1%/0028

Cur Ref: : CC2/MIDATBOI?072/p

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20948 & GQ 5985C ON 25/09/2018

We refer to the above matter and our discussion today, there was no damage to MID 20948 and no
recovery claim.

In view of this, we will proceed to close file,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 March 2019 8:21 AM

To: 'tptsafety@gmail.com’ <tptsafety@gmail.com>

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @/kkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <Request for Final Repair Bill & Damage Photos> FY 18/19/0028 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20948 &
GQ 5985C ON 25/09/2018]

Date 121 March 2019

To : MINDEF = Army

Attention : CPT MERLIN/ 1TWO RAVEEN
Your Ref : FY 18/19/0028

Qur Ref; C CC2/MIDATBOTR072/p




ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20948 & GQ 5985C ON 25/09/2018
We refer to the above matter.

According to SAF's accident report, the accident occurred solely caused by the negligence driving of
civilian driver by changing lane and collided with our MID 20948. As such, SAF driver is not liable for causing
the accident.

We are processing potential recovery for Mindef,

As per our meeting on 15/03/2019, kindly advise if there are any domages/repair work to military vehicle. If

50, please fumnish us a copy of the final repair bill and colour damaged photos for MID 20948 for our

necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply,

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 9 February 2019 12:31 PM

To: tptsafety@gmail.com

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <loyirene @lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuta) <clivialau@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: <Request for Final Repair Bill & Damage Photos> FY 18/19/0028 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20948 & GQ
5985C ON 25/09/2018]

Date : 09 FEB 2019
To ! MINDEF = Army
Attention : CPT MERLIN/ TWO RAVEEN
Your Ref : FY 18/19/0028
Our Ref: : CC2/MIDATBO19072/p
ACCIDENT INV! ID 20948 & GQ 5985C ON 25/09/201

We refer to the above matter,

According fo SAF's accident report, the accident occured solely caused by the negligence driving of
civilian driver by changing lane and collided with our MID 20948, As such, SAF driver is not liable for causing
the accident,

We are processing potential recovery for Mindef,

Kindly advise if there are any damages/repair work to military vehicle. If so, please fumish us a copy of the

final repair bill and colour damaged photos for MID 20948 for our necessary action.
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Appreciate an early reply.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)



