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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December 2018 1:57 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); do-not-reply@merimen.com; SUR; assignments

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: (1st reminder) Assigned case 1201800012929 is pending your action

Attachments: Accident involving SLF8488A and SGV188T on 08.10.18 (Your 

Ref:1201800012929/JL)

Hi Veron, 

 

We had received repair invoice from Dynamic Autowork.  

 

Please let us have the survey report with note of charges for case closure. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind Regards 

Josey Loh 

Executive, Claims 

  

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. 

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986 

 

T    (65) 6727 5872 

E    josey.loh@fwd.com 

W   fwd.com.sg 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 5 November, 2018 11:50 AM 

To: Do-Not-Reply; SUR; assignments 

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common 

Subject: RE: (1st reminder) Assigned case 1201800012929 is pending your action 

 
This message has been archived. View the original item  

Dear Sir/Madam, 
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Vehicle still under repair. 

 

  

 

  

 

  

 

Best Regards, 

 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

  

 

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>   

Sent: Saturday, 3 November 2018 4:40 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com 

Subject: (1st reminder) Assigned case 1201800012929 is pending your action 

 

  

 

Vehicle no.: SLF8488A 

 

Please follow up on the OD Finalization with the repairer and submit the OD case to Insurer for 

Payment urgently  
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