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Catherine Chnna (LKK Auto)

From: Irene Tay <irene tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 October, 2018 9:34 AM

Te: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc: bonnie kwok

Subject: CTP REF NO, SNM18D01326C02 & CO3 BK REF NO, BK.18613.18.5T - ACCIDENT
INVOLVING 5LL4726H AND FBH905Z ON 09 MARCH 2018

Attachments: 19102018093228 pdf

URGENT

Dear LKK [Catherineg],
Fiease assist to get your survevor to arrange with Bonnie Kwok on the Re-inspection.
Thank you.

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Direct (65) 6389 6192

Fax [65) 62247478/62247175

wiwhw s cntaiping.com

ALY H=ARY

In Singapere siwce 1918

Dizsclaimer;

This message 5 confidentiol; ity contents do nol constitule a comminmen by China Taiping fswrance (Singapore) Pre. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Preo Led Awy wnanthorized
discloswre, wse ar dissemination, either i whale or partial, is profiibited. If vou are not the intended recipient t:’.f'hri'n‘.' message,
please watthv the sender immediately

From: bonnie kwok [mailto:litigation@bonniekwok.com]
Sent: Monday, 15 October, 2018 2:48 PM
To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cnta iping.com>

Subject: Re-inspection: CTP REF NO. SNM18D04049C02 & CO3 BK REF NO, BK.18613.18.5T - ACCIDENT INVOLVING
5LL4726H AND FBH205Z ON 09 MARCH 2018

Dear Irene,
We refer to our email dated 28 September 2018.

We notice that you did not reply to our said email.



Kindly have your surveyor attend at Blk 4 Yew Tee Ind Est 393-] Woodlands Road Singapore 677978 on
22 October 2018 at 2.00 p.m. for the re-survey of our client’s vehicle.

Kindly ensure that your surveyor attends punctually.

Kindly let us know which survevor vou have appointed so that we mav inform our client accordingly,

Please let us have your offer of settlement as soon as possible.

Regards,
June

On Fri, 28 Sep 2018 at 17:27, bonnie kwok <litigation@bonniekwok.com> wrote:

Dear lrene,

We refer to your email dated 28 September 2018.

Kindly have your surveyor attend at Blk 4 Yew Tee Ind Est 393-] Woodlands Road Singapore 677978 on
15 October 2018 at 2.00 p.m. for the re-survey of our client’s vehicle.

Kindly ensure that your surveyor attends punctually.

Kindly let us know which survevor you have appointed so that we may inform our client

accordingly.

Please let us have your offer of settlement as soon as possible.

Regards,

June

On Fri, 28 Sep 2018 at 11:37, Irene Tay <irene.tav(@sg.cntaiping com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm

We refer to the above captioned matter and your letter dated 18 September 2018,

We are prepare fo offer up to 10% to resclve your client's injury claim and as for the property damage,
we will wish to conduct o resurvey an your client's vehicle.

Kindly please revert.



Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive

Claims Department (Motar Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079709

Direct (65) 4387 4192
Fox  [A5) A2247478/62247175

Email; claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

wiww sa.cnfaiping.com

by M A ' .. '-I
In Sigapare siece [938

Disclaimer .

This message is confidendal; its: contents do net constitie @ commipnen by Ching Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid,
excepl where provided for in a written agreement between vou and Ching Tuiping Insurance (Singaporey Pre, Lid, Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either inwhole or partial, is prokibited If yon are noi the intended recipient of
the message, please notify the sender immediately.

BONNIE KWOK LLC
Advocates & Solicitors
101 A Upper Cross Street
#08-12 People's Park Centre
Singapore 058358

TEL: 6536 6026




FAX: 6536 2279
¢mail ¢ litigation/@bonniekwok.com
GST Reg. No.: 2012035477

We do not accept service of documents by facsimile or email. Our business hours are from Mondays to
Fridays from 9 am to 6 pm and we are closed on Saturday, Sundays and Public Holidays.

-- Email Disclaimer --

This message contains information that may be privileged and confidential. If vou are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please delete it from your system and noti fv the
sender. You are advised to carry out your own checks on this message for computer viruses and other

defects. Please note that we disclaim liability for any loss or damage caused by computer viruses and/or
other defects.

BONNIE KWOK LLC
Advocates & Solicitors

101 A Upper Cross Street

#08-12 People's Park Centre
Singapore 058358

TEL: 6336 6026

FAX: 6536 2279

email : litigation{@ bonniekwok.com
GST Reg. No.: 2012035477

We do not accept service of documents by facsimile or email. Our business hours are from Mondays to
Fridays from 9 am to 6 pm and we are closed on Saturday, Sundays and Public Holidays.

-- Email Disclaimer --

This message contains information that may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please delete it from your system and notify the
sender. You are advised to carry out your own checks on this message for computer viruses and other
defects. Please note that we disclaim liability for any loss or damage caused by computer viruses and/or
other defects.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




Report Ref : TP18030021

Date: 14 June 2018

Muhammad Azroy Bin Abdul Hamid

AUTOMAX SURVEY

Blk 110 Bedok Reservoir Road , #07-280, Singapore 470110
Maobile - GBSS 6879

Email ; automaxsurvey@gmail.com
Registration Mo. 53110082

c/o Eng Soon Painting SVC
Bik 4 Yew Tee Ind Est 393 - J
Woodlands Road
Singapore 677969
THIRD PARTY SURVEY
- ACCIDENT OCCCURED ON 0% March 2018
¢ Workshop Name and Address Eng Soon Painting SVC
\ Blk 4 Yew Tee Ind Est 393 - J
Woodlands Road
Singapore 677969
As per your instruction dated 09 April 2018 with regard to the above matter,
We have carried out a physicial inspection on the said FBH 805 2
Ve enclosed herewith our report and findings as follows:
1. VEHIC TICULAR
Registration No : FBH 905 Z Engine No : 21CD020825
Model YAMAHA FZ 168 Mileage : n.a km
Year ! Capacity : 2012 /153 cc Colour : Multi colour
Chassis No : ME121C0D1D2020588
N 2. TYRES CONDITION
C Size Made Balance Rim
FRONT : T0/20/R17 Preilli 9.00 mm Sport
REAR : TO/B0/R1T Preilli 9.00 mm Sport



AUTOMAX SURVEY

Elk 110 Bedok Reservoir Road , #07-280, Singapore 470110
Mobiie : 8855 G879 Email : automaxsurvey@gmail.com
Registration No. 531100624

3. DESCRIPTION OF DAMAGES

At the time of inspection, we noted that the vehicle has sustained an impact damages
on the ALL portion{s). For more detail of the damages, please see photograph
attached.

4. Estimated normal period of repair: 05 working days to complete

5. In accordance to your instruction, we have Not Authorised repair to the vehicle and
the survey done on a "Without Prejudice” basis. We hope that this report will be of
assistance to you in dealing with the matter,

& Should you discover any discrepancy in the report, please kindly notify us within 1 week,
orf the report will be treated as correct.

Disclaimer

The rates and assessment of demages as stated in this report is to be used solely for legal proceedings in refation to
the surveyed vehicle and the accident in which the surveyed vehicle was invoived in, The rates and assessment of
damages must nat be used in any circumstances for comprarison with ofher vehicies andlor other accidents in other
legal proceedings

¥

et
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Vehicle Number: FBH 905 Z

SPARE PARTS
Workshop Our Revised
QTY | PARTS DESCRIPTION CONDITION Estimation Estimation
(S$) (S%)

List items _
1pc Grip throttie grazed/deformed ] 3680 3 3680 -
1pc Grip handle bent/distorted & 13.80 § 13.80
1pc Brake master cylinder assy distorted $ 483.00 % 48 ™
1 pc Steering handle lever bent/distorted s 2880 3 26.80 7
1pc Steering stem complete dent/deformed $ 3BE.00 § 356.00 |
1 set Front wheel fender grazed/deformed  § 15550 § 155.50 7
2 pcs Front shock absorber assy + twisted/distorted 744.90 % 74480 -
1pc Front brake caliper assy malfuction 3 38880 § ;;ED o
1pc Frontrim wraped $ 42430 § 42430 -
1pc Front brake disc » wraped/distorted 5 10825 § 109.25 -
1pc Fueltank assy » dent/distorted $ 199.80 § 199:80
1pc Seatassy (double) = grazed/deformed § 33250 % 332,80
1 set Cover set inner front body cracked/deformad & 6450 % 84.50 -
1pc Kick start arm assy bent/distorted $ 11115 § 134715 <
1pc Brake pedal complete bent/distorted 8 7700 § 7EO0
1pc Step bar complete dent/deformed 5 11550 § 115:50
2 pcs Front rubber step tom/deformed 5 3380 % 3380
1pc Headlamp complete malfuction 3 37865 $ 37865
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Vehicle Number: FBHS05Z
SPARE PARTS
Workshop Our Revised
amr PARTS DESCRIPTION CONDITION Estimation Estimation
(S%) (S%)
List jteims o ng
1pc Ignition key set  * malfunction g 15850 § 158-50
1pc Body frame assy deformed - repair § 1,559.40 & -
1pe Speedometer assy compiete malfunction § 306860 S 306.60
1pc Steering handie pipe complete bent/distorted  § 155.80 § 155.80 ~
1 set Complete steering cover handle grazed/deformed  § 38690 S ayﬁq o
1pc Switch starter malfunction $ 2520 $ 2520
1pc Switch dimer maifunction 5 3550 § 35.60 ;.
1pc Switch hom malfunction 3 3550 § 35580 .
1pe Switch winker malfunction 5 3550 5 aLe0 . |
2 pcs  Side mimror assy grazed/deformed 3 11080 3 110.80 ~
2 pcs Winkerassy grazed/deformed  § 28485 $ 284.85
1pc Fromt top cover assy with windshield distorted/deformed  § 45780 $ 457.80 | 55
2 pes Front headlamp outer cover distorted/deformed  § 13520 5 135.20 <
Parts Sub-Total $§ 775250 $ 6,193.10 7
10.00% $ 77525 % 818.31
& 697726 § 5,573.79
Wehicle Mumber . FBH 905 Z
SPARE PARTS
Workshop Dur Revised
aTy PARTS DESCRIPTION CONDITION Estimation Estimation
(S$) (S$)
Special Nett [tems
2 pcs Number plate distorted $ 9000 $ 9000 -
2 blts Fork oil Mecessary $ 4500 B 4500 -
1pc Mster cable grazed/cut $ 50.00 § 50,00 -
1pc Throtile cable grazedicut 3 5000 % 5000 ~
2 pcs Hose/Pipe deformed $ 8200 $ 8280 < |
1pc Hom assy dent/ open circuit  § 3500 S /OO W
1pc Tyre deformed $ 200.00 $ 20000
1pc Gaskst Mecessary % 3200 5 3zeg w |
1pc Spark plug slectronically shocked  § 1950 § 19,50 /|
1pc Brake pad damaged $ 2400 § 22400 |
1pc Exhaustassy . distorted $ 185000 § 1,850.00 /|
Special Nett Sub-Teotal £ 247750 % 2.677.50
Spare Parts Total § 045475 %
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LABOUR COST

Workshop Our Revised
SiNo JOB DESCRIPTIONS Estimation Estimation
(S5) (S§)
Spare PartsTotal off § 945475 B,251.29
1 Labour charges to repair and panel beat body frame structure 5 1,800.00 1.800.00
cutting/welding and replacing the above mentioned parts.
2  Transport 5 120.00 120.00
3 Toreplace winng hamess system incl checking 5 180.00 150.00 ¥
4 To tuff coat affected areas L 150.00 120000
5 Torespray affected areas 5 1.400.00 1,200.00
& Bleed brake system s 100.00 120.00
Total $ 13.204.75 11,561.29
The regpairer has agreed o underake the repair under a
Sum Basis. We have furtheradjusted the amount to
Sum Repair of _ ] 9,000.00
£
VAL
Fong Kok Heng Qs o
Qualified Appraiser 1 lr II Tl
6D
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ENG SOON PAINTING SERVICES

Blk 4 Yew Tee Ind Est 393 -]
Woodlands Road
Singapore 677978

Tel: 6760 6271 Fax: 6764 6676

MUHAMMAD AZROY BIN ABDUL HAMID
BLK 613 CHOA CHU KANG STREET 62
#07-225

SINGAPORE 680613

DEAR SIRS

ACCIDENT DATE: 05/03/18
FINAL REPAIR BILL TO FBH 905 Z

LUMP SUM REPAIRS RECOMMENDED
BY THE SURVEYOR

DATE: 14/06/18

DOLLARS: NINE THOUSAND ONLY

--$ 9,000.00

P
A



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref CS/CTI18019026/Gsbe2
S PRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Chge =St M“mwmm.mmm
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM (RESURVEY INSPECTION)
Insured Veh.  SLL 4726H Veh. Inspected FBH 905Z
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D01326C02 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From IRENE TAY Assign Date 19/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model YAMAHAFZ 16 c.C 153
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. ME121C0D1D2020589 Colour RED
Odometer B406 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [100/80-17 DUNLOP 5mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre |14070R17 MICHELIN 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE HAD COMPLETED ITS REPAIR WORKS,
REPAIR CONDITION SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 09/03/2018 [Inspection Date 22/10/2018
Survey held at ENG SOON PAINTING SVC
BLK 4 YEW TEE IND EST 393 - J
WOODLANDS ROAD
SINGAPORE 677969
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANGE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
sb. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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' P4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-H = ;‘- ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-3607198-R Page No.:1of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FBH 905Z
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop Igﬂ [il}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|GRIP THROTTLE REPLACED 36.80 36.80
1|GRIP HANDLE REPLACED 13.80 13.80
1|{BRAKE MASTER CYLINDER ASSY NOT NECESSARY 48300 -
1|STEERING HANDLE LEVER REPLACED 26.80 26 60
1|STEERING STEM COMPLETE REPLACED 368.00 135.00
1|SET FRONT WHEEL FENDER REPLACED 155.50 155.50
Z2|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER ASSY REPLACED 744,890 580.00
1|FRONT BRAKE CALIPER ASSY NOT NECESSARY 388,90
1|FRONT BRAKE DISC REPLACED 108.25 109.25
1|FUEL TANK ASSY REPAIRED SEE 199.80 -
LABOUR
1|SEAT ASSY (DOUBLE) NOT NECESSARY 332.50 -
1|SET COVER SET INNER FRONT BODY REPLACED 64 50 64.50
1|KICK START ARM ASSY NOT NECESSARY 111.15 -
1|BRAKE PEDAL COMPLETE NOT NECESSARY 77.00 -
1|STEP BAR COMPLETE NOT NECESSARY 115.50 -
2|FRONT RUBBER STEP NOT NECESSARY 33.80 -
1|HEADLAMP COMPLETE REPLACED 37865 250.00
1|SET IGNITION KEY NOT NECESSARY 158 .50 -
1|BODY FRAME ASSY REFAIRED SEE 1,559.40 -
LABOUR
1|SPEEDMETER ASSY COMPLETE REPLACED 306.60 308.60
1|STEERING HANDLE PIPE COMFLETE REPLACED 155,80 155.80
1|SET COMPLETE STEERING COVER HANDLE REPLACED 386.90 200.00
1|SWITCH STARTER NOT NECESSARY 2520 -
1|SWITCH DIMER NOT NECESSARY 35.50 -
1|SWITCH HORN NOT NECESSARY 35.50 -
1|SWITCH WINKER NOT NECESSARY 35.50 -
2|5IDE MIRROR ASSY REFPLACED 110.80 110.80
2|WINKER ASSY NOT NECESSARY 2B4.85 .
1|FRONT TOP COVER ASSY WITH WINDSHIELD REPLACED 457.80 155.00

Report Ref No. CS/CTI18019026/Gsbe2




r

1 Vd 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L -4 ; “' B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607T198R G3T Reg N, 19-5507 198-R Page No..2 of 3
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | EStma ﬁp?g}} {si}
2|FRONT HEADLAMP OUTER COVER NOT NECESSARY 135.20 2
LESS 10% DISCOUNT 732.82 227,97
6,595.38 2,051.68
1|FRONT RIM (SN) REPLAGED 424.30 300.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -42.43 .
381.87 300.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
2|NUMBER PLATE (SN) REPLACED 90.00 15.00
2|BLTS FORK OIL (SN} REPLACED 45.00 45.00
1|METER CABLE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 :
1|THROTTLE CABLE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
2|HOSE / PIPE (SN} NOT NECESSARY 82.00 i
1|HORN ASSY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 35.00
1|TYRE (SN} NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
1|GASKET (SN} NOT NECESSARY 32.00 :
1|SPARK PLUG (SN) NOT NECESSARY 19,50 .
1|BRAKE PAD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 24,00 =
1|EXHAUST ASSY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,850.00 -
2 47750 60.00
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO REPAIR AND PANEL BEAT BODY 1,800.00 250,00
FRAME STRUCTURE CUTTING / WELDING AND
REPLACING THE ABOVE MENTIONED PARTS. INCLUSIVE
OF THE REPAIR OF FUEL TANK ASSY AND BODY FRAME
ASSY.
TRANSPORT 120.00 80.00
TO REPLACE WIRING HARNESS SYSTEM INCL NOT NECESSARY 180.00 2
CHECKING.
TO TUFF COAT AFFECTED AREAS. NOT MECESSARY 150.00 -
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS. 1,400.00 400.00
BLEED BRAKE SYSTEM. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 :
3,750.00 730.00

Report Ref No. CS/CTI18019026/Gsbe2
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Page No.:3of 3
GRAND TOTAL 13,204.75 3,141.68
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/CTI18019026/Gsbe2
XING GUO QIANG K.K.LAU CPT(RET)
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A BEng(Hons),B.Bus,MBA,PEng,PE,
MinstAEA MASME MIRTE
Automotive Assessor REGD Auto Consultant-SAE, Licensed Appraiser

CASCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sclaly for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




