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- W Conaiant
BdE WA B Pie Lid

51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA LRI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (65) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18007509MFSH Date: 25 October 2018
Our Ref: CS/FC118018943/Ggd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLL 8226H .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 23/10/2018 at the premises of M/s TRANS EUROKARS . and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§  5.846.81
Revised Estimate Amount : S% 3.160.88
“Check” ltems Amount :S$ 465.93
Market Value 1 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value 8% -
Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

Guo Qiang
Automotive Assessor



" ¥ H M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Co®eq bo 1950001060 G51 Reg Mo M2-0D01E76-0
MS ‘ FIrStcap Itﬂl B Ratfies Quay #21-00 Singapore Q4ESED

Tel {69)6222 2311 Fax (B3] 6222 347

Clai & Motor Undenwiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #1E-01 Gty House Sengapore 0SBR77
Tek {65] 6507 3848 Fax [B5) 6507 3 B49

www. msfirstcapdtal [oam.Ag

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 16-10-2018 Our Ref No. D18007508MFSH
Accident Date 12-10-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA3948X% Third Party Vehicle. SLL8226H
Survey Location 5 UBI CLOSE
Contact Person. JESS FRAMCIS CARLOS
Contact No. 0f 81289802 Fax No. O
Survey Type DIRECT SETTLEMENT:
ARQOIaE LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 6B416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

TRANS EUROKARS PTE
Cc : Workshop Attention. NIL
LTD
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge EILEEN LEE
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is a computer genarated letter, no signature required.

I



10/M8/2018

Claim Workflow Syslem

Job Sheet (/ClaimWs/Surveyor/JobSheet/245100) - PRI Documents g| Close X

PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D18007509MFSH Policy No C-18088936MFSH S.No & 1 & TRANS EL
Name
Worksho E}S‘NS FHBRRARSITE f:::fi‘:m # UL ELURE
Name ’ (Contact Person : JESS & Contact Mokies 81289807 , Phiana: D, Fast 9
| FRANCIS CARLOS) Details Emailld; JESS.FRANCIS@EUROKARS, COM.5G
Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions
R ETTLEM :
Surveyor FTE LTD To Surveyor =L i ol
Insured S MR Insured TP
TRANSPORTATION PTE SHA394EX Vehicle SLL8226H
Name Vehicle No
LTD No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 16-10-2018 06:56:22 PM Appointed 17-10-2018 04:50:52 PM Accept 18-10-2018 1
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Surveyor — :pluad -
Inspection | s el s 18-10-2018 Y Choose File
I Report Date Report -
Date *: B i
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥ Model Please Select Model Year Select Year ¥
Chasis No | | EngineNo || Mileage ||
Cubic e

Color [ iy |

Multiple Documents Upload

Upload Multiple Documents
File Name Action

|

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks [ Save

- |

https:/iMiclaims.com:9001/ClaimWs/SurveyorDetalls/245100
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Shiau Chan !I.I{I{Autu)
o .- %

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 2:32 PM

To: catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: jess francis@eurokars.com.sg; SUR
Subject: RE: SLLE226H - FINALISATION OF COR

Dear Catherine,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $3,160.88 before GST and 3 repair days.

Kindly provide us the before paint photographs.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: stewse@lkkauto,.com | fax: 6a56-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 December 2018 2:42 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SLL8226H - FINALISATION OF COR

CS/FCI18018943/Ggd3

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan @ lkkauto,com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg <catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 December, 2018 2:22 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang @lkkauto.com>

Cc: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg; CS A Team <cs-a{@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SLL8226H - FINALISATION OF COR

Dear Guo Qiang

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.

COR: 53160.88 before GST

3 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible.

Thanks n Regards
Catherine Chuag



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta)

Sent: Thursday, 25 October 2018 2:00 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; assignments

Cc: ‘Eileen Lee'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007509MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18018943Gqd3.pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLL 8226H.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6as6-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto,com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 9:10 AM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1B007509MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G, Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 17 October 2018 4:51 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007509MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,
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PARFICOFE Rehata Frntirg

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner |1D: 6916G
Evoic ol e e e Al
Vehicle No.: SLL8226H
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 24 Oct 2018
Vehicle Make: MAZDA

Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

‘t "-!'!li:"?, :
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

mL {4

COE Expiry Date:

MAZDAG 4-DOOR SEDAN 2.0L SP.6EAT
Red

2016

PE20848377
JM6EGL1071H0107289
121.0 kW (162 bhp)
$20,492.00

10 Mar 2017

10 Mar 2017

0

$20,689.00

Yes
09 Mar 2027
$15,516.00

09 Mar 2027

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
€7 Paid: $50,621.00
CC £ Rebate Amount: $42,366.00
7 al Rebate Amount: $57,882.00
The  ‘ormation contained herein is correct as at 24 Oct 2018
nttps v 1 oy soiavrliactonienguireKesateByFUblicderareereginpui i UNG | IUN_IU=FUSUauUd | | 111



Sketch Plan #3 Pg. 1

Untitled
car: SLL B226H
Mazda & 2.8L

At 12 Oct 2018 22.48 T was driving the above car along Sims Avenue entering the
KPE tunnel. A car infront of me braked to a very low speed and I braked as well,
keep some distance between. A blue comfort taxi SHA 3948X behind me did not stop
and hit my car rear end. The damage to my car rear end that I can visually
observe includes 2 lost caps and some dents (I will be sending my car for
inspection of any further damages). I had no other collisions with other
vehicles. I had 2 adult (wife and demestic helper) and 2 child passengers (my
children) on my car during the accident. Please refer to video clips. Driver of
SHA 3948x is Mr Pang with handphone number 92276112,

Page 1
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DRIVER NRIC & LICENSE Pg. 1
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

All accidents must be reported within 24 hours of the incident regardless of whether it will lead to a claim.

Please call +65-6322-2072 for FWD Emergency Assistance
if Your Car breaks down or is involved in an accident,

POLICY NUMBER: PNPV2018-00003631 (Comprehensive - Classic Plan)
Car plate number: SLLB226H

Your name (As the policyholder): ZHANG KANG EN
Coverage start date: 10/03/2018
Coverage end date: 09/03/2013

Covered geographical area: Singapore, West Malaysia and Southern Thailand

Who is insured to drive:

(a) You; and

(b} Anyone with a valid driving license who You give permission to drive Your Car.

important things to know:

Your Policy camprises this Certificate of Insurance, the Contract, the Car Insurance Summary and any
Endorsements attached by Us. These documents should be read together as one. You must make sure that
any person You give permissian to drive Your Car understands Your duties under this Policy and complies with

its conditions,

Your Palicy is only valid if Your Car is being used for non-cammaercial activities in accordance with Your contract.

Finance company:Hong Leong Finance Limited

We confirm that this Policy complies with the Mator Vehicles {Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189).

Issued on: 11/03/2018

il :' ! J‘“i}\
E‘_ I'\g\i\s
<

|
\

Abhishek Bhatia
Chief Executive Officer
FWD Singapore Pte Ltd

Please immediately inform us at +65-6820-8888
or email us at contact.sgifwd,com If any details
in this Cartificate of Insurance need to be changed

FWE Skngapore Fre. Lid. & Temasek Bowlevard, # 16-01 Suntec Tower 4, Singapare 038986, T: {65) 6820 8688, Company Registration No. 200501 737H | wwiw fwd com s

Copyright € 2016 FWD Singapore Fte, Ltd, All Rights Reserved



REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE DRivING LICENCE
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TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

NO:5 UBI CLOSE, SINGAPORE 408605 (&) ELROKARS GROUP
mazpa ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS :
{UB]
[FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD NAME:  Mr Zhang Kang'En WIP : 31852
36 ROBINSON ROAD ADDRESS:  Blk 308a Punggol Walk EXCESS ;
#16-01 H08-424 DATE:
CITY HOUSE SINGAPORE DBBETY Singapore 821308
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL:
FAX :
VEHNO : SLLB226H DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : Jess 63957874 a
CHASSIS NO : IMEGL1071H0107289 | MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIM
MODEL : MAZDAG DATEREG.: | 10-Mar-17 |POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
Parts Description
NO ary REVISED PRICES
1 |reamsumeer - Q0 1 MGJR9-50-221ABB S 1,172.80
2 |BRACKET CENTER, REAR BUMPER 7. 1 MKD53-50-251 5 5.10
1 [rowngcovertis o (., 1 MGAYL-50-EL1 62 s 2370
4 |TOWING COVERRHS _~ 1 1 MG4YL-50-EK1 62 5 23.70 |
5 |FASTENER,REARBUMPER . [ 6 MBA5A-56-146A $ 1680
6 |GROMMET, REARBUMPER =~ Y #dt 4 MH260-50-841 $ 1120
7 |cuP, REARBUMPER / 4 MC274-50-133 $  14.00
& |GROMMET, REAR BUMPER .~ 2 M3591-00-501 S 5.60
9 |REAR REINFORCEMENT ! 1 MGHK1-50-260 $ 51260
10 |GASKET LHS, TAILLAMP o~ / 1 MGHK1-51-163 s 27.70
11 |GASKET RHS, TAILLAMP ~~ WC~ 1 MGHK1-51-153 $ 2770
TOTAL PARTS $  1,840.90
LESS 10% 5 184.09
TOTAL PARTS COST $ 1,656.81
Labour Description
¢ | izsinearos |[O FERLACE REAR BUUFER AN REAR REINFORCEMENT, REPAIR ALL AREAS AFFECTED é 6 5 |s 1200
3 | Mz-5P-SREAR2 |TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER AND REAR REINFORCEMENT E; 30 |s 126000
3 | MZ-BR-REVSEN |TO TRANSFER REVERSE SENSORS. 2 3 o |5 660.00
4 | MzZ-BR-CAVITY |TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION. !W'l/ X |s  250.00
5 | MZ-BRELECTR |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. [ '§ 6 1s 25000

SLL8226H Page 1 of 2



| MZ-BR-REPROG |TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS. | o 5 350.00
M2-BR-SUNDRI |SUNDRIES. nec Py NETT _{'$  100.00
TOTAL LABOUR 5 - |s az10000
TOTAL PARTS 4 - |s 185681
TOTAL 5 - 5 5,B46.81
LESS EXCESS g 5 .
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS 5 -
GST 7% 3 : :
GRAND TOTAL 5 - .
REMARKS: TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

THIS IS5 ONLY AN ESTIMATE FROM VISUAL INSPECTION AND SHOULD
THERE BE MORE DAMAGES FOUND DURING THE PROCESS OF
REPAIRING, YOU WILL BE INFORMED BEFORE THE REPAIRS ARE BEING
CARRIED QUT.TAKE NOTE THAT SHOULD YOU DECIDE NOT TO PROCEED
WITH THE REPAIRS, A QUOTATION FEE OF 5400 WILL BE APPLIED
ACCORDINGLY FOR MAN-HOURS INVOLVED IN SOURCING FOR PARTS
PRICE A5 WELL AS LABOUR CHARGES.

Authorised Signature

]—_ 4 te Consultants hence notify

» Mo illagal modification{s) 1% alkominid
» Supphemantary Memis) st be resunveyed and )
i subject 1o final approval from nsurance Compary

Acknowledged by Repaines

Shgnatune:

I.._': e

SLL8226H Page 2 of 2




e > TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
w NO:5 UBI CLOSE, SINGAPORE 408605

ma=oa FINALISED COST OF REPAIRS
B | e
MAME : mMr Zhang Kang'En WIP : 31852
VEAT APV TAL  1ne i
ADDRESS : Bk 308a Punggol Walk EXCESS
#08-424 DATE:
Singapore 821308
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL:
FAX :
VEH NO : SLLB226H DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : Jess GI95TET
CHASSIS NO : IMEGLIOTIHO107285  |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIM
MODEL : MAZDAG DATE REG.: 10-Mar-17  |POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
Parts Description
NO ary REVISED PRICES
1 |REAR BUMPER 1 MGIRG-50-221A86 £ 1,172.80 | 5 1,172.80
7 |BRACKET CENTER, REAR BUMPER 1 |MKDS3-50-251 5 5.10
3 |TOWING COVER LHS 1 MGAYL-50-EL1 B2 5 23.70 | 5 23.70
4 |TOWING COVER RHS 1 MGAYL-50-EK1 62 ¢ 23705 2370
5 |FASTEMER, REAR BUMPER B | MBASA-56-1464 $ 16.80 | & 16.80
& |GROMMET, REAR BUMPER 4 IMHZE0-50-841 s 11.20 | 5 11.20
7 |CUIP, REAR BUMPER 4 \MC274-50-133 5 14.00 | 5 14.00
& |GROMMET, REAR BUMPER 2 | MBge1-00-501 5 560 |5 5.60
9 |REAR REINFORCEMENT 1 | ' mGHK1-50-260 51260
10 |GASKET LHS, TAILLAMP 1 |MGEHK1-51-163 § 2770 S 27.70
11 |GASKET RHS, TAILLAMP i MGHK1-51-153 5 27.70 | & 27.70
TOTAL PARTS $ 1323.20 |5 1,B40.90
LESS 10% ¢ 13232|% 18409
TOTAL PARTS COST § 1,19088 | 5 1,656.81
1
bour ripti
10 REPLACE REAR BUMPER AND REAR REINFORCEMENT. REPAIR ALL AREAS AFFECTED
1 | MZ-BR-REARDZ |5y THE ACGIDENT. 4 66000 |5 1,320.00
3 | mz-SP-sREARZ |TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER AND REAR REINFORCEMENT. ] 630,00 | 5 1,260.00
3 | MZ-BR-REVSEN |[TO TRANSFER REVERSE SENSORS. § 330,00 | 5 £60.00
4 MZ-BR-CAVITY |TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION. 5 25000
5 | MZ-BR-ELECTR |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. $ 150005 250.00
& | Mz-BR-REPROG |TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS, 4  180.00 (%  350.00
e

SLL8226H Page 1of 2



7 | MZ-BR-SUNDRI |SUNDRIES. 5 20.00 | 5 100,00
a TOTAL LABOUR § 197000 % 4,190.00
TOTAL PARTS $ 110088 |§ 1,656.81
TOTAL ¢ 316088 )% 584651 |
|LESS EXCESS $ I
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS $  3,160.88
GST 7% $ 22126 % -
GRAND TOTAL § 338214 |3 ]

REMARKS:
3 REPAIR DAYS (exclude preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

SLLB226H Page 2 0f 2



' Vs 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

adE RS = 51 Liti Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 406933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 109607198R. GST Reg. No 19-8607198-R

Afiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CSIFCIB018943/Ggdan2
sromsonond e o oz [N
Code: FCI2
15 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHA 3948X Veh. Inspected SLL 8226H
Policy No. D-1B0B8336MFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1B007TS09MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  EILEEN Assign Date 17/10/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDAG c.C 1998
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JMEGL1071HO107289 Colour RED
Odometer 308499 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/55 R17 TOYOD & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/55 R17 TOYD & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R17 TOYO & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R17 TOYO & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 12M10/2018 Inspection Date 23102018
Survey held at TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
NC § UBI CLOSE
SINGAPORE 408805
5a, Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
CiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLL 8226H

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 190607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607196-R

Page Mot of 2

P Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop [:H' 1511
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1.172.80 1.172.80
1|BRACKET CENTER,REAR BUMPER NOT NECESSARY 510
1| TOWING COVER LHS MISSING 2370 23.70
1| TOWING COVER RHS MISSING 23.70 23.70
G|FASTENER.REAR BUMPER MECESSARY 16.80 16.80
A4|GROMMET REAR BUMFPER MECESSARY 11.20 11.20
4|CLIP,REAR BUMPER WECESSARY 14 00 14,00
2| GROMMET REAR BUMFER NECESSARY 5.60 560
1|REAR REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 51260 -
1|GASKET LHS TAILLAMP MECESSARY 27,70 27.70
11 GASKET RHS, TAILLAMP MECESSARY 2770 27.70
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -184.09 -132 .32
1,656.81 1,180.88
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN) MECESSARY 100.00 20,00
100.00 20.00
LABOUR
TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER AND REAR 1,320.00 660.00
REINFORCEMEMNT REPAIR ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY
THE ACCIDENT
TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER AND REAR 1.260.00 6530.00
REINFORCEMENT
TO TRANSFER REVERSE SENSORS. 660.00 330.00
TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION. NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER 250.00 150.00
FUNCTIONING.
TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR 350,00 180.00
WORKS
4 080.00 1,850.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,846.81 3,160.88
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 3,160.88 |

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018943/Gqd3n2
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XING GUO QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI
Automotive ASsessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD BARTIES:- This Report is mare solely for (he use and benefit of the Client namwd cn the tront page of this Repart.

Mo Bability of responsibility whatsoever. in condact or tor, I8 accepled to any third party who may repky on the Bepart wholly of in gart. Any third party acting of replying e this
Report, in whode or in parl, does 80 a8 RS o Tar own risk,



