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v SMRT Accident Vehicle Repalr Estimates T .
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EI. AR EEETE
] o LTETI
“Section A - Accident Details
Registraion Humber SHC4420)
Case Refaranca Number TR 10/182055 Igt e n
Registation Dote 130114
Company Type SMRT Taxis Ple Lig
F

Make TOYOTA . W
Model PRIUS | f 11@!:.
Name of Driver WEE KOK HONG [HUANG GUOXIONG) i ] [ : :
Type of Accident Heed to Rear * l-r—J
Ac<ident Date and Tima 1271018 4:50 PR
Acciden! Reported Daleand | 13/10/18 5:24 AM
| Time
is Surveyor Required? Yo
Sunay by
Vehicla is Towed Back? Ko
Towed Back Date and Time
Replacemaent Viehics issued? |No
Job Card Number

Izmam*.

Specl Instruchon 1o ARG,

[

Fropamd Date and Time 13M 018 4:28 PM
Chassis Number
Mileage
Wark Shap
Repair Compiehion Dake and
Tirme
Section B - Summary of Repalr Estimates
oy of Repal Extimates = St
— Guotation from ARG Adjusted by Surveyer,
Total Labour Cesl §507.00 Jﬁ.%!ﬂhm
Total Gpray Gost §378.00 200,00
Totsl Spare Parl Cosl E1.171.38 £58.00
[Total Ciher Cosl 2480.00 250,00
TOTAL COST 5251038 §586.00
Lump Sum Total 52,500.00 §550.00 |US)
Number of Repair Days 3.0 2.0
'Preparea/ Adjusted By Zhi Yang Phua Naz (LKK) | AIG
ARC | Surveycr Sign OF Date | 16/10/2018 7:57 AM 15/10/2018 §:22 PM
Signaturs i "1["1
Remarks LUMP SUM REPAIR.
2 DAYS.
CHECK [TEMS PHOTOS.
AFTER REPAR PHOTOS, |

Fage t
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Section C - Quotation and Accident Invoice Details
Quotation Humber I}N-ufmuu Involea Humber
Quotation Date 05.11.2018 Invalce Date
Invalce Amount Preparod Dale
SectionD - Detalls of Repair Estimates
Part 1+ Labour Works '
lJob Scops . Cuotation from AR
TO REPAIR REAR PORTION 5507.00
Total Labour $507.00
|Part 2 - Spray Painting & Fans! Beating Relatad Works T o=
Tob a:m ; nunh!ini'rum .l.l‘-ti: j =
TO REPSRAY REAR BUMPER §379.00
Total Spray Fainting & Panel Baating £37E.00
|Plrl:l Dlhircu-h A:cl:l-n;nd Accident Repair R-hhd Expanse = :
IJnhu-ﬂ:pl { ~ [Qustation from ARG nhd y_-wl‘iu
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTER FUNGTION 380,00 Tsao0
TO APPLY RUST-PROCFING ON AFFECTED AREA $100.00 54000 -
TO TEST AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR SYSTEM $120.00 52000 -
TO WASH ANG VACUUN $60.00 3000
TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS 510000 50.00
Total Othar Costs $460.00 $50.00
£ |22 24
Partd - EplrlleHﬁurlll u:-g. e 2 i = = _ 2 2’
Part. _ Ppu'lhu Slnul P:rt Nama - |Quantity [List Price IIJEEM Finai [E:I'Em*!qr Surveyer
Numeer 8L 0k |Price (] |Approved  |Approv 4407
5215  |BUMPER REAR 1.00 45880 (10000 [50.00 |Repisce  |Regair .
47905 —— ! o
52576-  [BUMPER SIDE RETAINER 000 35480 000 $000  |Replace  |Check + ks 200" *
47020 L 1 22
52575-  [BUMPER SIDE RETAINER  |0.00 §9480  |D0D $0.00  |Replece  |Not Given ,_1 Jjjc‘?'
47020 H ~ b .
52016-  |ARM SUB-ASSY, RR 0.00 513080 [ooo 5000  [Replace  [Chwck '}ﬂ &
47000 |BUMPER LM —_ cL&”
52015-  |ARM BUB-ASSY, RR 0.00 513860 [0.00 3000 |[Replsce  |Nel Given % -
47 BUMPER AH g —
52023- |BUMPER REINFORGCEMENT [0.00 §20570  [0.00 $000  |Repiace  |Gheck X
12240 IREAR . i‘>5 £
SENSOR REVERSE 000  [s16000 [a60  [s000  [Repice  [NatGwen yr| L S =
7B8§1- | BUMPER LIF REAR 0.00 522880 |oo0 000  |Repiace ﬁru:ch : -
47020 L
76087. |BUMPER LIP COVER RR/RH [0.00 511810  |D.00 $000  [Replace [Nol Givan
47020 B b
78088. |BUMPER LiP COVER RAILH |0.00 $7230  [D.00 S000  |Aoplacs  |Nol Given ?:
47020 | aV3 /""f
PIXEL STIGRER 2.00 §6000  |D.00 512000 |Replace  |Replace
otal $1,79230 $120.00 '
udded Sparv Parts | Matarial Usage After Surveyor Signed aff 1 "
g i oM LW Lump fuwm e éit 8 o f ] A M
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Vic !I.KI(AuI:u}

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & TA/Taxis/Claims)
<LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 December, 2018 3:16 PM

To: Vie (LKKAUTa)

Cc: Admin A; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 12/10/2018 involving SHC 4420) & 5LQ 7393M (AIG's
insured) Our Ref: TAX/10/18/2056/1g LKK REF CC3/AIG18018900/Nha3

Attachments: 10 1B 2056 - DV.pdf

Dear Vic,

We attach the duly signed DV and ATA for your necessary action. Please let us have AIG's cheque for $1,000.00 in
respect of our own losses payable to SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

Thanks for your prompt settlement.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

&5 SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: 21/12/2018 14:55

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & 1A/ Taxis/Claims)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD Re: Accident on 12/10/2018 involving SHC 4420 & SLQ 7393M (AIG's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/10/18/2056/lg LKK REF CC3/AlG18018900/Nha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Lee Gek,
We refer to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we offer a global sum of $1,000.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and ATA and forward back a copy to us for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.
Thank you.

“Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on o without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of lability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver, Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer mode in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only, No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising fram this offer
in any other reloted matters.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

e

i Save the Earth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient s prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
raad this &-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereol, Thank you.

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & 1A/Taxis/Claims) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 21 December, 2018 2:24 PM
To: C5 A Team; Admin A

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 12/10/2018 involving SHC 4420) & 5LQ 7393M (AIG's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/10/18/2056/1g

Dear All,

We guantify our own losses as follows:-

Cost of Repair 5550.00
Loss of Rental $556.40 | 5 daysx 511128 )
LTA Search Fee 57.00
Total $1113.40

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair invoice
2) Proof of rental rate
3) police/GIA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTA search

Our hirer is claiming his injury and loss of income through his own lawyer.

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks,

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

e-m

AUTOMOTIVE




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims 8¢ 1A/Taxis/Claims)
<LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 December, 2018 2:24 PM

To: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 12/10/2018 involving SHC 4420) & SLQ 7393M (AIG's
insured) Our Ref: TAX/10/18/2056/lg

Attachments: 10 18 2056.pdf

Dear All, J

We quantify our own losses as follows:-

Cost of Repair $550.00
Loss of Rental $556.40 | 5 daysx $111.28 )
LTA Search Fee 57.00
Total $1113.40

We enclose the following documents:
1} Repair invoice
2) Proof of rental rate
3) police/GIA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTA search

Our hirer is claiming his injury and loss of income through his own lawyer.

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

&5 SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE




S1UBLAVE 1, #0125 PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065} 62263361 FAX : (068) h256411E

03 DECEMBER 2018

JEREMY WONG WEI TUCK
BLOCK 961 HOUGANG AVENUE 9
#05-570

SINGAPORE 530961

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC3/AIG18018900/Nha3

YOUR REF :SLQ 7392M

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 73%3M AND SHC 4420J ALONG HOUGANG AVENUE 3
ON 12.10.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third
party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of
SHC 4420J against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had
collided to the Third-Party vehicle SHC 4420J. As such, liability may not be on your
favour

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD - if any) may be affected as a
result of the claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to vicalpeh@lkkauto com within 10 days from the date of this letter_if not
provided at AlG's reporting centre The list below is not all inclusive and further
document may be required:

« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)
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S1UBEAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAN L IN6S) 62564315

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AIG's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us
at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Vic Alpeh

CaseHandler

DID: 6841 2086

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto com

c.c. AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Mator Claims Dept)




AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
AlIG Pacific -

I, SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant”) of 60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL
BARK_E4 (S\757705 (address), owner of SHC 4420] (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SMRT
AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop") to act for me with respect to my claim

for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle no SHC 4420] that was
damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 12/10/2018 (date) along HOUGANG
AVENUE 3 (location) involving vehicle no/s SLQ 7393M (“the accident™).

I further authonize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit

and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Datedthis __ ) | (day)of !]{g (month) 2018 (year)

[ 77 ) :
|I E-Il ':} \
e
a2/
Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



ASE VOU
AIG Asi -E Third Claim

“We/l, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l

have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK

F ) TA [name .E.f surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
=/ 8$1.000.00 (Global Sum — all in) for vehicle no. SHC 4420] that was damaged pursuant 1o the
" accident which occurred on 12/10/2018 (date) along HOUGANG AVENUE 3 (location) involving

vehicle no/s SLO 7393M. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 15/10/2018 (date) at “the
workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SHC 4420] make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in 2 manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim ngainst the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SHC
4420] (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of linbility basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 3’/( (day) of Dﬂr {month) 2018 (year)

k:'\j; . Nies
Signed by aﬁbu:;wd surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)

Our acceptance of your offer
of settlement would not negate
or prejudice our dniver's right
of recovery for his/her losses.



EMET Automotive Sesvices Fre Ltd
m 251 Werth Bridge Road Singapors 17351032

Tel: 65 B3311000 Fax: 55 £3340247

AUTOMOTIVE s
Tax Invoice
Customer Code: 3000063 G5T Reg No. : MR-8500001-7
CRN : 1950042802
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice Mo. : IV181200030
Date : 03.12.2018
Block Unit Vehicle No. : SHC4420J
Your Ref Ne. : TAX/10/18/2056
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK Ed Cur Ref Mo. : 24098301
SINGAPORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Dascription Qty Unit Add / (Discount) Amsunt
Cost L] Amount
LUMP SUM AMODUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 8 550,00
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION
GRAND TOTAL s 550.00

Remark :

Make/Model : TOYOTR PRIUS
Rccident Date : 12.10.2018

N.B. Faymant by cheque should be crosssd and
sade payabls to “SMRT Automotive Services Proe Led'
Ho seceipt will be issued unless rogquestod.

N

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1/1 E. 6§ O.E
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SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref:  TAX/10/18/2056
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 18/10/2018

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 4420J & SLQ 7393M ON 12/10/2018 ALONG
HOUGANG AVENUE 3

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHC 44204 is $111.28 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
TAXIS PTELTD

for Manager



poday dn pren hi%@



1M RanR Wrnbirde ik

Enquire Transaction History
wl W

| g Dates Time: 15 Ccl 2018/ 09:04:31

Assei Type: Viehicla Transaction Amaunt:

Assed Iy S1Q7393M

Transaction Tyge: 1832 Insurance Frquiry (GIRO Payment] Channey:

User I ESASBAHO - BALDISH HINTE ABDUL Business Transaetion
HALN, Reference No.:

Search Date / Time: 1201 2018 14:50-00

Insurance Campary: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PT. 170,

hﬂmdhﬂwhwmtnuwmmmlm

Enquire Related Logs OK

mma-amn.gw.wmmmnw:ylmmmn LN LN S0t s guar

749

External Agency
20181015090431907%24



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Ezpreas
(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING . _
Case foatifed Est Sunmited | Adj Assigned Ady Rpt |Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed | Status |
| 15012018 15 oy $$550.00 ' §$550.00 | et
I H ¥
Edit Reg Edit Adj Bt l_, t:;l!!rm-ll . mﬂprl c "-'*| |

Claim Detalls

—— ...__...._LE“ T =
Insured: JEREMY WOMNG WEI TUCK. 10: SR0Z1815H

Main | SMRT TAXIS PTELTD, Co. Reg, No.: 198905369K

12/10/2018 15:00 - :59

I
SHC4420) | Pate of LOSE: | (56 Manths and 29 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

TP / 60239493305G !:’;’:"L‘E’“’ l;-:mms: (Comprahensive)

|
RQ7IOIM |y ecs;  |D-18090213mSH
1 :

— R — !
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) &0 Woodlands Industral Park E4, 757705 Woodlands - Tel: 68662628
| A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: £5-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Chan, Kian-Meng]

| Kisnmeng. Chanlalg.com
IH,,,,:F" | MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tell 62222311
== Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel| 6256-3561 .. [Handled by Muhammad Mazril Bin Abdulish] . [Final Rpt dus

LMK Auto Consultants
Adwster: | 26/10/2018] ==
|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Ml | Compose Case mail |
|« AIG_SG (18/10/201B): Request to upload TP GIA Report

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—
Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By
| No results.

View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | compete |
Completed On  Created On  Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp... 28/12/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SHC4420] (60239493305G)
[SLQ7393M]
™

SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Oct 12 2018 4:00PM
[IEREMY WONG WEI TUCK]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Letters/Correspondences |1 per page [ '
|No | Firsalized On LMK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
|1 |(Draft) Third Party Express Settiament - Paymen! Breakdown | Edme |
ebcntes et o . Dpercage  [v] M4
bo | Relabel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) — [ Thumbmail | Print
3 129/11/18 14145 | Gemaral View 0O | i=ivs | W
1 29/11/18 1445 General View 0 | tcaars | M
3 29/11/18 14:45 | General View N O | v | B
ol _‘H.HH;IT:;E General View O asvc | B
5 __:;,runu 14:45  Guneral View 0 leaws | 4
6 29/11/18 14:45 | General View B 0O | oarc | B
7 |29/11/18 14:45 | Genersl View © | lsdws | A
B 29/11/18 14:45 | General View 0O | 1eorc | & ]
|9 29711718 14:45 | General View O edive | B
10 29/11/18 14:45  General View 0O | ied G |
:u 129711718 18:45 General View _g | Lead lec | B
12 29/11/18 14:45 | General View - | @ | e | &
13 29/11/18 1445 | General View ©  woowc | &
(14 29/11/18 14:45 | Genersl View O  ledws | 4
15 |29/11/18 14:45 | Genaral View O | Leaws | (2
| Bocumentation tperpage | v]| B
No_|Relabel/Rearder |LKK Auto Consultants Pts Ltd (HQ) TThumbnail | print
1 2310/18 17:26 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED o @ | LoadroF

_J l!l."!_l_.'lf‘lﬂ 11:25_1 TP GIA REFORT Load POF

3 (03/12/18 15:44 | LETTER TO OI [ Losd vOF

4 28/12/18 12:39  WORKSHOP INVOICE S | Load POF

S 28/12/18 1235 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM § | Load POF |

|6 |18/12/1812:35 | Releasa Voucher = Losd POF |
7 28/12/1812:33 | RENTAL RECEIPT - § Losd POF |
8 28/12/1812:3% | RENTAL MILEAGE Load POF

& 28/12/1812:33 | LTA SEARCH - Losd POF |
\Np | Fanallized On ALG Agia Pacilic Tnsurance Pte. Lid. [SG) | Thumbnail | Print
1 |18/10/1809:32 | O GIA REPORT = @ | icearor

Documents Checklist

I-Dﬂﬂl.l'llﬁl‘l'l CHECKLIST
There are no decument checklists configored.

| l

https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do... 28/12/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 0f 2

Show Ramarks To: [ Handling Insurer
hindd Eeriahl @08 DrwBll wn i you Bhbe ol L0 ol paeTes

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do... 28/12/2018



Preview Page | of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|’b"ihlr.‘.lt No: SLQAT7393M (Insd veh) Modal: TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI 1.8 (A)
SHC4420J (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |12/10/2018
Global Sum Settlement | | [X] Yes [ [ 1 Mo
Repair Estimate s 3,1687.30
Final Repair Cost - 1.000.00
Loss of Use § days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) '8 4 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee 5
Others: g
.-
Final Setilement Sum (Global Sum) -] 1,000.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ | YES [ X1 NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A} For Non GIA Registered Wﬂl‘k!hnE: Agread Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes!/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liabiity to be filed only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1} | SMRT Tauxis Pte Lid & 1,000.00
2) i 8
3) g
28 Dec
JOANMNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill (if any)

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 28/12/2018



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ice reg e 1ssso71esm)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CC3AIG1B018800/NHA302
Date: 28/12R2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid Paolicy No: 2100510837
ommant Vehicl® srcaez0) Insured Vehicle No :  SLQ7383M
Date of Loss: 12/10/2018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 602384833056
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SHC4420J
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI, 1.8 (A) Engine Nao; 2ZR1326248
Req. Date; 13/01/2014 (Man_ Year: 2013) Chassis No JTDKMN3EU205721560
Colour: Maroon Odometer: 331628 km
Engine Capacity: 1788 cc
Markat Value/New Car Price: NfA
Sum Insured (S5) Market Value/New Car Price
F I AT TH F RV
General Condition; Slesring [Serviceable). Yes Footbrake [Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size 195/65 R15
Fromt Left Side Falken 5mm Rear Left Side- Hankook B mm
Front Right Side Falken 5 mm Rear Right Side: Hankook & mm
The above values epresent [he remaiiing fyre freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS = _ Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 1,852 .30 120.00 1,732.30 83.52
Miscallaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,345.00 480.00 B85.00 65.80
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 3,197.30 580.00 2,617.30 81.86
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 550.00
Nett Amount (S5) 3,187.30 550.00 2.647.30 B82.80
+ Car Rental (4.0 x $$111.28/day) (S5) 44512
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5) 7.00
Mett Liability {(S5) 1,002.12
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 1,000.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 15/10/2018
Date Inspacted: 151 0/2018 Inspected At SMRT Automative Services Pte Lid
(Woodlands)
B0 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapore 757705

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 28/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair 2.0 days

Adjuster: Muhammad Nazril Bin Abdullah Manager: VIC ALPEH

NGTE: This repori repressnts our findinga al fhe tirme and place of mspechon shifed hemen. Such nspection has been carmed out fo the best of aur
knowipdige and abilly but any ather lahility undsr any ather circumstances s heeby axpressly exclided

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 28/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 2 *PIXEL STICKER (SN) Necessary 12000F  *120.00F
2 1 *‘BUMPER REAR Repair 458 6OF *F
3 1 *BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RR/LH Serviceable B4 BOF *F
4 1 *‘BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RR/RH Serviceable 94 BOF *~F
5 1 *ARM SUB-ASSY ,RR BUMPER LH Serviceable 139 80F “F
& 1 “ARM SUB-ASSY ,RR BUMPER RH Serviceable 139.60F “F
7 1 *BUMPER REINFORCEMENT REAR Serviceable 205.70F -
B 1 *SENSOR REVERSE Serviceable 180.00F ~F
g 1 *BUMPER LIP REAR Serviceable 228 90F ~F
0 1 *BUMPER LIP COVER RR/RH Serviceable 118.10F .
1" 1 *BUMPER LIP COVER RR/LH Serviceable 72.20F .
FeFmnchise parl

Total Parts (S§) 1,852.30 120.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul. |

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 28/12/2018




Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous ltems selectod.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK New 507.00 200.00

2 SPRAY PAINT New 378.00 200.00

3 TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION New 80.00 0.00

4  TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFECTED AREA New 100.00 40.00

5  TO TEST AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR SYSTEM New 120.00 20.00

§ TOWASH AND VACUUM New £0.00 0.00

7 TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS New 100.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1,345.00 460.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 28/12/2018



