Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 October 2018 9:48 AM
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; assignments
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF SKB3927R

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 4:18 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; Chia Sin Muk <emlautopteltd@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF SKB3927R

Our Ref : 18/18/18/VP05/021025

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

Kindly proceed with the pre-repair survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:em1iautopteltd@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 16 October, 2018 4:13 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Re: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF SKB3927R




WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Gerald,
We agree LKK as SJE.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Nicole, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R

On Tue, 16 Oct 2018 at 08:31, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref :18/18/18/VP05/021025

Dear Sirs,

Please see attached and revert to us.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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