Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Chin Hui Xin <huixin@n51.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 12 July, 2019 6:08 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: LOD - Accident involving SKW9444S & GBE2108K on 13/10/2018 *** LKK REf:
CC4/LPC18018886/R1lja3n2

Attachments: 9444 pdf

Dear Joyirene,

Refer to the above subject.

Attached signed DV for your kind action.

Original copy will post out soon.

Thank you

Regards,
Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Fax : 6741 0510
www.n51.com.sg

On Wed, Jul 10, 2019 at 4:07 PM Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Melody,

DV attached.

Kindly send the original copy to us by post or by hand.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this
email is strictly forbidden.

From: Chin Hui Xin [mailto:huixin@n51.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 12:43 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD - Accident involving SKW9444S & GBE2108K on 13/10/2018 *** LKK REf:
CC4/1LPC18018886/R1ja3n2

Dear Joyirene,

Refer to the above subject.



We agreed as per offer $3,484.95.

Kindly proceed to necessary action.

Thank you

Regards,

Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Fax : 6741 0510

www.n51.com.sqg

On Tue, Jul 2, 2019 at 5:21 PM Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,



We refer to the subject.

On without prejudice basis and without admission of liability, we offer settlement as follows:

Cost of Repairs $2,835.50 GST

Loss of Rental S 642.00 ($100 x 6 days) GST
LTA Search Fee S 7.45

TOTAL $ 3,484.95

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this
email is strictly forbidden.

From: Chin Hui Xin [mailto:huixin@n51.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 5:21 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD - Accident involving SKW9444S & GBE2108K on 13/10/2018 *** LKK REf:
CC4/LPC18018886/R1ja3n2




Dear All,

We refer to the above subject.

There's no offer up to date.

Kindly reply us as soon as possible.

Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank you

Regards,

Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Fax : 6741 0510

www.n51.com.sqg

On Sun, Mar 17, 2019 at 4:19 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @lkkauto.com> wrote:
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‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/LPC18018886/R1ja3n2 Joy - 6841 2409

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chin Hui Xin <huixin@n51.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 15 March, 2019 10:22 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD - Accident involving SKW9444S & GBE2108K on 13/10/2018

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above reference.



Attached LOD for your kind perusal.

Original copy will post out to you soon.

Kindly acknowledge upon received our email and original copy of LOD.

Regards,

Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Fax : 6741 0510

www.n51.com.sqg




