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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B P Py
;_J; v ; 51 Lt Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industrial Park, Singapore 406833
= = TEL: 8256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Np 189807198R GST Reg No. 19-9607188-R
It Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CC4/AIG18018B85/Ghb3
L
CHARTIS BUILDING Date . 17-10-2018
SINGAPCREOT72120
Code . AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. 5LX 833U Veh. Inspected SME 43817
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Dale 17/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Maodification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RIH Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 03/10/2018 Inspection Date 18/10/2018
Survey held at BW WORKSHOP SERVICESPTELTD
30 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408615
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A™WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BlIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




BW WORKSHOP SERVICES PTE LTD

30 UBI ROAD 4 SINGAPORE 408615

TEL: 62898800 FAX: 68582120
GST REG NO, 201504834E
QUOTATION
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD NO. 1810004
CURRENCY £
THIRD PARTY CLAIM: SLXE33L PAGE
DATE OF ACCIDENT: 03,1018 DATE 15102018
VEH NO.
amy DESCRIPTION SMELIETT HONDA FIT HYBRID
Unit Price AMOUNT i
1PCs |FAT BUMPER "1 [ 1.300 b '?L'?.s
10PCS [FAT BUMPERCLIP~ 4 o 5 450 [ § 4500 '3:1(5!\()
WPCS |FAT BUMPER SEAL x i e 5 6500
1FCS |FAT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH X ° N7 2 3 171100
2PC5 [FAT BUMPER SIOE HOLOER X [ g 3500 | § TR OO
| T
TOTAL 1,867 .00
LABOUR CHARGE 530 00 %
DHSCOUNT innly Partal [
TOTAL 2.377 .00
GET T 158 39
TOTAL 7436.39
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LABOUR :
i TD TRANFER AND REFIX FAT BUMPER | GRILL . GRMISH -3230.00

] TO RESPRAY PAINT O ACCIDENT PORTION -5350 00
3 O TUFF-KIOTE -§1B0.00

INSURANCE SURVEYOR DETAIL | INSURANCE SURVEYDR DETAIL
FULL NAME IFI.IJ._L MAME
EMAIL ADDRESS |emaiL anoress
CONTACT NUMBER CONTACT NUMBER
REMARKS REMARKS
DATE DATE |
SIGNATURE SIGNATURE




HFRMNMG PARENTNFE Raksia Fodm b
> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 6844E

Vehicle No.: SME4381T

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 190ct 2018
Vehicle Make: HONDA

Vehicle Model: FITHYBRID 1.5F AUTO
Primary Colour: Blue

Manufacturing Year: 2018

Engine No.: LEB1432366
Chassis No.: GP51327596
Maximum Power Qutput: 101.0 kW (135 bhp)
Open Market Value: $21,148.00

Original Registration Date: 28 Sep 2018

First Registration Date: 28 Sep 2018
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $11,608.00

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 27 Sep 2028

PARF Rebate Amount: $8,706.00

COE Expiry Date: 27 Sep 2028

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $31,307.00

COE Rebate Amount: $31,115.00

Total Rebate Amount: $39,821.00

The information contained herein is correct asat 19 Oct 2018

OK

nIpsivelita. gov.sgitavriaction/an quireHebaedyHuDicHetoreLiereginpu fFUNG | LN _IU=Fuguauud | | M



- Pre repair inspection request - SME43817T VS SLX833U (OI) DOA: 03/10/2018 Page | of 2

- 1
- Pre rapair Inspoction request - SME4381T VS SLXB32U (O1) DOA: 031102018

Frimn  Aghen Symeuirdng

Ta adren-aiikmin om aesgnmenmiseun coem
ce Fang. Amdy-57, Chin, Les.ving. Abu Ksssim, Noor Mansss, W inhss. Bana srman, Lim. 5neng Y ang, Mimaosingn, Amnweerpemaur. Chsn, Youe G seur, Baipn
Sent  Teesdsy, 18 Ocinber, 2018 11915 P

Attachments. % wpw rw-g o sgr
Hi,

Pizass reter 1o the enciosed teguest hom BW Workshop Services Ple Lid
Fandiy caemy out Palicy coverage verficafionfiny before conducting fie pre-repar Inspection within 48 haurs

If you have any gueresiconcarms, peass et us know.
Kimdly auwiit to axign Xing Guo Qiong ax Single Joint Expert ar requested

Q ‘t]"’Qw

% ;
— VPP
ﬁ;ﬂ refinis Azlan \ i \ﬁ\

Thanhs and regarts,

Express Claimas Adjuste ||
55 Chairrs Cosratans | A1G Stared Servioas

From: syafirahfibw.com. =g [maito-syafirsh@bw.com sg)

Sent: Tuesday, October 16, 2018 12:14 PM

To: Azlan, Syarairding

Ce: Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Md Ishak, Mohd Imran; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithaosingh, Asshwesrjestiaur: Chan, Yoke Shi:
Kaur, Baljit; syafirahi@bw.com.sg

Subject: RE: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLXBIIU AND SME4381T ON 0371072018

Hi Syaza,

Ploase ussist in arsnging for Xing Guo Qiang from LKK Aute Consultants Pre Lid for the PRS

Thank vou

Best regards,

Moo Svafirah
BW Workshop Services Pre L1
20 Uk Rl 4 Singapore 408615

Muin: 6afg BB00 Fax 6858 2120 Emnil grafirshdbw.com sg

From: Azlan, Svazairding
Sent: Tue, 16 Oct 2018 03:24:01 +0000
To: syafirahfibw.com sg

Ce: Fong, Andy-5Y, Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Md Ishak, Mohd |mran, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur,
Char, Yoke Shi, Keur, Baljig

Subject: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLX833U AND SME4381T ON 03/10/2018

Without Prejudice
Your Relerence CSME4AMEIT
Chsr Reference CSLXA33L
Deear SigMadam,

We refer o your Nouce of Accident of even date

https://securemail2.aig.com/securereader/read.jsf 16/10/2018



- Pre repair inspection request - SME4381T VS SLX833U (OI) DOA: 03/10/2018 Page 2ot 2

Wwermend Yo conduct 8 pre-repair survey of thedumage o yourchent s'your castornes” svehclgpointly with your clert/your metor wirkshap, We propose to
sucone of themotor serveyors namedin the attached (i (o conduct the fuintpre-nepair surveyas & single joiniexpert

Mame of Surveyar Company Name

AlG In House Survevor AlQ Asin Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Priority Services
Jefircy Ong Leng Kial Prioriy Services
Jimmy Lec Prinnty Services

'EC Loor Automobile Inspection Services Pie Lid
Pang Kish Keen (Frankie) Formteam Adjusters Pte Lud
Mg You Han Formitcam Adjusters Pic Lid
Soon HanXin (Goary) Formteam Adjusters Ple Lid
Chow Bo Xia Formtenm Adjusters Pre Lid
Chun 500 Teck (Benjamin) | Formteam Adjusters Pre Lid
Kalvin Ang LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lud

[ Xing Guo Qiang LKK Auto Consultanis Pic Lid
Marcus Chua LEE Auto Consultants Pie Lud
Mohamad Taufikh LEK Auto Consulunis Pre Lid
Adrian ng LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Mohammed Rasul LEK Auto Consultamts Pre Ltd
Kenneth Kong LEK Aute Consultants Pre Lid

Please |etus know withimtwn (2jwarkong days whither youmgree to theappontment of anyef these moor suzveyors a5 & single jount expen. You mayseloct
one of mure of thelisted motor surveyers We will bearsthe contol the pre-repait survey carried out by the single jointexpert.

Thanks and regards.

Sywen inding Axian

AIG

Esparess T Adpastar ||

55 Cumrss Operatons | A5 Sharsd Servoes

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this email {and any attachements) is confidential. 1f you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information, IFyou have received this emadl in error, please immediately notify me by “Reply” command and permunently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereal, Although this email and any sttachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affoct any
compuler system into which it is reccived and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that i is viras free and no responsibility is
uwpﬁumihf;ﬁmumm Intemational Groap, Ine. or its subsidianes or affilites cither joinly or severally, for any loss or damage ansing m any
way e

IMPORTANT NOTICE.

Thm infoermalion in ey @mad (and any afachermnts) is confidenial If yo @rm not thet nbended recipant, you Must nat wse or diesaminale Me infarmanon. If you hew receved
is amail in error, pldass immedialsly nolify ma by “Aeply” command and pemmansntly desste ihe onginel andg sny copes or pintouts Berec, Although His amail snd any
itachmunts s believed 1o ba free cf any viue of ciher defoct that might affect any computer sysien imo which || i recefed and opunod, 8 is i responeiblity of the recpient
to anuur el i 8 virgs free end no responsitility s sccepted by American rtermational Graug, inc. ar ks subsidkenes or aMilabes wiltar jpinlly e sevetaily. hor any loss o
dwmape arising in ey wey bom i e

https://securemail2.aig.com/securereader/read. jsf 16/10/2018



107242018 Mermen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail & assocated with :

*SME4381T (02173270015G)
[5LX833U]
™
CHIJA SHARMAGNE GWEN
Ot 3 2018 1:00PM
|KINS ESH SOLUTIONS FTE LTD|
Bw Warkshop Services Ple Lid

Rephy | Beply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

Fram AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 24/10/20186 09:41 AM,
To LKk _HQ
Subject Re: No OI GIA Report

Hi,
Insured has not report accldent til date |

Thanks & Regarda |
Yin Rul, Hor (Viviene |

<-= Dnginal Message >

From: LKK_HQ |
To: AlG_5G; NoorMariesa AbulassimBalg.com; ShengYang LmEalg.com, Imran.ishak@aig.com; yokeshi.chan@akg.com;

Aashweenjestkaur, MithoosinghBsig.com; Syazairdina.AzianEaig.com: Yinrul Horieig.com

Sent On: 24/10/2018 09:16 AM

Subject: Re: No O] GIA Report

Dear S / Magam,

Kindly agvice whether imsured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary action,

Thank you.

<-- Original Message -->

From: AlG_SG

To: LKK_HO

Sent Cn; 16/10/2018 09:51 AM
Subject: No O GIA Report

Hi

Plense be advise thal no O GIA mport recslved.
Plaaza find O details beiow for your furthsr pctions.

Q1 Name: KINS ESH SOLUTIONS PTELTD
Address: BB0 UPPER THOMSON ROAD #02-12 SINGAPORE TAT102
Maobila Mo 91157288

Thanks & Regards
¥in Rul. Hor (Vivianal

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documnents,

httpa/fsingapore.merimaen com/claimeindes. cfmMHusebox=5VCmallAluseaction=dsp_viewAmode=18linboxid=13754134IDomainid=11810bjid=84.. 1/2
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$1 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: 10651 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564515

Our Ref: CC4/AIG18018885/Ghb3
24 October, 2018

KINS ESH SOLUTIONS PTE LTD
680 UPPER THOMSON ROAD #02-12

SINGAPORE 787103
Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME 4381T AND SLX 833U ON 03.10.2018 ALONG/

AT 7030 ANG MO KIO AVE 5 NORTHSTAR @AMK LVL 2

We. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appomnied to act on the behalf of your
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim
against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this
letter, giving the version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The
GIA report can be lodged a1 any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer to your
Centificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the
undersigned within five days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & elc
would be affected.

Yours faithfully,

Vic Alpeh Sanghilan

Claims

Tel : 6841 2096

Fax: 6741 4108

Email : vicalpeh @ lkkauto.com

c.e.  Claims Manager
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



Vic !Lﬂuutn]

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 20 January, 2020 9:34 AM

To: Chan, Kian-Meng

Cc: Admin A Vic (LKKAUtD)

Subject: RE: 02173270015G-003 / SME4381T & SLX833U(AIG) on 03/10/2018 - LKK REF
CC4/AlG18018885/Ghb3

Attachments: FW: SME4381T - Finalize

Dear Kian Meng,
We refer to the below email.
Please be informed that till date, we are still pending for TP LOD.

As per discussion on 17/01/2020 with Mr Bennie and Mr Chee Heng, in view of TP inactivity, we will temporarily
close the matter and submit WP report.

We will reapen the matter should there be any further development.

Thank you.

+ Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yegy

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fux: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

¥y EIRS e
SLERER =E Suve the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mail cantain confidental and privileged matanal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distibubion by an
unintended reciplent is prahibited, and may be a violation of law. If you bafieve that you received this e-mall in error, please do nol
raad this e-mail or any altached llems, Please delste the e-mall and all atachments, including any copies thereal, and Inform the
sender thal you have delated the e-mail, all altachments and any coples thereol. Thank you



From: Chan, Kian-Meng [mailto:Kianmeng.Chan1@aig.com]

Sent; Friday, 29 November, 2019 1:52 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: 02173270015G-003 / SME43B1T & SLXB33U(AIG) on 03/10/2018

Good day Vic,

We refer to claim in subject matter, kindly advise claim status and expedite settlement by soonest,
As this is a review seeking for claim closure, appreciate your advice if there is opportunity to do so.

Best regards,

Chan Kian Meng

AlG

Complax Claims Examingr

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

AlG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1678
KianMeng.Chan1@aig.com | www.aig.sq



S1 U AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (G5 ) 52563561 FAX @ (0A5) 62504313

05 JULY 2019

KINS ESH SOLUTIONS PTE LTD By Post & By Email
680 UPPER THOMSON ROAD

#0212

SINGAPORE 787103

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF  : CCA4/AIG18018885/Ghb3

YOUR REF :SLX 833U

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 833U AND SME 43817 ALONG AMK AVENUE 5
NORTHSTAR BUILDING ON 03.10.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third
party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of
SME 4381T against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had
collided to the Third-Party vehicle SME 4381T. As such, liability may not be on your
favour,

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD - if any) may be affected as a
result of the claim against your policy

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter_if not

provided at AlG’s reporting centre The list below is not all inclusive and further

document may be required:

« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)
Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)



!’ UU Aulo

-y Consultanis
Bl B A Pl

S1 UMEAVE |, #01-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX - (D6S) 2564313

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AIG's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us
at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

h
a andler
DID: 6841 2056

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh@]|kkauto.com

C.C. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Mator Claims Dept)

wilkinschew(@agrmail.com
(Email)




Vic (LKKAuto) T —

From: Vic (LEKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 5 July, 2019 6:16 PM

To: wilkinschew@gmail com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: YOUR REF: SLX B33U_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 833U AND SME 43817 ALONG

AMEK AVENUE 5 NORTHSTAR BUILDING ON 03.10.2018

Auto
.' - - "! Consuirans

-
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05 JuULY 2019

KINS ESH SOLUTIONS PTE LTD By Post & By Email
680 UPPER THOMSON ROAD

#02-12

SINGAPORE 787103

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/AIG18018885/Ghb3
YOUR REF :5LX 833U
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LX 833U AND SME 43817 ALONG AMK AVENUE 5 NORTHSTAR BUILDING ON 03.10.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SME 4381T against your
maotor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had collided to the Third-Party
vehicle SME 4381T. As such, liability may not be on your favour.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD— if any) may be affected as a result of the claim against your
policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under
the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s)
arising from this incident, at your own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

within 10 days from the date of this letter_if not provided at AlG’s reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive
and further document may be required:

s Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
e Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
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Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest{s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AlG's prior knowledge and
consent,

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s),

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at vicalpeh@|kkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended reciplent. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. |f you believe that you received this e-mall in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachmenls, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg ne 1sss071s8m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG180188BS/GHA302

Date: 23/01/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 1800067407
Claimant :
Vehicle No : SME4381T Insured Vehicle No : SLXB33U
Drate of Loss: 03/10/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 021732700156
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SME423B1T
Make & Model: HONDA FIT, 1.5 HYBRID (A) Engine No LEB1432368
Reg. Date: 28/09/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: (3P51327596
Colour: Blue Odomeler: 809 km
Engine Capacity 1486 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/60 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/60 R15
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 8 mm Rear Lefl Side: Bridgestone 8 mm
Froni Right Side: Bridgestone 8 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone & mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre reads depin
COST OF CLAIMS - Rnpilrtr't Adjuster's Difference Diff %,
Paits 1.597.00 612.00 985.00 61.68
Miscellanecus llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour B880.00 400.00 280.00 41.18
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 2,277.00 1,012.00 1,265.00 55.56
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 159,38 70.8B4 BB.55 55.56
Nett Amount (S§) 2,436.39 1,082.84 1,353.55 55.56
Global Sum Settlemeant (§5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 16M110/2018
Date Inspected: 18/10/2018 Inspected At: 30UBIRD 4
Repairer BW Workshop Services Ple
Ltd (HQ)
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE This report represents our findings af the Nme and place of (ngpection stahed herein. Such inspection has been camied ow fo the bes! of our
knowiedge and abilly bul any other Tabiity under any othor circumstances is hereby oxpressly aroiudoed
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Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
i 1 *FRT BUMPER Damaged 1.300.00F 727 50FL
2 10 *FRT BUMPER CLIP Necessary 4500FS *30.00FS
3 1 *FRT BUMPER SEAL Not Necessary B85.00F *-FL
4 1 *FRT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARNISH Not Necessary 111.00F “FL
5 2 *FRT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER Not Necessary T6.00F “~FL
F=Franchise part S=SpcMefl. L=ListhamDisc.
Sub Total (S5} 1,597.00 757.50
- List Iltem Discount on L Items 0.00/20.00% (S$) 0.00 145.50
Total Parts (55) 1,597.00 §12.00

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 23/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selscted.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR CHARGE MNew 680.00 400.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§5) 680.00 400.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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