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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July, 2019 3:31 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SME4381T - Finalize

 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email:  sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Justin Ee <justin_ee@bw.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 3:28 PM 

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Derek Low <derek@bw.com.sg>; Ebell Lee <ebell@bw.com.sg>; Xu Hai <xu_hai@bw.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: SME4381T - Finalize 

 

Hi Guo Qiang, 

 

Let Close at $1012 (Before GST) @ 2 Days. 

 

We will send out our LOD and Invoice soonest. 

 

Thank you. =) 

 

 
Best regards, 
Justin Ee 
Workshop Executive 

 
BW Workshop Services Pte Ltd - www.bw.com.sg 
Venture Cars Pte Ltd - www.venturecars.com.sg 
30 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408615 
Main: 6289 8800 / Direct Line : 6692 0139 / 
Fax: 6858 2120 / HP : 9731 8883  Email justin_ee@bw.com.sg 
 

ARC & Nominee Workshop Of :  
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On Tue, 30 Jul 2019 at 15:24, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Justin, 
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Finalize COR $1012 before GST @ 2 working days. 

  

Regards,  

Guo Qiang 

  


