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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18007567MFSH

Our Ref: CS/FCI18018874/Urb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam.

Date: 1 November 2018

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SKZ S877L. .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 17/10/2018 at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check™ Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the front portion.

Yours faithfully

MARCUS
Automotive Assessor

:S$  14.088.90
;8% 4.562.67

: S%

: S% -

: §% -
: S§ -




MS @ FirstCapital

G Rafties Quay #21-00 Sangapone 48580
Tel (65)6222 2311 Fax (B5)627F 2547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coes ne

JHGUIIIUEL L5 Heg No M2-HHI1GTG-Y

Claimn & Mater Underwriting Cept; 36 RoDinson Road i 1E-C1 City House Singapore 065377

Tel: (B3] 507 3848 Fax (6516507 3849

wrvew.mafirstoapital comasg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person,

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
17-10-2018 Our Ref No.
17-10-2018 Claim Type.
SHDBEDTZ Third Party Vehicle.

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-46/48/50AUTOBAY
NANCY LAM

67465405/ 0 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18007567MFSH

Third Party

SKZ5877L

67458520

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD Attention.
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No.
KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

MIL
MNA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer genarated letter, no signature required.




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

f

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 5:01 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1BO07S567MFSH/1
Dear Sir,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKZ 5877L on 17/10/2018.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2018 3:03 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007567M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 2:55 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007567MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, November 01, 2018 9:29 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc 'Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007567MFSH/1
Attachments: SKZ 5877L.pdf

Dear Sir,

Enclosed preliminary revised for SKZ 58771

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Aannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 5:01 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007567MFSH/1

Dear Sir,
please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKZ 5877L on 17/10/2018.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.
=

Thank you

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2018 3:03 PM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>




1NMAMDNEAR PARFICOF Rahata Fraiing

> Back to OneMatoring
" Enquire PARF/CCE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type: Company

Cwner ID: 0399N

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.: SkZ5B77L

Vehicle ta be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 18 Oct 2018

Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BEMNZ
Wehicle Maodel: C 180 KOMPRESSOR
Primary Colour: Brown

Manufacturing Year: 2012

Engine No.: 27191031354544
Chassis Mo.: WDD2040452A7 30015
Maximum Pawer Output: 115.0kW (154 bhp)
Open Market Value: $30,327.00

Original Registration Date: 15 Jun 2012

First Registration Date: 15 Jun 2012

Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $30327.00 /[ 4 7}
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 14 Jun 2022

PARF Rebate Amount: %19.712.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 14 Jun 2022

COE Category: & - Car (1400cc & below)
COE Pericd|Yearsh 10

QP Paid: %58,001.00

COE Rebate Amount: $21,211.00

Total Rebate Amount: $40,923.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Oct 2018

OK

REtps: LVt gov.Sgitan T acuon/enguiraHebala sy FUDICHeToreLereg Input fE LML | IUN_IU=FUsUauud | |



10M18/2018

Used Mercedes-Benz 180 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCariart

SGLEARMART.COM Login® Sian up

New Cars

Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

ANNOUNCING (@) soeete

as sgCarMart Premium Dealer for the 7 Consecutive Year

. ) L]
Pnn.:t an Advertisement V(‘-'-’} HIN LUNG AUTO 30 =
samiiesoon A =
unti It s B
One Stop Car Hub n
Met Link Partners Finance, insurance, Workshop
f 4 Mew and Used Cars e & =
Browse by Category ¥ = Back (12 ) Mext » Sort by Date Posted ¥ || 20 resuks/page ¥
34 ve G Mercedes-Benz cLA0 o
Modef Price Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage \iah Type
Search Selection Mercedes-Benz ¢ 180 Aty Rty 2012 Ay Any Any Available
Mercedes-Benr C-Class C1B0K  $63,800 $13,230 fyr 22-1un-2012 1,597 e 98,000 km Lusiry Available
Avantgarde —_—
Roed Tax Till Dec’)8, 1 Owner Only. Excellent Condition! Fully Service By CRC. Buy With Confidence, No Repairs Needed, Don't Miss To View, Call For
Appsintment,
F— . IR CIA0K, 2012 o des-Beng C1ADK, e
. , 1008, Merood M, |
Mercedes-Benz C-Class C180 565,000 $124920 fyr 25-0at-2012 1,505 ¢c 115,004 km Luxury Availahla
CGI Avantgarde
Owner Upgraded, Well Maintained, Service Regularly, 100% Accident Free, Call For A Viewing Sow, Doar Step Viewing Available.
- A Adoantg s ericedes-Bens 201 e £ 180, Mercedes-Bans £ meroedn s 5
Posted: 17:0c:2008 il 2, C1RT, C180, |
Mercedes-Banz C-Class C1B0K 555,800 $12,440 Jyr 12-Jan-2012 1,507 cc - Luury Available
One Owrer. Good Conddtian, This 1s Consignment Sale, View By Appointment, Trade In And Financing Availatie,
Pebid i Tangss 2042 Y0k Mercedes-Boens C1R0K, mercades- e
: 5 A0k, Marne 0K, ¢ R
Mercedes-Benz C-Class C1EQ 71,888 $13,940 fyr 23-Jul-2012 1,796 cc 99,000 kmn Saarts Available
Coupe ——)
! Owner Agent Unit, Pristine Interior & Exterior Condition, No Scratches/Dents, Al Servicing Records Well Kept. Biack On Black Easy To Mairtain, High
Lean & Trace-In Available. Call Now For & Viewing... S ——
Menster Mators Fre Lid
Prete HH end c18, iere C1A0, mencedes-tere c1Ar
Mercedes-Benz adds SLC180 to S5LC lineup
The Mercedes-Benz SLC roadster range in the UK. has been expanded with the intreductian of the new SLC1S0 AMG Lins,
Read this artiche
Mercedes-Benz C-Class CL80 $63,500 $11,770 fyr 28-MNow-2012 1,595 co - Ly Available
CGI Avantgarde
CarPlate 5533, 1 Owner! Accloent Free, Low Mileage. No Repairs Needed, No Repairs Needed, All Wear And Tear Has Been Changed. Car Has Besn
Dame Up Tastefully By Previous Owner, Buy With Peace OF Mind..., LT
Rt & Menenes-Rerg CLEQ, 2012 m wiieng C18, Marcegies-Band C1ED, memedes-beng c1480
il 2, C180, €180, Used Morce
. i Mercedes-Benz C-Class C1B0K §58.800 $12.730 fyr 43-Mar-2012 1,597 oc 89,000 km Luxury Avallable
R Avantgarde o
Mercedes-Benr C-Class C180K 452 800 $11,600 fyr {3-Jan-2012 1,597 ¢ 122,000 km Luscury Available

Init! Lusury Medium Size Secan, Fuel Efficient Yet Powerful, Accident Free, Low Mileage Done! Regularly Serviced, Supreme Condition! In
Inance Available And High Value Trade In Availablel, .

Autn Enterprise Pra Lid

https:/fwww.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MOD=Mercedes-Benz+c1808PRC=0ADEP=04RGD=20124VEH=08AYL=2 113
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FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD i Ry of /
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 $fsg #3602/7
#01-46/48/50 ‘ j /
SINGAPORE 417883 g =)
VEHICLE NO:SKZ 5877C
Qry PARTICULAR
1PCS BONNET /L s2450000%
1PCS BOMNMET LOGO A1 $82.000°%
1PCS FRONT BUMPER /¥U” . 3T Be/t-n $1817.20_—
2PCS FRONT BUMPER LOWER CHROME MOULDING @$145.00 I AL 529000 e
2PCS FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @$105.00 o B | $210.00 4
1SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS FLaA EE»D.I]I]--“’H
1PCS FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Sec §715.00.4
1PCS FRONT BUMPER DAYRUN LIGHT N/S Tra $495.00 -
1PCS FRONT GRILLE (rq  §788.20
1PCS FRONT GRILLE LOGO AUA $145.00 7
1PCS HEADLAMP N/S Ay Cra  $2,66500 —
1PCS FRONT SUPPORT PANEL /L $625.00.X
1PCS AIRCON CONDENSER SIDE GARNISH N/S FLa $82.000¢
1PCS AIRCON CONDENSER / A7 $1.418.002
1PCS FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH [ /.6 5l+ $366.50
[ /v $12,208.90
-
LABOUR CHRAGES: -
TO CHECK WIRING $80.00 20
TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING A -1 $80.00 0%
TO REFILL AIRCON GAS A1 $120.00 A
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT & REPLACING PARTS $800.00 ‘}LJ/;_/‘_)
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING $800.00 (/9
TOTAL $14,088.90
| I-:!,.'
. JisEL™
=rejudice” basis
2 resurvayed and

Ackn wiadged by Repaines

val from Insurance Company




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R G5T Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCHMB01BE74/Urbn2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date 07112018 ”mlmlmmmw “
Code: FCI2
1i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 6897Z Veh. Inspected SKZ 5877L
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18007567TMFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 18/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ C180 (A) c.C 1597
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2m2
Chassis No. WDD2040452A7 30015 Colour WHITE
Odometer 99060 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/40 R18 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/40 R18 YOKOHAMA, & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT F'ORTID-N_
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/10/2018 llmp&cﬂnn Date 171072018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
ADAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, Mo: 199607198R GS5T Reg. No. 19-9607158-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKZ 5877L
aty Description of Parts Condition ,.E:g:‘:;%'" Our "{‘;{‘“‘J‘d
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 2.450.00 =
LABOUR
1|BONNET LOGO NOT NECESSARY 8200 -
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED /{ TORN 1,817.20 1,425.32
2|FRONT BUMPER LOWER CHROME MOULDING @%145.00 |NECESSARY 200,00 280.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @$105.00 NOT NECESSARY 210.00 -
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIFPS HECESSARY 60.00 650.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABLE T15.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER DAYRUN LIGHT N/& SERVICEABLE 495.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED T88.20 788.20
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO NECESSARY 145.00 145.00
1|HEADLAMP NS CRACKED 2,665.00 1,450.00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 625.00 -
LABOUR
1|AIRCON CONDENSER SIDE GARNISH NIS SERVICEABLE 82.00 -
1|AIRCON CONDENSER NOT NECESSARY 1.418.00 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH SERVICEABLE 366.50 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -415.85
12,208.90 374267
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 80.00 20.00
TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING. NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
TO REFILL AIRCON GAS HOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT & REPLACING 800.00 400.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF BONNET AND
FRONT SUPPORT PANEL
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING BO0.00 400.00
1.880.00 B20.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,088.90 4,562.67
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,600.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18018874/Urbn2




CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

ESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repor.

iy 14 1 1

Report Ref No. CS/FCI118018874/Urbn2

i jceepied fo any therd pasty who m rephy on the Repor wholly o
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