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10/17/2018 Clalm Paortal

LRKAUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (QR) ~

4 Service Request Details

Claim
SEMOOYZF

Reference

None @

Loss Date
October 10, 2018

Reguest Date
October 17, 2018

Due Date
October 24, 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (0D

Tvpe ot Loss
Own Damage

Services
Accelerated survey and authorize

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Gl Work Arzent Wil

Vehicle Infermation

Incident Vehicla Registration &
SGQ1233R

Make
VOLKSWAGEN

MEnu

=7a745

2



10r 720148 Clajm Partal

Maodel
GOLF 20 GT|

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

BELGAR ARCHIMEDES
BLK 483 Y10 CHU KANG ROAD, #12-15 CASTLE GREEN, 787057, Singapore

be.archie@outlock.com

Claim Handler

KHONG Lynn
68804892
lynnkhong@axa.com.sg

Additional structions

Ah Lim (Sin Ming} OD EXCESS NIL
Misnoges Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes
Ml Mesogy

hittps {/vp smartcialma.axa.com, sg/claim-portabhtmilindex-vendor-service-raquests. himiftiservice- requests/tserviceReguestiNumber= 75745



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pel [LKKAuUto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 October 2018 10:34 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAute)

[ Admin A

Subject: FW: Fwd. Efile Accident Report - Vehicle 5GQ 1233R - Volkswagen Golf - Own
Damage & TP Claim

B=st Regards,

$Mu Pei| Admin

LItk Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: B366-0055 | email: shupel@ikkauto com | faxc 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industeial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(a08933)

From: meili@almsm.com.sg <meili@almsm.com.sg>

Sant: Thursday, 25 October 2018 9:43 AM

To: Lynn Khong-AXA <lynn khong@axa.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms>

Subject: Fw: Fwd: Efile Accident Report - Vehicle SGQ 1233R - Volkswagen Golf - Own Damage & TP Claim

Dear AXA Claims Handler,

This Is to inform that insured, Mr Archimedes Belgar of this vehicle 560, 1233R had decided withdraw out
his QD claim.

Kindly refer to his message below
Regards,

Meili Tan - (Sin Ming)

176 Sin Ming Drive

#)5-12 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

Tal : 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686

email : meili@almsm.com.sg

From: Archimedes Belgar

Sent: Tuesday, October 23, 2018 11:20 AM

Yot Ml aknc o

Subject: Fwd: Efile Accident Report - Vehicle SGQ 1233R - Volkswagen Golf - Own Damage & TP Claim

Hi Meili,
Appreciate if you can help to cancel this claim as | do not want my NCD and premium to be affected.

Kindly let me know once you notify AXA so | can ask them to void the additional premium they are asking.
Thanks.



et Outlook for 105

From: Archimedes Belgar <be.arch tiook.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 23, 2018 10:26 AM
To: Archimedes BELGAR

Subject: Re: Efile Accldent Report - Vehicle 560 1233R - Volkswagen Golf - Own Damage & TP Claim

Hi Meili,

Can you please help me to cancel this claim as | do not want my NCD and premium to be affected. Kindly
let me know once you notify AXA. Thanks

Get Qutlook for I0S

From: Archimedes Belgar <be.archie@outlook.com>
Sent: Friday, October 12, 2018 10:09 AM

To: Archimedes BELGAR
Subject: Fwd: Efile Accident Report - Vehicle SGQ 1233R - Volkswagen Golf - Own Damage & TP Claim

Get Outlook for iI0S

From: meili@almsm.com.sg <meili@almsm.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2018 6:11:59 PM

To: be.archi look.com

Subject: Efile Accident Report - Vehicle SGQ 1233R - Volkswagen Golf - Own Damage & TP Claim

[iear Archie,
Kindly refer to the attached efile report to keep for record.
Fegards,

Meili Tan - (Sin Ming)

176 Sin Ming Drive

#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

Tel : 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686

email : meili@almsm.com.sg



100352018 Glaim Portal

LKKE AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (OD) = Manu

<€ RE: WITHDRAW CLAIM

Type
@ Question

Message
Please be informed according to the repairer the owner declded to withdraw his od claim, we will close this
file at our end without billing.

Regily

hitps /ivp. smartctaims. axa.com sg/ciaim-portalhtmbindex-vendor-service-requents himitservice-requestsilew-messagel TserviceRequestNumbe... 11



102528 Clairm Portal

LR AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (0D = Meny

“ Re:RE: WITHDRAW CLAIM - Noted

Typin
© Question

Message
Hi, Noted, Will close file. Thanks

REpiy
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