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 Question

Message

NO DEVELOPEMENT FROM TP . WE WILL PROCEED TO CLOSE FILE AND SUBMIT SURVEY REPORT ,

JASPER CHUA ,29/01/2020.

Reply

RE: Status of claim

Menu LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 12 November 2020 10:59 AM
To: Rico 60 Claims
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: LOD for SMD 965R
Attachments: SLH 6235R.JPG

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir/ Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 965R & SLH 6235R ON 28/09/2018. 
 
Please be informed that according to our principal, our insured has successfully recovered 90% from your 
client ‘s insurer – NTUC INCOME INSURANCE since 26 June 2019         
 
Kindly refer to our insured’s statement as attached for your reference. 
 
As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
From: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 22 October 2020 8:19 PM 
To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <Pohkin@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK 
Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>; Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD for SMD 965 R 
 
FINAL REMINDER 
 
Dear All,  
I would like to check what's the status for this case? Do get back to me as soon as possible to avoid escalation of 
legal action. Our side has tried numerous efforts to get a resolution from your end.  
 
Please revert asap.  
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Regards, 

Damian Lim  

81880381 

 

 

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
#02-24, Singapore 415875 
Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 
Email: claims@rico60.com 

 
 
On Mon, Jul 1, 2019 at 5:47 PM Enquiry <claims@rico60.com> wrote: 

Dear Poh Kin , 

  

Attached file as per your pursuant. 

Kindly release DV/cheque. 

  

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Shanelle Lim 

  

 

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
#02-24, Singapore 415875 
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Mobile: +65 9187 8064| Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 
Email: enquiry@rico60.com 

  


