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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT /

RISCHARGE VOUCHER
lll-Direct Settlement (FODS)

India Ref: TF/MPC201600000108
Claimant Ref ; 5LJ 10420

Weil, _ Tan Chong Motor Sales Pie Lid {"the workshop”) hereby confirm that wedl have reached an agreement
with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pre Lid  LKK Auta Consultants Pte Lid {name
of Surveyor) with respeet to the amount claimed for S5 1.587.53 irepair cost), S%  214.00 (loss of
usefrental), 53 _7-45  (search fee). wehicle no. SLI 104267 ot was damaged pursuant o the accident which ocourred
on O4NO20TET a0y g Cuscaden Road (location) involving vehicle ro, SLO 16842 /(:rusured

vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 1711072018 idate) at “the workshop”,

Wed confirm that we/l arelam authorized by the owner  Oh Chin Yuan Benjamin _ {"he third party
claimant”) of vehicle no. SLI1042C to make the claim as sef out in the above paragraph and well have full autharity o settle
the matter on hisher behall in & manner that we!l deem fit. Well enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third

party claimant”,

Wedl further confirm that wed will indemnify India International Insurance Ple Lid for all damages, loss andior expense that
they will or hawve already incurred in the event thal “the thirg party claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs andfor rental andfor loss
of use pursuant to the damage to S 1M2  ehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

Well confirm thal the agreemen! reached abave is in full and fingl settlemeant of all claims of "the third party claimant®
pursuant lo the accident and that further this setfiement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of hability

basis,

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Cours have exclusive jurisdiction over any
dispute arizing out of the same.

Weflauthorize youto paythetotalamountof 85 _1818.98 1o Tan Cnong Motor Sales Ple Lid

Erabed g oy O R i 20 18
CLAIMANT: WITNESS:
Signature: ) ol Signatuire -
gﬁgmmnp“ {wath chop) Signed by appointed Surveyor
Name: {C-LNME EEEEART]_“ENT} - Name: =
MNRIC:
Address:
Nationality — B

Oecupation:
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From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@Ilkkauto.coms>

Sent: 27 March 2019 09:04

To: Morsipah

Subject: RE: RTA involving vehicle Nos. SLQ 1894Z and SLJ 1042C on 04.10.2018
Dear Sipah,

We need original copy DV.
Kindly mail it to us.
Thank you.

{Ill, CT1, Lonpac case need original dv)

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or su bsequently produced by either party that will mate rially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negatiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohking@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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S Save the Larth Print only when mecessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Norsipah [mailto:norsipah@tanchong.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 9:01 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@Ikkauto.com>

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RTA involving vehicle Nos. SLQ 18947 and SU 1042C on 04.10.2018
Importance: High

Hi
Signed DV attach for your processing soonest passible.

Payment instruction as follows:

Amount (SGD) | Cheque to be payable to: —r




1,918.98 Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd

Kindly mail the cheque/s to us at Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sipah

Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd
913 Bukit Timah Road
Singapore 589622

E: norsipah@tanchong.com D: +6567038915
Website: www.tanchong.com :: WWW.Nis5an.com.sg

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 22 March 2019 18:09

To: Norsipah <norsipah@tanchong.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RTA involving vehicle Nos. SLQ 1894Z and SLI 1042C on 04.10.2018
Importance: High

"Without Prejudice"”
“Save As To Costs”

Cur Ref: CC4/11118018839/R1fb3
Your Ref: SU 1042C

Dear Sipah,
We refer to the above matter and your letter of demand.

We hereby confirmed settlement as follow:-

1. Cost of Repair (w/gst) S5 1,697.53
2. Loss of Rental ($100.00 x 2 days)+7%gst SS  214.00
3. LTA search fee 55 7.45

s$ 1,918.98

Please duly sign the DV attached and return to us (LKK) for payment processing.
Your prompt action will be very much appreciated.

*** for Direct Settlement Case, Kindly mail your original copy LOD to us (LKK), instead of mail it to our
Principal.



