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SMAT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates

Secticn A - Accident Dotalis
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

e ————— e —————

From: Lucas Lee <lucaslee@sg.cntaiping.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October, 2018 11:14 AM

Ta: Mei Kwan (LKKAUtD)

Ce Catherine Thia

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Invaolving EM9399M (O : CAl - SNM18D04832C02)
and SHB1BO2R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTT18018826/MNwa3) on 08/10/2018

Attachments: leaSZ_SNMI1BD0O4832C01-EM9399M-

LKKDirectSettlementAccidentLtr_CLCR95.893 pdf, MCHM18130244-EM9399M pdf

Categories: HMK

Dear Sirs,

Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Catherine Thia

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Lid,

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 079309
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (65)6222 7175/6224 7478

Email; lucas.les .cniaiping.com

Waebsite: www.sg.cniaiping.com

AMNIVFRSARY
In Supapere smer [958

Disclaimer

Thix mexsage is confidential; its contents do net constitire a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lud. excep
where provided for in a written agreement berween you and Ching Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Any unauthorized
divclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or parrial, is prohibired. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message,
pease navify the sender immediarely

From: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan @|kkauto.com

Sent: Friday, 19 October, 2018 6:16 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Catherine Thia; Lucas Lee; Vivian Lau [LKEAute); Thin Thin [LEKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving EM3399M (Ol : CAl - TBA) and SHB1BO2R (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI1B018B26/Nwal) on 08/10/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
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Our Reference: SNM18D04832/C01/9

Date : 23 OCTOBER 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail
KOH MELVIN KENNY

BLK 316D PUNGGOL WAY

#06-685 WATERWAY CASCADIA
SINGAPORE 824316

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING EM9398M AND EM9399M ON 08 OCTOBER 2018
ALONG BLK 58 LENGKOK BAHRU CARPARK

We refer to the abovementioned accident,

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, EM9399M | is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly
Yours truly,
Claims Department
{This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.)
CC : LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
ATIn VIVIAN
Ref CC3/CTI1B018826/NWAS

Contact No - 68418625
via Email VIVIANEILKKAUTO COM

CC | Ageni - (ANOS09A) - NITA PTE LTD

FO1LKKDS-2013



From: Tan Lee Gek (AutD Syes/Ext Biz Sves/Claims g 1A/Taxis/Claims)
<LeeGek@smrLcom.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 December, 2018 5:57 PM

To: cS A Team; Admin A

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 8/10/2018 involving SHB 1802R & EM 9399M (China Taiping's
insured) Our Ref: TAX/10/18/2033/lg

Attachments: 10 18 2033 pdf

Dear All,

We quantify our own losses as follows:-

Cost of Repair £1100.00
Loss of Rental 5601.88 | 45 daysx 513375 )
LTA Search Fee 57.00

| Total $1708.88

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair Invoice
2) Proof of rental rate
1) Police/GIA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTA search
§) Hirer's Letter of Authorisation

Our hirer is claiming his injury and loss of income through his own lawyer.

Please let us have your offer soon, Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

&5 ST

ALTOMOTIVE
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Our Ref: CCNCTIIEDIEBZEJ"Hwa}
16 May 2019

Koh Melvin Kenny

Blk 316D Punggol Way
#06-685

Singapore 824316

Dear SirfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING EM 9399M AND SHB 1802R ON 08/10/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the maiter prior to our negotiations and
settiement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Y ours falthfully,

S

Vivian Lau

Case Handler

DID: 6841 8625

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com

c.c China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

AUTHORIZA IS S - ===

1. SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third purty claimant™) of 60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL

60 WOODLANDS 22—

PARK E4 (S)757705 (address), owner of SHB _1802R (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SMRT
AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim
for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SHB 1802R that was
damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 08/10/2018 (date) along BLOCK 68/59
LENGKOK BAHRU OSCP (location) involving vehicle no/s EM 9399M (“the accident”).

| further authorize the workshop 10 settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit

and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

| further acknowledge that uny settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/fowner/insurers of the other

vehicless is concerned.

Dated this aL (day) of él(.éé {month) illﬂ_[y:m]

Ap

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”

{with chop if applicable) (with chop)
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AUTOMDTIVE

Date: f‘;,) Jﬁlzaﬁ .

Cur Rel, No.:

| etter of Authorisation

L NE g Jeops (NRIC No.: 2137408 [~/ ) the
registered hirer / relief driver / contract hirer of SMRT taxi registration number
Zhr/%02 A hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(“AutoSvs") to deal with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi

and _EM 9399 M happened on _2 fra lo0 |3

along cabPILk b BlKEC anR Blf¢q Lenskok Rahry 9-aEAM.
(the “Accident”) on my behalf, including but not limited tﬂc;nstituﬂng and any claims or
proceedings against such party or parlies (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute
discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or

action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resalve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited
to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my
behalf as may be required.

Name M&ﬁfﬂfl}'ffﬁg&gnamre % Q/ |9 /2— 2%
ORI ™ 5 .0 20 1 - Y Lot AR
Tel No. 9“3\&315?9?5{

Address wkg‘??‘ﬁpﬂgééaﬁﬂ&
0 b-7% .. Mnerranr. (522.677)

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3



MOTOR_CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

e e et

Folicy Ho i DMPCSNI009521800 Claim Mo i sSHM18D04832C02/C02/9
claimant @ SMAT TAXIS FIE LID

Amount ; 551,640.00
SIMGAPORE DOLLARS ONE THOUSAMND SIX HUMDRED FORTY OHLY

1/We agres bto accept the above menticned amopunt to be pald to mafus tn full &
final settlemant of all claims, <osts & disbursemantas for injuries /[ damagea
sustalned by mefus through an accidant inwelving

claimant Vaklcle Ho. 3 gHR lAO0ZR
tnsured Vehicle Wo. = EM 939%H

pate of Loas : DEF10/2018
Place of Accident : BLOCK GA/5%9 LENGEOK BAHRU QsCP

14 COMSIDERATION of the payment made te mafus of the aforementioned Ssum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LID.. t/We agree absolutely to
digcharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5INGAPORE) FIE. LTD. and/or

[nsured Hame : WO MELVIN KENNY
Oriver Hama s KOH MELVIN KEMNY

frem all claims, present oF future in respect of all loms, injucy or damage
gustained by mefus arislng out af the said accident.

1 acknowledge thar cthis payment Lla made without admisasion of 1iabilicty on the
part of CHINA TAIFPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

11} Glabal Sum (all in) 85 1,640,00

Tﬂ'fhl-...-t.......-..5$ 1,640.00

claimant Name: TS __'/ NRIC No JIUMF‘

76 JuL 2018

Signacure H flate 1
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SMAT Automotive Bervices Fte Ltd
stT 251 Herth Bridge Boad Singapors 179103
g gel: 65 €3311000 Fax: 65 63340247
AUTOMOTIVE i
Tax Involice

GST Reg No. : MR-8500001-7

rustomer Code: 3000063

[ CRN . 1890042802
SMRT TAMIS PTE LTD Invoice HO. IV181200031
Date :+ 03.,12.2018

Vehicle Mo. : SHE1802R
Your Ref Wo. : TAX/10/18/2033
Our Ref No. : 24098222

Block Unit ™

5 @
06 ODEC 200 w
g

€3

Cinims

60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK Ed Depsment &

SINGAPORE 757705 Nve o€ Terms . 30 Days
Daseription Qty Onit Add / (Discount Amount
Cost % Amcunt
LUMP SUM AMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 5 1,100.00
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION
GRAND TOTAL 5 1,100.00

Remark :

Make/Model + TOYOTA PRIOS
accident Date : 08.10.2018

¥.8, Payment by chegue should be crossed and

made payable to 'EMAT Autcsotive Sgrvicea Pte Lvd*.
Wo receipt will be issusd unless requestod.
. — = .
———gn L= _'—'-l-.-l

BEuthorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Led

Page 1/1 E. & 0.E
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Our Ref : TAX/10/18/2033/LG
Date - 17/10/2018
To : Claims Department

From : SMRT Taxis

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHBIS
LENGKOK BAHRU OSCP

02R & EM9399M ON 08/10/2018 ALONG BLK 68/59

CONFIRMATION OF TAXI RENTAL

‘This is to confirm the daily taxi rental rate for taxi registration no. SHB1802R is $133.75/day.

Kindly proceed to recover any rental

loss from the third party as & result of this accident.
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Enquire Transaction History
W = conscrion History Dhadadd
Log Data/Time: 09 Oct 2018 /070353
Asset Type: Wehicle Transaction Amaount: §7.49
Asset I0x EMFIFIM
Transaction Type: 16,32 Insurance Enguiry (GIRO Payment) Chanel: External Agency
ESASBAHO- BALOISH BINTE ABDUL Business Trantaction
] 20101009090353667852
Ll HALIL Reference No:
. Search Date/ Time: 0B Oci 2018 me
Irsurance Company: CHIMA TAIPING IMSURANCE [SINGAPORE] PTELTD

irtarmation disglayed Is correct as at the log date and time.

Enquire Related Logs Back to List
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408333

TEL 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 188607198R GST Reg No 19-9607198-R

Affilinted to Fedaration

Internationale Des Experts En Automoblls

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

Ref CC3/CTI1B018826/Nha3qg2

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079908 Pate 02052016 MIM‘"IN"IH"“I
Code: CTI
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, EM 9329M Veh. Inspected SHB 1802R
Policy No. DMPCSN3009521800 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D04B832C02/C01/9 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 09/10/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS c.C 1708
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Req. 2015
Chassis No. JTDKN3BUB0STE5527 Colour MAROON
Odometer 376681 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/685R15 GOODYEAR 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 GOODYEAR 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 GOODYEAR B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/85R15 GOODYEAR B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. Ganeral Information
Accident Date 08/10/2018 Inspection Date D8/M0/2018
Survey held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
B0 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAFORE 757705
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, No: 1B0607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-5607158-R Paga No.1 ef 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB 1802R
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (5)) {ij]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER FRT (DISC 25%) CRACKED 482.00 361.50
10|BUMPER CLIPS @%1.61 (DISC 25%) NECESSARY 16.10 12.08
1|LENS & BODY.FR TURN RH (DISC 10%) SCRATCHED 511.80 460.62
1|BUMPER ENERGY ABSORBER FRT SERVICEABLE 78.80
1|BUMPER REINFORCEMENT FRT SERVICEABLE 498 40
1|ARM SUB-ASSY FR BUMPER LH SERVICEABLE 250.40
1|BUMPER SUPPORT FILH SERVICEABLE 76.40
1|BUMPER GRILLE SUB-ASSY LOWER SERVICEABLE 31110
1|BRACKET ,FR TURN LOWER RH SERVICEABLE 26.00
1|BRACKET ,FR TURN UPPER RH SERVICEABLE 24 40
2327540 834.20
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK. 845.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINT. 558.00 200.00
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION, B0.00 2000
TO WASH AND VACUUM. NOT NECESSARY B0.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT WIRE HARNESS. NOT NECESSARY 120.00
1,663.00 420.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,938.40 1,254.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,100.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No, CC3/CT118018826/Nha23q2
|
MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

MECLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Rapon s made soiely for the use and beansfit of ihe Clleni named on the frond page of s Repori.




