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CREDIT REVIEW HI
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> Back to OneMotoring
Encui ire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
" Vehicle Owner Particulars o =
| Cwner 1D Type: - o Singapors NRIC =
| Cwmer 1D: 44272
_ Vehicle Details _
[ Viehicle No: SIK6206H
‘Wuhicle to be Exported: No
intenged Deregistration Date: 28 Oct 2018
 Viehicle Malee: SUBARU
venicia Madel IMPREZA 50 2.5 WRX-S AWD SMT
_Primery Colowr: R ——— Blue - 1
Monfacturing Year B 2008 ]
_EngloeNo: e __E125D364748 D
| ChassisNo: ~ IrioMEXD38G01SZ78 ——
Maximum Pawer Output S 1690w (226 bigl ]
Criginal Registration Date: ~  290a2008
| First Registration Date: o 290c 2008
TslerCount — - - DUDEI———
Actual ARF Paid: 3 $19,406.00
OPC Cash Rebate Details
= OPC Cash Rebate Eligibility: Mo = |
CPC Cash Rebate Eligihility Expiry Date: . ) -
| OPC Cash Rebate Amount: -
intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 26 Oct 2018
| PARF Rebate Amount: $9,703.00
| Intended COE Rebate Detalls o o N B =
COE Expiry Date: 20018 ——
COECategory: ; £-OpenCategory |
COE Period|Years): S 10 = N
ppud - 5009 ————
| COERsbamAmountt o0 ) __'_1
| Total Rebate Amount: . $9.703.00 e
The inforrmation containag herein is cormact as 3t 09 Oct 2018
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102018 Singapore Used Car Lisiings - sgCarMant

sGCarMAaRT.COM
THE ONLY PUACE FOR SMART CAR RUTERS
Subaru Impreza 2.5 Used Vehicle List (6 vehicles)

Car Model Price Deprecistion  Reg Data Eng Cap  Milezge  Company Avallability
Subaru Impreza WRX 5D 2.5M  $66,000 $6,590 fyr 15-Nov-2008 245700 - 1 Accurats Aut Avallable
STT (Mew 10-yr COE}

Teiy Street Cull Ovin def Blue 00 Tamp,oll Pres & Boost Meter greddy Prisfes Bacst Gontralier, Picnssr Touch Sereesy Head Unit $450-bt, Whitkling |ower
Arrry Bueshing, forgis Engire Dome With Manky Plston A,

Office Mo, - 64532104

parren - 97330090 | Jeremy - 95885885

Subsry Tmprozs WRX-S 5D L5M$46.800  $4.680 jyr 12-Noy-2008 ZASTee 162,000 km Available
{New 10-yr COE)

Gt For COE Rirewal, Sporty NoIssues,

Office No, = -

Tea - 57109942

Submru Impreza WRX 5D 2.5M  $62,600 46,250 fyr 16:-0ct-2008 2457 - Pang's Motor Trading Pz Avaitable
5T1{New L0-yr COE) td

fcidant Free. Gutitanding CordRion STE S0 Wit feew 10 Year COE? Comes With Oy The Essential Balt-on Upgrates, Heser Be=n Heaavily Madlified Before.
Full Servicrg And Maintznance History Avaltabie! ..

Office No. - 67761061

flichard Mognshi - 96435535 | Mitthar Pung - 31114810

Subaru Impreza WRX-S 50 2.5M$72,500 £7,360 fyr J-AugI008  2457cc 140,000 ke Avaitable
(COE till 08/2028) ' '
Reguiar Saryicing With Wirkshop, View It And Seen Yourself,

Office No. - -
Sl Yaw - 91809004

Subaru Impreza WRX 50 2.5M  $67,800 $7.070 fyr 24-May-2008 2457 = - SG Car Chaice Pre Lid Availnble
STI {COE till 05/ 2028)

Gvinar Congignment Unit, Low Depreviation, Gosd Candition 50'STI Far Sale That 15 Already Renewed, Everything In Good Condition, 6 Months Free
Senvicing By Reputabin Workshop With 40 Years Experisnce L.

Marold - BEIEA111

Subaru Impreza WRX Z.5M £69,999 §7.340 fyr OfF-May-2008 2457 o 153@5 km Avallabile
{COE till 05/2028)

Extrermely fliiisble 106w Stret Lagal Wt Pumping JE08HE, $25K Worth OF Mosds. Dwnor Was Diagnosed With Obsassive Commylsive. Disardes (0L, Buy
SWith Confidencs, Contact Owrer For Mone Info,

Office N, - -
Bobhy - B7204292

aplarMart (s thi number on Car ehassifieds for parallel impart cors, Toyota, Hords, Missah, Mitsubishi 8 BMW, Thare are plenty of cars for sale, gwen four COE
raes, OPC Gats, &N, tricks, hylbd cans;-sports cors or stationiwagons: You can also buy from a car auction, Jook up car loans, kiw mileage cars, o brados,
arpatk rates & car |nsurance. We hive new car disglers comprising paraliet imparters, authorised cor denlers, and used car degiers on our ste. Find new car
tice: sts,, ness car inuneties -and rew car promotions; and alsg matoring advice, car reyiews & car news on the Istest models, VISt our parthes sites for job
peings for Singapore jobs, neal estste properties-for sale, mover, car plrinrmance parts, can discussion, farum discession, commerial vahicle leasing & TOE
whlits.

B 2004-2018'sgCarMart. All nghts reserved.
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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

e —
From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 11:55 AM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Ce: LKK Valuation; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Valuation Request

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,

wWe refer to your emall of 19 October 2018,
Flease proceed to submit the 3 valuation repors.
Thank you

fudrey Gah

¢ BG/WM Credit Collection
Fisk Management Group
[BS Bank Lid

Tel - 6B78 8026

From: Celine Fong (LKKAutp) <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 19 October 2018 10:44

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>

Ce: LKK Valuation <valuation@Ilkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Reguest

This mail originated from an external party outside DBS - celinefong@|kkauto.com.

Dear Audray,

The Valuation of vehicles as below:

1) SIKG206H (Revised OPC scheme) MV: 512K FS: 59.8K
2] SIYES55SR MY: 526K FS: 523.5K
3) SITE914A (Old OPC) MV: S6K FS: 53.4K
As at October 2018
liest Regards,

eline Fong

LKEK Auto Consultonts Pre Lid

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@kknotocom | fax: 6256-4315
1k 51, Pava Ukl Industrial Park, Ubi Avénie 1, #02-25 | S(qo8533)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 9:17 AM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong @lkkauto.com>



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 10:44 AM
To: ‘Audrey Hweae Ling GOH'

Ce: LKK Valuation; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE Valuation Regquest

Dear Audrey,

The Valuation of vehicles as below.

1) $IKB6206H (Revised OPC scheme) MV: $12K FS: $9.8K
2] SIYB559R MV S26K F5: 523.5K
3) SITE914A (Old OPC) MV: 56K FS: $3.4K
As at October 2018

fiest Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: f2s6-a561 | email: celinefong @ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Kk 51, Pavit Ui Industrial Park; Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | Sl4ob033)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 9:17 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Ce: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkautoe.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
subject: Valuation Reguest

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,

Please assist to provide valuation for the following 3 vehicles:
Viewing place at No 1 Bukit Batok Crescent Level 10 Weega Plaza -
1) SIK6206H (Revised OPC scheme)
2} SIYBS59R

Viewing place at 210 Turf Club Road Lot €20 -
3] SITES14A (Oid OPC)

\We had faxed the above log card, please acknowledged.
Thank you.

Audrey Goh

CBG/WM Credit Collection
Risk Management Group
DBS Bank Ltd

Tel - 6878 9026
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