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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Business
Owner ID: 2889)
8/ (2 o= | e . M |
Vehicle No.: SLH53408B
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 17 Oct 2018
Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicle Model: E 250CGlI
Primary Colour: Brown
Manufacturing Year: 2009
Engine No.: 27186030032772
Chassis No.: WDD2120472A162155
Maximum Power Output: 150.0 kW (201 bhp)
Open Market Value: $53,016.00
Original Registration Date: 31 Mar 2010
First Registration Date: 31Mar 2010
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: $53,016.00
EIntended PARERebateDetalls =0 = 7 7 T
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 30 Mar 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: $29,158.00
Clitended COERebatEDetaleeame e = e e )
COE Expiry Date: 30 Mar 2020
COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $36,089.00
COE Rebate Amount: $5,238.00
Total Rebate Amount: $34,396.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Oct 2018

OK

naps.Aivria.gov.sgialvriiachon enquireHebale By FupicBeroralaneg Inpul i UNG 1IN =R Dauaoug |

m



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - |l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Maonday, 15 October 2018 9:11 AM

To: account5 leasing; ben OQI; 'sur@lkkauto.com’; Catherine Chang (LKK Auto)

Cc Zuhaidah Samsuri

Subject: RE: FW: SLH53408 Accident 10.10.2018 - 3rd part claim against India Int'| Insurance
insured SHA3921Y

Attachments: SLH5340B SAS REPORT.PDF 16 3qam@) 1510]1€

uthitle not In
Dear Sir / Mdm, R“un@ Chai va

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLH53408 and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Aida.
*Kindly upload this survey requast email to meriman.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecll Street | #05 108 Bullding | Singapore 045711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: account5 leasing [mailto:accountS@allswellmotor.com.sg]

Sent: 12 October, 2018 7:15 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; ben 001 <ben@allswelimotor.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FW: 5LH53408 Accident 10.10.2018 - 3rd part claim against India Int'l Insurance insured SHA3921Y

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Thanks for your reply.

Please get LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 1o do the survey as a single joint expen.

Best regards,

Chin Yee

Ellswell Makor Tradies

25, Tt Lane 9 Singapore 539265
LT =a8 6579 | | 36

Fomm| pecountdiEallave] imistar com s

On Fri, Oct 12, 2018 at 4:02 PM, Motor Claim - 111 <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:



Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

» LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
« Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Joel Nah

Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
6 Cecll Street #04-02 108 Building
Singapore 048711

Tel; 6347 6100 Ext 206 Fax: 5324 4174

From: account5 leasing [mailto:account5 @allswellmotor.com.sg)
Sent: Friday, 12 October, 2018 3:58 PM
To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; ben 001 <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>; Edmund Ng

<edmund @allswellmotar.com.sg>; Mark Mark <mark@allswellmotor.com.sg>
Subject: SLH53408B Accident 10.10.2018 - 3rd part claim against India Int'l Insurance insured SHA3921Y

Dear India International Insurance { Motor claims department )



. | without prejudice )
We are the owner of the vehicle SLH5340B and your insured vehicle SHA3921Y came in contact with our vehicle at the material time,

Before we proceed to repair our damaged vehicle, please us know within 2 working days till 16.10.2018 whether you would
like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you, we will proceed repair without
any more reference to you

Thank You

Chai Yee

Allsweil Motor Traders
25. Detu Lane 9
Singapore 510288
Office +85 6679 1146

Email: account3@allswelmeiorcom.gg

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree 1o the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.



. India International Insurance Pte Lid.
‘Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing vour personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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View Received Message

This mail is associated with |

“SLH53408 (MCT18100321)
[SHA3921Y]
™

ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
Oct 10 2018 6:00AM

Allswell Motor Traders

hp_ly] Raply Al ] Mark a3 Linread I_Dnm. Message I Delete Huugnj Forward |

From india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 24/10/2018 11:28 AM,
To LKE_HG
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SLH53408 - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsurl

Approved: 0,00,

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

“There are no documents.

hitps:/isingapore. mermen.comiclaimsindex.cfm Musebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_viewhmode=14linboxid=1 3755644IDomainld=118i10bjId=3... 112



A._ ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS

= | 15, Defu Lane §, Singapore 539266
J'.l-j'- | GST Reg No.: 53192889) / Co Reg No. S3152880]
I S Tel No.: B6TY 11456

Email: beni@allswellmotor.com sg

L 0 }'}

d

BillTe : india International Insurance Pte Ltd TAX Invoice Defu-2B07
(Motor claims Department) Date 9/10/19
Terms Co.Dn
Ref: 3rd party claim SHA3921Y
Description fity | Amount before GST | GST Amount | Amount incude GST

Allswell Motor Traders
Vehicle # ; SLH53308
Date of accident: 10.10.2018
Repaired, Replaced and Resprayed 1 52,282.34 5159.76 $2,442.10
I Towing 0 NA NA Ma,
TP Insurer Search 1 57.45 NA 57.45
GIARMC - SAS Report 0 NA MNA MNA
Loss of Use @5100.00 / per day 2 5200.00 NA £200.00
Pre-Repair Survey Loss of Use $76.66 / per day o NA NA NA
Replacement vehicle @5120.00 / per day 0 NA NA NA
Cwn damage excess 0 NA NA NA
Surveyor Report 0 NA NA NA
Singapore Dollars : Sub Total ( Excluding GST ) 52,489.79
W thowrsnd bis hundred forty nire and conta lifry- e only GST payable @7% on 52,282.34 515976

Total { Inclusive of GST ) 52,649.55

e

Authorised Signature




Allswell Motor Traders

100, Sulian Plaza. #02-41. Singapore 199001 /
C/o 25. Defu Lane 9. Singapore 539266

Date: 05:11-3019

Discharge Voucher / Paymeni Authorisation

Our Claim reference numbers: Dg{u -3Bt]

Attention: Su i ¢fo hdm Iwmrhmal [hawanc

o 1/We hereby certify that the repairs to my/our vehicles bearing license
number plate : SW 53dve which was involved in an accident on
(o-f0.20] B

has been completed by Aliswell Motor Traders to my/ our

satisfaction.

I/We agreed that all 3 party claim payment to the workshop for
repairs, replace and re-spray works shall be made solely to Allswell

Motor Traders at 25, Defu Lane 9.5 539266

Signature:

Name: NG Boon Chin, Edmund

"-T Py
Company Stamp: { \\
\3\“‘_/"‘7
R~/
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Lund Transport Authority

Lang Transpan Authoarity

10 Sin Ming Driva

Singapore ST5701

GST Registration No. - M4-D006525-2
Print DiateTime : 12 Oct 2018 / 15:23:55
Receipt Date/Time © 12 Oct 2018 / 15:23:55

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Recapt No. : ITNET-00000-181012-001720

Previous Racsipt No. :
S/N Itom Dascription/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Befors Amount Aftar GST
No. GST (85) S8) (s%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SHA3E21Y
As al 10 Oct 2018MB8:30:00
Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS FTE LTD

~ 1 Insurance Enquiry - SHASB21Y
Enquiry Fee T.00 049 748
20181012152204 5968166
Sub-Total T.00 049 T.49
Total Before Rounding T.00 0.4 7.48
Rounding Differance .04
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
Credit Cant
ocooonoooo B 18
745
Tolnl TAS
Cash Change a.00
Tendernd Amount TA5
Excass Refundable Amount 0,00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure thal all payments to the Authority are good and promptly sstiled by the payment service
provider  financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt Is considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print Receipt OK Save as PDF

TREF VLIS, GOV, S0/ a0 TV BCTOnr COMDIS TRy T £ undl. | I _ILSE TIU TN




122018 Manman e-Claims
Print Received Message

This mall is associated with :

*SLH53408 (MCT18100321)
[SHA3921Y]
T'F

ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
Oct 10 2018 &:00AM

Allswell Motor Traders

From India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) (lll_SG), sent on 28/10/2019 14:04 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2649.55) - SLH53408 - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

Approved:2649.55.

hitps://singapore. merimen com/claims/index.cfmfusebox=SVCmailstuseaction=dsp_FrintACFID=617089558CF TOKEN=43dcdaZefdd65cal-A1..  1/1




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...{Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Setilement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

=" Notified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigmed Ad) Apt | Ad) Submitted | Ina Auth'ed Ststus
|17 02t 2018 IS0 gea2m233 ss22m23 e
[ 4
_teene | s marrpr | | et txomates | | _View 2t | Cancel Casa |

Claim Detalls

|CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

Ingured: MTHM““ PTELYD, ID: 199303821R
Main 4
Cluimant: ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS, Co. Reg, No.: 53192889)
ehicle | 10/10/2018 06:00 - :59
o ¢ sLHs3408 Date of Lo8s: | 1303 Months and 10 Days From LTA Rieg Date (Man ¥r)] |
G Type: | TP / MCT18100321 Foicyfcover | mcomoa1s
Vehicie Reg.
Ne. SHA2921Y lm,. 5068430889-03 I
[Tneured): | :
| | Exress:
Wopairer: | Allswell Motor Traders (HQ) 25 Defu Lane 3, 539266 Defu Lane - Tel| 66791146

T India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 . [Mandied by Zuhaldah Bte Samsur - 6347 6070)

NTUC Income Insurance Co-oparative Lid (HQ) - Tel:
| Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tal- 6256-1561 ... [Handled by XING GUO QIANG] . [Final Rpt dus 26/10/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compase Case mail |

-

» [I1_SG {29/10/2015): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$2649.55) - SLH53408 - Claim Handler: Tuhaidah Bt
« HI_SG (21/10/2015): Alert - Adj Mandate Malntained - SLH53408 - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samaur

!s 111_SG (24/10/2018]: Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (530.00) - SLHS3408 - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte S...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view Al | Search Tosks | Crmate New Task | Camplete |

Due Date  Priority  Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On~ Done?
ho results.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 14/11/2019



Mermnen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLH5340B (MCT18100321)
[SHA3921Y]
w7

ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
Oct 10 2018 6:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSFORTATION PTE LTD]

Page 1 of 2

Allswell Motor Traders

Upiasd Bocuments |  upiosa Protas |  Compose wew Lemer | View [viam in Sroweer ~ |
Photos/Images [3perpoge  [v]
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) Thumtmail
1 |DWUE/19 11018 | Gonersl View Load 190G
? |p7j0E/19 11:18 | Genersl View Load WG
1 |07/06/19 11:18 | Genersl View Load 1RG
4 |07/06/19 1118 | Geners! View Load JPG
5 |07/06/13 11:18 | Genersl View B Load IPG

B |07/08/19 11:18 | General View Load PG

7 |owoens 118 | General View Load IPG
8 |07/08/1911:18 | General View Load IFG

5 |0706/19 11118 | General View Loed 1PG
10 |07/06/19 11:18 | General View Load 1PG
11 |07/06/19 11:18 | General View Load TPG
12 |07/08/19 11:18 | General View Losd PG |
13 |o70619 11118 | General View Load 1PG
14 |07/06/19 11118 | General View Load PG
15 |O7/06/19 3118 Ganeral View Load PG

07/06/19 11:18 Genaral View

Lond JPG |

e
b

07/06/19 11:18 General View

Load PG |

=
=

O7/0a/19 11:18 General View

Losd P0G

=
L-]

O7/06/19 11118 General View

Load IPG

L]
L=}

07/06/19 11118 Ganeral View

Load PG

"]
-

DO7/06/19 11:18 Genaral View

Load PG

el
B

OF/06/19 11:18 General View

Load PG

u

29/10/19 10:05 Reinspection Photo

1.

Loas PG

[
&

29/10/19 10:05 Reinspection Photo

Load WG

cooco0OCOOOOCCOCODO0COCOORCOOROCRO0 0

H SIS IS S

25 |29/10/19 10:05 | Rainspection Phota Load IPG
26 |29/10/19 10:05 | After Repair Photo Load JPG
27 |29/10/19 10:05 | After Repair Photo Losd IPG
78 |29/10/19 10:05 | After Repair Phota Load IPG
Documentation [Lperpage  [V]
Ne |Relabel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbnail
1 |17/10/18 09:24 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO ITI DD 15.10.2018 Load POF
7 |17/10/1809:24 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
3 |2310/18 17:27 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED @) | LeadPoF
4 |09/10/18 16:38 | LOD AND OTHER DOCUMENTS @ | Load FOF
5 [21/10/19 10:53 | LTA SEARCH [ T
& | 14/11/1% 11:12 | WORKSHOP INVOICE & LOD ) | icadFOF
7 [14411/1911:12 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER g Load POF
B [14/11/1911:12 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
Mo | Finalired On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print |
1 18/10/18 09:28 Singapore Accident Statement n Loagd POF
Documents Checklist
| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | sove | pom |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 14/11/2019



Mernimen e-Claims Page 2 0f 2
There are ne document checklists configured.

Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)
el
L3

Show Remarks To: O Handlmg Insurer
Mo ! Ramasks ame privids uneedi yiu Bhoss @ 18 Bher pames

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 14/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co reg no 10searscar;

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel; 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCA4/118018B22/GGA302

Date: 1411172018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. India International Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No MCOMO015
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SLH5340B Insured Vehicle No : SHA3B21Y
Date of Loss 10/10/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18100321
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SLH5340B
Make & Model: MERCEDES-BENZ E250, 1.8 CGI (A) Engine No: 27188030032772
Reg. Date: 31/0/2010 (Man, Year: 2009) Chassis No: WDD2120472A162155
Colour: Black Odometer: 187463 km
Engine Capacily: 1796 co
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price
Sum Insured (S5). Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yeas
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/50Z R1T Rear Tyre Skze: 225/502 R17
Front Left Side: Firenza & mm Rear Left Side. Firenza 8 mm
Front Right Side. Firenza 6 mm Rear Right Side: Firenza 8 mm
The above values reprosant i remaining fyre lasds capth
COST OF CLAIMS Repaire’s  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 2,679.00 184233 B3B.67 31.23
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 700.00 440.00 260.00 37.14
Paimwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S5) 3,379.00 2,282.33 1,096.67 32.46
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 236.53 159.76 76.77 3246
Nett Amount (S§) 3,615.53 2,442.09 1,173.44 32.46
+ Car Rental (2.0 x 55100.00/day) (5§) 200.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.45
Nett Liability (S5) 2,649.54
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 15M10/2018
Dale Inspected. 16/10/2018 Inspected Al 24 DEFU LANE 12
Repairer-Allswell Motor Traders (HQ)
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: Chong Pui Lin
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MNOTE, This repart represents our findings af ihe me and place of inspection ststed henitn. Such mapection has been camisd oul o the bast of our
knawiidge and abilty but any ofher fabdity under any olfmr circamstances i hereby expressly sxchuded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 {Last Synchronised: 21 Oct 2018)

Parts: M1-COUPE MERCEDES-BENZ E250 1.8 CGl (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLHS3408)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the [ast estimate page

|_Furthnr Info: l!muinluus not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *TOP REAR BUMPER Deformed 1.625.00F *1,513.00FL
2 1 *LOWER REAR BUMPER (GARNISH) Deformed 1,010.00 F *48515FL
i 4 *CLIPS Necassary 44 00FS “44 00FS
F=Franchise part. S=Spchen. L=Listhemihsc
Sub Total (S5) 2,679.00 204215
- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/10.00% (S§) 0.00 199.82
Total Parts (SS) 2,679.00 1,84233
r Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no now miscellaneous ltems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 DISMANTLE /ASSEMBLE OF AFFECTED PART MNew 260.00 200.00

2  SPRAY PAINTING OF AFFECTED PARTS New 260.00 200.00

3 RE-ADJUST /MAKE SENSOR HOLES ON NEW BUMPER Mew 180.00 40.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 700.00 440.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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