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' B P4 P LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Badil B B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408333
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Feg No 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experis En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Raf : CC4/ASM1B018811/Nwb3
D AN AR 0888 T 1111111
Code ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 435M Veh. Inspected SHB 9914
Policy No. Coverage ($) 000
Claim No. Excess (5) D.00
Assign From Assign Date 16/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RIH Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
LiH Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
o General Information
Accident Date 13/10/2018 Inspection Date 15/10/2018
Survey held at SMRET AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSFECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Poh Kin !LKKAutnz

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & |A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.comsg>
Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 4:42 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAUto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 13/10/2018 involving SHB 991] & SHD

435M (AXA's insured) Our Ref: TAX/10/18/2058/1g

Categories: clear

Dear Poh Kin,
We accept your global offer of $1,800.00. Please let us have your DV. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6B66 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automative Services Pte Ltd

%m

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto: pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 06/03/2019 14:09

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/ Taxis)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 13/10/2018 involving SHB 991) & SHD 435M (AXA's insured)
Our Ref: TAX/10/18/2058/lg

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/ASM18018811/Nfb3
Your Ref: TAX/10/18/2058/lg

Dear Lee Gek,
We refer to above matter.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction from our Principal to offer settlement at global sum of $1,800.00(all in} on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.



Poh Kin !LKKAutu}

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6§ March 2019 2:09 PM

To: LeeGek@smrt.com.sg

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 13/10/2018 involving SHB 991) & SHD

435M (AXA's insured) Our Ref: TAX/10/18/2058/1g

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/ASM18018811/Nfb3
Your Ref: TAX/10/18/2058/lg

Dear Lee Gek,
We refer to above matter.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction from our Principal to offer settlement at global sum of $1,800.00(all in) on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
Intention of resalving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being distovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FEY, e
ELSRER =N Snve bhe Sarth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this @-mall in eror, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delele the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereofl, and inform the
sender thal you have delated the e-mail, all altschments and any coples thereal Thank you

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 11:14 AM



Poh Kin !LKKAutu!

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 B:32 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: New message for service request 75225, vehicle number SHB991J
Categories: clear

€ Pls proceed DS with quantum as proposed

Tvpe 0 Ousrtion

N vamay that TH submtted NOA for ZOT1E, we will sgres m pay $80/owy for srmcabis

MRS SEEE

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

—-0riginal Message-——

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 4:57 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 75225, vehicle number SHE991)

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S{408933)

-—-—-0riginal Message—-

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 1:14 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 75225, vehicle number SHB991J
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a1 Claim Partal

LEE AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD(TP] - M

« < S8MO00Z7Z> |A with mandate uploaded

Type
© Question

Message

Dear Peter, Liahility: Insured driver caollided into the rear aof third party vehicle. Liability is down against our
insured. Send letter to Ol via E-mail to notify TP claim and excess amount on 23rd October 2018 Immediate
Advice [with mandate] have been uploaded in SMART CLAIM, We hereby seek your approval to offer Third Party
repairer M/s "SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd" is as follows: - 1)COR{w/gst] ; $998.73 + 2) Loss of Rental
(4days x $120.91): $483.64 + 3) Loss of Income (4days x $80.00): $320.00 =Total: $1,802.37 *"2days
recommendation for repair. *“All the relevant documents had been uploaded in SMART CLAIM. For your
approval please. PohKin - 01/03/2019

Reply

hittpa:/ivp amartclaims axa.com sg/elaim-portal/ imlindax-vendor-service-reguests. nimi#/service-reguests/view-message/7serviceRequesiNumber=75... 11
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Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 1/3/2019

Survey Details:

Date of loss 13-Oct-18

Date of appointment 15-Oct-18

Date of survey 15-Oct-18

Location of survey SMRT Automotive Services Pie Ltd
Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Vehicle number EHE 8914

Make and Modal Toyota Prius -1798cc

Pate of registration 12-Dec-17

Parf Rebate

Market Value 5 =

Parf Rebate 5 -

Mett Loss s -

Repair details:

[Initial Estimate | 2,943.37

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts s 538.73
Check items (estimate)

Labour 5 460.00
Total (I/B/1) 5 998.73
Lump Sum(if applicable) 5 -

[Number of days for repair | 2 days |
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Compary Aegistralion Ha 15T 1IN

SLUMEAVE 1 SDZE PAY A LI DTS TIHLAL PAREL SI%0APTIRE S0 TEL i) a2Sadsal FaX o oias) alfad) s

Rem $
:

manth, 52.595.00/30= $86.50 per days

LOR 4 DAYS = 2days + weekend +PRI, TP proposed 580.00 per day
\far loss of income and provide us a copy of income tax statement on
year 2018. we guantify LO! as below: 531,138.00/ 12= §2595.00 per

Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repalr cost 5 998.73
Loss of use 5 .
Loss of rental 5 483.64 |[5120.91 x 4 days)
Loss of income 5 320.00 |(580.00 x 4 days)
GlA search fees 5 -
Others (medical) 5 .
Proposed Total 5 1,802.37




Poh Kin !LI{I{Autuz

Subject: FW: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 13/10/2018 involving SHB 991J & SHD
435M (AXA's insured) Our Ref TAX/10/18/2058/Ig

Attachments: 10 18 2058.pdf

From: Tan Lee Gek {Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 5:11 PM

To: C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 13/10/2018 involving SHB 991) & SHD 435M (AXA's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/10/18/2058/g

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of Repair $998.73
Loss of Rental 5604.55 | 5 daysx 512091 )
Loss of Income 5400.00 | 5 daysx SB0O.0DD )
Total 52003.28

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair invoice
2] Proof of rental rate
3) GIA report
4] Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) Hirer's current income tax proof
6] Hirer's Letter of Authorisation

We have notified AXA of PRS on 15/10/2018 at 11.45am and our taxi was surveyed on 15/10/2018 at 5.15pm. We attach
our email for your perusal

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6B66 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

%m

AUTOMOTIVE




* Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) —

From: Vivian Lau [LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October, 2018 4:52 PM

To: ‘claims@transcab.com.sg’

Cc: ‘carnsalee@ava-ins.com’; ‘icewong @ava-ins.com’; ‘ireneng@ava-ins.com’;
'foonghon@ava-ins.com’; Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 435M & SHB 991) ALONG JURONG WEST ST 64 ON
13/10/2018 @ 08:05Hrs

Dear Sirs/Mdm

OUR REF  : SEMODZTZ
YOUR REF : SHD 435M

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 435M & SHB 991J ALONG JURONG WEST ST 64 ON 131072018 @
08:05Hrs

We refer 1o the above subject matter. We have received third party claim(s) against your motor nsurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. (enclosed TP video)

We also wish to advise that there is an excess of $$5000/- is attached with Third Party Claims. Please be informed that
vou shall be liable for the excess following any settlement of the third party claim. The applicability of the excess is as
follows:

(1).Any settlement equal to or above the excess, you shall be liable to make the payment of $5000/-; or
(2) Any settlement below the excess, you shall be liable for the amount settled.

We shall keep you informed of the third party claim settlement and thereafter kindly let us have the excess payment in
your cheque pavable to “AXA Insurance Pte Ltd". Please indicate your vehicle registration number and the date of
accident on the back of the cheque.

Notwithstanding the excess being applied and/or received by us for the above subject matter, we expressly reserve all
our rights under the policy to refund the excess payvment in the event that there arises any known policy breach and or
exclusion material to coverage.

As Insurers, we shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at vour own cost and defence, please reply to us within 10 days from the date
of this letter. You intent must be formally expressed to AXA and acknowledged by AXA.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following if not provided at our
reporting centre. The list below is not all mclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are 1o keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.



* To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent. If
you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this accident, please
forward it'to us immediately. You mayv email it to cst@axa.com.sg or deliver it by hand to our Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), we shall keep vou informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Service Team at 1800-880 4888 at our
operating hours 9:00am to 5:30pm or cst@axa.com.sg. Please quote our claim reference when you contact us that we
can assist vou more effectively,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6B41-8625 | email: Vivinnlow@ kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue i, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Date: H\ml;m?

Our Re. No.: Tw\lﬂl 18 I}'ﬂ Y's

Letter of Authorisation

, U\wﬂ ‘;fg.\_o ())n_m (NRIC No.: S0 &3505H ) the

registered hirer / relief driver / l‘a&i share driver of SMRT taxi registration number

E&QO‘HL,I hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(“AutoSvs") to deal with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi
and __ LD 435 happened on ___{ 5{ 1 .u.-.l'rwr 2

along _'}ga.mﬁw_(&m’ Qb
(the "Accident™) on behalf, including but not limited to instituting and any claims or

proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute
discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or
action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resolve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited
to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my
behalf as may be required.

chonh New cHn b

Name ..Signature:

..........................................

................................................................................

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3




AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I/'We, SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of BLK 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 (S) 757708 (address), owner -::fm_u {vehicle no.) hereby
authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me
with respect 1o my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my
vehicle no. SHB 991J that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on

13/10/2018 (date) along Jurong West Street 64 (location) involving vehicle no/s SHD 435M
(“the accident™).

| further nuthorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my
claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the

other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this (n (day) of _Marel (month) 2014 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the warkshop™
{(with chop if applicable) {(with chop)



M redefining /insurance

CLAIM REF ¢ SEMOOZTZ
INSURED :  TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We, SMRT Automotive Services Pte Lid confirm that by letier of suthorisation dated_' 41 | we ure
luﬂmu:dwm&duhﬂtby'iwtmdhchwﬁrmlvumdmmfdwﬂnmm
Chong Yew Chung of vehicle no. SHE 991).

Now we SMRT Automative Services Pte Lid for ourselves and the said Hirer and the driver jointly and
severally:-

a)

by

-]

agree 1o accept the sum of Singapore Dollars One Thousand Eight Hundred only (S5 1.800,00) in the
aggregate in fall and fimal settlement of all claims of whatever kind including damages for personal injuries
and/or damage to property that all and any of us may have against AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD and/or
their Insured and/or the driver of vehicle no (SHD 435M) arising out of an accident with (SHB 9911) on
13.10.2018.

declare that AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD and/or their Insured and/or the driver of the Insured vehicle
shall not be liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever or howsoever present or future thal any of us may
have against AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD and/or their Insured andfor the driver of vehicle no. SHD
435M arising directlyfindirectly as » consequence of the accident and hereby give our full and final
discharge.

We hereby declare that I/we amfare the personis) entitled 1o receive the above sertlement and hereby
undertake 1o indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or 1o be made in respect
of this settlenent.

It is understood and agreed thar payment herein is made in favour of SMRT Taxis Pre Lid is made without any
admission of liahility whatsoever on the part of AXA INSURANCE FTE LTD and'or their Insured and/or the

driver

Dated

Signed by

of vehicle no. SHD 435M.

this ‘ day IJW‘.(:L 2019

W ST oM. Bg

ALA Insgrance Fia Lid (Compary Reg. No. 159903512

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 088811

Customer Centre #8101

Tel: +£5 5880 4888 Fax: +55 6338 7527 Website: www S S0 &f
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AUTOMOTIVE

Customer Code: 3000063
SMAT TRAXIS PTE LTD
Black Unit

60 WOODLANDS IMDUSTRIAL PARK E4
SINGAPORE 757705

SMAT Automotive Services Pte Lrd
281 Morth Bridge Road Singapors 179103
Tel: §5 E3311000 Fax: &5 63340247

Tax Invoice

GET Reg No. : MR-B8500001-7
: 1990042802

CRN

Invoice No. : IV1B1200024
Date : 03.12.2018
Vahicla No. : SHB931J

Your Ref Mo. : TRX/10/18/2058
Cur Ref Wo. : 24098303
Terms : 30 Days

Description Qty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cost L] Amount
Parts
COVER, RR BUMPER ASSY 1.00 5§ 423.90 (100.00) 5 423.90 3 0.00
PAD, RR BUMPER, AH £ 1H , 1 0.00 s 3.B0 Q.00 5 0.00 | 0.00
PAD, RR BUMPER, RH & 1H , 2 0.00 s 3.80 0.00 § 0.00 5 0.00
FAD, RR BUMPER, RH & LK , 3 0.00 $ 3.80 0.00 5 0.00 5 0,00
SEAL, RR BUMPER RRM, RH & LH ¢.00 & 11.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
RETAIMER, RR BUMPER, RH 0.00 & 112.70 0.00 -] 0.00 3 0.00
FETAINER, RR BUMPER, LH 0.00 5 111.50 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
GUARD, RR BUMPER, LOWER 1.00 5 55B.30 {25.00 } 2 13%.57 5§ 418B.73
COVER, GUARD RR BUMPER LOWER 0.00 5 14.80 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
FILLER, RR BUMPER , RH 0.00 § 119.90 0.00 5 0.00 - 0.00
FILLER, RR BUMPER , LH 0.00 § 119.90 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
SENSOR REVERSE 0.00 § 180.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
PIXEL STICKER 2.00 5 60.00 0.00 5 0.00 £l 120.00
Sub-Total 5 538.73
Labour
TO REPRIR RERE PORTIOM 1.00 5 200.00 Q.00 3 0.00 s 200.00
Othars
TO REPSRAY REAR BUMPER 1.00 § 200.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 200.00
TO CHECK WIRING ANMD SYSTEM FUNCTION 0.00 § 80.00 0.00 s 0.00 5 0.00
TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFECTED 1.00 5 40.00 0.00 - | 0.00 5 40.00
ARRER
TO TEST AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR 1.00 § 20,00 0.00 3 0.00 5 20.00
SEYSTEM
TO WASH AND VACUUM 0.00 60.00 0.00 5 0.00 0.00
TO REFLACE SUNDRY PARTS 0.00 5 100.00 0.00 § 0.00 5 0.00
)
=

Page 1/2

Authorlsed Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

£. & 0.E



SMRT Autosctive Services Pre Lid
m 251 Morth Bridge Road Singapere 179102
T — e

Tal: 65 £3311000 Fax: €% 53340247
ALUTOMDTIVE z
Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 GST Reg NHo. : MR-8500001-7
CRN : 1990042802
5MAT TAXIS PTE LTD Involce No. : IV1B1200024
Data + D3.12.2018
8lock Unit Vehicle Mo. : SHBS91J
Your Ref Wo. : TAX/10/18B/2058
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 Cur Raf No. : 24098303
SINGAPORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Description gty Unit add / (Discount) Amount
Cost & Amount
GRAND TOTAL 5 998.73
Remarck :
Make/Model : PRIUSY

hccident Date : 13.10.201E

H.B. Payssnt by cheque should be crossed and

sade payable to 'SHET Automotive Services Fte Ltd,
Ho receipt will be issusd usless requested. (//F }
[ =g —

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pre Ltd

Page 2/2 E. £ 0.E
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& SmRT

SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref: TAX/10/18/2058
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: I18/10/2018

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 981J AND SHD 435M ON 13/10/2018 ALONG JURONG
WEST STREET 64

This is 1o confirm that the daily rental rate for SHB 991J is $120.51 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
TAXIS PTE LTD

for Manager
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Jax Raloearce No ;. S0CO(06H NOTICE OF ASSESSMENT
il @

18 May 2016 ORIGINAL
Pleasa quole the Tex Reference Number (sg. NRIC, FIN, atc) in full when commespanding with us. LAMD REVEMNUE
u! WOODLANDS S SINGAPORE
ORE 730831
| 55 Newion Road
'l'[|'”""'llll'lllllllhll $2“' ll'dqilj Fhmul-;l;",
Tal: 1800-356 8300

bl

o . EESEEEM
SPORE(S) COUNTRIES (5) TOTAL ($) 1:::: o Rfermetion phven ¥
29.200.00 ml‘ reugh e-Filing on 12 Apr
EMPLOYMENT 31,138.00 13800
I your incoma
DIVIDENDS 1.00 1,00 % i Sk . Y
TOTAL INCOME 60,339.00 £0,339.00 w,s:
ASSESSABLE INCOME lhl‘ -mvt in
- the dus date,
LESS: PERSONAL RELIEFS aven i' yoeu to the
Earned incore 1,000.00 assessment.
Chikd ([SCR) 4 000,00 Your lotsl outstanding Income
Providen! FundiLite insurance 10.268.00 tax balance is shown in the
Statament of Account which is
TOTAL PERSONAL RELIEFS 15,288.00 attached [ will be sent to you
CHARGEABLE INCOME 45,041.00 I
MEXT 5,041.00 @ 7.00% 352 A7 BN nase submit your
e d mm 'ﬂﬂun lnllrs via the
TAX PAYASLE BY 18 JUN 2018 B0Z87T DR "“'““ “mﬂmm'm“m"" whow

Thank you for your contribution towards nation building

tHRA4, J

4] -
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NE WAl Cl
mwmm OF INCOME TAX

Privied via myTax Portal
i ad Moa=mns ks Gt or 1 101 orase B18-13-576368551-03



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
Vehicle No: ¥ FHI‘.‘I 435M (Insd veh) | Model: TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID
(SHB 981J {TP veh) o
Date of Accident: [13/10/2018
Global Sum Seltiement I : I_ [X] Yes [ 1 No
Repair Estimate - 3.297.40
Final Repair Cost 5 998.73
Loss of Token Sum 5 320.00 4days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 483 E-lll 4 days
LTA [ GlA Search Fee - ﬂ.U{"
Dthers: | S| I‘.}I-.Dﬂl
Final Settlerment Sum (Global Sum) -$ 1,800.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ YES [X ] NO {Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenano No.

B} For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability; (%) Assassed Liability (*. (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain coliisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) FMRT TAXIS PTE LTD '8 1.800.
( f ~
£
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 18032018
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.

(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill (if any)




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

25 gas Iaae = 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL G256 3581 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199807108R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affilisted to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobila
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CC4/ASM1B018811/Nfb3q2
R T OWERINGABORE 088 R 11111
ATTN.PETER Code ! ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 435M Veh. Inspected SHE 991
Policy No. VPX/P 1680520 Coverage ($) 0.00
Ciaim No. SEMDOZ7Z Excess (§) D.00
Assign From Assign Date 15/10/2018
20 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID c.c 1788
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JTOKB3IFU303576128 Colour MAROON
Odometer 88125 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/ Front Tyre |195/85R15 FALKEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 FALKEM 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/85R15 FALKEN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[185B85R15 FALKEN 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  13/10/2018 |inspection Date 15/10/2018
Survey held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705
Sa, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 LIbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408633
TEL A256 1581 FAX G256 4315

feg Mo 188607188R GST Reg No 18-8607168-R Page No. 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHE 931J
aty Description of Parts Conahion | FENSSMRY | (ot Adintad

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|GUARD RR BUMPER LOWER (DISC 25%) ([CONSISTENT) |SCRATCHED £58.30 418.73
2|PIXEL STICKER @550.00 (SN} (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 120.00 120.00
2{PAD RR BUMPER RH & LH_1 (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 3.80 -
2|PAD RR BUMPER ,RH & LH, 2 (CONSISTENT] NOT NECESSARY 380 B
Z|PAD RR BUMPER RH & LH, 3 (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 3.80 B
2|SEAL RR BUMFER ARM ,RHA&LH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 11.00 -
1|RETAINER RR BUMPER RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 11270 -
1|RETAINER RR BUMPER ,LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 111.50 -
1|COVER ,GUARD RR BUMPER LOWER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 14 80 -
1|FILLER RR BUMPER ,RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 118.80 -
1|FILLER RR BUMPE LH [CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 118.80 -
1|SENSOR REVERSE (COMNSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 180.00 -
1|COVER ,RR BUMPER ASSY (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 423.90 -

LABOUR
1,783.40 538.73

LABOUR

PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK INCLUSIVE OF THE < B76.00 200.00

REPAIR OF COVER RR BUMPER ASSY

SPRAY PAINT _~378.00 200.00

TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION. NOT NECESSARY BO.0O -

TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFECTED AREA ~100.00 40.00

TO TEST AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR SYSTEM 120.00 20.00

TO WASH AND VACULUM NOT NECESSARY .  80.00 -

TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -

1,514.00 48000
GRAND TOTAL 3,297.40 998.73
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | [ '998.73]

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18018811/Nfb3g2



Page No..2 of 2
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18018811/Nfb3g2

MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

MUSCLAMER OF LLARILITY T THIRD PARTIES. - This Report bs made solsty ber e uar snd bemefil of U Clisnt nemed on the bont pags af this Repon.
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