Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 11:58 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP00/020998 RE: XD8747X, TP claim against SJZ7099P (DOA:
06-10-18)

Attachments: SJZ7099P 061018.PDF

Dear Shu Pei

Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 October, 2018 11:14 AM

To: ONG LI LI; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP00/020998 RE: XD8747X, TP claim against S1Z7099P (DOA: 06-10-18)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 October 2018 11:11 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP00/020998 RE: XD8747X, TP claim against SJZ7099P (DOA: 06-10-18)




Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 October, 2018 8:57 AM

To: Chin Meng Motors <cmm@cmm.sg>; 'Quek Kim Seng (CMM)' <kimseng@cmm.sg>; MT_Claim_SG

<mt _claim@Ilonpac.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP00/020998 RE: XD8747X, TP claim against SJZ7099P (DOA: 06-10-18)

Without Prejudice

Dear Mr Quek

You may liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for quantum & liability on a without prejudice
basis first.

If your client has the Police Investigation result, please provide it to us.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Chin Meng Motors [mailto:cmm@cmm.sg]

Sent: Friday, 26 October, 2018 5:50 PM

To: ONG LI LI; 'Quek Kim Seng (CMM)'; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP00/020998 RE: XD8747X, TP claim against S1Z7099P (DOA: 06-10-18)

Dear Ms Ong,
| refer to our telecom 1 week plus+ back.

Kindly advise if your insured wish to pte settle.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Quek Kim Seng,

Chin Meng Motors
Main Branch



1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
Blk B #01-40

Blk C #01-63
Autobay
Singapore 417883

68 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-11

ARK @ KB
Singapore 417896
Tel: 6384-0111

Tel: 6747-4810
Fax: 6745-5018
Hp: 9191-2829

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@Ilonpac.com]
Sent: Monday, October 15, 2018 2:10 PM
To: Quek Kim Seng (CMM); MT_Claim_SG

Cc: cmm@cmm.sg
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP00/020998 RE: XD8747X, TP claim against S1Z7099P (DOA: 06-10-18)

Without Prejudice
Dear Mr Quek
As spoken, please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for quantum & liability.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



