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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX 6256 4215
Reg No 199607198R GST Reg Mo 19-8607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobila

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref CC3/CTI1B018769/K1jb3
2 -
2 PRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Dt W08 I“M"Mll'“lw
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKJ 3804P Veh. Inspected SH 76915
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) o.oo
Assign From Assign Date 16/1072018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/10/2018 Inspection Date 15/10/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508968
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSFECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Yourref:  To Be Advised
Our ref: CC3/CTII801B76WK1jh3

The Motor Claims Department
Mis CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5) FTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

We refer 1o the above matter.

Company Regisunuon Mo, 199807 19ER

Date:

SHT6915

tilmE L a2SRAEN] FAN |

IS B 25NN E

16.10.2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 15102018
at the premises of M/s _ComfonDelGro Engineering Pie Ltd _and have the following 1o report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S$ 901.52

Revised Estimate Amount ;5% 300,00

"Check” Tiems Amount ' 5% -

Murkel Value : 88 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value :S% -

Description of Damage: . —

The vehicle sustained damages at the | ). .:; b
N/S Fromt Portion i

Camments/Present Status;
Demages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours faithiully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser
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Team: ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1 JOB CARD  3sales Order: JeNO: 305225854
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. COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD s . |

S4EF 4O 7010045 TOYOTA g gy
383 SBIN MING DRIVE MODEL

Singapore SINGAPORE 575717
o 65508755 o
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Accident Date: 14.10.2018
NATURE: 3P 14.10.2018 |
S/NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION
i
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE
VEHICLE NO : SH 76915

Hifﬁ/t; [V (‘r[_'-,q.) f

15/10/2018 14:47

CHINA

MAKE :
MODEL : TOYOTA PRIUS
PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
FRONT BUMPER COVER XKMp=> $ 499.90
FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER % " ¢ $ 77.00
SUB TOTAL L 576.90
LESS 20% $ 115.38
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 461.52
LABOUR CHARGE loo
Panel Beating ]
Spray Painting Charge $ 700
1ea
TOTAL LABOUR 5 440.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 901.52
b /..l. /4%
/ r/*»/r:f 157 7o i
I A | ;I rez U ANS th
'2"' /‘J : Ili':.l '.JI" |d s
Yo A |
4 ,E/, Y t
: i
R oie I.
Esealure ]
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boensen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 B:50 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuta)

Cc Lucas Lee; Joy lrene (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKJ3904P (Ol : CT1 - TBA) AND SH76915 (TP
LKK REF -CC3/CTI18018769/K1jb3) on 14.10.2018 / OUR REF: SNM18D04906C02

Attachments: ol report pdf

Dear Shiu Pe,

Pls note our Insured report and our reference.

Awalt your further findings.

Thank you.
Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Talping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3 Anson Road #1800 Springleal Tower

Singapom 079809

Co. Reg. Mo, 2002083B4E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email; boonsan.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping com

Prwha mer

This message is confidentiol; its canterits do nof conatitute o commitiment by China Taipng insurance [Singapare) Pte Lid, eaczpt where prowvded fioe
in a written opreement between you and Ching Tolping indurance (Singapare) Pre. Lid Any unouthorited diselosure, use or dissemination, either in
whole or partial iy peahibited. If you are not the intended reciplent of the messoge. please notify the sender immedgiately,

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto] [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 October, 2018 10:13 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen chong@sg cntalping.com>; Lucas Lee <lucas lee @sg.cntaiping.com>; Joy Irene [LKKAuto)}
<Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKJ3904P (01 - CT1- TBA} AND SH76915 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18018769/K1jb3) on 14.10.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



We have inspected TP vehicle SH 76915 at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang) on a WP basis and TF
repairer purposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
= TP GIA report
. Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shepeyfikbauro com | fax 65741-4108
Ak 51, Paya Ui | ndustrisl Pack, Ukl Svenue 1, 80725 | S(208533)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hup/Awww svinantecclowd.com




CHIMR, TAIPING TWEURANCE [SWGAPDRE) PTE LTD

e MEAR P EA TR (M) FRAS)

CHINA TAIPING — - i
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Vbt g sy Mg =
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Qur Reference: SNM18D04906/C01/4

Date : 17 OCTOBER 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail
NEO MOH TECK

BLK 223D COMPASSVALE WALK

#08-681
SINGAPORE 544223

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SK.J3804P AND SH7691S ON 14 OCTOBER 2018
ALONG CTE TUNNEL

We refer to the abovementioned accident

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SH76915 | is filing a third parly property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.
Yours truly,
Claims Department
(This is a computer generaled letter and no signature is required.)
CC | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Attn Jov
Ref CCYCTI8018768/K1JB3

Contact No - 68412409
wia Emall JOY@LKKAUTD.COM

CC : Agent - [AND132A) - LAKE-VIEW (USED CARS) TRADING

FO1LKKDS-2013



' COMFORIDELGRO

Our Ref T 1018/ SH7691S MWT(st) \ ENGINEERING
Your Raf : ComfonDeiGro Engineerng Pie Lid
Date 24-Oct-18 CDGE Tau Claims Dept 205 Braddnll Foad Singapore 579701
mwumnnu-dml’lr Mamiina +65 6353 a0

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE COLTD Singapore SOBBED Facsimilie +85 8280 8755
3 ANSON ROAD W CUQE COM SG
#1"““ EPR!HGLEAF TDWER Cormgaesy pgiumessin bn | RSV
SINGAPORE 079909 Workshops
Braddall

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE 205 Bradtell Road

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SH 7691S YOUR INSURED SKJ3804P
AND OTHER ON 14.10.18

\We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicie No : SH 76918 which was Involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage lo the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SKJ3904P
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 321.00

2 3 dayslossofRental@ $ 12540 perday [

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) 3 -

4 LTA Search Fees 5 7.49

5 GIA / Police Report Fees $ -

B Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees [ -

Sub Total : § 704.69

HIRER'S CLAIM

T 3 dayslLossofincome@ $ 8000 perdays S 240.00
Total Claims : $ o944 68

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

Singapem s5rarni

Layang
50 Lowang Driva
g aEars DEAED

Sin Ming
383 Sm Ming Drive
Singopam 575717

Pandan
45 Pandan Road
Singapor BOE2AE

Ut

320 upl Road 3
Singapoie 408545
Sanoko

24 Sonoko Loop
Singapons THE156

Sungei Kadul

T Sungen Kadul Yoy

Sipgapore TZA7TH1
Yishun

376120 ishun indusinial Park A

Singapore 163712

a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : ] pes.
b)  LTA search slip/s of : SKJ3804P
¢) GIA/Police repors of : SH76815
d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
( ) Traffic Compound ( ) Towing/Medical billreceipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance
{ ) Photograph/s of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it Is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal Injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

William Tan

CDGE Claims Department

Tel: 6214 B737 Fax 6214 1843 Email : willamtan@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

A rmambes o

(9]
COMFORIDELGRO @ ﬁfﬁ Y
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S1UBEAVE 1L #0125 PAYA LIBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08913 TEL * (0651 62563561 FAX : (063) 67414108

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18018769/K1jb3
07 November 2018

NEO MOH TECK

BLK 223D COMPASSVALE WALK
#08-681

SINGAPORE 544223

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 3904P AND SH 76918 ON 14/10/2018

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

g

Handler

PID: 6841 2409

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: jovirene(@lkkauto.com

cc.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



CDG VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page 1 of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

[MAF / PAF]
ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SH76915 , SKI3904P ON 14-0Oct-1B8 11:55
ALONG CTE TWDS SLE
1/ We TEO WEN WEI (ZHANG ... (Hirer) NRIC No.: S8333645E
and/far CHUA SEOW KIANG {Relief) NRIC No.:  S0105977G

Taxi Number SH76915
hareby authorise ComfortDelGro Englneering Pte Lid{CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
madical fee and legal costs

3 To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on myfaur behalf.
4, To accapt any payment [claim proceads) 1N respedt af the claim against third party and payment by chegue

shall be farward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
“ComfortDelGro Engineering Pe Ltd",

[ate 15-Oct-2018
Name of Hirer TEOQ WEN WEI (ZHANG WEN WETI)
Hirer NRIC . SB333645E Signature : -
T
W/ - i

Agdoress 510 JELAPANG ROAD #09-64

670510
Contact No. 98150175
Mame of Raliel CHUA SEOW KIANG
Rehef NRIC S01059776G Signature :

T ————

Address 407 FAJAR ROAD 10-321

670407
Contact No. 67606755

http://edgek 2srv: 82/Runti me/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG VARS.V LettofAut... 15/10/2018
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Falicy Mo OMPCSN1514931803 claim ¥a : HHHIB&HWGM‘.DIH
Clalmant : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION FTE LID

Amount : S5720.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS SEVEN HUMDRED TWENTY ONLY.

i/We agres to accept the above mentioned amount o be palid to mefus in full &
final settlsment of mll claims, costs & disbursements for injuries /[ damages
sustained by ma/us throogh an accldent invelving

tlaimant Vehicle MNo. : SH 76215
Insured Vehicle Ne. : SKJ 1904P

pate of Loss : 14/1D/2018
Flace of Accldent + CTE TUMNEL

TH CONSIDERATION of the paymant made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPCRE) PTE. LID., 1/We agree asbsolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) BPTE. LTD. andfer

Inaured MHame 1 HED MOH TECE
Driver Hame : MEO MOH TECK

from a1l claima, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the sald accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on thae
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LID.

{1} Global Sum £5 720.00
ST e kR b e BN # s & eomow 5% 720.00
B b
CORIF(AT kY N T ELIb
Claimant Name : = Lol LT HRIC Ho =
’-":_';--".I
| LY
[ S 41-18
Signature 1 Date :
§ v
i !
_ g e Wiauke [orward yuti chegus _l=_--::"- pany bl L
sxal s e Lo s DN e el COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE 117

boyrs the amné &) poocaArs o S A0C gaen!’



CO MFOR-]DELCIRD ":If""'“’ED'?_IG"‘_‘ F‘.nqin&&ring Pte Ltd

Biamime «» ££ & l"L [
ENGINEERING e e sguoom scams 34 sors oy Svmi
| | CoMPORENLGRO :‘ h" I:“.Tr* i f‘jil, I AT ‘. L}"_ ki
"ESHOANY REG. NO.: 199506043
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE Feam: 1
8010012 VEHCLE NO NO/DATE
SH 76915 91403551 24.10.201

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO (S)PTE LTD

SPRINGLEAF TOWER MAKE JOB NO.

TOYOTA 305225854
3__ANSON ROAD #16-00
SINGAPORE 079909 MODEL ODOMETER READING

PRIUS HYERID(G4)

CONTACT NO: 62222366

DATE OF
23.03.20#
JTDKEE%U%EEEHE s
— Description : 3P 14.10.2018
Invoice for Lump Sum Repair
Total L Sum Repair amt 300.00
Add mF 7.000 % 21.00
Total Invoice amount 321.00

Issued by : ENG 24.10.2018 09:09:39
Paymnt%!ﬁm ; fi:ra.-l:h_t gﬂ days

vilurtDelGro Engineering Ple Lid
miesmibsar of COMAORIDELCo)

ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ N¢

=i OHTiee
15 Braddell Road
ngapare 379701

ndly nate that no receipt shall be issusd unless requestad
USTOMER'S COPY




OurRef: CT18100454 ,\

— comrfort
Date; 23 ber 201 --""" -
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 14/10/2018 @ 11:55hrs

ALONG CTE TWDS SLE

INVOLVING SKJ3004P

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SH76915 (lhe “Taxi"). The Taxi was hired 10 TEO WEN WEI ;ZH.&HB WEN
WE) IC NO $8333645E a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte
Ltd al the time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40
per day (inclusive of GST)

Plaase be advised that the Taxl was insured with India international Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission 1o
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settiement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully

Christine Tay
Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a compultar generated lelter. Mo signature is required,

83 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 8555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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Enquire Vehicle Insurer

Valiche Moy incident Dates Time Sesirch Statud lsuranie Company Code insurance Company Mame

SKJIPMP  140ct 2018/ 115500 Successiul col CHIMNA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTE LD

Previous oK

SHEGLS



’ ”” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i B = 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 8256 4215

Reg. No: 198607188R GST Reg. No. 15-9607198-R

CHINA TAJFING INSURANCE (5) PFTELTD Ref : ccm1m:m1qu

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00 .
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079908 Pate 22112018 I|“I"|||I|l||“

Insured Veh.  SKJ 3904P Veh. lnspnchd SH 76915

Policy No. DMPCSN1514931803 Coverage ($) 0.00

Claim No. SNM18D04906/C01/4 Excess ($) 0.00

Assign From Assign Date 1510/2018

Make & Model _ TOYOTA PRIUS ce 179

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017

Chassis No. JTDKB3FU403563436 Colour BLUE

Odometer 196820 Steering IN ORDER

Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR

R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 WEST LAKE 7 mm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE NiS FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD

59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPGRE 508969

A)THE INSPECTION WAS EUHDUETED ON A"WITHDUT PR‘EJUDH.‘-E' BASIS.
BjIN ﬁﬂGDRDANCE TD YOUR INSTHUCTIDNS "d"E I"IA'UE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

EST]HATED NDRMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




' 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- 51 Ubl Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 5256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 188607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R Page No.1af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SH 76915

.. e ..I ﬁ = == ="
ﬂ? il T | Mul]#nn ni‘hrllﬂ
BEELAEEHEHI_QEEAE[B
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER TO REPAIR SEE 499 90 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER SERVICEABLE 77.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -115.38
46152
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING .INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 220,00 100.00
BUMPER COVER .
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 220.00 200.00
440.00 300.00
GRAND TOTAL 901.52 300.00

— RECOMMENDED COST OF REPARS |

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI 13D1B?59ﬂ{1jh3q2

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN
Automoltive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor

DISCLAINER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Ropart i made solsly for the aes and benalil of the Cllent named on the front page of this Repert




