Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 13 November 2018 11:02 AM

‘admin1@kkimhin.com.sg'

'service@kkimhin.com.sg’; ‘sandrakhong@gmail.com’

RE: ===Email Spoofing Detected=== FW: Accident involving SJF 8837 A and SKE 7848
Ton 11/10/2018

Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Our insured NO ACCIDENT / NO COLLISION. Enclosed
herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard

further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to

look into the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: adminl@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:adminl@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 22 October, 2018 11:32 AM
To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common
Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; 'Sandra Khong'

Subject: ===Email Spoofing Detected=== FW: Accident involving SJF 8837 A and SKE 7848 T on 11/10/2018

Dear all,
Kindly appoint surveyor.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Shuman

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 3895

From: admini@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:admin1@kkimhin.com.sq]

Sent: 12 October, 2018 2:22 PM

To: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Cc: 'service@kkimhin.com.sg'; 'sandrakhong@gmail.com'; 'simon@kkimhin.com.sg'; 'survey@kkimhin.com.sg'
(survey@kkimhin.com.sq)

Subject: Accident involving SJF 8837 A and SKE 7848 T on 11/10/2018

Your ref: SKE 7848 T
Our ref: SJF 8837 A

Dear all,

Enclosed the GIA report of our client SIF 8837 A, who was involved in an accident with your insured SKE 7848 T, on
11/10/2018.

Vehicle is not in yet, kindly arrange for survey.
Please advise liability.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shuman

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 3895

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses
by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



