Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018 11:44 AM

To: lionel.tan@fwd.com; assignments; SUR

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident vehicle between our insured SLX963C and your insured SJL2826P on

10/10/2018 (Our Ref: PNPV2018-00012515)

Dear Lionel,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com [mailto:lionel.tan@fwd.com]

Sent: Friday, 12 October, 2018 3:14 PM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com; motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: FW: Accident vehicle between our insured SLX963C and your insured SJL2826P on 10/10/2018 (Our Ref:
PNPV2018-00012515)

Hi Joey,
Please attend to attached PRS and explore direct settlement with TP.

Kindly create case in Merimen.

Best Regards,

Lionel Tan
Senior Executive, Claims
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