| Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No, SCA 818 S

S/N Parts Description Mri
21 FRONT FENDER DEFORMATION ELEMENT BRACKET-RH /7 ¢ 43.00 +
22 FRONT FENDER BRACE-RH A= 5d 5 103.00 3. 1o
23 FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER-RH ~ Tor o 5 209.00 |
24  WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHEMENT PARTS Mo ¢ 78.00 - B
24 FRONTWHEELSPOILER-RH ~ (aeled ¢ 63.00 SO
25 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER END PLATE-RH A 7 $ 31.00 7 ¥
26 STONECHIPGUARD =+ x/.. 5 44.00 ~ %
27  FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER-RH ~ AF& M s 27.00 *%
26 FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER PROTECTON FILM-RH Al 20.00 - TI5RE
29 LED HEADLIGHT-RH (recleed s 6,973.00 A
30 LED HEADLIGHT POWER MODULE-RH fﬂ - $ 695.00
31 LED HEADLIGHT CONTROL UNIT-RH s 657.00
32 LED HEADLIGHT LIFT CYLINDER-RH 2\ * $ 184.00 © VWSS
33 FRONT NO. PLATE M- S/IN § 25.00
34 SUNDRIES Naws 3 300.00 . 134y
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES $ 14,986.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,152.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 19,138.00 9 285.93
All charges are mot inclusive of 05T,
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (%) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408695
Tel: 63662323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Name Adacn M ~
Surveyed Date 6 f 10[1g \
Authorised Date - :

Excess Cost

Liability

Remarks P At R ;

Please Note

LKK Aulo Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey before/after spry panting
» To display damaged parts) during resurvey
» Parts prices are subjed 1o confirmation
& Third party sunvey & on & “Wilhout Prejudics” basi
» No Begal modification(s) is aliowed
« Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
s subject to finsl approval from Insurancs Company

Acknowhedged by Fapamer
Signatune:
m.

vs ?h\j p)

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.

Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the

progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo
Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - (65) 6366 2323 Fax:(65) 6841 1183

supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg No. 19-9902271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PA/OD/1164/2018/GW
78 Shenton Way Date 12-Nov-18
#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor James
Singapore 079120 Pages 1
Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept Regn No SCABLES
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 'Model No Audi A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI
| Quantity Jescription R : Unit Price | Amount
LABORS
1 To carry out paint protection. {Supplied-by-Owner} 5 747.93
. JotaL LS J87.93

Far Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

' -“ Authorised Signature



Claims
# cm e e —ﬂ—

From: Aaron Goh [aarongjh@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 6:35 PM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: Attr: James Receipt / Tax Invoice for Aaron SCAB18S
Hi James,

please see forwarded email below.
Thank you!

From: EA Detailer <no-reply@vendhg.com:=
sent: Thursday, June 30, 2016 7:39 PM

To: aarongjih@hotmail.com
subject: Receipt / Tax Invoice

Making the REAL Difference

.—_-.—_-,.-—_-—-————--.-_-.——.-—-—--.-—.-—-—n.-—_.—_-—_-—_-—.-—.—n—-—-—.—

Aaron Goh

Receipt / Tax Invoice

Invoice #: 1643Thu, 30 Jun "16 7:39 pmServed by: Victor Tang On register: Siglap

- $382.00.:a-$382.0

-1 Discount

| DiamondBrite Paint Protection $850.0r

| NanoGlass Ultra Windscreen Coating %1800

1 Special Request S0.0
Rims Coating o

4  Prepayment: DiamondBrite Conservation Program -$88.00.:a $352.00

Subtotal $1,000.00

Tax (No Tax) $0.00

TOTAL $1,000.00

Credit Card $1,000.00

TO PAY 50.00

You are the heart of our operations
Nothing is more important than delighting you.
Eeel free to engage us anytime at enquiry@eadetailer.com



EA DETAILER PTE LTD

[EA DETAILER PTE LTD Quotation:  AG-EAD2018111¢

Attn: Mr Aaron Goh Date: 16-Mov-18
Blk 431 Ang Mo Kio Ave 10 #0B-1463
Singapore 560431

Date Items Unit Unit Price Total

16-Nov-2018 Reference: Audi A4 SCAS1ES

1 Ceraz Nane membrane 1 §1,213.02 51,214.02
- 3 Layering Application
- Paintwork Refining
. Sedan Category Range - Audi A4 SCAB185
1 -5794.46 -5794.46

2 Special Discount

Total Payable Amount$747.93

This (s a computer generaled form, no signalure Is required



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 9:33 AM
To: 'Claims'; SUR

Subject: RE: Supplementary for SCA 8185
Attachments: IMG.pdf

Dear James,

Refer attached marking.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email cur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=
sent: Monday, 19 November 2018 6:44 PM
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: Supplementary for SCA 818 5

Dear All,

Kindly refer to the above attached.
Above supplementary, please pass to Adrian for marking and revert back to us.
Thanks.

Best Regards,
James Tan
Claims Advisor

premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jeg v sz

55 Libi Road 1 Road Singapore 408693

p. +65 5388 2321 d. +65 A7AE 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto LOm. 55 w. www.gudi.com.58

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 251 plexandra Road Singapare 158938 p. +63 G836 2223
. Y e R §




Premium Automobiles

&5 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Email: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate
Workshop
Contact No
Fax No
Reference
Date

{ claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Accident Repairs

Ubi Road 1

6366 2323

6841 1183

PA/OD/ 164/2018/GW
15-Oct-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way
#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Mr. Aaron Goh Jin Hao (Wu RenHao)
Apt Blk 431 Ang Mo Kio Avenue 10
Singapore 560431

HP +65 90227055

Own Damage Claims
2100472595-02

SCA 818 S

Audi A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI
Jun-16

CWN 009457
WAUZZZF45GA0T4222

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
12-Oct-18
Car park Under Blk 432 Ang Mo Kio Ave 10



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Rpad 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

timated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SCA 818 S

Es s}

Estimated
Sin Mature of Jobs Charges
To remave and transfer front wire harness ofr headlights,
1 horns. outside temperature sensor and healdight washer SN § 360.00

assy.

To dismantle and renew front bumper,rhs front fender and
rhs headlight. Re-organise front crash management $ 2,100.00
components.Reinstall all parts removed.

To respray front bumper,rhs front fender 5 1,500.00
Added labour - by owner 5 747.93
To carry out diagnostic check. SN § 182.00

360.00

1,250.00

1,100.00

T47.93

192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES . ] 4,899.93

3,649.93




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408698
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 684711 183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SCA 818 S

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description SiNett Remark
1 FRONT BUMPER 5 1,849.00 5 1,479.20
2 FIXING PARTS FOR FRONT BUMPER 5 245.00
1 SECURING STRIP $ 30.00
4 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE-CENTER 5 171.00
5 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT 5 180.00
§ FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE-RH b 73.00
7  RADIATOR GRILLE 5 §72.00
& FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE-RH 5 118.00 5 94.00
s FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-RH 5 32.00 $ 25.36
10 FOAM FILLER PIECE 5 107.00
11 FRONT BUMPER CARRIER 5 702.00
12 FRONT BUMPER COVER $ 109.00
13 SIGN "CAUTION" 3 12.00
14  STICKER FOR AIR CONDITIONER 5 7.00
15 FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT-FH $ 24.00
w8 LOCK CARRIER BRACKET 5 118.00 5 94.00
17 FRONT FEDER-RH $ 66500 § 532.00
12 FRONT FENDER ATTACHNENT PARTS-RH 5 45.00
19 FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT-RH 5 4400 § 34.56
20 FRONT FENDER BRACKET-RH 5 31.00 1 24.16
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES 5 5,534.00 $ 2,283.28

Al charges are not inclusive of GST

Legend Remarks (0K} = Approved. Femarks (¥) = Mot approvad

Spare pars are Special MNett,




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408509
Tel ' 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SCA 818 S

Damaged Pa b
S/N  Parts Description SiNett Remark
eff $ 2,283.28
21 FRONT FENDER DEFORMATION ELEMENT BRACKET-RH  § 43.00
22 FRONT FENDER BRACE-RH $ 103.00 5 52.40
23 FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER-RH g 209.00 -1 167.20
24 WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHEMENT PARTS 5 78.00 5 £2.00
24 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER-RH - 63.00 5 50.16
25  FRONT WHEEL SPOILER END PLATE-RH 5 31.00
26 STONE CHIP GUARD 3 44,00
27 FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER-RH k] 27.00
28 FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER PROTECTON FILM-RH -] 20.00 s 15.36
29  LED HEADLIGHT-RH ] §,973.00 5 5,578.40
30 LED HEADLIGHT POWER MODULE-RH 5 £95.00
31 LED HEADLIGHT CONTROL UNIT-RH $ B857.00
a2 LED HEADLIGHT LIFT CYLINDER-RH 5 18400 8 147.20
a3 FRONT NO. PLATE SN $ 25.00
34 SUNDRIES $ 30000 13.92
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES 5 14,986.00 L3 8,399.92
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,899.93 5 3,649.93
GRAND TOTAL $ 19,885.93 § 12,049.85
All chasges are notinchusive of G5T
Lagend : Remarks (0K} = Approved, Remarks (X) = Net approved

Spare parts are Special Natt



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 |Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408689

Tel : (65) 6366 2323 Fax - (65) 6B41 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg No 19-9502271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PA/ODI1164/2018/GW
78 Shenton \Way Date 12-Mov-18
#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor James
Singapore 079120 Pages 1
Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept  Regn No SCAB1BS
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No Audi Ad SEDAN 1.4 TFSI
_ Quantity Jescription ' Unit Price |  Amount
LABORS
1 To carry out paint protection. (Supplied by Owner}) % 74793 | § 747.93

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel ' 6366 2323 Fax: 68411183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note . This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel 6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 5:31 PM

To: ‘Boo seng yak; Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumautu.ccm.sg; Chang Chee
sing; SUR

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SCA8185 - OD AlG - SURVEYED 16 OCT 18

Dear Mr Boo,

Confirm repair cost of $12.049.85 before GST @ 5 days of repairs.

Kindly send us invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: B256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

sent: Thursday, 10 January 2019 4:52 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@kkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg;
Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SCA818S - OD AlG - SURVEYED 16 OCT 18

hl Adrian and all,

Revised estimate and photographs attached.

please confirm repair cost of $12,049.85 @ 5 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



Premium Automobiles

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Norah Khai
7% Shenton Way 6768 9911
#07-16 AIG Building 6841 1183
Singapore 079120 Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg
Attn: Motor Claims Dept Body & Paint Dept
Yr Ref: SCABIBS PA/OD/1164/2018/MAS

23 Feb 2019
Dear 5ir.

RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SCA 818 S, Audi A4 Sedan 1.4 TFS15-Tro

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle. no. SCA 818 8, claimant, Mr.
Aaron Goh Jin Hao, please find the related document per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 8501 3460 — §512,893.34

2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at
6768 9911.

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

Norah Khai
Claims Dept

Encls

AIG -SCARIYS

from
Telephone +65-
Telefax +65-
EMail

Qur department
Qur Ref

Your Ref

Date

total pages

Premium Automobiles Pte Lt
Showroom

8 Leng Kee Road

Singapore 159090
Telephone (65) 6366 1111
Telefax  (65) 6471 3733

Service & Parts Centres
55 Ubi Rd 1

Singapore 408699
Telephone (65) 6336 2323
Telefax (B5) 6834 11183



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Customer Service
ferate Appomiment
v Brealck v Servicn

Alexandra Service Centre
81 Alexandri Road
Cngapore 159930
Teldphone BISE 1323

fats 12 Cowpany Reg N i998a2271d
BST Feg. No. 1999@227IM

Uhi 5ervice Centre
35 Ul Foad 1

Audi Centre Singapare
181 Alewandra Bodl
Singapnte 150HR

Wain Teleghone SH3E 2223
Whan Telatan 847t T3] Talalaz

Page 1  1T:48

INS SRR TINMVOICE.

3653333
A28 1213
CAEETET Car I T e, ComAn

: Invoices A5813468 Account: AR@2e (T o
RIG ASIA PACIFIC IWSURANCE PTE LTD RIG RSIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
MOTOR CLAIN DEPT Date ¢ 1S/02/2019 MOTOR CLAIM DEPT
ATS BUILDING AIG BUILDING
T8 SHENTON LAY Order @+ SCAGBIAS 78 SHENTON WAY
HT-16 #¥27-16
‘SINGAPORE 879120 273120 Tersm 1 30 SINGAPORE @73120
Regn Meo.: SCABBIAS (V237580 Regn Date: 29/@6/2Ris6 Mileage: &&572 WIF Mo.: 28539
Model: A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFS1 § tromic Chassiz: WALZITFASGABT4ZZE Engine: CUN B@3457 Dept: U
¥SE Mo, & :
[You have been assisted by 1= UB-Jiayee {3 )
Details | ity Urit Price Amaunt
5 | BODYWORK LH 360, 00 1.8 360, 00
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS
FOR HEADL IGHTS, HORNS, DUTSIDE TEMPERATURE
GENSOR AND HERDLIGHT WASHER ASSY
5 | BODYWORK M1 1258, 00 1.0 1,250,
[TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER, RHS FRONT
FENDER AND RHS HERDLIGHT. REORGANISE FRONT
CRASH MANAGEMENT COMPONENTS. REINSTALL ALL
PERTS REMOVED
5 | BODYWORK M: 1199, 00 1.8 1,100, 2
TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND RHS FRONT FENDER '
S | BODYWORK M: 192. 00 L& 1z
TO CARRY OUT DIRGMDSTIC CHECK
0 | OTHERS M: 747.93 108 T47.93
TG CARRY OUT PAINT PROTECTION
i(BY DWMER)
% | RBHES4ITT4R HERDLIGHT Less Q2% l.da E973. B0 5,978, 50
¥ ]. AdWeBZ1172A WHEEL HOUS Less d2@% 1.0@ 209, o2 167,29
Sub-Total
o6 GST
Grand Total

Customer




Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Audi Centre Singapons Alexandra Service Cantro Ubi Service Cenfre l:unnmnr Service
&1 Aledardira foad J01 Adguansdra Raad 55 Ui Bpad 1 Hirsice Appoditment E306 2323

Lingaporo 159530 Ringapnra 15901 ﬂ!ﬁ!l Eﬂn ar M a'.H.lJ.lw E-'w # LIl BRER
Main-Telephare BRI 2208 lelpphane S388-2223 I NE Tm M.,UI:II E T G R AT S0 0T M
Wi Telelss 54713723 Teietan #7500 Conpany Tiem Mg 19802 TIH

Page 2 17:4 BST Reg. Mo. 199902271
Invaice: B58134E0 Account: ABAGE {7 )]

\AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD AIG ASIA PARCIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

MOTOR CLAIM DERT Date & 15/@2/2019 MOTOR CLAIM DEPT

AIE BUILDING AIG BUILDING

T8 SHENTON WAY Order @ SCHOB1BS T8 SHENTON WRY

#7-18 #07-1E

SINGAPORE 73129 @7912@ Term ¢ 3B SINGAPORE @79120

Regn No.: SCRRBIBS (V  2975Q) Regn Date: 29/Q6/2016 Mileage: 4&&572 WIP No.: 28532

Model: A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI § tronic Chassis: WAUZIIF4SGRAT4ZZE Engine: CUN DOS4ST Dept: U

¥SB No.:

You have been assisted by :- UB-Jiayee (33 )

B | | |

Detalls ity Unit Price Amournt
¥ | ABWABS3BRBIA SPOILER Less e .00 B2 7@ 5. 16
¥ | ABWBAZ1186R FENDER Less Q2@ 1.80 BES. 08 532, k@
¥ | RBWeARTTTY BRACKET Less @2 1.0 117,58 94, @
% | ABWeBATRESC GRU COVER Less gos 1.08 1843, 80 1,479, 2@
¥ | ABWGRIBESS ATT. PARTS Less @2 1.® T7.58 b2. 09
) AEWBEZ 1468 BRACKET Less @2 .00 0.0 24.18
{ | AAHGBATZR4 BUIDE Less B2l 1.B0 H.70 .36
) AOWeEZ 193 FLATE Less Bofe .00 43.c00 3. 56
X ABWes2113aC SUPRORT Less B2ds 1.0 103, 09 fz, 40
1 | ABWRB23746 COVER Legs @20 1. 80 13.20 15,36
1 | ABNDBATRAZR 98BS BRILLE Lesz @i 1.9 117.59 04, 08
¥ | REN@SSS102A CYL INDER Less @o@n {008 184,09 147, 28
H AN 8161857 FOP-RIVET Less o 6. 00 2.0 13.9%2
Sub-Total
Parts  B,399.92 | 12, 043.85
Labaur 747,93 )
Sublet 2,902, 00 7% ST 843, 49
Menus 0.0 =
Lubricant 0,80 AN Grand Total | {2,893.34

- .
Received by For l ‘bn,c__hhg}?f of
Presiun Autosebiles Pie Lid

Customer




1o

Premium Automobiles

Telefax

ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

7% Shenton Way

#07-16 AlG Building

Singapore 079120
Motor Claims Dept

Your Ref: SCA 0818 8

RE: CLAIM-OWNER’S SATIHF&L’TIUHIDIH’ZH,&RGE VOUCHER

Make & Model
Vehicle Chassis No.
Vehicle Regn No.
Vehicle Mileage
Vehicle Owner
Certificate No
Policy Excess
Accident Date
Place

Repair Cost
WIP No.

Repairer's Name

I/'We certify that the vehicle

Norah Khai from
G768 U828 Telephane +65-

n841 1183 Telefax  +65
Mobile +63-
Body Repair Our department
Your Claim Ref
PA/OD/1164/2018/]W Our Ref

12 Nov 2018 Date

1otal pages

Premium Automaobiles Pie Lt
Showroom

g Leng Kee Road

Singapore 159080
Telephone (65) 6566 1111
Telefax  (B5) 6471 3733

Audi A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI
WAUZZZF45GA074222

Service & Parts Centres
55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408693
Telephone (65) 6366 2323
Telafax  (B5) 6841 1183

SCA OB18 S

45758 KM

Mr. Aaron Goh Jin Hao (Wu RenHao)
2100472595-02

Waived

12" October 2018

Carpark Under Blk 432 Ang Mo Kio Ave 10
s 1289334

28530

Premium Automobiles Ple Lid

has been fully repaired to my entire satisfaction and that

payment of the repairer’s charges that are claimable under the policy will be deemed in

full and final settlement of my claim.

Owner / Insured Signature

Time

Date

Py
-~ o~

DISCHARGE YOUCHER — AlG- 5CA 08185



3112019 Merimen @-Claims

_..CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

"""" Makified | Est Sut A -__ | Ji‘_‘l Adj Rpf i ) |':'\.:.]i Submitied . | Ins huth'ed ] Status S—
|16 Oct 2018 | 16012018 | 5437 049.85 |5#1!,D4H-EE | Pending for Survey .
Main (16:2% |14:32 Edit Estimates i Wiew Rpt Report I
Edit Adj Rpt || |- | | Cancel Case _

Reference Claim Details

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by insurer]

insured: | AARON GOH JIN HAO (WU RENHAO), 1D: 587254863, Tel: +6590227055, Emall: AARONGOH@HOTMAIL, COM _|
g et _Reg' _|SCAS18S |- of Enset |E§§-’3‘L§¥.§ al:::lnf:'r;g_&mm LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)] _|
| | Claim Type: | OD / 773099689856 IE“:::"'S;‘_’:’” (Comprehensive)
| —————————— . [550.00
| |Repairer: __:Frﬂiqp_ljﬂtgnloh!!gn_ﬂ-_l.twww Road 1, ADBE90 Ubi - Tel: 676B9828/9827/9911

:Ina:udrg:? | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (SG) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 . (Handled by Loo, Tong Shing] TongShing.Loo@alg.com

| Adjuster: _|_1.'mc_ﬁtc:m@ig_r£ Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 25/10/2018]

IE{;:‘:” Custo | parON GOM JIN HAO (WU RENHAQ) (31 / Male) ,  NRIC: S8725486), Tel: +6530227055 Email: AARONGOH@HOTMAIL.COM

- | IE RN

_ Tssﬁmﬁ MAIL RECEWEF 1 Wiew AM Compose Case Mail l

. AIG_SG (18/10/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$13100.00) - SCAB18S - Claim Handler: Loo, Tong S...
| . AIG SG(17/10/2018): SCAB18S / OD / 12/10/2018 / Coverage & Excess update |

View All | _Search Tasks | Create New Task

Due Date Priorily Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

| No results, J

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ [ Comptete | |

hitps:/isinga pare.rnarlman.mrm'u]aims.ﬁnduax.clm?fusebnx:MTRadjustar&fwsaanijun-dsp_::lmhaador&msaid=?52555&axlid=2&5ﬂ5&CFln=491 2200... 12



31142019 Merimen a-Claims

hups:#smgamre.merlm&n.cwmaimsﬂnde:.cfm'?fusebnx=MTRadjustar&fu5:aactiun=dsp_::lmMadarﬂ-t.a5eid=?52555&u:tid=2854?5&CFID=491m0.. 202



3112019

hitp

Meriman e-Claims

Claim Documents

+SCAB18S (77309968985G)
oD
Oct 12 2018 6:50PM

[AARON GOH JIN HAO (WU RENHAO)]

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

View [ View in Browser ¥ |

I A:m:rnant Repnrts

[No | Finalized on

116101816144

Photos/Images

1 'nannus 16:26
2 16/10/18 16:26
3

16/10/18 16:26 26
|1ﬁnﬂna 16:26 6:26

[
5
6
7 16/10/18 16:26
.  16:2

]

iﬂ_'_lﬁj'lﬂl,fiﬂ 16'25
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arz019 Adjuster Reporl
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreqNo:1ass07128R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkautn_mm:assignments@lkkaum.curn

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Our File No: CC3/AIG18018743/AVBS2
AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16

Singapore 079120 Date: 01/03/2019

REFERENCE

Insured/Claimant: AARON GOH JIN HAD (wWwu REMHAD) Policy No:

Date of Loss: 12/10/2018 Mature of Claim: 0D Claim No: 7730596898506

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: SCAB185

Make & Model. ALUDI A4, 1.4 TFSI S TRONIC (A) Engine No. CVND02457

Reg. Date: 20/06/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: WAUZZZF45GADT4222
Colour: White Odometer: 45170 km

Engine Capacity: 1395 cc

Market Value/New Car Price: 5%110,000.00

sum Insured (S3) Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Good  Steering (Serviceable): Yas Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:

CONDITION OF TYRES

Front Tyre Size: 245/40R18 Rear Tyre Size: 245/40R18
Front Left Side: Michelin & mm Rear Left Side: Michelin & mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin & mm
The above vaiues represent the remaining lyre treads depth
COSTOF CLAIMS - " Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference Diff %!
Parts 14,986.00 8,300.92 6,586.08 43.95
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4,899.93 3,649.93 1,250.00 25.51
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 19,885.93 12,049.85 7,836.08 39.41
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 1,392.02 843.49 54853 39.41
Nett Amount (S5) 21,277.95 12,893.34 B,384.61 39.41
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 16/10/2018
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UB1)
Date Inspected: 16/10/2018 Inspected Al 55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408699
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days
Adjuster:  ADRIAN LING Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herain, Such inspection has been carried out to the best of our knowledge and ability but
any other liability under any ather circumstances (s heraby gxpressly excluded.
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312019 Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deformed 1,84000FS *1,479.20F3
2 1 *FIXING PARTS FOR FRONT BUMPER Not Necessary 245.00FS *-FS
g0 *SECURING STRIP Mot Necessary 30.00FS *.F5
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER GRILLE - CENTER Mot Necessary 171.00FS *-F5
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT Mot Necessary 180.00FS *-F5
B 1 *FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH Mot Necessary 73.00FS *-Fs
7 1 *RADIATOR GRILLE Mot Necessary 972.00FS “.F5
B 1 *FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH Cracked 118.00FS 94 00F5
9 1 *FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH Damaged 32.00F5 *25.36F5
0 1 *FOAM FILLER PIECE Mot Necessary 107.00FS *-FS8
y i A | *FRONT BUMPER CARRIER Mot Necessary 702.00F5 “F5
12 *FRONT BUMPER COVER Mot Necessary 109.00FS *.FS8
13 1 *3I1GN CAUTION Mot Necessary 12,00FS *-FS
14 A *STICKER FOR AIR CONDITIONER Mot Necessary 7.00F5 =FS
15 1 *FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT -RH Mot Necessary 24 00F3 *.F5
16 1 *LOCK CARRIER BRACKET Damaged 118.00FS “94 00 FS
T *ERONT FENDER - RH Dented G65.00FS *532.00F3
18 1 *FRONT FENDER ATTACHMENT PARTS - RH Mot Mecessary 45 00FS *F5
19 1 *FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT - RH Mecessary 44.00F5 *34 56 FS
20 1 *FRONT FENDER BRACKET -RH Damaged 31.00FS *24.16FS
21 1 *FRONT FENDER DEFORMATION ELEMENT BRACKET - RH Mot Mecessary 43.00FS *F5
22 1 *FRONT FENDER BRACE -RH Bent 103.00FS *82.40FS
23 1 *FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER - RH Torn J09.00FS *167.20FS
24 1 “WHEEL HOUSING LINER ATTACHMENT PARTS Mecessary 78.00FS *62.00FS
25 1 *FRONT WHEEL SPOILER - RH Cracked 63.00FS *50.16 FS
26 1 *FRONT WHEEL SPOILER END PLATE - RH Nol Necessary 3M.00FS *-FS
27 1 *STONE CHIP GUARD Mot Necessary 44 00F5 *FS
28 1 *FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER -RH Mot Mecessary 27.00FS “-F3
28 1 *FRONT FENDER LEDGE COVER PROTECTOR FILM -RH Mecessary 20.00FS *15.36F5
200 A *LED HEADLIGHT - RH Cracked 6,973.00FS *5 578.40F3
i R | “LED HEADLIGHT POWER MODULE - RH Mot Necessary 695.00FS *-FS
32 1 *LED HEADLIGHT CONTROL UNIT - RH Mot Mecessary B57.00FS *~FS
a3 1 “LED HEADLIGHT LIFT CYLINDER - RH Damaged 184.00FS *147.20FS
34 1 *FRONT NO. PLATE Mot Mecessary 25.00FS *-FS
as 1 *SUNDRIES Necessary 300.00FS *13.92F5
F=Franchise parl. S=5pchett. -

Total Parts (55) 14,986.00 8,399.92

1_ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. :I
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312019 Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous ftems selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour [tems
1 TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS FOR New 360.00 360.00
HEADLIGHTS, HORNS, OUTSIDE TEMPERATURE SENSOR AND
HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY.
2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER, RHS FRONT FENDER Mew 2,100.00 1,250.00

AND RHS HEADLIGHT. RE-ORGANISE FRONT CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPONENTS. REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED.

TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER, RHS FRONT FENDER. New 1,500.00 1,100.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK. Mew 192.00 192.00
5 TO CARRY OUT PAINT PROTECTION. New 74793 T747.93
Gross Labour Cost (53) 4,899.93 3,649.93
Reporl was unsubmitted during this print-out. _l
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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