Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 November, 2018 2:58 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: 17/18/18//VP05/021013

Attachments: RE: ACC ON 11.10.2018 INVLG SGK 5216 X & SDD 128 Y
Dear Gerald,

We refer to the above matter.

Base on OI video, We offer 50% liability to TP repairer. TP repairer disagree on the liability and insisted 100%. (
enclosed is TP appeal email)

Based on the circumstances of both parties TP was travelling in the fast speed, OI stop and TP unable to
stop in time and collided onto OI. TP should bear some liability also.

Kindly advice on your view/opinion/instruction for this claim.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]
Sent: Thursday, 1 November, 2018 11:21 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: 17/18/18//VP05/021013

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/021013
Your Ref : LPC18018742/Awa3
Dear Vivian,

Attached video for your attention.
Best Regards

Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
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300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: CHEE SIONG LAM [mailto:colinlam@aia.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 1 November, 2018 11:08 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: Colin Lam

Subject: 17/18/18//vP05/021013

Hi Gerald,
FYI, SDD128Y. SGK5216X driving at a high speed at the carpark.



